

EXHIBIT 3

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/03/13	RIM, HISUN	Translation.	7.00	11	260.00	\$ 1,820.00
06/03/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Samsung production for H. Rim review.	0.50	11	295.00	\$ 147.50
06/04/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit joint prosecution agreement.	0.20	8	675.00	\$ 135.00
06/04/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with Jeff Friedman and Steve Williams re amending complaint; prepare for call.	1.30	11	675.00	\$ 877.50
06/04/13	RIM, HISUN	Translation.	8.00	11	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
06/04/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.50	11	295.00	\$ 147.50
06/04/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review signed protective order from H. Rim and save to file.	0.10	11	295.00	\$ 29.50
06/04/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re international service of complaints.	0.20	11	295.00	\$ 59.00
06/04/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translation re Samsung production and save to file.	0.10	11	295.00	\$ 29.50
06/05/13	RIM, HISUN	Translation.	7.00	11	260.00	\$ 1,820.00
06/05/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar re pending hearing dates.	0.50	11	295.00	\$ 147.50
06/06/13	RIM, HISUN	Translation.	6.00	11	260.00	\$ 1,560.00
06/06/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translation of Samsung production and save to file.	0.10	11	295.00	\$ 29.50
06/07/13	RIM, HISUN	Translation.	4.30	11	260.00	\$ 1,118.00
06/07/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re international service for E. Fastiff review.	1.30	11	295.00	\$ 383.50
06/07/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit master production index.	0.20	11	295.00	\$ 59.00
06/07/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	11	295.00	\$ 29.50
06/07/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review proofs of service re international service and save to file.	0.40	11	295.00	\$ 118.00
06/07/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re database vendor invoices for B. Glackin.	0.40	11	295.00	\$ 118.00
06/10/13	DUGAR, KIRTI	Further demonstration from ViewPoint re reporting features.	0.50	11	400.00	\$ 200.00
06/12/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Prepare for [REDACTED].	2.40	11	675.00	\$ 1,620.00
06/12/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Prepare for [REDACTED]; reviews documents.	1.70	11	925.00	\$ 1,572.50
06/12/13	KRUSE, JOY	Review email with translated documents.	0.80	9	750.00	\$ 600.00
06/12/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding Maxell production; review Maxell production.	0.10	11	395.00	\$ 39.50
06/12/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Samsung translations for attorney review.	2.70	11	295.00	\$ 796.50
06/12/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Maxell production and prepare for attorney review.	1.00	11	295.00	\$ 295.00
06/13/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with E. Fastiff re amending complaint and case status.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
06/13/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Meet with plaintiffs' counsel re consolidated complaint.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
06/13/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Prepare for [REDACTED].	3.10	11	675.00	\$ 2,092.50
06/13/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team meeting with Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs' and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs' co-lead counsel.	1.80	11	610.00	\$ 1,098.00
06/13/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Plaintiffs' group meeting and [REDACTED].	2.60	11	925.00	\$ 2,405.00
06/13/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review documents; prepare for [REDACTED].	2.70	9	925.00	\$ 2,497.50
06/13/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare invoice re [REDACTED] copying for payment.	0.30	11	295.00	\$ 88.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/13/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare pleadings for L. Chan review.	0.60	11	295.00	\$ 177.00
06/13/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery responses.	0.20	11	295.00	\$ 59.00
06/13/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery and save to file.	0.20	11	295.00	\$ 59.00
06/14/13	CABRASER, ELIZABETH	Legal research re class allegations/master complaint.	2.00	11	925.00	\$ 1,850.00
06/14/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read economic analysis for amended complaint; read notes of ██████████ and read ██████████.	3.20	9	675.00	\$ 2,160.00
06/17/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze complaint.	0.50	9	435.00	\$ 217.50
06/17/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	11	295.00	\$ 29.50
06/18/13	CABRASER, ELIZABETH	Correspondence with counsel re master complaint.	0.50	11	925.00	\$ 462.50
06/18/13	CABRASER, ELIZABETH	Legal research re ██████████.	1.30	11	925.00	\$ 1,202.50
06/18/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Todd Seaver re tolling agreements.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
06/18/13	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to E. Fastiff, co-counsel and Jon King email correspondence and attached documents re amending complaint.	1.30	11	435.00	\$ 565.50
06/18/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit consolidated amended complaint.	2.40	8	675.00	\$ 1,620.00
06/18/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review memorandum re information from ██████████.	0.40	9	925.00	\$ 370.00
06/18/13	KRUSE, JOY	Review draft complaint.	1.00	9	750.00	\$ 750.00
06/18/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	11	295.00	\$ 59.00
06/18/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review LG production and save to file.	0.40	11	295.00	\$ 118.00
06/18/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review ██████████ notes and save to file.	0.20	11	295.00	\$ 59.00
06/19/13	CABRASER, ELIZABETH	Revise consolidated amended complaint.	1.00	8	925.00	\$ 925.00
06/19/13	CHAN, LIN	Call Jon King re ██████████.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
06/19/13	CHAN, LIN	Call Steve Williams re ██████████.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
06/19/13	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to E. Fastiff and co-counsel email correspondence and attached drafts re amending complaint, reviewing documents, and tolling agreements.	1.10	11	435.00	\$ 478.50
06/19/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise draft tolling agreement.	0.30	8	435.00	\$ 130.50
06/19/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit amended complaint.	3.10	8	675.00	\$ 2,092.50
06/19/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft sections of consolidated amended complaint.	1.10	8	395.00	\$ 434.50
06/19/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.60	11	295.00	\$ 177.00
06/19/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review draft complaint.	0.20	11	295.00	\$ 59.00
06/19/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review draft ██████████ and save to file.	0.10	11	295.00	\$ 29.50
06/19/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review LG production and save to file.	0.70	11	295.00	\$ 206.50
06/20/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Todd Seaver re ██████████.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
06/20/13	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to Steve Williams, E. Fastiff, Jon King, and other co-counsel email correspondence re ██████████; confer with Steve Williams re same.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00
06/20/13	CHAN, LIN	Revise ██████████; draft email correspondence re same.	0.70	8	435.00	\$ 304.50
06/20/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Research and edit amended complaint.	2.40	8	675.00	\$ 1,620.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/20/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	11	295.00	\$ 29.50
06/21/13	CABRASER, ELIZABETH	Legal research; revise consolidated amended complaint.	1.50	8	925.00	\$ 1,387.50
06/21/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with counsel for Sony Corporation of America re tolling agreement; draft email correspondence re same.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
06/21/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit stipulation re extending time to respond to complaint; read documents produced for complaint; email re class definition.	2.10	8	675.00	\$ 1,417.50
06/21/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.30	11	295.00	\$ 88.50
06/24/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare order re complaint for M. Pilotin review.	0.10	11	295.00	\$ 29.50
06/25/13	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to Beatriz Mejia email correspondence and attached document re [REDACTED].	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
06/25/13	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to co-counsel, E. Fastiff, B. Glackin email correspondence re document review and complaint.	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
06/26/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Dugar re electronically stored information vendors; draft email correspondence re same.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00
06/26/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Todd Seaver re Sony [REDACTED].	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
06/26/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re [REDACTED].	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
06/27/13	CHAN, LIN	Call Todd Seaver re Sony Corp of America [REDACTED]; draft email correspondence re same.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
06/27/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit amended complaint.	1.10	8	675.00	\$ 742.50
06/27/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review service proofs re international defendants and save to file.	0.30	11	295.00	\$ 88.50
06/28/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with [REDACTED].	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
06/28/13	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to email correspondence and attached documents re complaint, tolling agreement, and case strategy.	1.20	11	435.00	\$ 522.00
06/28/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze draft [REDACTED]; draft email correspondence re same.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
06/28/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze Samsung SDI discovery.	3.00	7	435.00	\$ 1,305.00
06/28/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit draft amended complaint; draft email correspondence re same.	3.20	8	435.00	\$ 1,392.00
06/28/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit consolidated complaint.	2.60	8	675.00	\$ 1,755.00
06/28/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review proof of service re international defendant and save to file.	0.10	11	295.00	\$ 29.50
06/30/13	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re potential claims in complaint.	1.50	11	435.00	\$ 652.50
06/30/13	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to E. Fastiff and co-counsel email correspondence re complaint.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
06/30/13	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to E. Fastiff and co-counsel email correspondence re [REDACTED].	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
07/01/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with [REDACTED].	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
07/01/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence to Beatriz Mejia, E. Fastiff, and co-counsel re [REDACTED]; respond to email correspondence re same; confer with Beatriz Mejia re same.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00
07/01/13	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to E. Fastiff, Jeff Friedman, Steve Williams, Shana Scarlett, B. Glackin email correspondence re amended complaint; review, analyze, and edit draft complaint; confer with E. Fastiff re same.	2.80	8	435.00	\$ 1,218.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/01/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit consolidated amended complaint.	4.10	8	675.00	\$ 2,767.50
07/02/13	CABRASER, ELIZABETH	Review Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs complaint.	1.00	9	925.00	\$ 925.00
07/02/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with [REDACTED] re complaint.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
07/02/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with [REDACTED] re complaint.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
07/02/13	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to E. Fastiff, [REDACTED] Jon King, Steve Williams email correspondence re complaint and [REDACTED]; review prior orders.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
07/02/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit complaint.	1.40	8	435.00	\$ 609.00
07/02/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit consolidated complaint; emails with Jeff Friedman and Steve Williams re same.	6.20	8	675.00	\$ 4,185.00
07/02/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	11	295.00	\$ 59.00
07/02/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review tolling agreement and save to file.	0.20	11	295.00	\$ 59.00
07/03/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re electronically stored information vendor.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
07/03/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re electronically stored information vendors.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
07/03/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze filed complaint.	0.10	9	435.00	\$ 43.50
07/03/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with Steve Williams re case strategy; emails with plaintiff and defense counsel re July 12, 2013 hearing.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
07/03/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	11	295.00	\$ 29.50
07/03/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit service index re international service.	0.20	11	295.00	\$ 59.00
07/03/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.30	11	295.00	\$ 88.50
07/03/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.20	11	295.00	\$ 59.00
07/05/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze LG Chemical production.	5.50	7	435.00	\$ 2,392.50
07/05/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze [REDACTED].	0.20	7	435.00	\$ 87.00
07/08/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with E. Fastiff, Jeff Friedman and Steve Williams re case strategy and hearing re motions to dismiss.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
07/08/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs' co-lead counsel re case management strategy.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
07/08/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review summons and save to file.	0.10	11	295.00	\$ 29.50
07/09/13	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re [REDACTED]; draft memorandum re same.	4.10	11	435.00	\$ 1,783.50
07/09/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Read order.	1.30	9	925.00	\$ 1,202.50
07/09/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	11	295.00	\$ 29.50
07/10/13	CABRASER, ELIZABETH	Conference with E. Fastiff re 7/12/2013 hearing preparation and strategy.	0.50	14	925.00	\$ 462.50
07/10/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with E. Fastiff, R. Heimann, defense counsel, Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs' (IPP) counsel, and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs' (DPP) counsel re motions to dismiss.	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
07/10/13	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re [REDACTED] draft memorandum re same.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00
07/10/13	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re [REDACTED] defense; draft memorandum re same.	2.00	11	435.00	\$ 870.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/10/13	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to E. Fastiff, defense counsel, and co-counsel email correspondence and attached documents re proposed motions to dismiss.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
07/10/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read L. Chan's [REDACTED] and statute of limitations bullet point memorandum; telephone conference with plaintiff and defense counsel re defendants' Rule 12 issues; review complaint re same.	1.90	11	675.00	\$ 1,282.50
07/10/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Pre-hearing conference with plaintiffs' and defendants' counsel re hearing on 7/12/2013.	0.80	14	925.00	\$ 740.00
07/10/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	11	295.00	\$ 29.50
07/10/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare complaint for E. Fastiff review.	0.40	11	295.00	\$ 118.00
07/10/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare complaint for M. Pilotin review.	0.10	11	295.00	\$ 29.50
07/10/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re service of complaint for L. Chan review.	0.20	11	295.00	\$ 59.00
07/11/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with E. Fastiff, M. Pilotin, and co-counsel re hearing.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
07/11/13	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re [REDACTED]; draft memorandum re same.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
07/11/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze co-counsel memorandum re motions to dismiss.	0.20	9	435.00	\$ 87.00
07/11/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read memorandum to prepare for July 12, 2013 hearing; telephone conference with co-lead counsel to prepare.	1.80	14	675.00	\$ 1,215.00
07/11/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Plaintiffs' counsel conference call re hearing.	0.30	14	925.00	\$ 277.50
07/11/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with co-counsel.	0.30	11	395.00	\$ 118.50
07/11/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	11	295.00	\$ 59.00
07/12/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re hearing.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
07/12/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze defense counsel correspondence and attached legal research re motions to dismiss.	0.10	9	435.00	\$ 43.50
07/12/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	11	295.00	\$ 29.50
07/15/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze co-counsel and E. Fastiff email correspondence and attached document re proposed order.	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
07/15/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit proposed case management conference order re defendants' response to complaint.	0.20	8	675.00	\$ 135.00
07/15/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare orders re Rule 12 and summary judgment motions for L. Chan review.	5.20	11	295.00	\$ 1,534.00
07/16/13	CHAN, LIN	Research re motions to dismiss.	0.10	8	435.00	\$ 43.50
07/16/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit case management conference proposed order; emails with plaintiff counsel re same and defendants' edits.	0.50	8	675.00	\$ 337.50
07/16/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Rule 12 and summary judgment orders for L. Chan review.	3.50	11	295.00	\$ 1,032.50
07/17/13	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re [REDACTED].	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
07/17/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	295.00	\$ 29.50
07/18/13	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Legal research.	1.50	8	295.00	\$ 442.50
07/18/13	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re [REDACTED].	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
07/18/13	HEIMANN, RICHARD	Review Department of Justice press release.	0.30	9	925.00	\$ 277.50
07/18/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	8	295.00	\$ 29.50
07/22/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare draft notice of appearance for L. Chan.	0.40	8	295.00	\$ 118.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on
Timekeeper: all

From 06/01/13
To 02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/22/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare lead counsel pleadings for E. Fastiff review.	0.20	9	295.00	\$ 59.00
07/23/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	295.00	\$ 59.00
07/25/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze defendants' draft chart re motions to dismiss.	0.10	9	435.00	\$ 43.50
07/25/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Emails with plaintiffs' counsel re defendants' spreadsheet.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
07/25/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with co-lead counsel.	0.90	11	610.00	\$ 549.00
07/25/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for Direct and Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding defendants' spreadsheet.	0.50	11	395.00	\$ 197.50
07/25/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.30	9	295.00	\$ 88.50
07/25/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re factual allegations.	0.20	11	295.00	\$ 59.00
07/26/13	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with defendants re motions to dismiss.	0.30	9	435.00	\$ 130.50
07/26/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze co-counsel email correspondence re motions to dismiss.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
07/26/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze order and transcript re motions to dismiss.	0.50	9	435.00	\$ 217.50
07/26/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Meet and confer telephone conference with plaintiffs' and defendants' counsel re spreadsheet; read defendants' Rule 12 letter and spreadsheet; review case in defendants' letter.	1.20	6	675.00	\$ 810.00
07/26/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with Bonny Sweeney re amended complaint.	0.10	11	675.00	\$ 67.50
07/26/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with defendants regarding spreadsheet for court.	0.30	6	395.00	\$ 118.50
07/26/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	295.00	\$ 29.50
07/26/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare L. Chan notice of appearance for filing.	0.70	8	295.00	\$ 206.50
07/26/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	9	295.00	\$ 59.00
07/26/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re factual allegations.	0.20	11	295.00	\$ 59.00
07/29/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze order re notice of criminal action, sealing documents, letter brief, including exhibits, re motions to dismiss.	2.40	9	435.00	\$ 1,044.00
07/30/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with co-counsel for Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs; correspondence with E. Fastiff regarding assignments; review stipulation.	0.80	11	395.00	\$ 316.00
07/31/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letter to court regarding defendants' motions to dismiss; correspondence with E. Fastiff regarding the same.	2.00	8	395.00	\$ 790.00
07/31/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case authority re motions to dismiss for M. Pilotin review.	0.10	9	295.00	\$ 29.50
07/31/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare orders re status conference for M. Pilotin review.	0.20	9	295.00	\$ 59.00
08/01/13	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for letter brief re motions to dismiss; confer with M. Pilotin re same; draft letter re same.	4.30	8	435.00	\$ 1,870.50
08/01/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with L. Chan regarding letter brief responding to defendants' July 26, 2013 letter to the Court.	0.50	11	395.00	\$ 197.50
08/01/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare settlement filings for L. Chan review.	0.60	12	295.00	\$ 177.00
08/02/13	CHAN, LIN	File notice of appearance.	0.40	6	435.00	\$ 174.00
08/02/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	295.00	\$ 29.50
08/03/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs' and Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs' filings and co-counsel email correspondence re same.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/03/13	CHAN, LIN	Revise and draft letter brief re motion to dismiss.	0.50	8	435.00	\$ 217.50
08/05/13	CHAN, LIN	Revise letter brief re motions to dismiss; draft email correspondence re same.	0.70	8	435.00	\$ 304.50
08/05/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.30	9	295.00	\$ 88.50
08/07/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re letter brief re motion to dismiss; review and analyze email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
08/07/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize pleadings files.	0.20	9	295.00	\$ 59.00
08/07/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	11	295.00	\$ 59.00
08/08/13	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to E. Fastiff, B. Glackin, and M. Pilotin email correspondence re letter brief.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
08/08/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letters regarding motion to dismiss; telephone calls with Aaron Sheanin regarding letters and chart; review and revise chart concerning complaint.	3.00	11	395.00	\$ 1,185.00
08/08/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re case authority to plaintiffs' letter brief.	2.00	8	295.00	\$ 590.00
08/08/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re claims alleged in the third amended complaint for M. Pilotin.	2.20	8	295.00	\$ 649.00
08/09/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare filing of letter regarding defendants' motion to dismiss; telephone calls with Aaron Sheanin regarding the same; correspondence with co-counsel regarding the same.	5.10	11	395.00	\$ 2,014.50
08/09/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re letter brief case citations.	1.20	8	295.00	\$ 354.00
08/09/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case citations re letter brief.	2.00	8	295.00	\$ 590.00
08/12/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze E. Fastiff, co-counsel email correspondence re letter brief.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
08/12/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit briefing limit proposed order.	0.20	8	675.00	\$ 135.00
08/12/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare proposed order regarding briefing; correspondence with co-counsel regarding the same; correspondence with court regarding Excel spreadsheet.	0.70	11	395.00	\$ 276.50
08/12/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	295.00	\$ 59.00
08/12/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re key issues letter brief.	0.40	9	295.00	\$ 118.00
08/12/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re motions letter brief.	0.50	9	295.00	\$ 147.50
08/13/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit proposed order re defendants' Rule 12 briefing.	0.20	8	675.00	\$ 135.00
08/13/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Robert Retana regarding Toshiba service; draft proposed order; confer with Aaron Sheanin regarding the same.	1.00	11	395.00	\$ 395.00
08/14/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	295.00	\$ 29.50
08/14/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re proposed order.	0.50	8	295.00	\$ 147.50
08/14/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.50	9	295.00	\$ 147.50
08/17/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze orders relating civil and criminal cases, proposed order re motions to dismiss, and other related email correspondence.	0.30	9	435.00	\$ 130.50
08/19/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze order relating case.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/19/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit and finalize settlement conference statement; read E, Ink's and A.U. Optronics' settlement conference statements.	3.80	8	675.00	\$ 2,565.00
08/19/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Toshiba service stipulation; conference with M. Pilotin re same.	0.20	8	675.00	\$ 135.00
08/19/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Robert Retana regarding stipulation for Toshiba.	0.10	11	395.00	\$ 39.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/19/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Robert Retana regarding stipulation for Toshiba; review and revise stipulation.	0.50	11	395.00	\$ 197.50
08/19/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	295.00	\$ 29.50
08/20/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with co-counsel regarding stipulation concerning service on Toshiba.	0.20	11	395.00	\$ 79.00
08/23/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Review stipulation with Toshiba regarding complaints.	0.10	11	395.00	\$ 39.50
08/26/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Review order regarding briefing; correspondence to team regarding the same.	0.30	11	395.00	\$ 118.50
08/26/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	295.00	\$ 59.00
08/27/13	CABRASER, ELIZABETH	Review orders, stipulation, memos.	0.70	11	925.00	\$ 647.50
08/30/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.10	11	295.00	\$ 29.50
08/30/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated complaints Legal Language Services and save to file.	0.20	9	295.00	\$ 59.00
09/11/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.20	9	295.00	\$ 59.00
09/16/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin and B. Troxel re case status and document review.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
09/16/13	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to M. Pilotin, E. Fastiff, co-counsel email correspondence and attached documents, orders, and filings.	0.90	11	435.00	\$ 391.50
09/16/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for attorney review.	5.00	7	295.00	\$ 1,475.00
09/16/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar re pending hearing dates.	0.20	11	295.00	\$ 59.00
09/17/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with E. Fastiff, B. Glackin, and co-counsel re motions to dismiss and other work.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
09/17/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze defendants' motion to dismiss; draft memorandum re same.	4.00	9	435.00	\$ 1,740.00
09/17/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Rule 12 motion.	2.10	9	675.00	\$ 1,417.50
09/17/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs' co-lead counsel re responding to Rule 12 motion.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
09/17/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with co-counsel re motion to dismiss briefing; office conference with L. Chan and E. Fastiff re same.	0.80	11	610.00	\$ 488.00
09/17/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.40	9	295.00	\$ 118.00
09/17/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare complaint for B. Glackin review.	0.10	9	295.00	\$ 29.50
09/17/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for attorney review.	3.50	7	295.00	\$ 1,032.50
09/17/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare filings re motions to dismiss for E. Fastiff review.	0.70	9	295.00	\$ 206.50
09/18/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	11	295.00	\$ 59.00
09/19/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with C. Han re motion to dismiss opposition briefing.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
09/19/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs counsel re oppositions to motions to dismiss; draft memorandum re same.	1.30	11	435.00	\$ 565.50
09/19/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze co-counsel and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs counsel email correspondence re motions to dismiss.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
09/19/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze documents re Sanyo criminal sentencing.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
09/19/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs' counsel re Rule 12 oppositions; read briefs.	1.70	9	675.00	\$ 1,147.50
09/19/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team calls with Direct Purchasers re motion to dismiss briefing.	0.60	11	610.00	\$ 366.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/19/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	295.00	\$ 29.50
09/20/13	CHAN, LIN	Attend Sanyo sentencing.	2.80	14	435.00	\$ 1,218.00
09/20/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re Sanyo sentencing.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
09/20/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft oppositions to motions to dismiss.	2.60	8	435.00	\$ 1,131.00
09/20/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze stipulation and proposed order canceling status conference.	0.10	9	435.00	\$ 43.50
09/20/13	CHAN, LIN	Travel to and from hearing re Sanyo sentencing.	1.00	14	435.00	\$ 435.00
09/20/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Rule 12 briefs and research oppositions.	1.80	9	675.00	\$ 1,215.00
09/21/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft oppositions to motions to dismiss, including legal research.	5.70	8	435.00	\$ 2,479.50
09/23/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft oppositions to motions to dismiss, including legal research.	6.00	8	435.00	\$ 2,610.00
09/23/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Rule 12 opposition outlines and briefs.	0.40	9	675.00	\$ 270.00
09/23/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review defendant Grand Jury productions; review draft outlines of oppositions to motion to dismiss.	4.50	8	610.00	\$ 2,745.00
09/24/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Troxel re document review.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
09/24/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs counsel re oppositions to motions to dismiss; confer with B. Glackin re document review.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
09/24/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft opposition briefs to motions to dismiss, including reviewing outlines.	1.20	8	435.00	\$ 522.00
09/24/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read CRT Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs class certification order.	1.80	9	675.00	\$ 1,215.00
09/24/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Grand Jury productions; review outlines of oppositions briefs; telephone conference with Todd Seaver and Judith Zahid; office conference with L. Chan re same.	2.10	9	610.00	\$ 1,281.00
09/24/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare outlines re motions to dismiss for attorney review.	1.20	9	295.00	\$ 354.00
09/25/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	295.00	\$ 29.50
09/26/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Conversion, preparation, and load electronic discovery materials into electronic discovery database.	2.00	7	310.00	\$ 620.00
09/26/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading to CaseMap.	0.40	7	295.00	\$ 118.00
09/27/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Code documents in CaseMap by bates range, date, author, recipient, title, and write a description for B. Glackin and L. Chan.	2.00	11	250.00	\$ 500.00
09/27/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review grand jury production.	0.90	7	610.00	\$ 549.00
09/27/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Conversion, preparation, and load electronic discovery materials into electronic discovery database.	1.00	7	310.00	\$ 310.00
09/27/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for review and coding.	0.20	7	295.00	\$ 59.00
09/30/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Continue to code documents in CaseMap for L. Chan and B. Glackin.	2.50	11	250.00	\$ 625.00
09/30/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review grand jury production.	0.90	9	610.00	\$ 549.00
09/30/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Todd Seaver re opposition brief drafts.	0.20	11	610.00	\$ 122.00
10/01/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft oppositions to motions to dismiss; draft email correspondence re same.	0.40	8	435.00	\$ 174.00
10/01/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Continue to code documents in CaseMap for L. Chan and B. Glackin.	1.30	11	250.00	\$ 325.00
10/01/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Samsung SDI grand jury production.	2.40	9	610.00	\$ 1,464.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/02/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with T. DeSouza re document review.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
10/02/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft oppositions to motions to dismiss.	7.60	8	435.00	\$ 3,306.00
10/02/13	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to co-counsel email correspondence re oppositions to motions to dismiss.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
10/02/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Continue to code documents in CaseMap for B. Glackin and L. Chan.	2.20	11	250.00	\$ 550.00
10/02/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Find criminal proceedings for one of the defendants named in the civil case for L. Chan.	0.50	11	250.00	\$ 125.00
10/02/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Supervise drafting of opposition briefs.	0.20	8	610.00	\$ 122.00
10/03/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft oppositions to motions to dismiss.	12.40	8	435.00	\$ 5,394.00
10/03/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Continue work to code all the documents in the system for L. Chan and B. Glackin.	3.00	11	250.00	\$ 750.00
10/03/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Do research on Panasonic for L. Chan to see if they were ever criminally sued as part of the lithium batteries case.	1.00	11	250.00	\$ 250.00
10/03/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with L. Chan regarding direct purchaser plaintiffs' complaint.	0.10	8	395.00	\$ 39.50
10/04/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft oppositions to motions to dismiss.	7.30	8	435.00	\$ 3,175.50
10/04/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Continue to code documents for L. Chan and B. Glackin.	3.50	11	250.00	\$ 875.00
10/04/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Research criminal docket for LG Chem and find plea agreement for L. Chan.	0.50	11	250.00	\$ 125.00
10/05/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft oppositions to motions to dismiss.	4.70	8	435.00	\$ 2,044.50
10/06/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft oppositions to motions to dismiss.	4.10	8	435.00	\$ 1,783.50
10/06/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise drafts opposition briefs.	4.20	8	610.00	\$ 2,562.00
10/07/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft oppositions to motions to dismiss; confer with B. Glackin re same.	8.60	8	435.00	\$ 3,741.00
10/07/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Continue to code documents for L. Chan and B. Glackin in Summation.	1.50	11	250.00	\$ 375.00
10/07/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise draft opposition briefs; review grand jury production.	5.50	9	610.00	\$ 3,355.00
10/08/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence to co-counsel re oppositions to motions to dismiss.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
10/08/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit oppositions to motions to dismiss; confer with B. Glackin re same.	10.10	8	435.00	\$ 4,393.50
10/08/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Continue to work on coding documents in CaseMap for L. Chan and B. Glackin.	1.00	11	250.00	\$ 250.00
10/08/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Rule 12 opposition brief.	2.20	8	675.00	\$ 1,485.00
10/08/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise draft opposition briefs; office conference with L. Chan re same.	2.10	9	610.00	\$ 1,281.00
10/08/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare [REDACTED] B. Glackin review.	0.20	8	295.00	\$ 59.00
10/09/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with co-counsel and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re oppositions to motions to dismiss; draft email correspondence re same.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
10/09/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft oppositions to motions to dismiss, including legal research.	10.50	8	435.00	\$ 4,567.50
10/09/13	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for arraignment and plea hearings, including reviewing relevant filings and letters.	0.70	14	435.00	\$ 304.50
10/09/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with L. Chan regarding motions to dismiss.	0.30	8	395.00	\$ 118.50
10/09/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	295.00	\$ 29.50
10/09/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare criminal filings for L. Chan review.	0.40	9	295.00	\$ 118.00
10/09/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and code defense productions in CaseMap.	2.30	7	295.00	\$ 678.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/09/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar re pending hearing dates.	0.10	11	295.00	\$ 29.50
10/09/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	7	295.00	\$ 29.50
10/09/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re [REDACTED].	0.10	7	295.00	\$ 29.50
10/09/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.20	9	295.00	\$ 59.00
10/10/13	CHAN, LIN	Attend LG arraignment and sentencing; draft memorandum re same; review documents re same.	2.60	14	435.00	\$ 1,131.00
10/10/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Judith Zahid re oppositions to motions to dismiss.	0.10	8	435.00	\$ 43.50
10/10/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft opposition to Toshiba motion to dismiss.	3.70	8	435.00	\$ 1,609.50
10/10/13	CHAN, LIN	Travel to and from Northern District of California, Oakland for arraignment and sentencing.	1.00	14	435.00	\$ 435.00
10/10/13	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Continue to code documents for batteries for L. Chan and B. Glackin.	2.30	11	250.00	\$ 575.00
10/10/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and code defense productions in CaseMap.	4.00	7	295.00	\$ 1,180.00
10/11/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs and Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs counsel re oppositions to motions to dismiss; draft email correspondence re same.	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
10/11/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft oppositions to motions to dismiss.	7.00	8	435.00	\$ 3,045.00
10/11/13	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to B. Glackin, E. Fastiff, co-counsel, Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs counsel email correspondence re oppositions to motions to dismiss.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
10/11/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise joint opposition to motion to dismiss.	4.60	8	610.00	\$ 2,806.00
10/11/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and code defense productions in Case Map.	1.60	7	295.00	\$ 472.00
10/12/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise joint opposition to motion to dismiss.	1.30	8	610.00	\$ 793.00
10/13/13	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to co-counsel email correspondence re oppositions to motions to dismiss.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
10/14/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re oppositions to motions to dismiss.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
10/14/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Troxel re finalizing oppositions to motions to dismiss.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
10/14/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Judith Zahid re finalizing oppositions to motions to dismiss; draft email correspondence re same.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
10/14/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft and edit oppositions to motions to dismiss.	8.40	8	435.00	\$ 3,654.00
10/14/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs draft opposition to request for judicial notice.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
10/14/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise oppositions to motions to dismiss.	2.30	8	610.00	\$ 1,403.00
10/14/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare redacted invoices for B. Glackin review.	1.50	11	295.00	\$ 442.50
10/14/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and code defense productions for attorney review.	1.50	7	295.00	\$ 442.50
10/14/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit citations re oppositions to motions to dismiss.	1.50	8	295.00	\$ 442.50
10/15/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs and Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs re oppositions to motions to dismiss.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
10/15/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft oppositions to motions to dismiss.	10.50	8	435.00	\$ 4,567.50
10/15/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise motion to dismiss oppositions.	2.70	9	610.00	\$ 1,647.00
10/15/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare opposition briefs re motions to dismiss for filing.	3.50	8	295.00	\$ 1,032.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/16/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft oppositions to motions to dismiss and proposed orders.	6.10	8	435.00	\$ 2,653.50
10/16/13	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs and Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs email correspondence re oppositions of motions to dismiss.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
10/16/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Final review of Motion to dismiss oppositions; supervise filing of same.	3.40	9	610.00	\$ 2,074.00
10/16/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare opposition briefs re motions to dismiss for filing.	0.40	8	295.00	\$ 118.00
10/17/13	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs and Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs counsel email correspondence re motions to dismiss and other litigation matters.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
10/17/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Rule 12 opposition.	2.00	9	675.00	\$ 1,350.00
10/17/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.50	9	295.00	\$ 147.50
10/17/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re oppositions motions to dismiss.	2.00	9	295.00	\$ 590.00
10/18/13	CHAN, LIN	CaseMap training; draft email correspondence re document review.	0.40	9	435.00	\$ 174.00
10/18/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare pleadings for attorney review.	0.50	9	295.00	\$ 147.50
10/18/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.40	11	295.00	\$ 118.00
10/21/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare filings re motions to dismiss for attorney review.	2.50	9	295.00	\$ 737.50
10/22/13	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to co-counsel email correspondence re service and other case management matters.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
10/22/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Translate complaint to Japanese project.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
10/23/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze filings re summons.	0.20	9	435.00	\$ 87.00
10/23/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	295.00	\$ 29.50
10/25/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	295.00	\$ 29.50
10/25/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare complaint for Japanese translation.	1.00	8	295.00	\$ 295.00
10/28/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review hearing transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	295.00	\$ 29.50
10/31/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze co-counsel email correspondence re complaint and service.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
10/31/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email translation service re status of translated complaint for E. Fastiff.	0.30	8	295.00	\$ 88.50
11/05/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re document review and litigation strategy.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
11/06/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze defendants' replies in support of motions to dismiss.	0.80	9	435.00	\$ 348.00
11/07/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze reply briefs in support of motions to dismiss; draft memorandum re same.	2.50	9	435.00	\$ 1,087.50
11/07/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read L. Chan memorandum re Rule 12 reply brief.	0.10	11	675.00	\$ 67.50
11/07/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings re motions to dismiss and save to file.	0.20	9	295.00	\$ 59.00
11/11/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare filings re motions to dismiss for L. Chan review.	0.50	9	295.00	\$ 147.50
11/11/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated complaint and save to file.	0.20	9	295.00	\$ 59.00
11/12/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare invoice re translated complaint for payment.	0.40	9	295.00	\$ 118.00
11/13/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare summons for translation.	0.30	8	295.00	\$ 88.50
11/15/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated summons and save to file.	0.20	8	295.00	\$ 59.00
11/19/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare summons translation invoice for payment.	0.30	8	295.00	\$ 88.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/20/13	GRANT, ANTHONY	Troubleshoot database issues. Maintenance of discovery database.	3.00	7	310.00	\$ 930.00
11/20/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	295.00	\$ 59.00
11/20/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	11	295.00	\$ 59.00
11/25/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze documents produced by defendants.	3.80	7	435.00	\$ 1,653.00
11/25/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with L. Chan regarding CaseMap for evidence organization.	0.10	1	395.00	\$ 39.50
11/25/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense production documents for L. Chan review.	3.50	7	295.00	\$ 1,032.50
11/26/13	CABRASER, ELIZABETH	Correspondence with counsel re motion to dismiss argument.	1.00	8	925.00	\$ 925.00
11/26/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with L. Chan regarding defendants' letter concerning motion to dismiss hearing.	0.10	11	395.00	\$ 39.50
11/27/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re oral argument for motions to dismiss and document review.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
11/27/13	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to co-counsel, E. Fastiff email correspondence re letter to court re motion to dismiss hearing; revise letter to court.	1.10	11	435.00	\$ 478.50
11/27/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze documents produced by defendants.	2.80	7	435.00	\$ 1,218.00
11/27/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with L. Chan regarding defendants' letter concerning oral argument.	0.10	9	395.00	\$ 39.50
12/01/13	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for motion to dismiss hearing, including reviewing and analyzing sentencing hearing transcripts and complaint.	0.50	14	435.00	\$ 217.50
12/02/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin, B. Troxel, and Jon King re motion to dismiss hearing.	0.60	14	435.00	\$ 261.00
12/02/13	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for motion to dismiss hearing, including reviewing briefing, other pleadings, hearing transcripts, and legal research.	7.90	14	435.00	\$ 3,436.50
12/02/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze Direct Purchaser list of counsel appearing for hearing; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	9	435.00	\$ 87.00
12/02/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Steve Williams; telephone conference with Steve Berman; memorandum to Rick Saveri; office conference with L. Chan re Twombly arguments.	0.60	11	610.00	\$ 366.00
12/02/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	295.00	\$ 59.00
12/02/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation re motions to dismiss.	1.00	14	295.00	\$ 295.00
12/02/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated complaint re formatting issues.	0.20	8	295.00	\$ 59.00
12/03/13	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for motion to dismiss hearing, including legal research, drafting outline, reviewing briefing.	11.80	14	435.00	\$ 5,133.00
12/03/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation re motion to dismiss.	3.40	14	295.00	\$ 1,003.00
12/03/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review revised translated complaint and save to file.	0.10	8	295.00	\$ 29.50
12/04/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Direct Purchasers re motion to dismiss hearing.	0.70	14	435.00	\$ 304.50
12/04/13	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for motion to dismiss hearing, including legal research.	12.20	14	435.00	\$ 5,307.00
12/04/13	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to co-counsel, E. Fastiff email correspondence re motion to dismiss hearing.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
12/04/13	CHAN, LIN	Travel to and from conference with Direct Purchasers re motion to dismiss hearing.	0.30	14	435.00	\$ 130.50
12/04/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Plaintiff counsel call re Rule 12 hearing.	0.50	14	675.00	\$ 337.50
12/04/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with L. Chan regarding motion to dismiss argument.	0.20	11	395.00	\$ 79.00
12/04/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with L. Chan regarding motion to dismiss hearing.	0.70	11	395.00	\$ 276.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/04/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation re motions to dismiss.	0.50	14	295.00	\$ 147.50
12/05/13	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for motion to dismiss hearing, including legal research, confer with E. Fastiff and B. Glackin, and draft outline.	13.40	14	435.00	\$ 5,829.00
12/05/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Prepare for Rule 12 hearing with B. Glackin and L. Chan.	1.50	14	675.00	\$ 1,012.50
12/05/13	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Moot argument with L. Chan.	1.10	11	610.00	\$ 671.00
12/05/13	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with L. Chan regarding motion to dismiss argument.	0.20	11	395.00	\$ 79.00
12/05/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation re motions to dismiss.	2.30	14	295.00	\$ 678.50
12/06/13	CABRASER, ELIZABETH	Conference with E. Fastiff re motion to dismiss hearing, case and class strategy.	1.00	11	925.00	\$ 925.00
12/06/13	CHAN, LIN	Attend hearing re motion to dismiss.	2.30	14	435.00	\$ 1,000.50
12/06/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case status.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
12/06/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with co-counsel re motion to dismiss hearing.	0.70	14	435.00	\$ 304.50
12/06/13	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re motion to dismiss hearing.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
12/06/13	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for hearing re motion to dismiss.	1.00	14	435.00	\$ 435.00
12/06/13	CHAN, LIN	Travel to and from hearing re motion to dismiss.	1.00	14	435.00	\$ 435.00
12/06/13	FASTIFF, ERIC	Rule 12 hearing; travel to and from Oakland court house.	3.10	14	675.00	\$ 2,092.50
12/06/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	295.00	\$ 29.50
12/06/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review hearing summary and save to file.	0.10	14	295.00	\$ 29.50
12/10/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.30	11	295.00	\$ 88.50
12/16/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with E. Fastiff re case status; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
12/16/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze Grand Jury production.	0.10	7	435.00	\$ 43.50
12/17/13	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case status.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
12/17/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review document productions re translation status for L. Chan.	2.00	7	295.00	\$ 590.00
12/18/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Grand Jury production re status of untranslated documents for L. Chan.	3.30	7	295.00	\$ 973.50
12/19/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare index of untranslated production documents for L. Chan.	2.50	7	295.00	\$ 737.50
12/20/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze defense counsel correspondence re Grand Jury production; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
12/20/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze Grand Jury production; confer with Aaron Sheanin re same.	1.20	7	435.00	\$ 522.00
12/21/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze stipulations filed with court.	0.10	9	435.00	\$ 43.50
12/23/13	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to co-counsel email correspondence re case strategy.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
12/23/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze Sony correspondence; draft email correspondence re same.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
12/23/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and code documents on CaseMap.	2.50	7	435.00	\$ 1,087.50
12/24/13	CHAN, LIN	Review documents and code on CaseMap.	0.90	7	435.00	\$ 391.50
12/26/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze documents; code on CaseMap.	2.90	7	435.00	\$ 1,261.50
12/27/13	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze documents; code on CaseMap.	1.00	7	435.00	\$ 435.00
12/30/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	295.00	\$ 29.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/30/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	295.00	\$ 118.00
12/30/13	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re translated documents for L. Chan.	0.30	7	295.00	\$ 88.50
01/02/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re untranslated documents for L. Chan's review.	1.70	7	305.00	\$ 518.50
01/02/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
01/02/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
01/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
01/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and edit letter to court re Grand Jury production; review and respond to email correspondence re same.	0.40	9	465.00	\$ 186.00
01/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to B. Glackin, E. Fastiff, and co-counsel email correspondence and attached drafts re meet and confer re Grand Jury production.	0.30	6	465.00	\$ 139.50
01/06/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Sanyo and Sony production letters.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
01/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
01/08/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with Lesley Weaver re production.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
01/08/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin re case management conference statement.	0.40	11	650.00	\$ 260.00
01/08/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding document collection.	0.20	11	415.00	\$ 83.00
01/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft case management conference statement.	1.10	8	465.00	\$ 511.50
01/09/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Lesley Weaver regarding document collection.	0.40	11	415.00	\$ 166.00
01/09/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re case schedule for L. Chan.	0.50	11	305.00	\$ 152.50
01/09/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
01/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft case management conference statement.	0.10	8	465.00	\$ 46.50
01/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze defendants' correspondence re Grand Jury production.	0.30	6	465.00	\$ 139.50
01/10/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with B. Glackin regarding document collection inquiry from Lesley Weaver.	0.40	11	415.00	\$ 166.00
01/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise draft case management conference statement.	2.40	9	465.00	\$ 1,116.00
01/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze draft case management conference statement and reply to email correspondence re same.	0.50	8	465.00	\$ 232.50
01/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze draft correspondence re meet and confer re Grand Jury production; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	6	465.00	\$ 93.00
01/13/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise draft case management conference.	0.80	9	650.00	\$ 520.00
01/13/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with B. Glackin regarding document collection; investigate notice issues regarding [REDACTED].	0.50	11	415.00	\$ 207.50
01/13/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare complaint for E. Fastiff review.	0.30	9	305.00	\$ 91.50
01/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft case management conference statement.	0.30	9	465.00	\$ 139.50
01/14/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Further review/revise case management conference statement; emails with co-counsel re same.	1.30	9	650.00	\$ 845.00
01/14/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise case management conference statement; telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin re same.	0.60	9	650.00	\$ 390.00
01/15/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Sony and Panasonic letters; review draft case management conference.	0.90	8	700.00	\$ 630.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/15/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise draft case management conference statement.	0.90	8	650.00	\$ 585.00
01/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze defense counsel, co-counsel, B. Glackin, and E. Fastiff email correspondence and attached documents re case management conference and document production.	1.20	11	465.00	\$ 558.00
01/16/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
01/16/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and save to file.	3.00	7	305.00	\$ 915.00
01/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Aaron Sheanin re case management conference statement.	0.20	9	465.00	\$ 93.00
01/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with co-counsel re Grand Jury production.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
01/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Dugar re document review platform; draft email correspondence re same.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
01/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze draft response to motion to continue case management conference and correspondence re same and grand jury production; draft email correspondence re same; confer with B. Glackin re same; draft case management conference statement.	2.40	9	465.00	\$ 1,116.00
01/17/14	DUGAR, KIRTI	Follow up on email from L. Chan re comparative vendor proposals, costs and offerings.	1.00	7	410.00	\$ 410.00
01/17/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Draft case management conference statement.	0.50	8	700.00	\$ 350.00
01/17/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit opposition to defendants' motion to continue case management conference.	0.40	8	700.00	\$ 280.00
01/17/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with co-lead Indirect Purchaser (IPP) counsel re document review.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
01/17/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Todd Seaver re case management conference statement; memorandum re same. Telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin re case management conference statement.	1.10	11	650.00	\$ 715.00
01/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
01/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery binder re defense productions.	1.20	9	305.00	\$ 366.00
01/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	305.00	\$ 122.00
01/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.30	9	305.00	\$ 91.50
01/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review hearing transcript and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
01/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze correspondence re discovery matters and case management conference statement; draft email correspondence re same.	0.40	6	465.00	\$ 186.00
01/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze Court orders re motions to dismiss and case management conference; draft memorandum and email correspondence re same.	2.00	9	465.00	\$ 930.00
01/21/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Rule 12 order.	0.60	9	700.00	\$ 420.00
01/21/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review order on motions to dismiss; office conference with E. Fastiff; email memoranda re orders of court.	1.10	11	650.00	\$ 715.00
01/21/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.40	9	305.00	\$ 122.00
01/21/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize production files.	1.00	9	305.00	\$ 305.00
01/21/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	305.00	\$ 122.00
01/21/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.50	9	305.00	\$ 152.50
01/21/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production document and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
01/22/14	BERNSTEIN, WILLIAM	Conference with B. Glackin re ruling on motion to dismiss.	0.30	11	925.00	\$ 277.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/22/14	CABRASER, ELIZABETH	Review court orders on motion to dismiss, status conference.	1.00	11	950.00	\$ 950.00
01/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to co-counsel, B. Glackin, K. Dugar email correspondence re litigation strategy, and order re motion to dismiss.	0.70	11	465.00	\$ 325.50
01/22/14	DUGAR, KIRTI	Follow up with vendors re revised hosting quotes; update comparison chart.	2.50	8	410.00	\$ 1,025.00
01/22/14	FINEMAN, STEVEN	Read order dismissing Indirect Purchaser and Direct Purchaser claims; email exchange with E. Fastiff re same.	0.50	11	825.00	\$ 412.50
01/22/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Review order on motions to dismiss.	0.40	11	415.00	\$ 166.00
01/22/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
01/22/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.30	9	305.00	\$ 91.50
01/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Aaron Sheanin re joint statement; draft email correspondence re same.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
01/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with co-counsel and B. Glackin, including separate confer with B. Glackin re case strategy, document review, and joint statement.	1.00	11	465.00	\$ 465.00
01/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Noguchi re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
01/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence to B. Troxel and B. Glackin re document review.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
01/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze memoranda re electronically stored information vendors; confer with K. Dugar re same; draft memorandum re same.	0.80	11	465.00	\$ 372.00
01/23/14	DUGAR, KIRTI	Further review of hosting quotes from vendors; emails from L. Chan re same.	1.00	7	410.00	\$ 410.00
01/23/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Co-counsel call re document review, amendment, etc.	0.90	11	650.00	\$ 585.00
01/23/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with B. Glackin and L. Chan regarding document review.	0.10	11	415.00	\$ 41.50
01/23/14	YAMAT, CYRUS	Copy documents to local network location. Examine production sent by defense.	3.00	7	320.00	\$ 960.00
01/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Call Aaron Sheanin re joint statement.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
01/24/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Decrypt disk and copy to hard drive.	2.00	7	320.00	\$ 640.00
01/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze expense and time reports; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
01/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze co-counsel email correspondence re joint statement.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
01/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze draft joint statement; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
01/27/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Todd Seaver.	0.40	11	650.00	\$ 260.00
01/27/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Todd Seaver; memorandum to co-leads re compliance with order.	0.50	11	650.00	\$ 325.00
01/27/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Decrypt file in the hard drive then copy to compiled production.	1.50	13	320.00	\$ 480.00
01/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Troxel re document review.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
01/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze draft joint statement.	0.10	8	465.00	\$ 46.50
01/28/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Joe Tabacco and Todd Seaver; telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin.	0.70	11	650.00	\$ 455.00
01/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare index re defense productions for L. Chan's review.	3.00	7	305.00	\$ 915.00
01/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	305.00	\$ 91.50
01/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and save to file.	1.30	7	305.00	\$ 396.50
01/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re untranslated productions for L. Chan.	1.00	7	305.00	\$ 305.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Call Jon King re [REDACTED].	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
01/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with [REDACTED].	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
01/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Dugar re electronically stored information vendors and document review; draft email re same.	0.60	7	465.00	\$ 279.00
01/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with M. Pilotin re document review plan.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
01/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft plan for document review; review documents produced; confer with K. Jones and B. Glackin re same; draft email re same.	3.00	7	465.00	\$ 1,395.00
01/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Direct Purchasers (DPPs) and defendants re joint statement.	0.60	6	465.00	\$ 279.00
01/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze co-counsel and Direct Purchasers email correspondence and attached documents re joint statement and document review; draft email correspondence re same.	1.10	11	465.00	\$ 511.50
01/29/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit draft joint case management conference statement and telephone conference with plaintiffs' and defendants' counsel re draft statement.	1.00	8	700.00	\$ 700.00
01/29/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit prepared document review memorandum and plan.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
01/29/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with plaintiff counsel and Jim McGinnis re evidence.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
01/29/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Call with defendants re joint statement.	0.50	11	650.00	\$ 325.00
01/29/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with L. Chan regarding document review plan.	0.30	11	415.00	\$ 124.50
01/29/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re translated production documents for L. Chan review.	0.50	7	305.00	\$ 152.50
01/30/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Review document discovery review plan memorandum.	0.20	9	700.00	\$ 140.00
01/31/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze draft joint statement.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
01/31/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Finalize submission re time reporting.	2.90	11	650.00	\$ 1,885.00
01/31/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
01/31/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare time reports for in camera review.	1.70	8	305.00	\$ 518.50
01/31/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
01/31/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re encrypted passwords and save to file.	0.40	9	305.00	\$ 122.00
02/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Aaron Sheanin re document production; draft email correspondence re same.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
02/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to defense, Indirect Purchaser (IPP), and Direct Purchaser (DPP) email correspondence re GS Yuasa International production and other grand jury production matters.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
02/03/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Decrypt and copy two volumes to the compile production hard drive.	1.50	13	320.00	\$ 480.00
02/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
02/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.30	9	305.00	\$ 91.50
02/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize production files.	0.40	7	305.00	\$ 122.00
02/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
02/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Panasonic production and prepare for downloading.	0.70	7	305.00	\$ 213.50
02/03/14	YAMAT, CYRUS	Duplicate CDs and DVDs.	2.50	11	320.00	\$ 800.00
02/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft motion for administrative relief allowing telephonic appearance; file same; email co-counsel re same.	1.10	8	465.00	\$ 511.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze document produced by Sony; confer with B. Troxel and Aaron Sheanin re same.	0.60	7	465.00	\$ 279.00
02/04/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
02/04/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Sony production and prepare status re production issues for L. Chan.	5.50	7	305.00	\$ 1,677.50
02/05/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
02/05/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re motion for telephonic appearance.	0.40	9	305.00	\$ 122.00
02/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin, E. Fastiff, and K. Lubin re case status and hearing.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
02/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re grand jury production; draft email correspondence re same.	0.70	6	465.00	\$ 325.50
02/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for hearing, including reviewing submissions and related correspondence; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
02/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze draft discovery request and email correspondence re same.	0.50	2	465.00	\$ 232.50
02/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze meet and confer correspondence re Sony grand jury production.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
02/06/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Prepare for case management conference.	0.40	14	700.00	\$ 280.00
02/06/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet and confer with Sony.	0.50	6	650.00	\$ 325.00
02/06/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet with L. Chan and E. Fastiff.	0.50	11	650.00	\$ 325.00
02/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
02/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare for E. Cabraser telephonic appearance.	0.40	14	305.00	\$ 122.00
02/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Attend strategy meeting with co-counsel re case management hearing and discovery (two meetings).	1.30	11	465.00	\$ 604.50
02/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re status hearing.	1.00	11	465.00	\$ 465.00
02/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze defendants' letter re motion to strike nationwide class allegations; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	9	465.00	\$ 93.00
02/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze Panasonic correspondence re Grand Jury production and defense counsel correspondence re motions to dismiss; review co-counsel email correspondence re same.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
02/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Travel to and from strategy meeting with co-counsel re case management hearing and discovery.	1.00	11	465.00	\$ 465.00
02/07/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Scott Joiner letter from defendants re motion to strike certain class allegations.	0.10	9	700.00	\$ 70.00
02/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
02/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Status hearing preparation.	0.50	14	305.00	\$ 152.50
02/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Indirect Purchaser co-counsel, E. Fastiff, B. Glackin re document review and briefing; separate conference with E. Fastiff, B. Glackin re same.	0.80	11	465.00	\$ 372.00
02/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Dugar re Catalyst document review platform.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
02/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to court re class allegations; legal research re same.	2.20	8	465.00	\$ 1,023.00
02/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to Jon King email correspondence and attached documents re document review.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
02/10/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Plaintiff counsel conference call re document review and reporting to Rule 12 motions.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
02/10/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Research response to Scott Joiner letter and edit draft letter.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/10/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with co-lead counsel.	0.40	11	650.00	\$ 260.00
02/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
02/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.40	11	305.00	\$ 122.00
02/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.60	11	305.00	\$ 183.00
02/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize production files.	0.50	7	305.00	\$ 152.50
02/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
02/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Panasonic and Sanyo productions and prepare for loading.	1.00	7	305.00	\$ 305.00
02/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status conference summary and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
02/11/14	CARNAM, TODD	Attempt to find for L. Chan certain case incorrectly cited to.	0.80	1	305.00	\$ 244.00
02/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jon King, Ronnie Spiegel, Nancy Fineman, and others re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	1.20	11	465.00	\$ 558.00
02/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Dugar re document review platform; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
02/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Research re [REDACTED].	2.70	1	465.00	\$ 1,255.50
02/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and edit draft letter to Steering Committee.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
02/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze documents produced by defendants.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
02/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze electronically stored information platform draft contract.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
02/11/14	DUGAR, KIRTI	Follow up on database set up; conference call with L. Chan.	1.00	7	410.00	\$ 410.00
02/11/14	DUGAR, KIRTI	Follow up with L. Chan and Catalyst re upload of data and final execution agreement.	1.00	7	410.00	\$ 410.00
02/11/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Copy additional data from P:/ drive to hard drive.	1.50	7	320.00	\$ 480.00
02/11/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Decrypt two disks and copy to the hard drive.	2.50	7	320.00	\$ 800.00
02/11/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading by Catalyst.	0.60	7	305.00	\$ 183.00
02/11/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re responses to Massachusetts Consumer Protection Act demand.	1.50	8	305.00	\$ 457.50
02/11/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Panasonic and Sanyo productions and prepare for loading.	0.60	7	305.00	\$ 183.00
02/12/14	CARNAM, TODD	Follow-up work trying to run down a citation.	0.20	1	305.00	\$ 61.00
02/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin and K. Dugar re Catalyst contract.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
02/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re document review.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
02/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Susman Godfrey re document review; confer with E. Fastiff re same.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
02/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re [REDACTED].	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
02/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to co-counsel email correspondence re discovery matters.	0.70	11	465.00	\$ 325.50
02/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze defendants' letter re motions to dismiss.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
02/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze electronically stored information vendor contract; draft email correspondence re same.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
02/12/14	DUGAR, KIRTI	Emails regarding master hosting agreement and revisions to same; calls to Catalyst to revise agreement.	1.00	7	410.00	\$ 410.00
02/12/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Document review preparation.	0.40	7	700.00	\$ 280.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/12/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	305.00	\$ 122.00
02/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin and E. Fastiff re case strategy.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
02/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re document review plan.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
02/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with co-counsel and B. Glackin re document review.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
02/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Dugar re electronically stored information platform; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
02/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with T. You and K. Jones re foreign language reviewers.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
02/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to defendants re Massachusetts notice.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
02/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for and draft memorandum re [REDACTED].	0.90	11	465.00	\$ 418.50
02/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for confer with H. Rim re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	0.70	11	465.00	\$ 325.50
02/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to B. Troxel, Ronnie Spiegel email correspondence re document review; edit memorandum re same.	2.70	11	465.00	\$ 1,255.50
02/13/14	DUGAR, KIRTI	Several conference calls with Catalyst re proposed contract; review same; calls from L. Chan re same.	1.50	7	410.00	\$ 615.00
02/13/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review vendor contract. Team call re document review; office conference with L. Chan and E. Fastiff.	1.60	11	650.00	\$ 1,040.00
02/13/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Copy DVD to hard drive and ship to Catalyst.	3.00	13	320.00	\$ 960.00
02/13/14	RIM, HISUN	Prepare to begin document review; review case materials.	0.30	7	260.00	\$ 78.00
02/13/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
02/13/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense production and prepare for copying and loading.	0.50	7	305.00	\$ 152.50
02/13/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re defense production passwords for L. Chan.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
02/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Call Steven Williams and Jeff Friedman re motions to dismiss.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
02/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Call with Nancy Fineman re Catalyst contract.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
02/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re briefing and document review.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
02/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review.	0.80	11	465.00	\$ 372.00
02/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Dugar and A. McDaniel re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	0.90	11	465.00	\$ 418.50
02/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with M. Pilotin re response to defendants' letter re motions to dismiss.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
02/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re document review.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
02/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Shinae Kim-Helms re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
02/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with translation vendor; confer with Veronica Glaze re same.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
02/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with T. You re Japanese reviewers.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
02/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence to H. Rim and Shinae Kim Helms re document review.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
02/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to defendants re Massachusetts notice; legal research re same.	1.90	11	465.00	\$ 883.50
02/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum and email correspondence re document review; respond to email correspondence re same.	1.00	11	465.00	\$ 465.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to Aaron Sheanin and defense counsel email correspondence re document production.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
02/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to T. You, H. Rim, Steven Williams email correspondence re foreign language reviewers and document production and translation.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
02/14/14	DUGAR, KIRTI	Emails with Catalyst; check progress of database setup.	1.00	7	410.00	\$ 410.00
02/14/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Emails and conferences with L. Chan and B. Glackin re document review; telephone conference with Bonny Sweeney re same.	1.00	11	700.00	\$ 700.00
02/14/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan; telephone conference with Jennie Anderson; office conference with H. Rim.	1.10	11	650.00	\$ 715.00
02/14/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan; telephone conference with Steve Williams and Jeff Friedman; office conference with M. Pilotin.	0.90	11	650.00	\$ 585.00
02/14/14	GRANT, ANTHONY	Conversion, preparation, load and optical character recognition of electronic discovery documents for use with electronic discovery documents database.	3.00	11	320.00	\$ 960.00
02/14/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review; preparation for coding; review background materials and calls and emails with E. Fastiff, L. Chan and H. Rim.	2.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
02/14/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with B. Glackin and L. Chan regarding letter to defendants.	0.40	11	415.00	\$ 166.00
02/14/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	7.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,820.00
02/14/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
02/14/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for review and loading by Catalyst.	0.70	7	305.00	\$ 213.50
02/14/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare translated documents for review by Shinae Kim Helms.	0.50	7	305.00	\$ 152.50
02/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re Catalyst contract.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
02/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to email correspondence re translation vendors; confer with translation vendors re pricing.	0.80	11	465.00	\$ 372.00
02/15/14	CHAN, LIN		0.70	11	465.00	\$ 325.50
02/16/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review; preparation for coding; review of background materials.	3.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,545.00
02/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to defendants re motions to dismiss; confer with M. Pilotin re same.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
02/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to co-counsel email correspondence re electronically stored information platform.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
02/17/14	CHAN, LIN		0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
02/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to translation vendor email correspondence re rates and service.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
02/17/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft letter responding to defendants' letter regarding Phase II motions to dismiss.	4.70	8	415.00	\$ 1,950.50
02/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs and Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs re document review process; draft email correspondence re same.	0.70	7	465.00	\$ 325.50
02/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to Ronnie Spiegel email correspondence re document review.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
02/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze documents for translation; confer with K. Dugar re same.	0.30	7	465.00	\$ 139.50
02/18/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review; prepare for coding; review of background materials.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
02/18/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Respond and explain the issue in volume uploaded to file-transfer protocol.	0.30	11	320.00	\$ 96.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/18/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Respond to email regarding load file issue.	0.20	13	320.00	\$ 64.00
02/18/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letter to defendants regarding motions to dismiss.	1.50	8	415.00	\$ 622.50
02/18/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	5.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,300.00
02/18/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case management orders for M. Pilotin's review.	0.40	9	305.00	\$ 122.00
02/18/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	11	305.00	\$ 61.00
02/18/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	305.00	\$ 122.00
02/18/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading.	1.00	7	305.00	\$ 305.00
02/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with foreign language reviewers and Ronnie Spiegel re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
02/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence to co-counsel re electronically stored information platform.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
02/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to vendor email correspondence re document review and translation.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
02/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze memoranda re document review issues; review, analyze, and respond to email correspondence re same.	2.10	11	465.00	\$ 976.50
02/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze order re future motions to dismiss.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
02/19/14	DUGAR, KIRTI	Follow up with team and Catalyst re database and loading of documents; emails from L. Chan re training; review database.	1.50	7	410.00	\$ 615.00
02/19/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review; prepare for coding; review of background materials and development of list of important Japanese terms for case.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
02/19/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Upload two replacement volumes to file-transfer protocol.	2.00	11	320.00	\$ 640.00
02/19/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft letter responding to defendants' letter concerning motion to dismiss.	2.50	8	415.00	\$ 1,037.50
02/19/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
02/19/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
02/19/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.50	11	305.00	\$ 152.50
02/19/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Catalyst contract and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
02/19/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review hearing transcript and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
02/19/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Sony production and prepare for loading.	0.60	7	305.00	\$ 183.00
02/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with defendants re discovery; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
02/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs and Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs counsel re discovery conference.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
02/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Veronica Glaze and Ronnie Spiegel re translation vendors.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
02/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence to Catalyst re electronically stored information platform.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
02/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for call re translation vendors, including reviewing documents and proposals.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
02/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to co-counsel email correspondence re discovery matters.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
02/20/14	DUGAR, KIRTI	Review database and follow up with Catalyst re training and foreign language documents issue.	1.00	7	410.00	\$ 410.00
02/20/14	GRANT, ANTHONY	Preparation, conversion, and upload electronic discovery to file transfer protocol server, for use with electronic discovery database.	5.00	7	320.00	\$ 1,600.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/20/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review; prepare for coding; review of background materials and development of list of important Japanese terms for case.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
02/20/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Upload volume "P-DOJ" to file-transfer protocol for posting.	2.00	11	320.00	\$ 640.00
02/20/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
02/20/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email Josh Schmitt re Catalyst training session.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
02/20/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar re pending hearing dates.	0.10	11	305.00	\$ 30.50
02/20/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize production files.	0.40	9	305.00	\$ 122.00
02/20/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	1.50	7	305.00	\$ 457.50
02/20/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re defense productions for loading by Catalyst.	1.50	7	305.00	\$ 457.50
02/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Attend Catalyst training.	1.70	11	465.00	\$ 790.50
02/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel, H. Rim, and Shinae Kim-Helms re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	0.70	11	465.00	\$ 325.50
02/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and edit draft order re motion to dismiss deadlines.	0.70	8	465.00	\$ 325.50
02/21/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review; preparation for coding; review of background materials and development of list of important Japanese terms for case.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
02/21/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letter regarding defendants' letter regarding motion to dismiss; correspondence with co-counsel regarding the same.	1.60	8	415.00	\$ 664.00
02/21/14	RIM, HISUN	Call with L. Chan re document review; foreign language document review and management projects.	5.50	7	260.00	\$ 1,430.00
02/21/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Meeting re Catalyst document review platform.	1.50	7	305.00	\$ 457.50
02/21/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review procedures re Catalyst document review software.	0.50	7	305.00	\$ 152.50
02/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze defense counsel and co-counsel email correspondence re discovery matters and motions to dismiss.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
02/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.80	11	465.00	\$ 372.00
02/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs and co-counsel email correspondence re proposed order; review filings and hearing transcript re same.	2.20	11	465.00	\$ 1,023.00
02/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with E. Fastiff, B. Glackin, M. Pilotin, and B. Troxel re case management.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
02/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with potential foreign language reviewers and T. You re document review project; draft email correspondence re same.	1.10	11	465.00	\$ 511.50
02/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
02/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re case management issues.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
02/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to Ronnie Spiegel and co-counsel email correspondence re document review and other case management matters.	2.20	11	465.00	\$ 1,023.00
02/24/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with B. Glackin, L. Chan, M. Pilotin and B. Troxel re document review and proposed case management order.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
02/24/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Finalize proposed case management order.	0.20	8	700.00	\$ 140.00
02/24/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review; preparation for coding; review of background materials and development of list of important Japanese terms for case; searches in Catalyst database.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/24/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Create cross reference file for all data sent to Catalyst and upload new data for posting via file-transfer protocol.	2.00	11	320.00	\$ 640.00
02/24/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Attend meeting with E. Fastiff, B. Glackin, L. Chan, and B. Troxel re case planning.	0.30	11	415.00	\$ 124.50
02/24/14	RIM, HISUN	Prepare foreign language document review projects for reviewers.	8.90	7	260.00	\$ 2,314.00
02/24/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Meeting re case status.	0.40	11	305.00	\$ 122.00
02/24/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading and review by Catalyst.	1.70	7	305.00	\$ 518.50
02/24/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
02/24/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	11	305.00	\$ 61.00
02/24/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	305.00	\$ 91.50
02/24/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review production correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
02/24/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re defense production bates numbers for Catalyst.	0.60	7	305.00	\$ 183.00
02/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Call Steve Williams re foreign language reviewers.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
02/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Ronnie Spiegel and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re document review.	0.70	11	465.00	\$ 325.50
02/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Ronnie Spiegel, H. Rim, and Shinae Kim-Helms re document review.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
02/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Noguchi re document review.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
02/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and edit memorandum re document review instructions.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
02/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to Ronnie Spiegel, Steve Williams, E. Fastiff, B. Glackin, co-counsel email correspondence re document review and discovery matters.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
02/25/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise summary of discovery conference.	0.90	11	650.00	\$ 585.00
02/25/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review; preparation for coding; review of background materials and development of list of important Japanese terms for case; searches in Catalyst database.	6.50	7	515.00	\$ 3,347.50
02/25/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Respond to all communication regarding data sent to Catalyst.	0.80	11	320.00	\$ 256.00
02/25/14	RIM, HISUN	Call with L. Chan re document review; conduct research on California contacts; create list of Defendant information; research American subsidiaries; create sample reviewer notes for the foreign language document review team.	8.70	7	260.00	\$ 2,262.00
02/25/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for review and loading by Catalyst.	3.00	7	305.00	\$ 915.00
02/25/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare hearing transcript for E. Fastiff review.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
02/25/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.60	9	305.00	\$ 183.00
02/25/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review draft index re cast of characters and save to file.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
02/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Attend and give training re document review.	1.70	7	465.00	\$ 790.50
02/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for motions to dismiss.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
02/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for training with document reviewers; draft and review email correspondence re document review.	1.30	7	465.00	\$ 604.50
02/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Review documents and assign batches; confer with Ronnie Spiegel re same.	1.20	7	465.00	\$ 558.00
02/26/14	JONES, KAREN	Document Review - Batch SANYO_JP_00001.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
02/26/14	RIM, HISUN	Draft search terms for foreign language documents.	9.20	7	260.00	\$ 2,392.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/26/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for review and loading by Catalyst.	1.20	7	305.00	\$ 366.00
02/26/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated defense production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
02/27/14	CABRASER, ELIZABETH	Review/revise joint statement; correspondence re same.	0.50	8	950.00	\$ 475.00
02/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze notes and memoranda re case management issues and document review; draft email correspondence re same.	0.80	11	465.00	\$ 372.00
02/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Revise joint statement re discovery conference.	2.50	11	465.00	\$ 1,162.50
02/27/14	JONES, KAREN	Document Review - Batch SANYO_JP_00001.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
02/27/14	RIM, HISUN	Document review database training (Advance); assemble hot documents; research defendants' contacts with California.	8.70	7	260.00	\$ 2,262.00
02/27/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense production and prepare for loading.	1.00	7	305.00	\$ 305.00
02/28/14	CARNAM, TODD	Research [REDACTED].	0.60	1	305.00	\$ 183.00
02/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with amnesty applicant; confer with B. Glackin re same and case management.	1.30	11	465.00	\$ 604.50
02/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
02/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re document review issues; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
02/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re [REDACTED].	1.30	11	465.00	\$ 604.50
02/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to co-counsel and defense counsel email correspondence re Joint Statement.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
02/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Review documents and draft email correspondence re document batches; respond to email correspondence re document review.	1.60	7	465.00	\$ 744.00
02/28/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jim McGinnis; office conference with L. Chan.	1.40	11	650.00	\$ 910.00
02/28/14	JONES, KAREN	Document Review - Batch SANYO_JP_00001.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
02/28/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects; document review database training (Catalyst).	4.50	7	260.00	\$ 1,170.00
02/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit master production log.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
03/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to email correspondence re document review; review Grand Jury documents.	1.30	7	465.00	\$ 604.50
03/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze proposed stipulations re motions to dismiss; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
03/01/14	RIM, HISUN	Create a case-wide Japanese vocabulary list.	0.30	7	260.00	\$ 78.00
03/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to email correspondence re document review; review Grand Jury documents.	0.60	7	465.00	\$ 279.00
03/02/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	0.30	7	260.00	\$ 78.00
03/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs, H. Rim, and Ronnie Spiegel re document review strategy; draft email correspondence re same.	0.90	7	465.00	\$ 418.50
03/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case management.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
03/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jennie Anderson re document review.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
03/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re document review.	1.30	7	465.00	\$ 604.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Travel to and from Berman DeValerio for document review meeting.	0.40	7	465.00	\$ 186.00
03/03/14	JONES, KAREN	Document Review - Batch SANYO_JP_00001.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/03/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise defendants' stipulation regarding plaintiffs' claims; correspondence with co-counsel regarding the same; confer with B. Glackin regarding the same.	0.40	11	415.00	\$ 166.00
03/03/14	RIM, HISUN	Call re document review quality control; call re Japanese language searches; conduct quality control reviews of other team members' work product; research on defendant corporate relationships; create Japanese searches for reviewer assignments.	8.90	7	260.00	\$ 2,314.00
03/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
03/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case filings for L. Chan review.	1.20	9	305.00	\$ 366.00
03/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
03/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize production files.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
03/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review case management statement and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
03/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Catalyst contract and save to file.	0.10	7	305.00	\$ 30.50
03/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	305.00	\$ 91.50
03/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with class member re case status inquiry; draft email correspondence re same.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
03/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence to co-counsel re experts.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
03/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze fees and costs report.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
03/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze memoranda re document review.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
03/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.60	7	465.00	\$ 279.00
03/04/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jeff Friedman re electronically stored information protocol; team call re same.	0.30	11	650.00	\$ 195.00
03/04/14	JONES, KAREN	Document Review - Batch SANYO_JP_00001.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/04/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding changes to defendants' stipulation regarding claims; correspondence with opposing counsel regarding the same; confer with B. Glackin regarding the same.	0.60	11	415.00	\$ 249.00
03/04/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	9.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,340.00
03/04/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG production documents for loading by Catalyst.	0.40	7	305.00	\$ 122.00
03/04/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re LG production documents sent to Catalyst for L. Chan	0.50	7	305.00	\$ 152.50
03/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel and H. Rim re document review status; draft email correspondence re same.	0.60	7	465.00	\$ 279.00
03/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel, H. Rim, and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re document review.	1.10	7	465.00	\$ 511.50
03/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re cost and expense reports; review and analyze cost report.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
03/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence to Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs and Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs re electronically stored information protocol.	0.10	6	465.00	\$ 46.50
03/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with defendants re discovery electronically stored information protocol; confer with B. Glackin and M. Pilotin re same.	0.50	6	465.00	\$ 232.50
03/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and respond to co-counsel email correspondence re document review.	1.20	11	465.00	\$ 558.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze draft electronically stored information protocol and email correspondence re same; confer with B. Glackin re same; draft and respond to email correspondence re same.	1.60	11	465.00	\$ 744.00
03/05/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Call with defendants re electronically stored information protocol; office conference with L. Chan re same; review draft electronically stored information protocols.	1.10	11	650.00	\$ 715.00
03/05/14	JONES, KAREN	Document Review - Batch SANYO_JP_00001.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/05/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in telephone call regarding electronically stored information.	0.40	11	415.00	\$ 166.00
03/05/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.30	7	260.00	\$ 2,158.00
03/05/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
03/05/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case filings for L. Chan review.	0.40	9	305.00	\$ 122.00
03/05/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
03/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re document review; confer with Ronnie Spiegel re same.	1.60	7	465.00	\$ 744.00
03/06/14	JONES, KAREN	Document Review - Batch SANYO_JP_00001.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/06/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	7.40	7	260.00	\$ 1,924.00
03/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with co-counsel re English review team; draft email correspondence re same.	0.80	11	465.00	\$ 372.00
03/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs and Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs re electronically stored information protocols.	0.90	11	465.00	\$ 418.50
03/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re document review; confer with B. Glackin re same.	1.80	7	465.00	\$ 837.00
03/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft [REDACTED].	0.70	2	465.00	\$ 325.50
03/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer email correspondence re electronically stored information protocol, including reviewing notes and prior correspondence.	0.60	6	465.00	\$ 279.00
03/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Japanese language review training session.	0.70	7	465.00	\$ 325.50
03/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze draft electronically stored information protocols.	1.40	11	465.00	\$ 651.00
03/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze motion to dismiss.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
03/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze report re document review results.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
03/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Train Japanese language reviewers; draft email correspondence re same.	1.50	7	465.00	\$ 697.50
03/07/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum to team re document review.	0.30	11	650.00	\$ 195.00
03/07/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call re electronically stored information protocol; office conference with L. Chan re same.	0.70	11	650.00	\$ 455.00
03/07/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Todd Seaver re document review; office conference with L. Chan re document review.	0.70	11	650.00	\$ 455.00
03/07/14	JONES, KAREN	Document Review - Batch SANYO_JP_00001.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/07/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Review motion to dismiss.	0.10	9	415.00	\$ 41.50
03/07/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	6.30	7	260.00	\$ 1,638.00
03/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
03/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence for service and save to file.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
03/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
03/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze report re document review; draft memorandum re same.	4.90	7	465.00	\$ 2,278.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze supplemental motion to dismiss; draft email correspondence re same.	0.80	11	465.00	\$ 372.00
03/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
03/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs and Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs re document review, including separate conference with Ronnie Spiegel re same.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
03/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with English language reviewers re document review.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
03/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Dugar re document review platform.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
03/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re case management.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
03/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re document review.	2.00	7	465.00	\$ 930.00
03/10/14	JONES, KAREN	Document Review - Batch SANYO_JP_00001.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/10/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.30	7	260.00	\$ 2,158.00
03/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
03/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin, M. Pilotin and Indirect Purchaser Plaintiff counsel re case management.	0.70	11	465.00	\$ 325.50
03/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Dan Owen re electronically stored information protocol; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
03/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Dugar re electronically stored information protocol.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
03/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Kristena Kitchen re document review.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
03/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re document review.	0.70	7	465.00	\$ 325.50
03/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re document review status.	0.90	11	465.00	\$ 418.50
03/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list and review correspondence re upcoming deadlines and motions.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
03/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for call with co-counsel re case management.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
03/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze filings re Grand Jury production.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
03/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze joint statement re discovery.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
03/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze meet and confer correspondence re discovery protocol.	0.50	6	465.00	\$ 232.50
03/11/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Read motion to dismiss.	0.90	9	650.00	\$ 585.00
03/11/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call.	0.60	11	650.00	\$ 390.00
03/11/14	JONES, KAREN	Document Review - Batch SANYO_JP_00001.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/11/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in telephone call with co-counsel regarding case; confer with B. Glackin and L. Chan regarding case.	0.70	11	415.00	\$ 290.50
03/11/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Review motion to dismiss.	0.30	8	415.00	\$ 124.50
03/11/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	6.80	7	260.00	\$ 1,768.00
03/11/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case authorities re motion to dismiss for M. Pilotin review.	4.00	9	305.00	\$ 1,220.00
03/11/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare filings re professional conduct for B. Glackin review.	0.40	9	305.00	\$ 122.00
03/11/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re Toshiba productions for L. Chan.	0.30	6	305.00	\$ 91.50
03/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re document review.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
03/12/14	JONES, KAREN	Document Review - Batch SANYO_JP_00001.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/12/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	7.30	7	260.00	\$ 1,898.00
03/12/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.10	11	305.00	\$ 30.50
03/12/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading issues.	1.00	7	305.00	\$ 305.00
03/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Dugar re electronically stored information protocol.	0.60	6	465.00	\$ 279.00
03/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	1.30	7	465.00	\$ 604.50
03/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Revise electronically stored information protocol.	1.70	6	465.00	\$ 790.50
03/13/14	DUGAR, KIRTI	Review draft ESI protocol	2.00	7	410.00	\$ 820.00
03/13/14	JONES, KAREN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/13/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
03/13/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sony production for loading by Catalyst.	1.00	7	305.00	\$ 305.00
03/13/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize production files.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
03/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin re electronically stored information protocol.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
03/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Ronnie Spiegel, H. Rim, Shinae Kim Helms, and Nate Cihlar re document review.	0.40	7	465.00	\$ 186.00
03/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft electronically stored information protocol.	1.60	11	465.00	\$ 744.00
03/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for opposition to supplemental motion to dismiss; draft memorandum re same.	2.40	8	465.00	\$ 1,116.00
03/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with defendants re deposition protocol; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	6	465.00	\$ 232.50
03/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer re deposition protocol, including reviewing draft protocol.	0.40	6	465.00	\$ 186.00
03/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to B. Glackin email correspondence re case status.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
03/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review issues.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
03/14/14	JONES, KAREN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/14/14	RIM, HISUN	Document review.	5.50	7	260.00	\$ 1,430.00
03/14/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email Catalyst re production loading issues.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
03/14/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email co-counsel re production loading issues.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
03/14/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare authorities re motions to dismiss for M. Pilotin review.	5.00	9	305.00	\$ 1,525.00
03/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
03/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Ronnie Spiegel and H. Rim re document review and drafting amended complaint.	1.00	7	465.00	\$ 465.00
03/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re electronically stored information protocol.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
03/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re electronically stored information protocol.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
03/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	2.30	7	465.00	\$ 1,069.50
03/17/14	JONES, KAREN	Preparation of factual summaries for amended complaint.	8.00	8	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/17/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	9.30	7	260.00	\$ 2,418.00
03/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with K. Dugar and Josh Schmidt re electronically stored information protocol; draft email correspondence re same.	0.70	11	465.00	\$ 325.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Ronnie Spiegel and H. Rim re document review project.	0.40	7	465.00	\$ 186.00
03/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
03/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with J. Gerard Stranch re document review project.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
03/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
03/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re electronically stored information protocol; confer with K. Dugar re same.	0.80	11	465.00	\$ 372.00
03/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Review documents; draft memorandum re same; confer with H. Rim re same.	5.40	7	465.00	\$ 2,511.00
03/18/14	DUGAR, KIRTI	Call with Catalyst and L. Chan re ESI; follow up	0.50	7	410.00	\$ 205.00
03/18/14	JONES, KAREN	Preparation of factual summaries for amended complaint.	8.00	8	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/18/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	11.30	7	260.00	\$ 2,938.00
03/19/14	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	0.70	11	465.00	\$ 325.50
03/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Ronnie Spiegel and H. Rim re document review.	0.30	7	465.00	\$ 139.50
03/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Gerard Stranch re document reviewers.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
03/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Dugar re electronically stored information protocol.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
03/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with M. Pilotin re opposition to supplemental motion to dismiss.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
03/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re electronically stored information protocol.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
03/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze documents for amending complaint; draft memorandum re same.	6.80	7	465.00	\$ 3,162.00
03/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze memoranda re [REDACTED]; draft memorandum re same.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
03/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze supplemental motion to dismiss.	0.10	8	465.00	\$ 46.50
03/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
03/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Review records re document production; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
03/19/14	DESOUZA, TERENCE	Track down the production log and compare it to the audit log to make sure everything has been processed by the vendor for L. Chan.	1.50	11	285.00	\$ 427.50
03/19/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with James McGinnis.	0.70	11	650.00	\$ 455.00
03/19/14	JONES, KAREN	Preparation of factual summaries for amended complaint.	8.00	8	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/19/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	11.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,860.00
03/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze memoranda re amending complaint.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
03/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review; review memoranda re same.	1.70	7	465.00	\$ 790.50
03/20/14	JONES, KAREN	Preparation of factual summaries for amended complaint.	8.00	8	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/20/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	10.50	7	260.00	\$ 2,730.00
03/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft opposition to supplemental motion to dismiss; legal research re same.	6.50	8	465.00	\$ 3,022.50
03/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze documents for amending complaint.	2.80	7	465.00	\$ 1,302.00
03/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.30	7	465.00	\$ 139.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/21/14	JONES, KAREN	Preparation of factual summaries for amended complaint.	8.00	8	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/21/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	11.50	7	260.00	\$ 2,990.00
03/22/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	1.30	7	260.00	\$ 338.00
03/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft opposition to supplemental motion to dismiss; legal research re same.	11.50	8	465.00	\$ 5,347.50
03/23/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	5.80	7	260.00	\$ 1,508.00
03/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft opposition to supplemental motion to dismiss, including legal research re same.	8.80	8	465.00	\$ 4,092.00
03/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze draft Direct Purchaser Plaintiff amended complaint; draft email re same.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
03/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.60	7	465.00	\$ 279.00
03/24/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft portions of opposition to motion to dismiss.	0.60	8	415.00	\$ 249.00
03/24/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	6.50	7	260.00	\$ 1,690.00
03/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re amending complaints; draft email correspondence re same.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
03/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft opposition to supplemental motion to dismiss, including legal research re same.	6.00	8	465.00	\$ 2,790.00
03/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise second amended consolidated complaint.	2.50	8	465.00	\$ 1,162.50
03/25/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft portions of opposition to motion to dismiss.	6.00	8	415.00	\$ 2,490.00
03/25/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	6.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,560.00
03/25/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence with Catalyst re status of document loading.	0.50	9	305.00	\$ 152.50
03/25/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.50	9	305.00	\$ 152.50
03/25/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review production documents and save to file.	0.40	7	305.00	\$ 122.00
03/26/14	CARNAM, TODD	Pull [REDACTED] for L. Chan.	0.10	1	305.00	\$ 30.50
03/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft opposition to supplemental motion to dismiss, including legal research.	12.20	8	465.00	\$ 5,673.00
03/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze draft amended complaint.	0.50	8	465.00	\$ 232.50
03/26/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit amended complaint.	2.80	8	700.00	\$ 1,960.00
03/26/14	JONES, KAREN	Plan and strategy for future document review.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/26/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise opposition to motion to dismiss.	6.80	8	415.00	\$ 2,822.00
03/26/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	7.30	7	260.00	\$ 1,898.00
03/26/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare order for claims for M. Pilotin review.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
03/26/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery memoranda and save to file.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
03/26/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review draft second amended complaint.	0.20	8	305.00	\$ 61.00
03/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Ronnie Spiegel, K. Jones, Veronica Glaze, and Jessica Moy re document review; draft email correspondence re same; confer with Ronnie Spiegel re same.	1.50	7	465.00	\$ 697.50
03/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Jones re document review plan.	0.40	7	465.00	\$ 186.00
03/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft opposition to supplemental motion to dismiss.	3.00	8	465.00	\$ 1,395.00
03/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft plan for document review.	0.60	7	465.00	\$ 279.00
03/27/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit complaint.	2.10	8	700.00	\$ 1,470.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/27/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control analysis on document review for amended complaint.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/27/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	0.50	7	260.00	\$ 130.00
03/27/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
03/27/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
03/27/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review sealed second amended complaint and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
03/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re opposition to motion to dismiss.	0.30	8	465.00	\$ 139.50
03/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft opposition to motion to dismiss, including legal research.	6.10	8	465.00	\$ 2,836.50
03/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
03/28/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review opposition to motion to dismiss; office conference with M. Pilotin and L. Chan re same.	2.60	9	650.00	\$ 1,690.00
03/28/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control analysis on document review for amended complaint.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/28/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	7.80	7	260.00	\$ 2,028.00
03/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare coding information for H. Rim review.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
03/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review filing deadlines re opposition to motions to dismiss.	0.10	8	305.00	\$ 30.50
03/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translation index and save to file.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
03/29/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise section of opposition brief.	1.60	8	415.00	\$ 664.00
03/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft opposition to motion to dismiss.	9.10	8	465.00	\$ 4,231.50
03/30/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise opposition brief.	1.50	8	415.00	\$ 622.50
03/31/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft opposition to supplemental motion to dismiss, including legal research re same; confer with B. Glackin re same; draft email correspondence re same.	3.20	8	465.00	\$ 1,488.00
03/31/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze draft coding form.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
03/31/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Rule 12 opposition brief.	2.70	8	700.00	\$ 1,890.00
03/31/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control analysis on document review for amended complaint.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/31/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise portions of opposition brief.	2.00	8	415.00	\$ 830.00
03/31/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	4.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,040.00
03/31/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
04/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re document review plan.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
04/01/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control analysis on document review for amended complaint.	5.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,575.00
04/01/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
04/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs and Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs re meet and confer re electronically stored information protocol.	0.60	6	465.00	\$ 279.00
04/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case management issues.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
04/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re case status.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
04/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with defendants re electronically stored information protocol.	0.60	6	465.00	\$ 279.00
04/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and edit electronically stored information protocol; draft email correspondence re same.	1.40	6	465.00	\$ 651.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze draft deposition protocol.	0.50	6	465.00	\$ 232.50
04/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to co-counsel email re amended complaint.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
04/02/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Rule 12 opposition.	2.10	8	700.00	\$ 1,470.00
04/02/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Call re electronically stored information protocol.	1.20	11	650.00	\$ 780.00
04/02/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	2.50	7	260.00	\$ 650.00
04/02/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
04/02/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Samsung SDI production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.40	7	305.00	\$ 122.00
04/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with co-counsel re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
04/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft opposition to supplemental motion to dismiss.	1.00	8	465.00	\$ 465.00
04/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.30	7	465.00	\$ 139.50
04/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Revise coding sheet.	1.80	7	465.00	\$ 837.00
04/03/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Rule 12 opposition brief.	1.40	8	700.00	\$ 980.00
04/03/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	4.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,040.00
04/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN		0.40	11	305.00	\$ 122.00
04/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize production files.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
04/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
04/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Troxel re cite checking and filing opposition to motion to dismiss.	0.10	8	465.00	\$ 46.50
04/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re document review.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
04/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft and revise electronically stored information protocol; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	6	465.00	\$ 93.00
04/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft opposition to motion to dismiss.	4.20	8	465.00	\$ 1,953.00
04/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze Catalyst invoice.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
04/04/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Rule 12 opposition brief.	2.40	8	700.00	\$ 1,680.00
04/04/14	JONES, KAREN	Plan for merits document review; analysis of proposed materials.	1.00	7	515.00	\$ 515.00
04/04/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	4.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,040.00
04/04/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit citations re opposition to motion to dismiss.	7.50	8	305.00	\$ 2,287.50
04/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft opposition to motion to dismiss.	6.00	8	465.00	\$ 2,790.00
04/06/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise brief regarding motion to dismiss.	1.00	8	415.00	\$ 415.00
04/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft and finalize opposition to motion to dismiss.	8.20	8	465.00	\$ 3,813.00
04/07/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Rule 12 opposition brief.	1.80	8	700.00	\$ 1,260.00
04/07/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Edit motion to dismiss opposition.	2.10	8	650.00	\$ 1,365.00
04/07/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise opposition to motion to dismiss.	0.30	8	415.00	\$ 124.50
04/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.30	9	305.00	\$ 91.50
04/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
04/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft electronically stored information protocol; confer with M. Murgage re same.	2.40	6	465.00	\$ 1,116.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re filing opposition to motion to dismiss.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
04/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze document review instructions.	0.40	7	465.00	\$ 186.00
04/08/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re opposition to motion to dismiss.	0.70	9	305.00	\$ 213.50
04/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Revise electronically stored information protocol; draft email correspondence re same.	0.30	6	465.00	\$ 139.50
04/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to H. Rim and K. Jones email correspondence re document review.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
04/10/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	0.50	7	260.00	\$ 130.00
04/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email re Catalyst invoice.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
04/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit document coding manual.	0.40	7	465.00	\$ 186.00
04/11/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
04/12/14	JONES, KAREN	Plan for merits document review; preparation of training materials.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
04/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft coding manual for document review.	1.20	7	465.00	\$ 558.00
04/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze amended complaint.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
04/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to defendant correspondence re document production.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
04/13/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	0.30	7	260.00	\$ 78.00
04/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Jones re coding manual.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
04/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft coding manual.	2.30	7	465.00	\$ 1,069.50
04/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
04/14/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	1.00	7	260.00	\$ 260.00
04/15/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
04/15/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sony replacement production for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	305.00	\$ 152.50
04/15/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit index re information on defendant employees.	3.70	7	305.00	\$ 1,128.50
04/15/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re productions sent to Catalyst for L. Chan.	0.10	7	305.00	\$ 30.50
04/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze draft deposition protocol; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
04/16/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit index re information on defendant employees.	0.50	7	305.00	\$ 152.50
04/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft coding manual.	0.80	7	465.00	\$ 372.00
04/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze deposition protocol; draft email correspondence re same.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
04/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re cost and time reports.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
04/17/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	0.30	7	260.00	\$ 78.00
04/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit index re information on defendant employees.	6.00	7	305.00	\$ 1,830.00
04/18/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	0.30	7	260.00	\$ 78.00
04/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
04/21/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	4.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,040.00
04/22/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
04/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re stipulation.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze draft stipulation re motions to dismiss; draft email correspondence re same.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
04/23/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
04/23/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition protocol orders for attorney review.	0.20	2	305.00	\$ 61.00
04/23/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review NEC production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	305.00	\$ 152.50
04/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Ronnie Spiegel re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
04/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft coding manual.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
04/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and edit deposition protocol; draft email correspondence re same.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
04/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze draft stipulation; draft email correspondence re same.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
04/24/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
04/25/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	7.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,820.00
04/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze Catalyst invoices; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
04/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze motions to dismiss; draft memorandum re same.	2.00	11	465.00	\$ 930.00
04/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin and M. Pilotin re case status.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
04/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Noguchi re document review.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
04/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze motions to dismiss; draft memorandum re same.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
04/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze reply in support of motion to dismiss; draft memorandum re same.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
04/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Review court orders; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
04/28/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Status meeting with L. Chan and M. Pilotin.	0.40	11	650.00	\$ 260.00
04/28/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Steve Williams.	0.20	11	650.00	\$ 130.00
04/28/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Review motions to dismiss complaint; status meeting with B. Glackin and L. Chan; confer with L. Chan regarding filing of case management statement.	0.40	11	415.00	\$ 166.00
04/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	11	305.00	\$ 61.00
04/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare summary re hearing arguments for B. Glackin.	0.70	11	305.00	\$ 213.50
04/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Noguchi; draft email correspondence re same.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
04/29/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	0.80	7	260.00	\$ 208.00
04/29/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	11	305.00	\$ 30.50
04/29/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	11	305.00	\$ 61.00
04/30/14	BERNSTEIN, WILLIAM	Conference with B. Glackin re status.	0.30	11	950.00	\$ 285.00
04/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and edit coding instructions for document review.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
04/30/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Rule 12 reply brief and new Rule 12 briefs.	2.70	9	700.00	\$ 1,890.00
04/30/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	0.50	7	260.00	\$ 130.00
04/30/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sony production for return to counsel.	0.70	11	305.00	\$ 213.50
05/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin and co-leads re motions to dismiss.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
05/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re document review; review and respond to email correspondence re same.	0.80	11	465.00	\$ 372.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence to defendants re electronically stored information protocol.	0.20	6	465.00	\$ 93.00
05/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
05/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meeting with co-leads, including reviewing docket and updating task list; draft email correspondence re same.	1.10	11	465.00	\$ 511.50
05/01/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence for L. Chan review.	0.10	7	305.00	\$ 30.50
05/01/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare motion to dismiss filings for E. Fastiff review.	0.60	9	305.00	\$ 183.00
05/02/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	0.30	7	260.00	\$ 78.00
05/02/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
05/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze [REDACTED].	2.20	11	465.00	\$ 1,023.00
05/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re opposition to motion to dismiss.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
05/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Troxel re preparing for hearing re motion to dismiss.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
05/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re document review.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
05/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for hearing re motion to dismiss.	0.10	14	465.00	\$ 46.50
05/06/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Preparation for motion to dismiss argument.	4.60	14	650.00	\$ 2,990.00
05/06/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Steve Williams re [REDACTED].	0.40	11	650.00	\$ 260.00
05/06/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Additional legal research for motion to dismiss hearing.	0.30	14	415.00	\$ 124.50
05/06/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Legal research for hearing on motion to dismiss.	1.40	14	415.00	\$ 581.00
05/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare motion to dismiss filings for B. Glackin review.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
05/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for hearing re motion to dismiss; conference with B. Troxel and M. Pilotin re same.	0.40	14	465.00	\$ 186.00
05/07/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for motion to dismiss oral argument.	8.20	14	650.00	\$ 5,330.00
05/07/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with B. Glackin regarding motion to dismiss hearing; legal research regarding state antitrust laws.	1.50	14	415.00	\$ 622.50
05/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare law re motions to dismiss for B. Glackin review.	1.30	9	305.00	\$ 396.50
05/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare memorandum of case law re motions to dismiss for L. Chan review.	2.50	9	305.00	\$ 762.50
05/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for hearing re motion to dismiss, including reviewing briefing and legal research.	0.50	14	465.00	\$ 232.50
05/08/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for motion to dismiss argument.	7.30	14	650.00	\$ 4,745.00
05/08/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Legal research for motion to dismiss, confer with B. Glackin the same.	1.70	14	415.00	\$ 705.50
05/08/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
05/08/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation re motions to dismiss.	2.00	9	305.00	\$ 610.00
05/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Attend hearing re motion to dismiss.	1.70	14	465.00	\$ 790.50
05/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re motion to dismiss hearing.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
05/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for and travel to hearing re motion to dismiss, including conference with Lesley Weaver and B. Glackin.	2.50	14	465.00	\$ 1,162.50
05/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Travel from hearing re motion to dismiss.	0.70	14	465.00	\$ 325.50
05/09/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Rule 12 hearing in Oakland.	3.00	14	700.00	\$ 2,100.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/09/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Oral argument re motion to dismiss; prepare for same.	2.90	14	650.00	\$ 1,885.00
05/09/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with B. Glackin regarding hearing on motion to dismiss.	0.10	14	415.00	\$ 41.50
05/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with co-counsel re motions to dismiss.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
05/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to B. Glackin and co-counsel email correspondence re motions to dismiss.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
05/12/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
05/12/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review NEC production and prepare for loading.	0.50	7	305.00	\$ 152.50
05/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with E. Fastiff re electronically stored information protocol meet and confer.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
05/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re meet and confer re electronically stored information protocol.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
05/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with defendants re electronically stored information protocol.	1.00	6	465.00	\$ 465.00
05/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze defendants' redline of electronically stored information protocol.	0.40	6	465.00	\$ 186.00
05/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to H. Rim, B. Glackin, Jon King, and Steve Berman email correspondence re case management matters.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
05/13/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	4.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,040.00
05/13/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
05/13/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence to Catalyst re NEC production.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
05/14/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	6.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,560.00
05/14/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
05/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jon King re oppositions to motion to dismiss.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
05/15/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	3.00	7	260.00	\$ 780.00
05/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re Catalyst invoices.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
05/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to co-counsel email correspondence re oppositions to motions to dismiss; confer with Steven Sklaver re same.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
05/16/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	2.00	7	260.00	\$ 520.00
05/16/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.50	9	305.00	\$ 152.50
05/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft opposition to LG Chem America Inc.'s motion to dismiss.	4.30	8	465.00	\$ 1,999.50
05/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
05/19/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	1.50	7	260.00	\$ 390.00
05/19/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize production files.	0.40	7	305.00	\$ 122.00
05/19/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review NEC production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.70	7	305.00	\$ 213.50
05/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Doug Millen re meet and confer re draft electronically stored information protocol.	0.10	6	465.00	\$ 46.50
05/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
05/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with defendants and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re electronically stored information protocol.	1.00	6	465.00	\$ 465.00
05/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze draft electronically stored information protocol; draft email correspondence re same.	0.40	6	465.00	\$ 186.00
05/20/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit LG Chem answer to Rule 12 opposition brief.	0.30	8	700.00	\$ 210.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/20/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	2.00	7	260.00	\$ 520.00
05/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with E. Fastiff re opposition to motion to dismiss; draft email correspondence re same.	0.40	8	465.00	\$ 186.00
05/21/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit LG brief.	1.80	8	700.00	\$ 1,260.00
05/21/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	3.30	7	260.00	\$ 858.00
05/21/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review hearing transcript and save to file.	0.10	14	305.00	\$ 30.50
05/21/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review NEC productions and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	1.00	7	305.00	\$ 305.00
05/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze draft electronically stored information protocol.	0.10	6	465.00	\$ 46.50
05/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Revise GS Yuasa brief.	5.50	8	465.00	\$ 2,557.50
05/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Revise LG brief.	0.50	8	465.00	\$ 232.50
05/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Revise Toshiba brief.	2.20	8	465.00	\$ 1,023.00
05/22/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Toshiba brief.	1.50	8	700.00	\$ 1,050.00
05/22/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	0.50	7	260.00	\$ 130.00
05/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re motions to dismiss; draft email correspondence re same.	0.60	8	465.00	\$ 279.00
05/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Aaron Sheanin re briefing for individual motions to dismiss.	0.40	8	465.00	\$ 186.00
05/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re briefing for individual motions to dismiss.	0.10	8	465.00	\$ 46.50
05/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re briefing for individual motions to dismiss.	0.50	8	465.00	\$ 232.50
05/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft opposition to NEC motion to dismiss; confer with E. Fastiff re same.	4.20	8	465.00	\$ 1,953.00
05/23/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Rule 12 opposition brief.	1.00	8	700.00	\$ 700.00
05/23/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	2.30	7	260.00	\$ 598.00
05/23/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case filings for L. Chan review.	0.60	9	305.00	\$ 183.00
05/23/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review NEC production and prepare for loading.	0.70	7	305.00	\$ 213.50
05/23/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production dates for L. Chan.	0.10	7	305.00	\$ 30.50
05/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft GS Yuasa brief.	2.50	8	465.00	\$ 1,162.50
05/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft NEC brief.	2.70	8	465.00	\$ 1,255.50
05/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re oppositions to motions to dismiss; draft email correspondence re same.	0.70	8	465.00	\$ 325.50
05/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft GS Yuasa brief; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	8	465.00	\$ 232.50
05/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft LG brief.	0.60	8	465.00	\$ 279.00
05/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft Toshiba brief.	0.40	8	465.00	\$ 186.00
05/26/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	1.30	7	260.00	\$ 338.00
05/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with co-counsel re document review.	1.50	7	465.00	\$ 697.50
05/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re briefing.	0.10	8	465.00	\$ 46.50
05/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Nancy Fineman re briefing.	0.10	8	465.00	\$ 46.50
05/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft oppositions to motions to dismiss.	9.70	8	465.00	\$ 4,510.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/27/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review and comment on draft oppositions to motions to dismiss.	1.10	8	650.00	\$ 715.00
05/27/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	0.30	7	260.00	\$ 78.00
05/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.40	7	465.00	\$ 186.00
05/28/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	6.30	7	260.00	\$ 1,638.00
05/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
05/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re opposition filings to motions to dismiss.	2.00	9	305.00	\$ 610.00
05/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with co-counsel and Catalyst re document review.	1.20	7	465.00	\$ 558.00
05/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Ronnie Spiegel, H. Rim, Shinae Kim-Helms, Jaclyn Verducci, and Demetrius Lambrinos re document review.	0.90	7	465.00	\$ 418.50
05/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin case status.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
05/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re document review.	0.30	7	465.00	\$ 139.50
05/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to co-counsel email correspondence re deposition protocol and other discovery issues.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
05/29/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re document review.	0.40	11	650.00	\$ 260.00
05/29/14	JONES, KAREN	Preparation for merits review (review of Coding Manual, character and term lists).	4.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
05/29/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	1.50	7	260.00	\$ 390.00
05/29/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.60	9	305.00	\$ 183.00
05/29/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review filings re motions to dismiss.	0.30	9	305.00	\$ 91.50
05/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
05/30/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	2.00	7	260.00	\$ 520.00
05/30/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case filings for L. Chan review.	0.50	9	305.00	\$ 152.50
06/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze document review training materials.	1.00	7	465.00	\$ 465.00
06/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to E. Fastiff and co-counsel email correspondence re discovery issues.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
06/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re document review process.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
06/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review and translation.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
06/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re document review.	0.40	7	465.00	\$ 186.00
06/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze document review manual.	0.80	7	465.00	\$ 372.00
06/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to Ronnie Spiegel email correspondence re document review.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
06/02/14	JONES, KAREN	Preparation for merits review; review of coding manual and amended complaint; conferences and email with H. Rim re translation vendors and hot documents.	3.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,545.00
06/02/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	6.80	7	260.00	\$ 1,768.00
06/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re document review.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
06/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze Catalyst invoice; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
06/03/14	JONES, KAREN	Preparation for merits review; review of background and training materials.	3.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,545.00
06/03/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	5.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,300.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	0.30	7	465.00	\$ 139.50
06/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Training call for document reviewers.	0.80	7	465.00	\$ 372.00
06/04/14	JONES, KAREN	Preparation for merits review; review of background and training materials; training call for merits review; analysis of NEC materials to start Japanese merits review.	5.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,575.00
06/04/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	6.80	7	260.00	\$ 1,768.00
06/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Ronnie Spiegel and H. Rim re document review.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
06/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Alvina Wong re electronically stored information protocol; draft email correspondence re same.	0.10	6	465.00	\$ 46.50
06/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re Catalyst.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
06/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
06/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with defendants re deposition protocol.	1.50	6	465.00	\$ 697.50
06/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze draft deposition protocol; confer with B. Glackin re same; review and respond to email correspondence re same.	0.80	8	465.00	\$ 372.00
06/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
06/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to Steve Williams email correspondence re deposition protocol.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
06/05/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re task list; review deposition protocol; telephone conference with Steve Williams.	0.60	11	650.00	\$ 390.00
06/05/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Defendants re deposition protocol; office conference with L. Chan re same; telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin.	2.00	11	650.00	\$ 1,300.00
06/05/14	JONES, KAREN	Preparation for merits review; review of background and training materials; analysis of NEC materials to start Japanese merits review.	3.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,545.00
06/05/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	5.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,300.00
06/05/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	11	305.00	\$ 30.50
06/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Ronnie Spiegel, Shinae Kim-Helms, and H. Rim re document review.	1.00	7	465.00	\$ 465.00
06/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft and review email correspondence re document review.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
06/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer re discovery; draft email correspondence re same.	0.40	6	465.00	\$ 186.00
06/06/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	3.30	7	260.00	\$ 858.00
06/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	11	305.00	\$ 30.50
06/08/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	0.30	7	260.00	\$ 78.00
06/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Respond to email correspondence re translation vendors; confer with H. Rim re same.	0.30	7	465.00	\$ 139.50
06/09/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	4.30	7	260.00	\$ 1,118.00
06/10/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise discovery letter.	0.80	6	650.00	\$ 520.00
06/10/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	4.50	7	260.00	\$ 1,170.00
06/11/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise discovery letter to U.S. Magistrate Judge Donna Ryu; forward to Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs.	0.40	6	650.00	\$ 260.00
06/11/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	6.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,560.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re letter to Judge Ryu and translation vendors; draft email correspondence re same.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
06/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze defense counsel correspondence re letter to Judge Ryu re discovery.	0.20	6	465.00	\$ 93.00
06/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
06/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re translation protocol and vendors; revise translation protocol.	0.70	11	465.00	\$ 325.50
06/12/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
06/13/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise discovery dispute letter.	0.90	6	650.00	\$ 585.00
06/13/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
06/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email to K. Jones re translation vendors.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
06/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to H. Rim email correspondence re document review.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
06/16/14	JONES, KAREN	Merits review and quality control issues.	2.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
06/16/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
06/16/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
06/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Jones re translation vendors.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
06/17/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit letter to court re case administration.	0.10	11	700.00	\$ 70.00
06/17/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	6.30	7	260.00	\$ 1,638.00
06/18/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	6.30	7	260.00	\$ 1,638.00
06/18/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
06/18/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare filings re motions to dismiss for L. Chan review.	1.70	9	305.00	\$ 518.50
06/19/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	6.80	7	260.00	\$ 1,768.00
06/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
06/20/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	7.50	7	260.00	\$ 1,950.00
06/20/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
06/22/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	1.50	7	260.00	\$ 390.00
06/23/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	7.50	7	260.00	\$ 1,950.00
06/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
06/24/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
06/24/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.50	11	305.00	\$ 152.50
06/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit draft translation protocol; draft email correspondence re same.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
06/25/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
06/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to H. Rim and Ronnie Spiegel email correspondence re document review.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
06/26/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
06/27/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	7.50	7	260.00	\$ 1,950.00
06/28/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	1.00	7	260.00	\$ 260.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/29/14	JONES, KAREN	Review of materials for call on merits review and quality control issues.	1.00	7	515.00	\$ 515.00
06/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re document review.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
06/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze deposition protocol; draft email correspondence re same.	0.90	11	465.00	\$ 418.50
06/30/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
06/30/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
06/30/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition protocols for L. Chan review.	0.40	9	305.00	\$ 122.00
07/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference call re document review.	1.00	7	465.00	\$ 465.00
07/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review; draft email correspondence to E. Fastiff and B. Glackin re same.	0.80	7	465.00	\$ 372.00
07/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to Direct Purchaser Plaintiff email correspondence re electronically stored information protocol.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
07/01/14	JONES, KAREN	Call on merits review and quality control issues.	1.00	7	515.00	\$ 515.00
07/01/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
07/02/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
07/03/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
07/06/14	JONES, KAREN	Review of manual and spreadsheets for merits review.	2.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
07/07/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control issues for merits review.	4.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
07/07/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	7.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,820.00
07/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
07/08/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with Steve Williams and Jeff Friedman re discovery hearing.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
07/08/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control issues for merits review.	4.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
07/08/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	9.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,340.00
07/09/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control issues for merits review.	4.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
07/09/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with co-counsel regarding opposition briefs.	0.10	11	415.00	\$ 41.50
07/09/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
07/09/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
07/09/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery orders for E. Fastiff review.	0.20	14	305.00	\$ 61.00
07/09/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re translations sent to Catalyst for H. Rim.	0.50	7	305.00	\$ 152.50
07/10/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control issues for merits review.	3.50	7	515.00	\$ 1,802.50
07/10/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
07/11/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control for merits review.	1.00	7	515.00	\$ 515.00
07/11/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
07/11/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
07/12/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control for merits review.	1.00	7	515.00	\$ 515.00
07/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re discovery matters.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and edit electronically stored information protocol and deposition protocol; draft email correspondence re same; confer with B. Glackin re same.	4.10	11	465.00	\$ 1,906.50
07/14/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise electronically stored information and deposition protocols.	3.40	11	650.00	\$ 2,210.00
07/14/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
07/14/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
07/14/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Direct Purchaser complaint for H. Rim review.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
07/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jon King re electronically stored information protocol.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
07/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re electronically stored information protocol.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
07/15/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read discovery order.	0.20	9	700.00	\$ 140.00
07/15/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memoranda re deposition protocol.	1.00	11	650.00	\$ 650.00
07/15/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
07/15/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit calendar re pending hearing dates.	0.20	11	305.00	\$ 61.00
07/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and Ronnie Spiegel re document review.	1.20	7	465.00	\$ 558.00
07/16/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	7.50	7	260.00	\$ 1,950.00
07/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case status.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
07/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re electronically stored information protocol.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
07/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
07/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft electronically stored information protocol and email correspondence re same.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
07/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list and email correspondence re same.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
07/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze motion to dismiss hearing transcript; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
07/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze order re discovery.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
07/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re electronically stored information protocol; revise electronically stored information protocol.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
07/17/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team conference call re electronically stored information.	0.80	11	650.00	\$ 520.00
07/17/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
07/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery orders for L. Chan review.	0.30	9	305.00	\$ 91.50
07/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.30	9	305.00	\$ 91.50
07/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review calendar re discovery deadlines.	0.10	11	305.00	\$ 30.50
07/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re case strategy.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
07/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs re case strategy.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
07/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re electronically stored information protocol.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
07/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter brief re initial disclosures; conference with Jessica Moy and H. Rim re same.	2.40	8	465.00	\$ 1,116.00
07/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list, including reviewing related notes and email correspondence.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
07/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for conference with Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs, including re-reading orders.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
07/18/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with co-counsel re planning; office conference with L. Chan re same.	1.20	11	650.00	\$ 780.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/18/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
07/18/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
07/18/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review hearing transcript and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
07/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter brief re initial disclosures.	3.20	8	465.00	\$ 1,488.00
07/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze draft combination brief re motions to dismiss.	0.30	8	465.00	\$ 139.50
07/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re letter brief.	0.10	8	465.00	\$ 46.50
07/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter brief re initial disclosures; review and respond to email correspondence re same; confer with H. Rim re same.	4.40	8	465.00	\$ 2,046.00
07/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze memoranda re document review.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
07/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to H. Rim email correspondence re NEC document review.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
07/21/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review letter to Magistrate Judge Donna Ryu; office conference with L. Chan re same.	0.90	9	650.00	\$ 585.00
07/21/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	0.80	7	260.00	\$ 208.00
07/21/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production correspondence for L. Chan review.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
07/21/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	11	305.00	\$ 61.00
07/21/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit citations re joint letter brief.	1.50	8	305.00	\$ 457.50
07/21/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review hearing transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
07/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter brief re initial disclosures; conference with B. Glackin and Jessica Moy re same.	2.20	8	465.00	\$ 1,023.00
07/22/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read defendants' section of discovery letter brief.	0.30	9	700.00	\$ 210.00
07/22/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review defendants' brief to Magistrate Judge Ryu.	0.60	9	650.00	\$ 390.00
07/22/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	2.80	7	260.00	\$ 728.00
07/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review.	0.30	7	465.00	\$ 139.50
07/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re letter brief re initial disclosures.	0.20	8	465.00	\$ 93.00
07/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re electronically stored information protocol.	0.30	6	465.00	\$ 139.50
07/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise letter brief re initial disclosures; confer with Jessica Moy re same.	2.30	8	465.00	\$ 1,069.50
07/23/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control issues for merits review.	6.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,090.00
07/23/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	5.50	7	260.00	\$ 1,430.00
07/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re letter brief.	0.10	8	465.00	\$ 46.50
07/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Shinae Kim-Helms, H. Rim re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	1.20	7	465.00	\$ 558.00
07/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter brief.	3.60	8	465.00	\$ 1,674.00
07/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze memoranda and email correspondence re document review.	0.30	7	465.00	\$ 139.50
07/24/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit discovery letter.	0.80	8	700.00	\$ 560.00
07/24/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise letter brief re initial disclosures.	1.20	8	650.00	\$ 780.00
07/24/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control issues for merits review.	6.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,090.00
07/24/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	4.80	7	260.00	\$ 1,248.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with co-leads re case strategy.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
07/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with defense counsel re electronically stored information protocol.	0.80	6	465.00	\$ 372.00
07/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with E. Fastiff re case strategy.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
07/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft electronically stored information protocol; draft email correspondence re same.	0.80	6	465.00	\$ 372.00
07/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re document review issues.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
07/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meeting re case strategy, including drafting task list, reviewing orders, etc.	1.80	11	465.00	\$ 837.00
07/25/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Conference with Jeff Friedman and Steve Williams re case strategy.	0.80	11	700.00	\$ 560.00
07/25/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Electronically stored information conference call with plaintiffs' and defendants' counsel.	0.80	11	700.00	\$ 560.00
07/25/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control issues for merits review.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
07/26/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control issues for merits review.	1.00	9	515.00	\$ 515.00
07/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re deposition protocol.	0.50	6	465.00	\$ 232.50
07/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re Hawaii claims, bench memos, and document review.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
07/27/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control issues for merits review.	1.00	9	515.00	\$ 515.00
07/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with defendants re electronically stored information checklist; draft email correspondence re same.	1.40	6	465.00	\$ 651.00
07/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer re discovery, including reviewing prior productions, orders, etc. and review and analyze transactional data request.	1.50	11	465.00	\$ 697.50
07/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
07/28/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control issues for merits review.	8.00	9	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
07/28/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	4.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,040.00
07/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft electronically stored information protocol and email correspondence re same.	0.40	6	465.00	\$ 186.00
07/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to co-counsel email correspondence re deposition protocol and document review.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
07/29/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control issues for merits review.	8.00	9	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
07/29/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	3.80	7	260.00	\$ 988.00
07/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review and translation.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
07/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft electronically stored information protocol; confer with B. Glackin re same.	0.30	6	465.00	\$ 139.50
07/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to B. Glackin and co-counsel email correspondence re discovery requests and discovery.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
07/30/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise deposition protocol; emails with co-counsel about electronically stored information conferences.	2.00	11	650.00	\$ 1,300.00
07/30/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control issues for merits review.	8.00	9	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
07/30/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	5.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,300.00
07/31/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Aaron Sheanin re electronically stored information protocol.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
07/31/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare electronically stored information protocol for filing.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/31/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN		2.00	11	650.00	\$ 1,300.00
07/31/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control issues for merits review.	8.00	9	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
07/31/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	4.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,040.00
08/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case status and document review.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
08/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re document review and translation; draft email correspondence re same.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
08/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re document review.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
08/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re discovery matters; confer with H. Rim re same.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
08/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Review documents identified as hot.	3.80	6	465.00	\$ 1,767.00
08/01/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re document review.	0.40	11	650.00	\$ 260.00
08/01/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control issues for merits review.	4.50	9	515.00	\$ 2,317.50
08/01/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	7.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,820.00
08/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list, including reviewing correspondence re discovery.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
08/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Review Catalyst receipts; draft email correspondence re same.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
08/02/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control issues for merits review.	2.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
08/03/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control issues for merits review.	1.50	7	515.00	\$ 772.50
08/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze documents coded hot.	1.20	7	465.00	\$ 558.00
08/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and code documents.	1.10	7	465.00	\$ 511.50
08/04/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control issues and merits review.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
08/04/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	7.80	7	260.00	\$ 2,028.00
08/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re document review plan; create spreadsheet and draft email correspondence re same.	1.00	7	465.00	\$ 465.00
08/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze briefing to prepare for motion to dismiss hearing; draft memorandum re same.	4.50	11	465.00	\$ 2,092.50
08/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze memoranda re document review.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
08/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and code documents.	1.10	7	465.00	\$ 511.50
08/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise interrogatories.	1.00	2	465.00	\$ 465.00
08/05/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review document review protocol; telephone conference with E. Fastiff and L. Chan re same.	0.50	11	650.00	\$ 325.00
08/05/14	GRANT, ANTHONY	Administration of database.	1.00	7	320.00	\$ 320.00
08/05/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control issues and merits review.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
08/05/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	7.80	7	260.00	\$ 2,028.00
08/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case strategy.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
08/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review.	0.40	7	465.00	\$ 186.00
08/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft interrogatories and email correspondence re same.	0.30	2	465.00	\$ 139.50
08/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and code documents; draft memorandum re same.	4.40	7	465.00	\$ 2,046.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
08/06/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft interrogatories.	0.40	2	650.00	\$ 260.00
08/06/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control issues and merits review.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
08/06/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	9.50	7	260.00	\$ 2,470.00
08/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare GS Yuasa production for loading by Catalyst.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
08/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading for L. Chan.	0.40	7	305.00	\$ 122.00
08/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
08/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
08/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with document review managers; draft email correspondence re same.	2.20	7	465.00	\$ 1,023.00
08/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re document review.	0.30	7	465.00	\$ 139.50
08/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re Samsung.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
08/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meeting re document review, including review and respond to email correspondence and memoranda; confer with H. Rim re same.	2.10	7	465.00	\$ 976.50
08/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze briefing re motions to dismiss and related memoranda.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
08/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze co-counsel email correspondence re deposition protocol; review draft deposition protocol.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
08/07/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control issues and merits review.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
08/07/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	7.50	7	260.00	\$ 1,950.00
08/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
08/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare GS Yuasa production for H. Rim review.	0.10	7	305.00	\$ 30.50
08/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
08/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Attend motion to dismiss hearing; draft memorandum re same.	3.90	14	465.00	\$ 1,813.50
08/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with co-counsel and review briefing.	0.80	14	465.00	\$ 372.00
08/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze hot documents.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
08/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
08/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Travel to and from motion to dismiss hearing.	1.50	14	465.00	\$ 697.50
08/08/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Rule 12 hearing.	4.20	14	650.00	\$ 2,730.00
08/08/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control issues and merits review.	3.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,545.00
08/08/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	7.50	7	260.00	\$ 1,950.00
08/08/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re loading of productions by Catalyst.	0.80	7	305.00	\$ 244.00
08/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to co-counsel email correspondence re discovery meet and confer, document review, and case strategy.	1.10	11	465.00	\$ 511.50
08/10/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control project; refine Coding Manual.	2.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
08/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with co-counsel re meet and confer re deposition protocol.	0.50	6	465.00	\$ 232.50
08/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with defendants re deposition protocol.	1.20	6	465.00	\$ 558.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to co-counsel email correspondence re deposition protocol; review draft deposition protocol; draft briefing re same; confer with U.S. Embassy re same.	6.90	8	465.00	\$ 3,208.50
08/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
08/11/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet and confer with defendants.	1.20	6	650.00	\$ 780.00
08/11/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team conference call re deposition protocol.	0.50	11	650.00	\$ 325.00
08/11/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Steve Williams.	0.20	11	650.00	\$ 130.00
08/11/14	JONES, KAREN	Translation and quality control projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
08/11/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
08/11/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.10	7	305.00	\$ 30.50
08/11/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition protocols for L. Chan review.	0.80	8	305.00	\$ 244.00
08/11/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.40	7	305.00	\$ 122.00
08/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter brief re deposition protocol; confer with B. Glackin re same; draft email correspondence re same.	5.10	8	465.00	\$ 2,371.50
08/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Review, analyze, and draft email correspondence re Consortra Translations contract.	0.80	11	465.00	\$ 372.00
08/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.30	7	465.00	\$ 139.50
08/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re meet and confer re transactional data.	0.20	6	465.00	\$ 93.00
08/12/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Edit letter brief; telephone conference with L. Chan.	0.70	8	650.00	\$ 455.00
08/12/14	JONES, KAREN	Translation and quality control projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
08/12/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
08/12/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
08/12/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare court reporter information for L. Chan.	0.20	8	305.00	\$ 61.00
08/12/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery order for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
08/12/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
08/12/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review CaseMap re loading translations.	0.10	7	305.00	\$ 30.50
08/12/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.10	7	305.00	\$ 30.50
08/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case status and meet and confer strategy.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
08/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
08/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter brief re deposition protocol.	0.50	8	465.00	\$ 232.50
08/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review; draft memorandum re same.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
08/13/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise deposition protocol brief.	0.80	8	650.00	\$ 520.00
08/13/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
08/13/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
08/13/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery correspondence for L. Chan review.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
08/13/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery orders for L. Chan review.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
08/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter brief re deposition protocol.	0.50	8	465.00	\$ 232.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/14/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise/research discovery letter to Magistrate Judge Ryu.	2.90	9	650.00	\$ 1,885.00
08/14/14	JONES, KAREN	Translation and quality control projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
08/14/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
08/14/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case authority for B. Glackin review.	0.50	8	305.00	\$ 152.50
08/14/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare order re professional conduct for attorney review.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
08/14/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review CaseMap re loading translations for L. Chan.	0.40	7	305.00	\$ 122.00
08/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with potential document reviewers.	0.40	7	465.00	\$ 186.00
08/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with defendants re transactional data.	0.20	6	465.00	\$ 93.00
08/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit joint letter brief re deposition protocol.	0.10	8	465.00	\$ 46.50
08/15/14	JONES, KAREN	Translation and quality control projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
08/15/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
08/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with potential document reviewers.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
08/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit draft statement of compliance.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
08/18/14	JONES, KAREN	Special projects for merits review.	5.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,575.00
08/18/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
08/18/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
08/18/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
08/18/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleading and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
08/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review issues.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
08/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to co-counsel email correspondence re document review, deposition protocol, and compliance statement.	1.20	11	465.00	\$ 558.00
08/19/14	JONES, KAREN	Special projects for merits review.	2.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
08/19/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	7.50	7	260.00	\$ 1,950.00
08/19/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review hearing transcript and save to file.	0.10	14	305.00	\$ 30.50
08/19/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.10	7	305.00	\$ 30.50
08/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to H. Rim, Ronnie Spiegel, and others' email correspondence re document review.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
08/20/14	JONES, KAREN	Special projects for merits review.	2.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
08/20/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	7.50	7	260.00	\$ 1,950.00
08/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with document review managers re document review.	1.00	7	465.00	\$ 465.00
08/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re meet and confer with SDI; draft email correspondence re same.	0.30	6	465.00	\$ 139.50
08/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to SDI re meet and confer regarding transactional data and document preservation.	0.80	6	465.00	\$ 372.00
08/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with SDI re transactional data and document preservation; draft memorandum re same.	1.90	6	465.00	\$ 883.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with SDI re transactional data, including reviewing prior correspondence, court orders, and documents; conference with E. Fastiff, Shana Scarlett, and Demetrius Lambrinos re same.	2.40	6	465.00	\$ 1,116.00
08/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.90	7	465.00	\$ 418.50
08/21/14	JONES, KAREN	Special projects for merits review.	4.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
08/21/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with L. Chan regarding electronically stored information protocol.	0.10	6	415.00	\$ 41.50
08/21/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
08/21/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare translations for H. Rim review.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
08/21/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
08/21/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery requests and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
08/21/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re status of privilege logs for H. Rim.	0.40	9	305.00	\$ 122.00
08/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter re SDI meet and confer.	0.40	6	465.00	\$ 186.00
08/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze defendants' disclosures re grand jury document custodians.	0.60	9	465.00	\$ 279.00
08/22/14	JONES, KAREN	Special projects for merits review.	4.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
08/22/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
08/22/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re certified translations for L. Chan.	0.10	7	305.00	\$ 30.50
08/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	1.30	7	465.00	\$ 604.50
08/23/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	1.00	7	260.00	\$ 260.00
08/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze privilege logs.	0.20	9	465.00	\$ 93.00
08/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise interrogatories.	0.20	2	465.00	\$ 93.00
08/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to SDI re meet and confer; draft email correspondence re same.	0.40	6	465.00	\$ 186.00
08/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Orientation for M. Kubota; draft email re same.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
08/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meeting with M. Kubota.	0.80	7	465.00	\$ 372.00
08/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.30	7	465.00	\$ 139.50
08/25/14	JONES, KAREN	Special projects for merits review.	7.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
08/25/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
08/25/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email potential class member re case status.	0.10	11	305.00	\$ 30.50
08/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to SDI re meet and confer.	0.20	6	465.00	\$ 93.00
08/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re meet and confers with defendants.	0.10	6	465.00	\$ 46.50
08/26/14	JONES, KAREN	Special projects for merits review.	5.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,575.00
08/26/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
08/26/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	305.00	\$ 152.50
08/26/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
08/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to GS Yuasa re meet and confer.	0.80	6	465.00	\$ 372.00
08/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re document review; respond to email correspondence re same.	0.70	7	465.00	\$ 325.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with GS Yuasa re transactional data.	0.50	6	465.00	\$ 232.50
08/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Panasonic and Sanyo re transactional data and electronically stored information checklist.	1.30	6	465.00	\$ 604.50
08/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Toshiba re transactional data and electronically stored information checklist; draft email correspondence re same.	0.80	6	465.00	\$ 372.00
08/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer calls with Toshiba, Panasonic, Sanyo, and GS Yuasa.	0.80	6	465.00	\$ 372.00
08/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to co-counsel email correspondence re discovery issues.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
08/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to defendants' correspondence re electronically stored information checklist.	0.10	6	465.00	\$ 46.50
08/27/14	JONES, KAREN	Special projects for merits review.	3.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,545.00
08/27/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
08/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re privilege logs; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
08/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with document review managers re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	1.60	7	465.00	\$ 744.00
08/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Hitachi re transactional data.	0.70	6	465.00	\$ 325.50
08/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence re GS Yuasa meet and confer.	0.70	6	465.00	\$ 325.50
08/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to Hitachi re meet and confer.	1.10	6	465.00	\$ 511.50
08/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re privilege logs; legal research re same.	0.70	11	465.00	\$ 325.50
08/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with LG.	1.10	6	465.00	\$ 511.50
08/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with NEC and LG.	0.60	6	465.00	\$ 279.00
08/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze privilege logs.	0.40	9	465.00	\$ 186.00
08/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit correspondence to Panasonic and Sanyo re meet and confer.	0.80	6	465.00	\$ 372.00
08/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit correspondence to Toshiba re meet and confer.	0.50	6	465.00	\$ 232.50
08/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to Direct Purchaser Plaintiff and co-counsel email correspondence re meet and confers with defendants.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
08/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to H. Rim, Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs and Ronnie Spiegel email correspondence re document review.	0.30	7	465.00	\$ 139.50
08/28/14	JONES, KAREN	Special projects for merits review.	3.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,545.00
08/28/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
08/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
08/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re NEC disclosures for L. Chan.	0.40	9	305.00	\$ 122.00
08/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with NEC.	0.90	6	465.00	\$ 418.50
08/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony.	1.00	6	465.00	\$ 465.00
08/29/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit draft discovery meet and confer letter.	0.80	6	700.00	\$ 560.00
08/29/14	JONES, KAREN	Special projects for merits review.	7.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
08/29/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Open encrypted disk and copy contents to P:/ drive.	1.00	7	320.00	\$ 320.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/29/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
08/29/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Sony production and prepare for loading.	0.70	7	305.00	\$ 213.50
09/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case status.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
09/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
09/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence to defendants re transactional data.	2.80	6	465.00	\$ 1,302.00
09/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re meet and confer with defendants and document review.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
09/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Review case status, including document review results; draft memorandum re same.	1.20	11	465.00	\$ 558.00
09/02/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re discovery and case status.	0.40	11	650.00	\$ 260.00
09/02/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control and special projects for merits review.	7.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
09/02/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/02/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence for L. Chan review.	0.80	9	305.00	\$ 244.00
09/02/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.60	9	305.00	\$ 183.00
09/02/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	305.00	\$ 91.50
09/02/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense production re corrupted document.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
09/02/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translation production and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
09/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and Ronnie Spiegel re document review issues.	0.60	7	465.00	\$ 279.00
09/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with defendants re electronically stored information checklist and document preservation.	0.60	6	465.00	\$ 279.00
09/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with potential document reviewers re assignment.	0.40	7	465.00	\$ 186.00
09/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence to GS Yuasa and NEC.	0.70	6	465.00	\$ 325.50
09/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze translated documents.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
09/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to co-counsel email correspondence re meet and confer and document review; conference with B. Glackin, B. Troxel, M. Pilotin, and T. You re same.	3.00	11	465.00	\$ 1,395.00
09/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Review documents and draft key term sheet.	1.30	7	465.00	\$ 604.50
09/03/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan; revise GS Yuasa letter; electronically stored information call with defendants; telephone conference with Steve Williams.	2.10	11	650.00	\$ 1,365.00
09/03/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control and special projects for merits review.	6.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,090.00
09/03/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with L. Chan regarding document preservation; review documents regarding the same.	0.40	11	415.00	\$ 166.00
09/03/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare draft exhibits for L. Chan.	0.10	8	305.00	\$ 30.50
09/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.50	9	305.00	\$ 152.50
09/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	305.00	\$ 122.00
09/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re correspondence to plaintiff for L. Chan.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
09/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re plaintiffs' documents for L. Chan.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
09/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review hearing transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/04/14	CHAN, LIN		0.70	1	465.00	\$ 325.50
09/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Document review manager call; draft email correspondence re same.	1.00	7	465.00	\$ 465.00
09/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to co-counsel and defense counsel email correspondence re meet and confer.	1.50	6	465.00	\$ 697.50
09/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.60	7	465.00	\$ 279.00
09/04/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit meet and confer letters.	0.40	6	700.00	\$ 280.00
09/04/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN		2.90	9	650.00	\$ 1,885.00
09/04/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control for merits review.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
09/04/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case strategy.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
09/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memoranda re case strategy and Samsung.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
09/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to co-counsel and defense counsel meet and confer correspondence.	0.20	6	465.00	\$ 93.00
09/05/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re discovery status.	0.50	11	650.00	\$ 325.00
09/05/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Steve Williams, Jeff Friedman re experts.	0.90	11	650.00	\$ 585.00
09/05/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control for merits review.	7.50	7	515.00	\$ 3,862.50
09/05/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
09/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft attorney fee application and exhibits.	0.50	9	465.00	\$ 232.50
09/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to email correspondence re document review.	0.80	7	465.00	\$ 372.00
09/08/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control for merits review.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
09/08/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/08/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review hearing transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
09/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with LG re transactional data.	1.20	6	465.00	\$ 558.00
09/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for document reviewer training.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
09/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer re transactional data and electronically stored information checklist; review and respond to email correspondence re same; draft memorandum re same.	2.70	6	465.00	\$ 1,255.50
09/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Quality control work of document reviewers.	1.20	7	465.00	\$ 558.00
09/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to T. You, co-counsel email correspondence re document review and meet and confer.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
09/09/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control for merits review.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
09/09/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/09/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	8	305.00	\$ 61.00
09/09/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.60	9	305.00	\$ 183.00
09/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with potential document reviewers.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
09/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case status.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review.	0.40	7	465.00	\$ 186.00
09/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony; draft correspondence re same.	3.20	6	465.00	\$ 1,488.00
09/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for document review training with T. Lee.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
09/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with Sony.	0.30	6	465.00	\$ 139.50
09/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to co-counsel and defense counsel email correspondence re meet and confers and document review.	1.00	11	465.00	\$ 465.00
09/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Review hot Korean language documents; draft email correspondence re same.	0.40	7	465.00	\$ 186.00
09/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Review reviewer notes and coding.	2.50	7	465.00	\$ 1,162.50
09/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Train T. Lee for document review.	0.30	7	465.00	\$ 139.50
09/10/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control and key terms for merits review.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
09/10/14	LEE, TRACY	Train with L. Chan and H. Rim regarding document review assignment.	6.00	7	450.00	\$ 2,700.00
09/10/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email Catalyst re transactional data.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
09/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.30	9	305.00	\$ 91.50
09/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	305.00	\$ 91.50
09/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review transactional data and save to file.	0.40	7	305.00	\$ 122.00
09/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to Hitachi re meet and confer.	2.60	6	465.00	\$ 1,209.00
09/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Hitachi meet and confer re transactional data and electronically stored information checklist.	1.30	6	465.00	\$ 604.50
09/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Panasonic/Sanyo meet and confer re transactional data.	1.20	6	465.00	\$ 558.00
09/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confers with Hitachi, Panasonic, and Toshiba.	0.90	6	465.00	\$ 418.50
09/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit correspondence to Sony re meet and confer.	0.60	6	465.00	\$ 279.00
09/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to Direct Purchaser Plaintiff, defense counsel, H. Rim, co-counsel email correspondence re document review, meet and confer, and privilege logs.	1.10	11	465.00	\$ 511.50
09/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Toshiba meet and confer re transactional data.	0.60	6	465.00	\$ 279.00
09/11/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review LG letter.	0.30	9	650.00	\$ 195.00
09/11/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Ed Leamer.	1.90	11	650.00	\$ 1,235.00
09/11/14	JONES, KAREN	Update coding manual for merits review; review of translations manual; research re [REDACTED].	7.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
09/11/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
09/11/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/11/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email Catalyst re transactional data loading.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
09/11/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare pleadings for B. Glackin review.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
09/11/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case filings.	0.40	9	305.00	\$ 122.00
09/11/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
09/11/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review materials re motions to dismiss and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/11/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review signatures re protective order and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
09/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Mike Katz-Lacabe re documents; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
09/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to defendants re privilege log; legal research re same.	1.70	6	465.00	\$ 790.50
09/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email to Aaron Sheanin re GS Yuasa; confer with Aaron Sheanin re same; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
09/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft list of key terms for document reviewers.	1.30	7	465.00	\$ 604.50
09/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to Direct Purchaser Plaintiff, defense counsel, H. Rim, T. Lee, B. Glackin, and co-counsel email correspondence re meet and confers, document review, discovery, and translations.	1.30	11	465.00	\$ 604.50
09/12/14	JONES, KAREN	Update coding manual for merits review; review of translations manual; research re [REDACTED].	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
09/12/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
09/12/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/12/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
09/12/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	8	305.00	\$ 91.50
09/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence to Hitachi.	0.10	6	465.00	\$ 46.50
09/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to co-counsel email correspondence re meet and confers.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
09/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and K. Jones re search terms.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
09/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Shana Scarlett and Demetrius Lambrinos re defendant productions; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
09/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re document review.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
09/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with LG re electronically stored information checklist.	0.90	6	465.00	\$ 418.50
09/15/14	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
09/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re document review plan.	0.30	7	465.00	\$ 139.50
09/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Document review management call.	0.70	7	465.00	\$ 325.50
09/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence to LG.	0.40	6	465.00	\$ 186.00
09/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence to Toshiba.	0.40	6	465.00	\$ 186.00
09/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re Toshiba.	0.80	11	465.00	\$ 372.00
09/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
09/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for document review manager meeting, including reviewing quality control comments, memoranda, and email correspondence.	0.90	7	465.00	\$ 418.50
09/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with LG re electronically stored information checklist, including review orders and correspondence.	0.50	6	465.00	\$ 232.50
09/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze meet and confer correspondence re electronically stored information checklist.	0.10	6	465.00	\$ 46.50
09/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit joint status report.	0.40	8	465.00	\$ 186.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to H. Rim, E. Fastiff, T. You, K. Jones, Jessica Moy, co-counsel email correspondence re document review and discovery.	0.80	11	465.00	\$ 372.00
09/15/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan.	0.50	11	650.00	\$ 325.00
09/15/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Task list.	0.90	11	650.00	\$ 585.00
09/15/14	JONES, KAREN	Update coding manual for merits review, search terms.	6.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,090.00
09/15/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
09/15/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/15/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	305.00	\$ 91.50
09/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re document review.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
09/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with M. Boyle re document review.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
09/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with T. Lee re document review.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
09/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to Hitachi re meet and confer.	0.30	6	465.00	\$ 139.50
09/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to LG re meet and confer.	0.50	6	465.00	\$ 232.50
09/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to Panasonic/Sanyo.	0.40	6	465.00	\$ 186.00
09/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft joint report re discovery.	0.50	8	465.00	\$ 232.50
09/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with GS Yuasa re transactional data and electronically stored information checklist.	0.50	6	465.00	\$ 232.50
09/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with NEC re transactional data and electronically stored information checklist.	1.20	6	465.00	\$ 558.00
09/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Toshiba re electronically stored information checklist.	0.60	6	465.00	\$ 279.00
09/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to H. Rim and Demetrius Lambrinos email correspondence re meet and confer and document review.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
09/16/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Review combined draft of joint status report.	0.20	9	700.00	\$ 140.00
09/16/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence re experts.	0.10	11	650.00	\$ 65.00
09/16/14	JONES, KAREN	Update coding manual for merits review; review search terms; train new Japanese language reviewer in New York.	7.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
09/16/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
09/16/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/16/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sony production for H. Rim review.	0.40	7	305.00	\$ 122.00
09/16/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
09/16/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re Sony production for L. Chan.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
09/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
09/17/14	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	0.20	3	465.00	\$ 93.00
09/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft joint statement; review and respond to email correspondence re same.	0.50	8	465.00	\$ 232.50
09/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re LG; review documents re same.	3.60	11	465.00	\$ 1,674.00
09/17/14	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	0.90	10	465.00	\$ 418.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and respond to H. Rim, T. Lee, Shinae Kim-Helms, co-counsel, Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs, Mas Uchino, K. Jones email correspondence re document review and discovery.	0.90	11	465.00	\$ 418.50
09/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise GS Yuasa meet and confer correspondence.	0.40	6	465.00	\$ 186.00
09/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise Toshiba meet and confer correspondence.	0.40	6	465.00	\$ 186.00
09/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Review Hitachi initial disclosures.	0.10	9	465.00	\$ 46.50
09/17/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN		0.30	11	650.00	\$ 195.00
09/17/14	JONES, KAREN	Update coding manual for merits review; review search terms.	2.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
09/17/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
09/17/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
09/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review disclosures and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
09/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re expert retainer agreements for L. Chan.	0.70	7	305.00	\$ 213.50
09/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
09/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Call Shana Scarlett re Toshiba.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
09/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin and Ronnie Spiegel re case status.	1.10	11	465.00	\$ 511.50
09/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with document review managers re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	1.00	7	465.00	\$ 465.00
09/18/14	CHAN, LIN		0.50	3	465.00	\$ 232.50
09/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re document review plan.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
09/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Email and telephone call re Consortra Translations contract.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
09/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, translation vendor, and discovery.	0.70	11	465.00	\$ 325.50
09/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Review documents and draft memorandum re SDI, LG, and Sanyo.	2.20	11	465.00	\$ 1,023.00
09/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Review initial disclosures.	0.20	9	465.00	\$ 93.00
09/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Review invoices and draft email correspondence re assessment for litigation fund.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
09/18/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re document review plan memorandum to Steve Williams and Jeff Friedman re same.	0.90	11	650.00	\$ 585.00
09/18/14	JONES, KAREN	Update coding manual for merits review; search terms; quality control - release project.	3.30	7	515.00	\$ 1,699.50
09/18/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
09/18/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/18/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleading and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
09/18/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege log and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
09/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Jones re document review.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
09/19/14	JONES, KAREN	Update coding manual for merits review; search terms; quality control - release project; team calls re projects and coding manual revisions.	3.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,545.00
09/19/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
09/19/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/19/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re CaseMap invoices for B. Glackin.	0.50	7	305.00	\$ 152.50
09/21/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control - release project.	1.00	7	515.00	\$ 515.00
09/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re discovery.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
09/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with IT Department re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
09/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Jones re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	1.00	7	465.00	\$ 465.00
09/22/14	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	0.70	3	465.00	\$ 325.50
09/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re document review, Catalyst, discovery.	1.70	11	465.00	\$ 790.50
09/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memoranda re document review.	3.30	7	465.00	\$ 1,534.50
09/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for negotiation call with Consortra.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
09/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Review memoranda re document review.	0.40	7	465.00	\$ 186.00
09/22/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control - release project; team meeting re new projects; negotiations of vendor contract.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
09/22/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
09/22/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	4.50	7	260.00	\$ 1,170.00
09/22/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Sony production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	305.00	\$ 152.50
09/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin and Lesley Weaver re document review.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
09/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with A.K. Martin re [REDACTED].	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
09/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Dugar and Ronnie Spiegel re [REDACTED].	0.90	11	465.00	\$ 418.50
09/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re document review.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
09/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re document review, privilege logs, and case status.	1.10	11	465.00	\$ 511.50
09/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Negotiate Consortra translation contract; confer with K. Jones re same.	0.90	11	465.00	\$ 418.50
09/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Sony meet and confer re privilege logs, including reviewing privilege logs, prior correspondence and legal research.	0.90	6	465.00	\$ 418.50
09/23/14	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	0.30	3	465.00	\$ 139.50
09/23/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re [REDACTED], document review plan; correspondence re same.	0.60	7	650.00	\$ 390.00
09/23/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with [REDACTED]; memorandum to Jeff Friedman and Steve Williams.	0.30	11	650.00	\$ 195.00
09/23/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control for merits review; team meetings.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
09/23/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
09/23/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/23/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sony production for loading by Catalyst.	0.40	7	305.00	\$ 122.00
09/23/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	305.00	\$ 122.00
09/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re privilege logs.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
09/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Document review manager meeting.	0.80	7	465.00	\$ 372.00
09/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
09/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with LG re transactional data and electronically stored information checklist.	0.80	6	465.00	\$ 372.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re privilege logs; confer with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re same.	2.10	6	465.00	\$ 976.50
09/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for and meet with H. Rim and K. Jones re document review.	0.60	7	465.00	\$ 279.00
09/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with Sony re privilege logs, including reviewing orders, correspondence, logs, and legal research.	1.90	6	465.00	\$ 883.50
09/24/14	JONES, KAREN	Quality control for merits review; team and co-lead meetings.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
09/24/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
09/24/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/24/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	305.00	\$ 91.50
09/25/14	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	0.20	3	465.00	\$ 93.00
09/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re privilege logs.	1.00	11	465.00	\$ 465.00
09/25/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Organize meeting with Ed Leamer and co-counsel.	0.20	11	650.00	\$ 130.00
09/25/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	6.80	7	515.00	\$ 3,502.00
09/25/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
09/25/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/25/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
09/25/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re pleadings for L. Chan review.	0.40	9	305.00	\$ 122.00
09/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re discovery.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
09/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Steering Committee firms re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	0.60	7	465.00	\$ 279.00
09/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Document review and create list of custodians.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
09/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review and discovery meet and confer.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
09/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit document review manual.	0.80	7	465.00	\$ 372.00
09/26/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	6.50	7	515.00	\$ 3,347.50
09/26/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
09/26/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/26/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email Catalyst re status of Sony replacement production.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
09/27/14	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
09/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft SDI custodian list.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
09/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re privilege logs, Consortra contract, electronically stored information checklist, and document review.	1.10	11	465.00	\$ 511.50
09/27/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	0.50	7	260.00	\$ 130.00
09/28/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	3.50	7	515.00	\$ 1,802.50
09/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim, Ronnie Spiegel, and K. Jones re SDI custodians; draft email correspondence re same.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
09/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case status.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
09/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Lesley Weaver re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with M. Boyle re document review.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
09/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Shana Scarlett re SDI custodians.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
09/29/14	CHAN, LIN		0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
09/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re SDI custodians, document review, electronically stored information checklist, privilege logs.	0.80	11	465.00	\$ 372.00
09/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise correspondence to Sony re privilege log.	0.20	6	465.00	\$ 93.00
09/29/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
09/29/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
09/29/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/29/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sony production for re-loading by Catalyst.	1.00	7	305.00	\$ 305.00
09/29/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
09/30/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Conference call re revised review protocol.	0.50	11	350.00	\$ 175.00
09/30/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code documents.	1.30	7	350.00	\$ 455.00
09/30/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review background material.	1.50	9	350.00	\$ 525.00
09/30/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Train with K. Jones re review walk-through.	1.00	11	350.00	\$ 350.00
09/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re document review.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
09/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Document review call.	0.40	7	465.00	\$ 186.00
09/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, Catalyst, and meet and confers.	0.70	11	465.00	\$ 325.50
09/30/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet with Ed Leamer and Jeff Friedman.	2.40	11	650.00	\$ 1,560.00
09/30/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
09/30/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
09/30/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/01/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Discuss coding protocols with K. Jones and L. Chan.	1.00	7	350.00	\$ 350.00
10/01/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code documents; write up summary memo.	5.80	7	350.00	\$ 2,030.00
10/01/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review background materials for case.	1.20	9	350.00	\$ 420.00
10/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and K. Jones re SDI custodians.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
10/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case status.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
10/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re Sony redactions and other privilege log issues.	0.70	11	465.00	\$ 325.50
10/01/14	CHAN, LIN		0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
10/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re privilege logs, electronically stored information checklist, Catalyst, and document review; confer with H. Rim re same.	1.40	11	465.00	\$ 651.00
10/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for and meet with K. Jones and H. Rim re document review status.	0.60	7	465.00	\$ 279.00
10/01/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
10/01/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
10/01/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/01/14	TROXEL, BRIAN		0.40	7	305.00	\$ 122.00
10/01/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sony production for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	305.00	\$ 152.50
10/01/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re loading of replacement Sony production by Catalyst.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
10/02/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code documents; write up summary memo.	7.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,450.00
10/02/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review background materials for case.	1.00	9	350.00	\$ 350.00
10/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Shana Scarlett and Demetrius Lambrinos re privilege logs.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
10/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re Sony meet and confer.	0.20	6	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/02/14	CHAN, LIN		0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
10/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Document review management call.	0.60	7	465.00	\$ 279.00
10/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft Consortra contract.	0.80	11	465.00	\$ 372.00
10/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to Sony re privilege log.	1.30	6	465.00	\$ 604.50
10/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review and discovery; confer with K. Jones re same.	1.00	11	465.00	\$ 465.00
10/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze order re motions to dismiss.	1.30	9	465.00	\$ 604.50
10/02/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
10/02/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
10/02/14	PILOTIN, MARC	Review order on motion to dismiss.	0.30	11	415.00	\$ 124.50
10/02/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/02/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
10/03/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code documents; write up summary memo.	7.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,450.00
10/03/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review background materials and attorney notes.	1.00	9	350.00	\$ 350.00
10/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
10/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft Consortra contract; confer with K. Jones re same.	1.30	11	465.00	\$ 604.50
10/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence re privilege logs.	0.20	6	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list and schedule, review prior orders, filings, and discovery.	2.80	11	465.00	\$ 1,302.00
10/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re electronically stored information meet and confers, document review.	0.80	11	465.00	\$ 372.00
10/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Toshiba.	0.60	6	465.00	\$ 279.00
10/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with Toshiba, including reviewing prior correspondence, orders, etc.	1.30	6	465.00	\$ 604.50
10/03/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Rule 12 order.	2.00	9	700.00	\$ 1,400.00
10/03/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	7.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
10/03/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
10/03/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare hot documents for L. Chan review.	1.30	7	305.00	\$ 396.50
10/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Create list of SDI custodians.	4.90	11	465.00	\$ 2,278.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/06/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code documents; write up summary memo.	7.30	7	350.00	\$ 2,555.00
10/06/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review attorney feedback and background materials for case.	0.70	1	350.00	\$ 245.00
10/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re expert work.	0.20	10	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Troxel re expert work.	0.10	10	465.00	\$ 46.50
10/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Dugar re CaseMap; draft email correspondence re same.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
10/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Leigh O'Neil re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	0.40	7	465.00	\$ 186.00
10/06/14	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Todd Seaver re Sony meet and confer.	0.20	6	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/06/14	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
10/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re SDI custodians; confer with H. Rim re same.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, Consortra contract, case status, class certification, and discovery meet and confer.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
10/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Research re expert work for class certification.	0.30	10	465.00	\$ 139.50
10/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise meet and confer letter to Toshiba.	0.80	6	465.00	\$ 372.00
10/06/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
10/06/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
10/06/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
10/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email Catalyst re status of Sony replacement file.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
10/07/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read/review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.60	9	350.00	\$ 210.00
10/07/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.40	7	350.00	\$ 2,590.00
10/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim and K. Jones re document review.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
10/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, amending complaint, privilege logs.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
10/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise meet and confer correspondence re privilege logs.	0.10	6	465.00	\$ 46.50
10/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Review expert work and class certification orders in similar cases.	0.20	10	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/07/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
10/07/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
10/07/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review documents re Sony replacement file.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
10/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone call with Catalyst re status of Sony replacement file.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
10/08/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read/review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.60	9	350.00	\$ 210.00
10/08/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.40	7	350.00	\$ 2,590.00
10/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim and K. Jones re Sony custodians; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to Sony.	0.90	6	465.00	\$ 418.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re Sony custodians.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
10/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery meet and confers.	0.10	6	465.00	\$ 46.50
10/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, Consortra.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with NEC re transactional data and electronically stored information checklist.	0.80	6	465.00	\$ 372.00
10/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re transactional data and electronically stored information checklist.	0.70	6	465.00	\$ 325.50
10/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with NEC including reviewing prior correspondence and orders.	0.90	6	465.00	\$ 418.50
10/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with Sony including reviewing prior correspondence and orders.	0.50	6	465.00	\$ 232.50
10/08/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
10/08/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
10/08/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/08/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email Catalyst re Sony replacement production.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
10/08/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare hot documents for L. Chan review.	1.80	7	305.00	\$ 549.00
10/08/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
10/09/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read/review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.50	9	350.00	\$ 175.00
10/09/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	6.50	7	350.00	\$ 2,275.00
10/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re Sony.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re custodian lists.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
10/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Leigh O'Neill re document review.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Document review management meeting.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
10/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, case strategy, and Consortra contract.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
10/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for document review management meeting.	0.30	7	465.00	\$ 139.50
10/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Respond to inquiries re case status.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
10/09/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
10/09/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
10/09/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/09/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.60	9	305.00	\$ 183.00
10/09/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	305.00	\$ 152.50
10/10/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read/review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.50	9	350.00	\$ 175.00
10/10/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.50	7	350.00	\$ 2,625.00
10/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Dugar re Catalyst.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
10/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re SDI custodians.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
10/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re case status, redactions, document review.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
10/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re class certification and expert work; review prior expert reports.	9.40	10	465.00	\$ 4,371.00
10/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Respond to class member inquiries re case status.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise NEC letter.	0.30	6	465.00	\$ 139.50
10/10/14	DUGAR, KIRTI	Review dashboard in Catalyst and issues raised by L. Chan; calls to Catalyst support re same.	1.00	7	410.00	\$ 410.00
10/10/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
10/10/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	9.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,340.00
10/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
10/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re class certification and expert work; review prior expert reports.	4.20	9	465.00	\$ 1,953.00
10/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review and meet and confer with defendants.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
10/12/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
10/13/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.50	9	350.00	\$ 175.00
10/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim and K. Dugar re document review platform.	0.80	11	465.00	\$ 372.00
10/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
10/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence to Sony.	0.30	6	465.00	\$ 139.50
10/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re expert work for class certification.	0.70	10	465.00	\$ 325.50
10/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re SDI custodians, Sony correspondence, amending complaint, expert work, document review, case schedule.	1.30	11	465.00	\$ 604.50
10/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Respond to class member inquiries; draft email correspondence re same.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
10/13/14	DUGAR, KIRTI	Calls to vendor re CaseMap hosting and cost scenarios; emails to and from L. Chan re same.	1.00	7	410.00	\$ 410.00
10/13/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
10/13/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
10/13/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/13/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare organizational charts for L. Chan review.	2.00	7	305.00	\$ 610.00
10/14/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.40	9	350.00	\$ 140.00
10/14/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.60	7	350.00	\$ 2,660.00
10/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Dugar re CaseMap estimate.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
10/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re SDI custodians.	0.70	11	465.00	\$ 325.50
10/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re Sony custodians.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
10/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft retainer agreement.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, case scheduling, cost report.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
10/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with defendants re joint statement; draft email correspondence re same.	1.30	6	465.00	\$ 604.50
10/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Hitachi re transactional data and document preservation.	0.60	6	465.00	\$ 279.00
10/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for confer with defendants re joint status report, including reviewing orders and prior correspondence.	0.40	6	465.00	\$ 186.00
10/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with Hitachi, including reviewing prior correspondence and discovery and confer with H. Rim.	0.80	6	465.00	\$ 372.00
10/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Respond to class member inquiries.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/14/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
10/14/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
10/14/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/14/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare organizational charts for L. Chan review.	1.00	7	305.00	\$ 305.00
10/15/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.40	9	350.00	\$ 140.00
10/15/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.60	7	350.00	\$ 2,660.00
10/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with E. Fastiff re case management.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Jones and H. Rim re document review.	0.60	7	465.00	\$ 279.00
10/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with LG re discovery.	0.60	6	465.00	\$ 279.00
10/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Sony re transactional data.	0.80	6	465.00	\$ 372.00
10/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to Sony.	0.60	6	465.00	\$ 279.00
10/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re joint stipulation re amending complaint.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/15/14	CHAN, LIN		0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
10/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Respond to class member inquiries.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
10/15/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
10/15/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
10/15/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/15/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare organizational charts for L. Chan review.	4.00	7	305.00	\$ 1,220.00
10/15/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re Sony replacement production for Catalyst.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
10/16/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	1.00	9	350.00	\$ 350.00
10/16/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,450.00
10/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Document review management call.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
10/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re Sony custodians, document review, transactional data, and written discovery.	1.10	11	465.00	\$ 511.50
10/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise joint case management conference statement; legal research re same.	1.00	8	465.00	\$ 465.00
10/16/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	1.00	7	515.00	\$ 515.00
10/16/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
10/16/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/16/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare organizational charts for L. Chan review.	5.00	7	305.00	\$ 1,525.00
10/16/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare per se briefing for L. Chan review.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
10/16/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re loading of transactional replacement file by Catalyst.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
10/17/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, drafts, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.80	9	350.00	\$ 280.00
10/17/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.20	7	350.00	\$ 2,520.00
10/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with S. Cassidy re class member inquiries.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re LG custodians.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
10/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re Sony custodians; confer with H. Rim and K. Jones re same.	1.00	11	465.00	\$ 465.00
10/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft retainer agreement.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re proposed schedule, joint statement, discovery.	0.70	11	465.00	\$ 325.50
10/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re [REDACTED].	0.90	11	465.00	\$ 418.50
10/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Respond to class member inquiries.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise joint statement.	0.10	8	465.00	\$ 46.50
10/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise letter to Hitachi re meet and confer.	0.10	6	465.00	\$ 46.50
10/17/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	7.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
10/17/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
10/17/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
10/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize corporate organizational documents.	0.50	7	305.00	\$ 152.50
10/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re loading of replacement transactional data by Catalyst.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
10/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with class member re claims.	1.20	11	465.00	\$ 558.00
10/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Review Sony privilege log and correspondence.	0.50	6	465.00	\$ 232.50
10/20/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.50	9	350.00	\$ 175.00
10/20/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.50	7	350.00	\$ 2,625.00
10/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery deadlines.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
10/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Respond to class member inquiries.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
10/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit joint case management conference statement.	0.40	8	465.00	\$ 186.00
10/20/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit case management conference statements and emails with plaintiff counsel re same.	0.50	9	700.00	\$ 350.00
10/20/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
10/20/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
10/20/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/20/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare organizational charts for attorney review.	0.40	7	305.00	\$ 122.00
10/20/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.50	9	305.00	\$ 152.50
10/20/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	305.00	\$ 122.00
10/20/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege logs and save to file.	0.30	9	305.00	\$ 91.50
10/20/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re replacement load files.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
10/21/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.60	9	350.00	\$ 210.00
10/21/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.40	7	350.00	\$ 2,590.00
10/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Demetrius Lambrinos and Shana Scarlett re discovery issues.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
10/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re joint status report.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit meet and confer letter to LG.	0.20	6	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/21/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
10/21/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
10/21/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/21/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
10/22/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.70	9	350.00	\$ 245.00
10/22/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.30	7	350.00	\$ 2,555.00
10/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin re discovery.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
10/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and K. Jones re document review.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
10/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Steve Williams re amended complaint.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
10/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to Sony.	0.20	6	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re amended complaint and other discovery issues.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
10/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise amended pleadings.	2.70	8	465.00	\$ 1,255.50
10/22/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
10/22/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
10/22/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/22/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.50	9	305.00	\$ 152.50
10/22/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email Catalyst re replacement bates numbers for Sony production.	0.10	7	305.00	\$ 30.50
10/22/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re replacement load files.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
10/22/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone call to Catalyst re replacement bates numbers for Sony production.	0.10	7	305.00	\$ 30.50
10/23/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.60	9	350.00	\$ 210.00
10/23/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.40	7	350.00	\$ 2,590.00
10/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, Sony meet and confers, translation.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
10/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Respond to class member inquiries.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Review documents identified as hot.	0.90	7	465.00	\$ 418.50
10/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Review joint statement.	0.30	9	465.00	\$ 139.50
10/23/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
10/23/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
10/23/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/23/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
10/23/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email Catalyst re bates numbering.	0.10	7	305.00	\$ 30.50
10/24/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	1.00	9	350.00	\$ 350.00
10/24/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,450.00
10/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re written discovery requests.	0.10	2	465.00	\$ 46.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/24/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
10/24/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
10/24/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	2.50	7	260.00	\$ 650.00
10/25/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	2.50	7	260.00	\$ 650.00
10/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re Sony custodians.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
10/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Review meet and confer correspondence with NEC.	0.10	6	465.00	\$ 46.50
10/26/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	3.00	7	260.00	\$ 780.00
10/27/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.60	9	350.00	\$ 210.00
10/27/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.40	7	350.00	\$ 2,590.00
10/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft initial disclosures.	0.70	3	465.00	\$ 325.50
10/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re initial disclosures, Sony custodians, document review, case management conference; confer with H. Rim re same.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
10/27/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
10/27/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
10/27/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/27/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email Catalyst re bates numbering of Sony production.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
10/27/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re replacement bates numbering of Sony production.	1.00	7	305.00	\$ 305.00
10/28/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Litigation strategy, analysis and case management.	1.00	11	350.00	\$ 350.00
10/28/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.30	9	350.00	\$ 105.00
10/28/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	6.70	7	350.00	\$ 2,345.00
10/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Document review call.	0.80	7	465.00	\$ 372.00
10/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft interrogatories and requests for production.	1.50	2	465.00	\$ 697.50
10/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re Sony custodians, Catalyst, document review.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
10/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for case management conference, including reviewing prior orders.	0.20	14	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/28/14	DUGAR, KIRTI	Review and trouble shoot issues with Catalyst database.	1.00	7	410.00	\$ 410.00
10/28/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	4.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
10/28/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
10/28/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare orders for B. Glackin review.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
10/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare organizational charts for attorney review.	2.50	7	305.00	\$ 762.50
10/28/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
10/29/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.40	9	350.00	\$ 140.00
10/29/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.60	7	350.00	\$ 2,660.00
10/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and K. Jones re document review.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re meet and confers, written discovery, custodians, document review, and case management conference.	0.90	11	465.00	\$ 418.50
10/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for case management conference hearing, including reviewing prior filings and orders.	1.40	14	465.00	\$ 651.00
10/29/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
10/29/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
10/29/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/29/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare organizational documents for L. Chan review.	2.50	9	305.00	\$ 762.50
10/29/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review disclosures and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
10/30/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.30	9	350.00	\$ 105.00
10/30/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.70	7	350.00	\$ 2,695.00
10/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Attend case management conference.	1.80	14	465.00	\$ 837.00
10/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Ronnie Spiegel and Demetrius Lambrinos re document review.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Jones re document review.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft interrogatories.	0.20	2	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re case management conference.	1.10	11	465.00	\$ 511.50
10/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, discovery.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
10/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Review case management conference papers.	0.10	14	465.00	\$ 46.50
10/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Review Sony organizational charts.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
10/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Travel to and from case management conference.	1.40	14	465.00	\$ 651.00
10/30/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
10/30/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
10/30/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/30/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare organizational documents for attorney review.	0.40	7	305.00	\$ 122.00
10/31/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.40	9	350.00	\$ 140.00
10/31/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.60	7	350.00	\$ 2,660.00
10/31/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft requests for production and interrogatories.	0.90	2	465.00	\$ 418.50
10/31/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re case strategy, written discovery, and status.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
10/31/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Toshiba.	0.80	6	465.00	\$ 372.00
10/31/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with Toshiba including legal research and reviewing prior correspondence and filings.	1.20	6	465.00	\$ 558.00
10/31/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	4.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
10/31/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, discovery, class member inquiries, translation vendor.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
11/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for discovery hearing.	0.10	14	465.00	\$ 46.50
11/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Review discovery responses.	1.00	3	465.00	\$ 465.00
11/01/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	2.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
11/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Review written discovery and draft task list.	2.50	11	465.00	\$ 1,162.50
11/03/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.30	9	350.00	\$ 105.00
11/03/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.70	7	350.00	\$ 2,695.00
11/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case strategy; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
11/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery responses, Sony meet and confer, document review.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
11/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re worldwide transactional data.	1.00	11	465.00	\$ 465.00
11/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with Panasonic and Sanyo, including review prior correspondence, filings, and discovery responses.	1.10	6	465.00	\$ 511.50
11/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and approve document review time sheets.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
11/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise Toshiba meet and confer letter.	0.20	6	465.00	\$ 93.00
11/03/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re various case and discovery issues; memorandum to Steve Williams and Jeff Friedman re planning call.	1.10	11	650.00	\$ 715.00
11/03/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	7.50	7	515.00	\$ 3,862.50
11/03/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
11/03/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery correspondence for attorney review.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
11/03/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare magistrate filings for attorney review.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
11/04/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Litigation strategy, analysis and case management conference call with attorneys.	1.00	11	350.00	\$ 350.00
11/04/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.40	9	350.00	\$ 140.00
11/04/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	6.60	7	350.00	\$ 2,310.00
11/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Aaron Sheanin and Shana Scarlett re discovery hearing; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	14	465.00	\$ 93.00
11/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case strategy.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
11/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Catalyst re document review platform.	1.00	11	465.00	\$ 465.00
11/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Document review call.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
11/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for discovery conference, including reviewing briefing re deposition protocol; legal research re same.	4.20	14	465.00	\$ 1,953.00
11/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Review docket.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
11/04/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan.	0.80	11	650.00	\$ 520.00
11/04/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Research potential experts.	0.40	11	650.00	\$ 260.00
11/04/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Steve Williams and Jeff Friedman.	1.00	11	650.00	\$ 650.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/04/14	HILTERMANN, KAYLA		2.90	10	305.00	\$ 884.50
11/04/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
11/04/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
11/04/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/05/14	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI		1.20	10	305.00	\$ 366.00
11/05/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.40	9	350.00	\$ 140.00
11/05/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.60	7	350.00	\$ 2,660.00
11/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim and K. Jones re document review.	0.40	7	465.00	\$ 186.00
11/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Edit letter to defendants re discovery schedule.	0.10	6	465.00	\$ 46.50
11/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery, document review.	1.00	11	465.00	\$ 465.00
11/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for discovery conference, including legal research re deposition protocols in other cases.	3.10	14	465.00	\$ 1,441.50
11/05/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
11/05/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
11/05/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/05/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case filings for L. Chan review.	1.20	9	305.00	\$ 366.00
11/06/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.40	9	350.00	\$ 140.00
11/06/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.60	7	350.00	\$ 2,660.00
11/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re discovery hearing.	0.90	14	465.00	\$ 418.50
11/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Cadio Zirpoli re discovery hearing.	0.40	14	465.00	\$ 186.00
11/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Geoff Rushing re discovery hearing.	0.30	14	465.00	\$ 139.50
11/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Shana Scarlett re discovery hearing.	0.40	14	465.00	\$ 186.00
11/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Document review management call.	0.80	7	465.00	\$ 372.00
11/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery hearing, document review.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
11/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for discovery hearing, including legal research.	7.20	14	465.00	\$ 3,348.00
11/06/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with Sony, including reviewing written discovery responses.	1.20	6	465.00	\$ 558.00
11/06/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re hearing preparation.	0.70	14	650.00	\$ 455.00
11/06/14	HARVEY, DEAN		1.60	10	490.00	\$ 784.00
11/06/14	HILTERMANN, KAYLA		1.80	1	305.00	\$ 549.00
11/06/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
11/06/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/06/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Hitachi indictments for L. Chan review.	0.50	9	305.00	\$ 152.50
11/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	305.00	\$ 91.50
11/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.50	9	305.00	\$ 152.50
11/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Panasonic production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	305.00	\$ 152.50
11/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleading and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
11/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Samsung SDI production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.40	7	305.00	\$ 122.00
11/06/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re missing productions for Catalyst.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
11/07/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.30	9	350.00	\$ 105.00
11/07/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.70	7	350.00	\$ 2,695.00
11/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Aaron Sheanin, Shana Scarlett, Jessica Moy, and Todd Seaver re discovery conference and meet and confer.	1.30	11	465.00	\$ 604.50
11/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re deposition protocol.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
11/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re custodians.	2.00	6	465.00	\$ 930.00
11/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for discovery conference, including legal research.	3.80	14	465.00	\$ 1,767.00
11/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Sony meet and confer, including reviewing organizational charts.	0.40	6	465.00	\$ 186.00
11/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Travel from Sony meet and confer.	1.40	6	465.00	\$ 651.00
11/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Travel to Sony meet and confer.	1.00	6	465.00	\$ 465.00
11/07/14	HARVEY, DEAN		2.10	11	490.00	\$ 1,029.00
11/07/14	HILTERMANN, KAYLA	Created binder of articles written by potential experts Margaret Levenstein and Valerie Suslow.	1.10	1	305.00	\$ 335.50
11/07/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
11/07/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
11/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
11/07/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sony data for L. Chan review.	0.10	7	305.00	\$ 30.50
11/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for discovery conference, including research and email.	3.60	14	465.00	\$ 1,674.00
11/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for discovery conference; prepare for discovery conference.	7.90	14	465.00	\$ 3,673.50
11/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Review defendants' joint motion to certify orders for appeal under 28 U.S.C. 1292(b).	0.20	9	465.00	\$ 93.00
11/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Review Toshiba correspondence re summary judgment briefing.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
11/10/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.40	9	350.00	\$ 140.00
11/10/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.60	7	350.00	\$ 2,660.00
11/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with co-counsel re discovery conference.	0.80	14	465.00	\$ 372.00
11/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Discovery conference.	2.50	14	465.00	\$ 1,162.50
11/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re discovery conference.	1.00	11	465.00	\$ 465.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for discovery hearing, including reviewing defendants' filing and legal research; confer with Steve Williams re same.	2.50	14	465.00	\$ 1,162.50
11/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Travel to and from discovery conference.	1.40	14	465.00	\$ 651.00
11/10/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
11/10/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
11/10/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/11/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.30	9	350.00	\$ 105.00
11/11/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.70	7	350.00	\$ 2,695.00
11/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Aaron Sheanin re transactional data briefing.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
11/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case status and discovery conference.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
11/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with G. Stuart re document review and analysis; draft email correspondence re same.	0.70	11	465.00	\$ 325.50
11/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re potential NEC custodians.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
11/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery conference, class member inquiries, and document review.	0.70	11	465.00	\$ 325.50
11/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise Consortra contract.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
11/11/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
11/11/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
11/11/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/12/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.30	9	350.00	\$ 105.00
11/12/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.70	7	350.00	\$ 2,695.00
11/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim and K. Jones re document review.	0.90	7	465.00	\$ 418.50
11/12/14	CHAN, LIN		0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
11/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft discovery requests to defendants.	0.30	2	465.00	\$ 139.50
11/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re Catalyst, class member inquiries.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
11/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review.	0.30	7	465.00	\$ 139.50
11/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Panasonic and Sanyo.	1.50	6	465.00	\$ 697.50
11/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for document review meeting.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
11/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with Panasonic and Sanyo.	0.30	6	465.00	\$ 139.50
11/12/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
11/12/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
11/12/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/12/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review complaint and primary case materials.	6.50	9	350.00	\$ 2,275.00
11/13/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.20	9	350.00	\$ 70.00
11/13/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.80	7	350.00	\$ 2,730.00
11/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence re Panasonic/Sanyo.	0.70	6	465.00	\$ 325.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re case plan, Catalyst.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
11/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for document review training for G. Stuart.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
11/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Train G. Stuart for CaseMap document review.	0.80	7	465.00	\$ 372.00
11/13/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
11/13/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
11/13/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/13/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review complaint and primary case materials.	4.50	9	350.00	\$ 1,575.00
11/14/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.20	9	350.00	\$ 70.00
11/14/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.80	7	350.00	\$ 2,730.00
11/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Review draft stipulation re discovery plan; confer with D. Harvey re same.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
11/14/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
11/14/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
11/14/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/17/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
11/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with class members re case inquiries.	0.50	1	465.00	\$ 232.50
11/17/14	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	0.60	10	465.00	\$ 279.00
11/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with D. Harvey re potential expert.	0.30	10	465.00	\$ 139.50
11/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft deposition protocol; draft email correspondence re same.	1.00	6	465.00	\$ 465.00
11/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft written discovery; legal research re [REDACTED].	1.80	2	465.00	\$ 837.00
11/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery, document production, and privilege logs.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
11/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Research potential expert.	0.80	10	465.00	\$ 372.00
11/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Review discovery conference transcript.	1.00	9	465.00	\$ 465.00
11/17/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Valerie Suslow.	0.50	11	650.00	\$ 325.00
11/17/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential expert, research same; review correspondence re discovery issues, conference with L. Chan re same.	1.40	6	490.00	\$ 686.00
11/17/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
11/17/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
11/17/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/17/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	6.30	7	350.00	\$ 2,205.00
11/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
11/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Sony production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
11/17/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re loading of Samsung production by Catalyst	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
11/18/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Litigation strategy, analysis and case management conference call.	0.50	11	350.00	\$ 175.00
11/18/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.30	9	350.00	\$ 105.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/18/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.20	7	350.00	\$ 2,520.00
11/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Document review call.	0.40	7	465.00	\$ 186.00
11/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Review documents identified as hot.	0.60	7	465.00	\$ 279.00
11/18/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	7.50	7	515.00	\$ 3,862.50
11/18/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
11/18/14	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Decrypt DVD and copy contents to P drive.	1.50	7	320.00	\$ 480.00
11/18/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/18/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
11/18/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
11/18/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Samsung production for review by counsel.	0.50	7	305.00	\$ 152.50
11/19/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
11/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re depositions, translation protocol, and document review.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
11/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, interpreters, interrogatory responses, translations, transactional data, and written discovery.	1.10	11	465.00	\$ 511.50
11/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise letter re privilege logs.	0.20	6	465.00	\$ 93.00
11/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Review documents identified as hot.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
11/19/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research expert issues, conference with potential experts.	1.30	10	490.00	\$ 637.00
11/19/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
11/19/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
11/19/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/19/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
11/19/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Samsung production for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	305.00	\$ 152.50
11/19/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sony production for loading by Catalyst.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
11/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Document review management call.	0.60	7	465.00	\$ 279.00
11/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re deposition protocol, Consortra contract, privilege logs, interrogatories, document review, mediation.	1.50	11	465.00	\$ 697.50
11/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Respond to class member inquiries re case status.	0.40	1	465.00	\$ 186.00
11/20/14	CHAN, LIN	Review G. Stuart hours; draft email correspondence re same.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
11/20/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	7.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
11/20/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
11/20/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/20/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' productions for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
11/20/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re loading issues with Catalyst.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
11/21/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
11/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Demetrius Lambrinos and Shana Scarlett re case strategy.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on
Timekeeper: all

From 06/01/13
To 02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/21/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Shana Scarlett re case strategy.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
11/21/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	5.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,575.00
11/21/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
11/21/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/21/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	4.00	7	350.00	\$ 1,400.00
11/21/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email Catalyst re loading status of Sony production.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
11/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, transactional data, Consortra contract.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
11/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with Panasonic and Sanyo re privilege logs, including r [REDACTED].	3.00	6	465.00	\$ 1,395.00
11/22/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	4.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
11/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft [REDACTED] for meet and confer.	1.00	6	465.00	\$ 465.00
11/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, Consortra, class member inquiries, transactional data, deposition protocol.	1.20	11	465.00	\$ 558.00
11/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Review Panasonic answer.	0.50	9	465.00	\$ 232.50
11/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with G. Stuart and H. Rim re document review.	0.40	7	465.00	\$ 186.00
11/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case strategy.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
11/24/14	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
11/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re deposition scheduling, plaintiff discovery plan, transactional data, interrogatory responses, potential plaintiff; confer with D. Harvey re same.	1.00	11	465.00	\$ 465.00
11/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Finalize and file deposition protocol.	0.70	8	465.00	\$ 325.50
11/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Panasonic and Sanyo re privilege logs.	0.50	6	465.00	\$ 232.50
11/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re transactional data.	0.40	6	465.00	\$ 186.00
11/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with Panasonic and Sanyo, including conference with Jessica Moy and legal research.	0.80	6	465.00	\$ 372.00
11/24/14	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	0.30	8	465.00	\$ 139.50
11/24/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re retaining experts.	0.40	11	650.00	\$ 260.00
11/24/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
11/24/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
11/24/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/24/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
11/25/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.20	9	350.00	\$ 70.00
11/25/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.80	7	350.00	\$ 2,730.00
11/25/14	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
11/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re Consortra, privilege logs, [REDACTED], Econ One, joint statement, mediation.	1.30	11	465.00	\$ 604.50
11/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Panasonic and Sanyo re transactional data and interrogatories.	0.90	6	465.00	\$ 418.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/25/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Panasonic and Sanyo meet and confer, including reviewing prior correspondence and filings.	0.70	6	465.00	\$ 325.50
11/25/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and circulate expert retention agreement; research potential experts.	1.30	10	490.00	\$ 637.00
11/25/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
11/25/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
11/25/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/25/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
11/26/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.20	9	350.00	\$ 70.00
11/26/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.80	7	350.00	\$ 2,730.00
11/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and K. Jones re document review.	0.70	7	465.00	\$ 325.50
11/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Shana Scarlett and Aaron Sheanin re Toshiba motion for summary judgment.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
11/26/14	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
11/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft retainer agreement for Ed Leamer.	0.90	10	465.00	\$ 418.50
11/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
11/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re expert retention, [REDACTED], Sony finished product data, Toshiba motion for summary judgment, answers, custodian lists.	0.90	11	465.00	\$ 418.50
11/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Toshiba.	1.20	6	465.00	\$ 558.00
11/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with Toshiba re motion for summary judgment and finished products, including legal research re withdrawal, reviewing prior correspondence, and reviewing draft discovery requests.	1.90	6	465.00	\$ 883.50
11/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise meet and confer letter to Sony.	0.40	6	465.00	\$ 186.00
11/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Revise Toshiba discovery requests.	0.70	2	465.00	\$ 325.50
11/26/14	CHAN, LIN	Train and prepare to train C. Saunders for document review; draft email correspondence re same.	0.70	7	465.00	\$ 325.50
11/26/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
11/26/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
11/26/14	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate orders and briefs from various cases, for L. Chan.	1.00	11	270.00	\$ 270.00
11/26/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/26/14	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Meet with L. Chan regarding case management.	0.50	11	350.00	\$ 175.00
11/26/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	6.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,100.00
11/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery meet and confers, custodian lists.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
11/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit meet and confer letters.	0.20	6	465.00	\$ 93.00
11/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Review draft joint letter re worldwide transactional data; draft email correspondence re same.	0.60	8	465.00	\$ 279.00
11/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re joint letter brief, document review.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
11/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Review documents identified as hot.	0.80	7	465.00	\$ 372.00
11/28/14	CHAN, LIN	Review meet and confer correspondence and discovery requests.	0.40	6	465.00	\$ 186.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/28/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	1.50	7	350.00	\$ 525.00
11/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review.	0.30	7	465.00	\$ 139.50
11/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re joint letter brief, Catalyst, discovery.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
11/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re one-way intervention.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
11/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft plaintiff discovery plan.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
11/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft subpoenas to third parties.	0.70	2	465.00	\$ 325.50
11/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, 1292 briefing, mediation statement.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
11/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re withdrawal.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
12/01/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/01/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, plaintiffs' discovery plan, joint letter brief, Catalyst.	1.40	11	465.00	\$ 651.00
12/01/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review discovery letter brief; telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin re same; memorandum to co-counsel re same.	0.80	9	650.00	\$ 520.00
12/01/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
12/01/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
12/01/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects..	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
12/01/14	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Read and review pleadings, briefs, and discovery.	8.00	9	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/01/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/01/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Download production data and save to file.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
12/01/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.30	9	305.00	\$ 91.50
12/02/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Litigation strategy, analysis and case management attorney conference call.	0.60	11	350.00	\$ 210.00
12/02/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.40	9	350.00	\$ 140.00
12/02/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,450.00
12/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Check Judge Gonzalez Rogers' calendar.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
12/02/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re plaintiffs' discovery plan, document review, discovery responses.	0.90	11	465.00	\$ 418.50
12/02/14	GRANT, ANTHONY	Management of electronic discovery database.	2.00	7	320.00	\$ 640.00
12/02/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
12/02/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
12/02/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
12/02/14	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Read and review pleadings, briefs and discovery.	5.00	9	350.00	\$ 1,750.00
12/02/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/03/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft opposition to motion for 1292 certification.	2.50	8	465.00	\$ 1,162.50
12/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft plaintiffs' discovery plan.	0.50	8	465.00	\$ 232.50
12/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft proposed custodian list for GS Yuasa.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re withdrawal.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
12/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Review answers.	1.10	9	465.00	\$ 511.50
12/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Review hot Korean language documents.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
12/03/14	CHAN, LIN	Review NEC discovery responses.	0.20	9	465.00	\$ 93.00
12/03/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise opposition to 1292 motion.	1.10	8	650.00	\$ 715.00
12/03/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	4.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
12/03/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
12/03/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
12/03/14	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Read and review pleadings, briefs and discovery.	8.00	9	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/03/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/04/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.50	9	350.00	\$ 175.00
12/04/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.50	7	350.00	\$ 2,625.00
12/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with K. Jones and H. Rim re document review.	1.40	7	465.00	\$ 651.00
12/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re discovery strategy.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
12/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re custodian lists.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
12/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft and revise discovery plan.	0.70	11	465.00	\$ 325.50
12/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re document review, experts, 1292 opposition brief, and custodian lists; confer with D. Harvey re same.	1.50	11	465.00	\$ 697.50
12/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare to train C. Saunders re CaseMap.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
12/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Review documents identified as hot.	0.60	7	465.00	\$ 279.00
12/04/14	CHAN, LIN	Train C. Saunders on CaseMap.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
12/04/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential experts, retain Econ One, correspond with potential experts.	2.20	10	490.00	\$ 1,078.00
12/04/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
12/04/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
12/04/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
12/04/14	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Meet with L. Chan regarding case.	0.50	11	350.00	\$ 175.00
12/04/14	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.50	7	350.00	\$ 2,625.00
12/04/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/05/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/05/14	CARNAM, TODD	Pull cases from Westlaw and Lexis for L. Chan.	0.30	7	305.00	\$ 91.50
12/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re 1292 brief.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
12/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Ronnie Spiegel, H. Rim, and K. Jones re document review.	0.60	7	465.00	\$ 279.00
12/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case management.	1.00	11	465.00	\$ 465.00
12/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re discovery and new plaintiffs.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re custodian negotiations.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
12/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with G. Stuart re document review.	0.20	7	465.00	\$ 93.00
12/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list, including reviewing orders and email correspondence.	0.80	11	465.00	\$ 372.00
12/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, custodian lists, and discovery.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
12/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit 1292 opposition brief.	0.50	8	465.00	\$ 232.50
12/05/14	CHAN, LIN	Review Consortra contract; draft email correspondence re same.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
12/05/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jeff Friedman; draft task list; email correspondence with Jeff Friedman.	2.10	11	650.00	\$ 1,365.00
12/05/14	GRANT, ANTHONY	Management of electronic discovery database. Train employees to use electronic discovery database. Troubleshoot of issues with electronic discovery database.	3.00	7	320.00	\$ 960.00
12/05/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
12/05/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
12/05/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
12/05/14	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Meet with A. Grant regarding CaseMap training for document review.	0.50	7	350.00	\$ 175.00
12/05/14	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.50	7	350.00	\$ 2,625.00
12/05/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/06/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	4.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
12/07/14	CHAN, LIN		0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
12/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence to Toshiba re discovery for withdrawal motion; legal research re same.	0.60	6	465.00	\$ 279.00
12/07/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re custodian lists, 1292 opposition brief, document review, discovery.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
12/08/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case strategy.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
12/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with co-counsel and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re custodian lists.	0.70	11	465.00	\$ 325.50
12/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft proposed custodian lists.	7.60	6	465.00	\$ 3,534.00
12/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re potential custodians and other discovery issues.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
12/08/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise draft search term protocol.	0.20	6	465.00	\$ 93.00
12/08/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
12/08/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
12/08/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
12/08/14	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/08/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/09/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Litigation strategy, analysis and case management weekly conference call.	0.60	11	350.00	\$ 210.00
12/09/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.30	9	350.00	\$ 105.00
12/09/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.10	7	350.00	\$ 2,485.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/09/14	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Input regarding production file to download.	0.20	7	320.00	\$ 64.00
12/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Troxel re document production and Catalyst.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
12/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft custodian lists; confer with H. Rim and Shana Scarlett re same.	3.90	6	465.00	\$ 1,813.50
12/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft inventory re document production.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
12/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re ██████████ and search term protocol, case strategy, document review; confer with K. Jones re same.	1.00	11	465.00	\$ 465.00
12/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with NEC re transactional data.	0.90	6	465.00	\$ 418.50
12/09/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Panasonic/Sanyo re transactional data.	0.60	6	465.00	\$ 279.00
12/09/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft/revise task list.	0.50	11	650.00	\$ 325.00
12/09/14	GRANT, ANTHONY	Un-archive documents. Electronic document control.	3.00	7	320.00	\$ 960.00
12/09/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
12/09/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
12/09/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
12/09/14	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/09/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/09/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Meet with L. Chan re discovery issues.	0.30	11	305.00	\$ 91.50
12/09/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production index for attorney review.	1.00	7	305.00	\$ 305.00
12/09/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.50	9	305.00	\$ 152.50
12/09/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review productions and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	2.20	7	305.00	\$ 671.00
12/10/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.30	9	350.00	\$ 105.00
12/10/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.10	7	350.00	\$ 2,485.00
12/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference K. Jones and H. Rim re document review.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
12/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Bryan Payne, T. Lee, and M. Boyle re organization charts and custodian lists.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
12/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Aaron Sheanin re SDI custodian list.	0.90	11	465.00	\$ 418.50
12/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re custodian lists.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
12/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft proposed custodian lists.	3.20	6	465.00	\$ 1,488.00
12/10/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re custodian lists, document review, document production, Consortra, motion to strike.	2.70	11	465.00	\$ 1,255.50
12/10/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Read proposed stipulation; telephone conference with Steve Williams.	0.50	11	650.00	\$ 325.00
12/10/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
12/10/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
12/10/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
12/10/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Email Catalyst re status of Sony data mapping.	0.20	7	305.00	\$ 61.00
12/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading by Catalyst.	1.30	7	305.00	\$ 396.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare email re Catalyst poor instruction billing for L. Chan.	0.50	7	305.00	\$ 152.50
12/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare revised production log for L. Chan review.	0.50	7	305.00	\$ 152.50
12/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	1.00	9	305.00	\$ 305.00
12/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.10	9	305.00	\$ 30.50
12/10/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re outstanding issues for defense productions sent to Catalyst.	0.70	7	305.00	\$ 213.50
12/11/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.50	9	350.00	\$ 175.00
12/11/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	4.00	7	350.00	\$ 1,400.00
12/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Jessica Moy and Todd Seaver re Sony custodians; draft email correspondence re same; confer with H. Rim re same.	1.40	11	465.00	\$ 651.00
12/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ben Shiftan re NEC custodians; draft email correspondence re same.	0.80	11	465.00	\$ 372.00
12/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with co-counsel re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
12/11/14	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
12/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to Toshiba re partial summary judgment motion.	1.50	6	465.00	\$ 697.50
12/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence to Sony.	0.40	6	465.00	\$ 186.00
12/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft SDI custodian list.	0.80	11	465.00	\$ 372.00
12/11/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with SDI re custodian lists; draft email correspondence re same.	1.90	6	465.00	\$ 883.50
12/11/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	[REDACTED]	2.10	11	700.00	\$ 1,470.00
12/11/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
12/11/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
12/11/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
12/11/14	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, etc., for case.	4.00	9	350.00	\$ 1,400.00
12/12/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Read and review pleadings, briefs, discovery, transcripts, etc.	0.30	9	350.00	\$ 105.00
12/12/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.10	7	350.00	\$ 2,485.00
12/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ben Shiftan re custodian list; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
12/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case strategy.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
12/12/14	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
12/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence to Sony re custodians.	1.80	6	465.00	\$ 837.00
12/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence to Toshiba re motion for summary judgment.	0.20	6	465.00	\$ 93.00
12/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft Sony custodian list.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
12/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
12/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document production, translation protocol, custodian negotiations, and Catalyst.	2.30	11	465.00	\$ 1,069.50
12/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Toshiba re transactional data.	0.50	6	465.00	\$ 232.50
12/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Negotiate Consortra contract; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
12/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Consortra negotiation, including review email correspondence and draft contract.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/12/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with Toshiba re transactional data, including reviewing prior discovery responses and correspondence.	0.30	6	465.00	\$ 139.50
12/12/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft planning documents; telephone conference with Jeff Friedman re same; telephone conference with L. Chan re same.	2.20	11	650.00	\$ 1,430.00
12/12/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
12/12/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
12/12/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
12/12/14	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	4.00	7	350.00	\$ 1,400.00
12/12/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/12/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Load translated production documents to CaseMap.	0.50	7	305.00	\$ 152.50
12/12/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	1.50	9	305.00	\$ 457.50
12/12/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re outstanding production issues for Catalyst.	0.50	7	305.00	\$ 152.50
12/13/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence to Sony re custodians.	1.00	6	465.00	\$ 465.00
12/13/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	4.00	7	350.00	\$ 1,400.00
12/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to Toshiba re motion for summary judgment.	2.80	6	465.00	\$ 1,302.00
12/14/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re translation protocol, custodian lists, Catalyst.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
12/15/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re case strategy and work distribution.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
12/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with C. Saunders and G. Stuart re document review and CaseMap.	0.30	7	465.00	\$ 139.50
12/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re discovery conference and CaseMap.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
12/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Document review and check quality of coding; confer with C. Saunders re same.	0.40	7	465.00	\$ 186.00
12/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to Sony re custodians.	0.20	6	465.00	\$ 93.00
12/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to Toshiba re summary judgment motion.	0.40	6	465.00	\$ 186.00
12/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, custodian lists, transactional data.	2.40	11	465.00	\$ 1,116.00
12/15/14	CHAN, LIN	Set up coding panel for CaseMap.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
12/15/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum correspondence with Jeff Friedman re hearing. Office conference with L. Chan re hearing. Office conference with E. Fastiff re work plan. Telephone conference with Steve Williams. Review LG Chem Grand Jury documents. Office conference with L. Chan re database.	3.60	11	650.00	\$ 2,340.00
12/15/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan and D. Harvey; telephone conference with Steve Williams.	1.30	11	650.00	\$ 845.00
12/15/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN		0.40	11	650.00	\$ 260.00
12/15/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Steve Williams re hearing.	0.20	14	650.00	\$ 130.00
12/15/14	HARVEY, DEAN	correspond with Dr. Ed Leamer re expert retention; conference with B. Glackin and L. Chan re data production and pending expert issues; review and research data issues.	3.60	10	490.00	\$ 1,764.00
12/15/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
12/15/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/15/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
12/15/14	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,450.00
12/15/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,450.00
12/15/14	TAJIMA, SERA	Create two binders of custodian lists for B. Glackin and D. Harvey.	1.50	7	260.00	\$ 390.00
12/15/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.50	9	305.00	\$ 152.50
12/15/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	[REDACTED]	0.40	9	305.00	\$ 122.00
12/15/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare meet and confer correspondence for D. Harvey review.	1.50	9	305.00	\$ 457.50
12/15/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and monitor status re loading of productions by Catalyst.	0.40	7	305.00	\$ 122.00
12/15/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	305.00	\$ 152.50
12/16/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Litigation strategy, analysis and case management attorney conference call.	0.60	11	350.00	\$ 210.00
12/16/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.40	7	350.00	\$ 2,590.00
12/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim and Ronnie Spiegel re document review.	1.00	7	465.00	\$ 465.00
12/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft SDI custodian list and prepare for meet and confer; confer with Aaron Sheanin re same; draft email correspondence re same.	1.80	11	465.00	\$ 837.00
12/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list; confer with B. Glackin re same.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
12/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re custodian lists, document review, letter to Judge Ryu.	1.20	11	465.00	\$ 558.00
12/16/14	CHAN, LIN	Set up coding panel for CaseMap document review.	0.10	7	465.00	\$ 46.50
12/16/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan.	0.50	11	650.00	\$ 325.00
12/16/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	[REDACTED]	0.40	9	650.00	\$ 260.00
12/16/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
12/16/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
12/16/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
12/16/14	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/16/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/16/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare meet and confer correspondence for attorney review.	1.50	9	305.00	\$ 457.50
12/16/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	8	305.00	\$ 152.50
12/16/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.20	9	305.00	\$ 61.00
12/16/14	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re loading of productions by Catalyst for L. Chan.	0.40	7	305.00	\$ 122.00
12/17/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and K. Jones re document review.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
12/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with co-lead counsel re division of labor and case strategy.	0.80	11	465.00	\$ 372.00
12/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
12/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, transactional data, task list.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
12/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with SDI re custodian list; draft follow up list re same.	1.80	6	465.00	\$ 837.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for discovery conference, including reviewing prior filings.	1.00	14	465.00	\$ 465.00
12/17/14	CHAN, LIN	Revise Consortra contract.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
12/17/14	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read discovery letters.	1.20	9	700.00	\$ 840.00
12/17/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Lead co-counsel call.	0.90	11	650.00	\$ 585.00
12/17/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential expert, draft and circulate summary re same.	1.20	10	490.00	\$ 588.00
12/17/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	2.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
12/17/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
12/17/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
12/17/14	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/17/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/18/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Attend discovery conference; confer with co-counsel re same.	3.50	14	465.00	\$ 1,627.50
12/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Call with co-counsel re document review.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50
12/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re deposition plan.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
12/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft comments re translation protocol.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
12/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re discovery conference.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
12/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, Consortra contract, and custodian negotiations.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
12/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with NEC; conference with Ben Shiftan re meet and confer; confer with NEC re custodians.	1.20	6	465.00	\$ 558.00
12/18/14	CHAN, LIN	Travel to and from hearing, including reviewing relevant legal research and confer with co-counsel.	1.60	14	465.00	\$ 744.00
12/18/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
12/18/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
12/18/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
12/18/14	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/18/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/19/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re translation protocol.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
12/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with potential class members re case inquiry.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
12/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re translation protocol.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
12/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Veronica Glaze re Consortra; draft email correspondence re same.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
12/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to NEC re custodians.	1.00	6	465.00	\$ 465.00
12/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re custodian lists, Catalyst, and Consortra contract.	0.80	11	465.00	\$ 372.00
12/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Review resume of potential document reviewer; confer re same.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
12/19/14	CHAN, LIN	Revise translation protocol; draft email correspondence re same.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/19/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise translation protocol; office conference with L. Chan re same.	0.80	11	650.00	\$ 520.00
12/19/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
12/19/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
12/19/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
12/19/14	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Document review.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/19/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.50	7	350.00	\$ 2,625.00
12/21/14	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	3.50	7	350.00	\$ 1,225.00
12/22/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Jessica Moy and G. Stuart re Sony custodians.	0.60	11	465.00	\$ 279.00
12/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference with potential document reviewer; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	11	465.00	\$ 232.50
12/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re Sony custodians and answer.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
12/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review and custodians.	0.70	11	465.00	\$ 325.50
12/22/14	CHAN, LIN	Review Panasonic, Sanyo, GS Yuasa, and Toshiba discovery responses.	0.20	9	465.00	\$ 93.00
12/22/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
12/22/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
12/22/14	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	4.50	7	350.00	\$ 1,575.00
12/22/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,450.00
12/23/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review and potential deponents.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
12/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re custodian list.	1.90	6	465.00	\$ 883.50
12/23/14	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Sony meet and confer, including reviewing notes, correspondence and memoranda.	1.00	6	465.00	\$ 465.00
12/23/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	██████████; memorandums re departing Samsung employee.	0.60	11	650.00	\$ 390.00
12/23/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
12/23/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	4.50	7	260.00	\$ 1,170.00
12/23/14	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	3.00	7	350.00	\$ 1,050.00
12/23/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,450.00
12/24/14	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re custodian lists, document review, and transactional data.	0.40	11	465.00	\$ 186.00
12/24/14	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise meet and confer correspondence to Sony.	0.80	6	465.00	\$ 372.00
12/24/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence re departing Samsung employee.	0.20	11	650.00	\$ 130.00
12/24/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	5.00	7	450.00	\$ 2,250.00
12/26/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	5.80	7	260.00	\$ 1,508.00
12/27/14	CHAN, LIN	Review Panasonic Sanyo discovery responses.	0.10	9	465.00	\$ 46.50
12/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Document review; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	7	465.00	\$ 232.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/29/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re custodian negotiations, Catalyst, Sanyo discovery responses, depositions, and expert work.	0.90	11	465.00	\$ 418.50
12/29/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
12/29/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Conference experts and co-counsel re transactional data; confer with Judith Zahid re same.	1.00	10	465.00	\$ 465.00
12/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ben Shiftan re NEC custodian negotiations.	0.30	11	465.00	\$ 139.50
12/30/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re NEC custodian negotiations, Consortra, Catalyst, and transactional data.	3.40	11	465.00	\$ 1,581.00
12/30/14	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Kick off conference call with experts; telephone conference with Ed Leamer.	1.30	11	650.00	\$ 845.00
12/30/14	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Ed Leamer, Econ One, and Co-Counsel.	0.70	10	490.00	\$ 343.00
12/30/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
12/30/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
12/30/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
12/31/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ben Shiftan re NEC custodian negotiations.	0.10	11	465.00	\$ 46.50
12/31/14	CHAN, LIN	Confer with M. Pilotin re potential conflict questions.	0.20	11	465.00	\$ 93.00
12/31/14	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re class member inquiries, custodian negotiations, transactional data.	0.70	11	465.00	\$ 325.50
12/31/14	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
12/31/14	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
12/31/14	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	0.50	7	260.00	\$ 130.00
12/31/14	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	1.00	7	350.00	\$ 350.00
12/31/14	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/02/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
01/02/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	1.30	7	325.00	\$ 422.50
01/02/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/03/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	5.30	7	350.00	\$ 1,855.00
01/05/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Review correspondence re data issues; conference with potential expert; research data productions.	2.60	10	515.00	\$ 1,339.00
01/05/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
01/05/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
01/05/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
01/05/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/05/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Toshiba production for loading by Catalyst.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
01/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare transactional data for D. Harvey review.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
01/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review transactional data re electronically stored information protocol.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
01/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re custodian negotiations and document production.	3.20	11	490.00	\$ 1,568.00
01/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re custodians.	1.20	6	490.00	\$ 588.00
01/06/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Research data issues, conference with Phil Johnson re same, conference with B. Troxel re same.	2.10	10	515.00	\$ 1,081.50
01/06/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	6.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,090.00
01/06/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
01/06/15	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Decrypt disc contents and save to P:/ drive.	1.00	7	340.00	\$ 340.00
01/06/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
01/06/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	5.00	7	350.00	\$ 1,750.00
01/06/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	5.50	7	350.00	\$ 1,925.00
01/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare transactional data for attorney review.	3.50	7	325.00	\$ 1,137.50
01/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare transactional data for loading by Catalyst.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
01/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	1.00	9	325.00	\$ 325.00
01/07/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with co-counsel and defendants re data productions issues, prepare for same, research issues re same; conference with Shana Scarlett re outstanding data and expert issues; conference with Phil Johnson; research data production chart and conference with B. Troxel re same.	4.10	10	515.00	\$ 2,111.50
01/07/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
01/07/15	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Show paralegal decrypting method use on truecrypt encryption method.	0.50	7	340.00	\$ 170.00
01/07/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
01/07/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/07/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	6.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,100.00
01/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare transactional data for attorney review.	4.50	7	325.00	\$ 1,462.50
01/08/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Research data production issues; attend conference call re Sony data productions.	2.10	10	515.00	\$ 1,081.50
01/08/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
01/08/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
01/08/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
01/08/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/08/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare transactional data for attorney review.	2.50	7	325.00	\$ 812.50
01/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare transactional data for loading by Catalyst.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
01/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
01/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with NEC re custodians; separate meet and confer with Ben Shiftan re same.	2.00	6	490.00	\$ 980.00
01/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for NEC and SDI meet and confer; draft email correspondence re same.	1.80	6	490.00	\$ 882.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/09/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defendants re data productions, custodians, and follow-up on other pending discovery issues, prepare for same, review draft letter memorializing same; revise data production charts.	3.20	10	515.00	\$ 1,648.00
01/09/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
01/09/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
01/09/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
01/09/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/09/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
01/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
01/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with D. Harvey re custodian negotiations; draft email correspondence re same.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
01/10/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	4.50	7	350.00	\$ 1,575.00
01/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence and memoranda re custodian lists.	3.20	11	490.00	\$ 1,568.00
01/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with NEC re custodians; separate conference with Ben Shiftan re same.	0.70	6	490.00	\$ 343.00
01/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with SDI re custodians; separate conference with Aaron Sheanin re same.	1.20	6	490.00	\$ 588.00
01/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re custodians.	1.10	6	490.00	\$ 539.00
01/12/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
01/12/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
01/12/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
01/12/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	6.50	7	350.00	\$ 2,275.00
01/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
01/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re loading of Samsung production by Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
01/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence and memoranda re custodian lists.	7.60	11	490.00	\$ 3,724.00
01/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter briefs re custodians; legal research re same.	3.10	8	490.00	\$ 1,519.00
01/13/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
01/13/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
01/13/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
01/13/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
01/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.70	9	325.00	\$ 227.50
01/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.70	7	325.00	\$ 227.50
01/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review e-mails from Econ One re transactional data.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
01/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleading and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
01/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Aaron Sheanin re custodians.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
01/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ben Shiftan re NEC custodians.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with D. Harvey re case status; draft email correspondence re same.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
01/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re Sony custodians.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
01/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Shana Scarlett re case status.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
01/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re custodians; review proposals re same.	1.80	11	490.00	\$ 882.00
01/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with NEC re custodians.	0.30	6	490.00	\$ 147.00
01/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Panasonic re custodians and transactional data.	0.60	6	490.00	\$ 294.00
01/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re custodians.	0.20	6	490.00	\$ 98.00
01/14/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Email correspondence re custodian issues, GS Yuasa issues.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
01/14/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with defendant NEC re transactional data issues; research and review correspondence and other information re outstanding data disputes with defendants. conference with L. Chan re same.	2.10	10	515.00	\$ 1,081.50
01/14/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
01/14/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
01/14/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
01/14/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense production for loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
01/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
01/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re rough translations of defense productions.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
01/15/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case strategy; draft email correspondence re same.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
01/15/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Troxel re document production; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
01/15/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with document review management re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	1.10	7	490.00	\$ 539.00
01/15/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to NEC re custodians.	0.80	6	490.00	\$ 392.00
01/15/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re custodian lists, plaintiffs, and transactional data.	1.20	11	490.00	\$ 588.00
01/15/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit draft letter brief re search term protocol.	0.70	8	490.00	\$ 343.00
01/15/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Catalyst invoice; draft email correspondence re same.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
01/15/15	CHAN, LIN	Review draft GS Yuasa settlement filing.	0.20	8	490.00	\$ 98.00
01/15/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft agreement re prioritizing custodians; memorandum re same.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
01/15/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
01/15/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
01/15/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
01/15/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	6.50	7	350.00	\$ 2,275.00
01/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
01/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Meet with L. Chan re discovery issues.	0.20	11	325.00	\$ 65.00
01/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit index of defense productions.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
01/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re Sony production prefix issues.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
01/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
01/16/15	CHAN, LIN		0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
01/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, custodian negotiations, search term protocol, and transactional data; conference with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, Aaron Sheanin, and Shana Scarlett re same.	1.80	11	490.00	\$ 882.00
01/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with SDI re transactional data.	0.40	6	490.00	\$ 196.00
01/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Review documents identified as hot.	0.90	7	490.00	\$ 441.00
01/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Review hot documents.	0.70	7	490.00	\$ 343.00
01/16/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft [REDACTED]; review data and custodian correspondence, conference with co-counsel re same.	1.60	10	515.00	\$ 824.00
01/16/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
01/16/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
01/16/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
01/17/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	4.50	7	350.00	\$ 1,575.00
01/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re transactional data.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
01/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Review [REDACTED] joint status report.	0.20	9	490.00	\$ 98.00
01/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, translations, and transactional data.	1.00	11	490.00	\$ 490.00
01/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Review documents re Sam Kim; draft email correspondence re same.	1.80	7	490.00	\$ 882.00
01/19/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
01/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case status.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
01/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re privilege logs.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
01/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Document review call.	0.20	7	490.00	\$ 98.00
01/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list, including reviewing status of discovery requests.	1.60	11	490.00	\$ 784.00
01/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Toshiba re transactional data; draft email correspondence re same.	0.60	6	490.00	\$ 294.00
01/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Review documents for SDI custodians and prioritize them for production.	1.30	11	490.00	\$ 637.00
01/20/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence re Sam Kim.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
01/20/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re status of case; [REDACTED]	0.80	11	675.00	\$ 540.00
01/20/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
01/20/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
01/20/15	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Decrypt disc and save contents to P:/ drive.	1.00	7	340.00	\$ 340.00
01/20/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
01/20/15	SHAVER, ANNE	Pull motion to substitute plaintiff for L. Chan.	0.30	8	490.00	\$ 147.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/20/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense production for expert review.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
01/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
01/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re Sony prefix issue.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
01/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
01/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Sony production re encryption issues.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
01/21/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with co-leads re case strategy.	1.20	11	490.00	\$ 588.00
01/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with K. Jones and H. Rim re document review and evidence synthesis.	1.00	11	490.00	\$ 490.00
01/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re synthesis of evidence.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
01/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence re case status, document review, custodians.	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
01/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memoranda re potential deponents.	1.20	11	490.00	\$ 588.00
01/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with defendants re translation protocol.	0.60	6	490.00	\$ 294.00
01/21/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Weekly team call; office conference with L. Chan.	1.20	11	675.00	\$ 810.00
01/21/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Ed Leamer re expert issues; conference with Phil Johnson re expert work allocation; attend weekly co-lead call; research expert and data issues.	2.30	10	515.00	\$ 1,184.50
01/21/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
01/21/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
01/21/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
01/21/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	6.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,100.00
01/21/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
01/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare custodial documents for L. Chan review.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
01/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense production for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
01/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare pleadings for B. Glackin review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
01/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	11	325.00	\$ 65.00
01/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
01/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re LG Chem productions loaded to Catalyst.	0.70	7	325.00	\$ 227.50
01/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re transactional data files with Catalyst.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
01/22/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Document review management conference call.	0.70	7	490.00	\$ 343.00
01/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review and depositions.	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
01/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meeting re synthesis of evidence and depositions, including drafting memoranda; conference with H. Rim and K. Dugar re same.	5.40	11	490.00	\$ 2,646.00
01/22/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/22/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
01/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with L. Chan regarding discovery.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
01/22/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
01/22/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,450.00
01/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re transactional data issues.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
01/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition planning documents for L. Chan review.	2.70	9	325.00	\$ 877.50
01/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG Chem documents for loading by Catalyst.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
01/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
01/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
01/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re LG Chem native files with Catalyst.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
01/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
01/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone call with Catalyst re transactional data issues.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
01/23/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/23/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Set up and copy documents from network to a flash drives.	1.50	7	340.00	\$ 510.00
01/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Steve Williams, Demetrius Lambrinos, D. Harvey, and B. Glackin re depositions.	1.50	11	490.00	\$ 735.00
01/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Matt Boyle re document review plan.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
01/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re custodian, document review, search terms, translation protocol, and deponent identification.	1.40	11	490.00	\$ 686.00
01/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for deposition planning meeting; draft email correspondence re same.	1.80	11	490.00	\$ 882.00
01/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Prioritize custodians, including reviewing memoranda and documents.	2.00	11	490.00	\$ 980.00
01/23/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meeting re planning of depositions.	1.60	11	675.00	\$ 1,080.00
01/23/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with co-counsel re deposition planning, prepare for same, research same.	2.60	11	515.00	\$ 1,339.00
01/23/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
01/23/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
01/23/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
01/23/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
01/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition planning documents for L. Chan review.	1.20	9	325.00	\$ 390.00
01/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production index for L. Chan review.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
01/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare transactional data for co-counsel review.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
01/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare transactional data for Econ One review.	0.50	10	325.00	\$ 162.50
01/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, custodians, and transactional data.	1.10	11	490.00	\$ 539.00
01/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Prioritize NEC custodian production.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
01/26/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Analysis re custodian prioritization.	3.00	11	490.00	\$ 1,470.00
01/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case status.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
01/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim and K. Jones re document review and depositions.	0.80	11	490.00	\$ 392.00
01/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re deposition liaisons.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
01/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel and Demetrius Lambrinos re Catalyst and depositions.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
01/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Shana Scarlett re custodian prioritization.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
01/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Document review re GS Yuasa.	0.20	7	490.00	\$ 98.00
01/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re transactional data, document review, discovery responses, and document production.	1.60	11	490.00	\$ 784.00
01/26/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read order denying §1292 appeal.	0.10	9	725.00	\$ 72.50
01/26/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft letter re Sam Kim. Review LG Chem documents. Office conference with L. Chan re status of various products.	1.50	11	675.00	\$ 1,012.50
01/26/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
01/26/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
01/26/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
01/26/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare draft deposition notice.	1.20	8	325.00	\$ 390.00
01/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production index for Econ One review.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
01/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
01/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production translations.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
01/27/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ben Shiftan re NEC custodians.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
01/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re 30(b)(6) deposition notice.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
01/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with D. Harvey re transactional data.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
01/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re Catalyst and Sony custodians.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
01/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Jones re GS Yuasa documents.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
01/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Veronica Glaze re translation vendors.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
01/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
01/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re [REDACTED].	1.40	11	490.00	\$ 686.00
01/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit letter re litigation fund.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
01/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Review document with K. Jones; draft email correspondence re same.	0.30	7	490.00	\$ 147.00
01/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Review prior correspondence and privilege logs; draft correspondence re same.	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
01/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Serve deposition notice, including drafting notice and researching rules re service; confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re same.	0.70	2	490.00	\$ 343.00
01/27/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft letter to executive committee firms; review order re 1292 certification.	0.70	11	675.00	\$ 472.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/27/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Finalize and send letter to Sam Kim.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
01/27/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re expert search.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
01/27/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential experts and conference with B. Glackin re same; conference with potential experts; review data issues, conference with Shana Scarlett re same.	2.20	10	515.00	\$ 1,133.00
01/27/15	HILTERMANN, KAYLA	[REDACTED]	0.90	10	325.00	\$ 292.50
01/27/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
01/27/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
01/27/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with L. Chan regarding deposition notices.	0.10	2	435.00	\$ 43.50
01/27/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
01/27/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	3.00	7	350.00	\$ 1,050.00
01/27/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,450.00
01/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense production for loading by Catalyst.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
01/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production documents for Econ One review.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
01/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
01/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Upload production documents to Case Map.	3.00	7	325.00	\$ 975.00
01/28/15	BERNSTEIN, WILLIAM	Review hot documents.	0.80	7	975.00	\$ 780.00
01/28/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case status.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
01/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Catalyst re platform analytics.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
01/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with co-lead counsel re case strategy.	1.00	11	490.00	\$ 490.00
01/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re deposition subpoena.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
01/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim and K. Jones re document review, translations, and depositions.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
01/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re translations; draft email correspondence re same.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
01/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to NEC re custodians.	0.30	6	490.00	\$ 147.00
01/28/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Attend weekly co-lead conference call, prepare for same; conference with Panasonic counsel re data questions, draft summary re same; review correspondence with Defendants; research potential experts, conference with same, conference with B. Glackin re same.	3.20	11	515.00	\$ 1,648.00
01/28/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
01/28/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
01/28/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
01/28/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re status of replacement files.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
01/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense production for loading by Catalyst.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
01/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production correspondence for Econ One review.	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare transactional data for Econ One review.	0.40	10	325.00	\$ 130.00
01/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
01/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review expert correspondence re Sony data.	0.10	10	325.00	\$ 32.50
01/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re LG documents in Case Map.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
01/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re LG production loaded to Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
01/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re pending translations for Econ One.	0.30	10	325.00	\$ 97.50
01/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re service of deposition notice.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
01/29/15	BERNSTEIN, WILLIAM	Review hot documents.	1.00	7	975.00	\$ 975.00
01/29/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Call Shana Scarlett re custodian prioritization; draft email correspondence re same.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
01/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Ronnie Spiegel, Nate Cihlar, Shinae Kim-Helms, K. Jones, and H. Rim re document review.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
01/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re Toshiba discovery; draft email correspondence re same.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
01/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re Sony redactions and privilege log.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
01/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Nate Cihlar re informal translations.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
01/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re document review.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
01/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence to NEC and Panasonic/Sanyo re custodians and privilege logs.	0.20	6	490.00	\$ 98.00
01/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft Sam Kim subpoena and check local rules; conference with Jessica Moy and Demetrius Lambrinos re same; draft email correspondence re same.	1.40	2	490.00	\$ 686.00
01/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re custodian prioritization, translation protocol, informal translations, time reporting.	0.80	11	490.00	\$ 392.00
01/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with defendants re custodian prioritization.	0.90	6	490.00	\$ 441.00
01/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re discovery.	1.10	6	490.00	\$ 539.00
01/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Review ESI protocol.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
01/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Review time records from other firms.	1.10	11	490.00	\$ 539.00
01/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Revise task list.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
01/29/15	HILTERMANN, KAYLA		1.00	10	325.00	\$ 325.00
01/29/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
01/29/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
01/29/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with L. Chan regarding subpoena.	0.10	2	435.00	\$ 43.50
01/29/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
01/29/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	5.00	7	350.00	\$ 1,750.00
01/29/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Download native files for Econ One review.	0.60	10	325.00	\$ 195.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re replacement LG files.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
01/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re replacement Panasonic and Sanyo files.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
01/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading by Catalyst.	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00
01/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare translated productions for Econ One review.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
01/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
01/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
01/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re documents sent to Econ One.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
01/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re duplicate LG production loaded to Catalyst.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
01/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated defense productions and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
01/30/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
01/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Catalyst re document review.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
01/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re Catalyst.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
01/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re Toshiba discovery, Catalyst, translations, privilege logs.	1.00	11	490.00	\$ 490.00
01/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise joint letter brief re discovery responses.	0.10	8	490.00	\$ 49.00
01/30/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
01/30/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
01/30/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
01/30/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	4.50	7	350.00	\$ 1,575.00
01/30/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,450.00
01/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare replacement defense productions for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
01/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare translated production documents for Econ One review.	0.60	10	325.00	\$ 195.00
01/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
01/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translation and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
01/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/02/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re billing rates; draft email correspondence re same.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review issues.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with plaintiffs' counsel re translation protocol.	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
02/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Tracy McMahon, B. Glackin, and K. Dugar re Catalyst and document review.	1.00	11	490.00	\$ 490.00
02/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re translation protocol, document review, cost report, transactional data, translations.	1.20	11	490.00	\$ 588.00
02/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with defendants re translation protocol.	0.80	6	490.00	\$ 392.00
02/02/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential experts, correspond with same, conference with same, conference with B. Glackin re same.	2.30	10	515.00	\$ 1,184.50
02/02/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/02/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
02/02/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Meet with IT (A. Hardy) to review computer and file systems for document review project.	2.00	7	350.00	\$ 700.00
02/02/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Review complaint and case documents.	5.40	9	350.00	\$ 1,890.00
02/02/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
02/02/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,450.00
02/02/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare transactional data for Econ One review.	0.40	10	325.00	\$ 130.00
02/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review NEC production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review NEC production and prepare for translation.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/03/15	BERNSTEIN, WILLIAM	Continue hot document review.	0.50	7	975.00	\$ 487.50
02/03/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Call with Demetrius Lambrinos re GS Yuasa status report; draft email correspondence re same.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Catalyst training.	1.30	11	490.00	\$ 637.00
02/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re prioritization of custodians and Catalyst.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
02/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re Toshiba discovery.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
02/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re translations, document review, search terms, prioritization, Catalyst.	1.00	11	490.00	\$ 490.00
02/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Toshiba re discovery and motion for summary judgment.	0.70	6	490.00	\$ 343.00
02/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with Toshiba, including reviewing prior correspondence and legal research.	0.90	6	490.00	\$ 441.00
02/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise 30(b)(6) notice.	0.60	2	490.00	\$ 294.00
02/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Review draft search terms; confer with H. Rim re same.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
02/03/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential experts, research same.	1.60	10	515.00	\$ 824.00
02/03/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
02/03/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
02/03/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Analyze hot document spreadsheet; draft memo regarding evidence if inter-defendant sales.	5.00	7	350.00	\$ 1,750.00
02/03/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Review complaint and case documents.	2.30	9	350.00	\$ 805.00
02/03/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with L. Chan regarding document production.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
02/03/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
02/03/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/03/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re NEC production mapping.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare transactional data for Econ One review.	0.30	10	325.00	\$ 97.50
02/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit calendar re deposition dates.	0.10	4	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re Toshiba translations for Econ One.	0.30	10	325.00	\$ 97.50
02/04/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Analyze LG custodians for depositions.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Call with co-lead counsel re case strategy.	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
02/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and K. Jones re document review and evidence synthesis.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
02/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with co-counsel and DPP's re Toshiba discovery plan.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
02/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to LG re potential deponent; confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re same.	0.60	6	490.00	\$ 294.00
02/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re Toshiba discovery, document review, case strategy.	1.90	11	490.00	\$ 931.00
02/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re [REDACTED]	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
02/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Toshiba re discovery responses.	1.10	6	490.00	\$ 539.00
02/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise discovery requests to Toshiba.	0.60	2	490.00	\$ 294.00
02/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise meet and confer letter to Toshiba re motion for summary judgment.	0.20	6	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/04/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with co-counsel re weekly status meeting, prepare for same.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
02/04/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential experts, draft summary re same, research same.	1.30	10	515.00	\$ 669.50
02/04/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and research subpoena to plaintiffs' firms in related cases.	0.60	2	515.00	\$ 309.00
02/04/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
02/04/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
02/04/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	[REDACTED]	7.80	7	350.00	\$ 2,730.00
02/04/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
02/04/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/04/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare disclosures for K. Jones review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare draft discovery requests for D. Harvey review.	0.20	2	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare transactional files for Econ One review.	0.40	10	325.00	\$ 130.00
02/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
02/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review LG Chem production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
02/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re loading of NEC production by Catalyst.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re translated transactional files for Econ One.	0.30	10	325.00	\$ 97.50
02/05/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re Sony meet and confer.	0.20	6	490.00	\$ 98.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with D. Harvey re document subpoena.	0.10	2	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review and translations.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
02/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re LG custodian and privilege logs; draft email correspondence re same.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
02/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Document review management call.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
02/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to LG re potential deponent.	0.20	6	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re translations, letter briefing, document review, custodians, experts, privilege logs, transactional data, translation protocol.	2.20	11	490.00	\$ 1,078.00
02/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Apple re redactions; confer with Demetrius Lambrinos and Jessica Moy re same.	0.70	6	490.00	\$ 343.00
02/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with Sony, including reviewing prior correspondence.	0.30	6	490.00	\$ 147.00
02/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise letter brief re LG discovery responses.	0.90	8	490.00	\$ 441.00
02/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise meet and confer letter to Toshiba re discovery issues.	0.70	6	490.00	\$ 343.00
02/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Review documents and draft memorandum re LG deponents.	1.10	11	490.00	\$ 539.00
02/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Revise Toshiba withdrawal discovery.	1.40	2	490.00	\$ 686.00
02/05/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read discovery correspondence.	0.50	11	725.00	\$ 362.50
02/05/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise Toshiba discovery.	0.70	3	675.00	\$ 472.50
02/05/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential subpoena recipient re draft subpoena, draft summary re same, research and revise subpoena.	1.80	2	515.00	\$ 927.00
02/05/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond with potential experts and research same.	1.20	10	515.00	\$ 618.00
02/05/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review and management projects.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
02/05/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
02/05/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	[REDACTED]	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/05/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
02/05/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	3.00	7	350.00	\$ 1,050.00
02/05/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re production loading status.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare transactional data for Econ One review.	0.60	10	325.00	\$ 195.00
02/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare transactional data for L. Chan review.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
02/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit transactional data log.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
02/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translation status re transactional data for Econ One.	0.50	10	325.00	\$ 162.50
02/06/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Analyze LG materials for depositions.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Barbara Alexander, B. Glackin, D. Harvey, Jeff Friedman, and Shana Scarlett re expert work.	1.10	10	490.00	\$ 539.00
02/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, Steve Williams, Jeff Friedman, and Shana Scarlett re experts.	0.50	10	490.00	\$ 245.00
02/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with G. Stuart and C. Saunders re LG documents.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case strategy.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
02/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re search terms.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
02/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re privilege logs.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to LG re depositions.	0.10	6	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re LG letter brief, depositions, experts, document review, search terms.	0.80	11	490.00	\$ 392.00
02/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re transactional data; draft correspondence re same.	2.20	6	490.00	\$ 1,078.00
02/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Toshiba re discovery; draft confirmatory letter re same.	0.70	6	490.00	\$ 343.00
02/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Barbara Alexander background materials.	0.10	10	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/06/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference call re experts; office conference with L. Chan.	2.30	11	675.00	\$ 1,552.50
02/06/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN		0.30	10	675.00	\$ 202.50
02/06/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Judith Zahid; memorandum to team.	0.60	11	675.00	\$ 405.00
02/06/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential expert and co-counsel re selection of expert for class and merits analysis, research same.	1.60	10	515.00	\$ 824.00
02/06/15	JONES, KAREN	Preparation for LG depositions; draft search terms in English and Japanese.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
02/06/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
02/06/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue to analyze evidence and draft Donny Lee (LGCAI) deposition preparation background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/06/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
02/06/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	2.00	7	350.00	\$ 700.00
02/06/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.50	7	350.00	\$ 2,625.00
02/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare transactional data for L. Chan review.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
02/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re expert backup data for B. Glackin.	0.40	10	325.00	\$ 130.00
02/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations re transactional data and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
02/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re privilege logs.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Review LG and Hitachi meet and confer correspondence re written discovery.	0.10	6	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Review NEC discovery responses.	1.10	9	490.00	\$ 539.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Review privilege logs and related correspondence.	0.20	9	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/07/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	3.00	7	350.00	\$ 1,050.00
02/07/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendant's documents for relevance.	0.50	7	350.00	\$ 175.00
02/08/15	CHAN, LIN	Review NEC privilege logs and documents; draft email re same.	1.70	9	490.00	\$ 833.00
02/08/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Sony privilege logs and documents; draft email re same.	2.40	9	490.00	\$ 1,176.00
02/09/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and K. Jones re search terms.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
02/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Jessica Moy and other DPPs re Sony meet and confer.	0.50	6	490.00	\$ 245.00
02/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re NEC privilege logs; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	6	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re Sony privilege logs.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Shana Scarlett re search terms.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
02/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms and discovery meet and confer.	1.20	11	490.00	\$ 588.00
02/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re written discovery and privilege logs; draft correspondence re same.	2.90	6	490.00	\$ 1,421.00
02/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for NEC meet and confer, including reviewing privilege logs.	0.20	6	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise status report re capacity and utilization data.	0.20	9	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Sony meet and confer correspondence re written discovery.	0.50	6	490.00	\$ 245.00
02/09/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re experts; telephone conference with [REDACTED]	1.30	11	675.00	\$ 877.50
02/09/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re case issues.	0.10	11	675.00	\$ 67.50
02/09/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential class cert expert, conference with co-counsel re same, research same.	1.20	10	515.00	\$ 618.00
02/09/15	JONES, KAREN	Review of foreign language document to decide on initial set of certified translations; project management of search term creation (work with T. Lee, M. Boyle, E. Newman, H. Rim) and draft search terms in English and Japanese.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
02/09/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
02/09/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue to analyze evidence and draft Donny Lee (LGCAI) deposition preparation background memo.	1.40	7	350.00	\$ 490.00
02/09/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	1.50	7	325.00	\$ 487.50
02/09/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/09/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense production documents for B. Glackin review.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare documents cited in complaint for Econ One review.	0.50	10	325.00	\$ 162.50
02/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare native files for Econ One review.	0.50	10	325.00	\$ 162.50
02/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.90	9	325.00	\$ 292.50
02/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re loading of Samsung production by Catalyst.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/10/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with D. Harvey, Demetrius Lambrinos, Shana Scarlett, and Rosa Abrantes-Metz re potential expert work.	0.70	10	490.00	\$ 343.00
02/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re custodial production and case strategy; draft email correspondence re same.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
02/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Dugar re Casemap.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence to Sony and Toshiba re transactional data.	0.30	6	490.00	\$ 147.00
02/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
02/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re expert work, document review, translations, privilege logs, transactional data.	1.30	11	490.00	\$ 637.00
02/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise letter brief re Toshiba's failure to respond to interrogatories.	0.40	9	490.00	\$ 196.00
02/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Review cost report for January.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Review document review productivity reports; confer with Ronnie Spiegel re same; draft email correspondence re same.	0.80	11	490.00	\$ 392.00
02/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Review resume of potential expert.	0.40	10	490.00	\$ 196.00
02/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Revise custodial production proposal.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
02/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Revise letter to Apple re redactions.	0.60	6	490.00	\$ 294.00
02/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conferences with L. Chan re production protocol and document review audit; review production protocol.	0.80	11	675.00	\$ 540.00
02/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Judith Zahid re [REDACTED]	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
02/10/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential expert, conference with co-counsel re same, research same.	1.30	10	515.00	\$ 669.50
02/10/15	JONES, KAREN	Review of foreign language document to decide on initial set of certified translations; project management of search term creation (work with T. Lee, M. Boyle, E. Newman, H. Rim) and draft search terms in English and Japanese.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
02/10/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
02/10/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue to analyze evidence and draft Donny Lee (LGCAI) deposition preparation background memo; analyze reviewer notes for association key terms and additional pricing search terms for production search terms list; forward findings to K. Jones, L. Chan and H. Rim.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/10/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	5.50	7	325.00	\$ 1,787.50
02/10/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/10/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Econ One re status of documents cited in complaint.	0.30	10	325.00	\$ 97.50
02/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Econ One re status of translations.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re pending translations.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/11/15	BERNSTEIN, WILLIAM	Review allegations of complaint.	1.30	11	975.00	\$ 1,267.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/11/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Call with co-leads; confer with B. Glackin re same.	1.10	11	490.00	\$ 539.00
02/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and K. Jones re search terms, document review, and translations.	0.70	11	490.00	\$ 343.00
02/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re co-lead call.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft proposal re custodial production; draft email correspondence re same.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
02/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re letter brief, co-lead call, experts, transactional data, joint letter brief.	1.40	11	490.00	\$ 686.00
02/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise joint letter brief re Toshiba discovery responses.	0.40	8	490.00	\$ 196.00
02/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Revise task list.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
02/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Serve subpoena notice.	0.20	2	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/11/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft letter to Executive Committee; telephone conference with Steve Williams.	0.70	11	675.00	\$ 472.50
02/11/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re Econ One data.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
02/11/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re case status; office conference with D. Harvey re experts.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
02/11/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise letter brief re Toshiba.	0.60	8	675.00	\$ 405.00
02/11/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with co-counsel.	1.00	11	675.00	\$ 675.00
02/11/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Research potential experts, conference with B. Glackin re same.	0.30	10	515.00	\$ 154.50
02/11/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise and serve draft subpoena to Hagens Berman re data issues on parties, conference with B. Glackin re same.	0.80	2	515.00	\$ 412.00
02/11/15	JONES, KAREN	Review of foreign language document to decide on initial set of certified translations; project management of search term creation (work with T. Lee, M. Boyle, E. Newman, H. Rim) and draft search terms in English and Japanese.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
02/11/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
02/11/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue to analyze evidence and draft Donny Lee (LGCAI) deposition preparation background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/11/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.70	7	325.00	\$ 2,827.50
02/11/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	4.50	7	350.00	\$ 1,575.00
02/11/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare materials cited in complaint for Econ One review.	1.20	10	325.00	\$ 390.00
02/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare native files for Econ One review.	1.00	10	325.00	\$ 325.00
02/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare translated production documents for Econ One review.	0.50	10	325.00	\$ 162.50
02/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re native sent to Econ One.	0.30	10	325.00	\$ 97.50
02/12/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with G. Stuart and C. Saunders re synthesizing LG evidence.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with LG re discovery.	0.50	6	490.00	\$ 245.00
02/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re LG deponent.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re LG deponent.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re search terms.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re search terms; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Shana Scarlett re search terms.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
02/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Document review management meeting.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
02/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re LG custodians, translation protocol, evidence synthesis platforms, and discovery meet and confers.	0.80	11	490.00	\$ 392.00
02/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Order re Joint Discovery Letter.	0.10	9	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Synthesize evidence re LG custodians, including reviewing documents and drafting memorandum.	0.30	1	490.00	\$ 147.00
02/12/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re Kwak deposition.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
02/12/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review letter brief re Toshiba response to interrogatories.	0.50	9	675.00	\$ 337.50
02/12/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Research [REDACTED], conference with co-counsel re same.	0.80	10	515.00	\$ 412.00
02/12/15	JONES, KAREN	Review of foreign language documents to decide on initial set of certified translations; project management of search term creation (work with T. Lee, M. Boyle, E. Newman, H. Rim) and draft search terms in English and Japanese.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
02/12/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue to analyze evidence and draft Donny Lee (LGCAI) deposition preparation background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/12/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	5.00	7	325.00	\$ 1,625.00
02/12/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/12/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare documents cited in complaint for Econ One review.	3.00	10	325.00	\$ 975.00
02/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare subpoena for service.	2.50	2	325.00	\$ 812.50
02/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Toshiba documents for B. Glackin review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re translations for Econ One.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/13/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Call NEC re data production.	0.10	6	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with D. Harvey re transactional data and experts.	0.50	10	490.00	\$ 245.00
02/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re LG deposition; draft email correspondence and review documents re same.	1.70	11	490.00	\$ 833.00
02/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re LG deponent; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ed Leamer re expert work.	0.40	10	490.00	\$ 196.00
02/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re LG deponent.	2.90	11	490.00	\$ 1,421.00
02/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery meet and confer, written discovery, LG depositions; review documents re same.	1.60	11	490.00	\$ 784.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Toshiba re written discovery and summary judgment.	0.50	6	490.00	\$ 245.00
02/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise stipulation re custodial production.	0.10	8	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Review NEC transactional data production; conference with D. Harvey and B. Troxel re same.	0.40	9	490.00	\$ 196.00
02/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Review reports of potential expert.	0.10	10	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Sanyo supplemental discovery responses.	0.10	9	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Revise chart re transactional data.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
02/13/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Expert call.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
02/13/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum re Kwak; telephone conference with L. Chan re Kwak; office conference with L. Chan re Kwak.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
02/13/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with co-counsel re data production and review issues, conference with Econ One re same, draft correspondence to econ one re same.	1.10	10	515.00	\$ 566.50
02/13/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with co-counsel re potential experts, research same.	0.80	10	515.00	\$ 412.00
02/13/15	JONES, KAREN	Review of foreign language documents to decide on initial set of certified translations; deposition preparation: searches in Catalyst for SH Kwak deposition; analysis of SDI proposed search terms.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
02/13/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue to analyze evidence and draft Donny Lee (LGCAI) deposition preparation background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/13/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	2.30	7	325.00	\$ 747.50
02/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare translations for co-counsel review.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare translations for Econ One review.	0.60	10	325.00	\$ 195.00
02/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	11	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
02/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	1.00	9	325.00	\$ 325.00
02/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review index re translation status and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re NEC transactional data for L. Chan.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
02/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translation requests from Econ One.	0.10	10	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.70	7	325.00	\$ 227.50
02/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re LG deponent.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
02/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re custodial productions, expert stipulation.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
02/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise meet and confer letter to Panasonic.	0.30	6	490.00	\$ 147.00
02/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise meet and confer letter with Toshiba.	0.30	6	490.00	\$ 147.00
02/14/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.80	7	350.00	\$ 2,730.00
02/15/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re potential LG deponent.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
02/15/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re written discovery, translations.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/15/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	2.00	7	325.00	\$ 650.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

From 06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To 02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery, including legal research.	0.70	11	490.00	\$ 343.00
02/16/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise expert Stipulation.	0.40	9	675.00	\$ 270.00
02/16/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue to analyze evidence and draft Donny Lee (LGCAI) deposition preparation background memo.	6.70	7	350.00	\$ 2,345.00
02/16/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
02/17/15	BERNSTEIN, WILLIAM	Further review of meeting minutes.	0.50	11	975.00	\$ 487.50
02/17/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and K. Jones re document review, translations, potential deponents.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
02/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Aaron Sheanin re SDI custodian prioritization.	0.70	11	490.00	\$ 343.00
02/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re discovery deadlines and staffing.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re GS Yuasa.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re document production; draft email correspondence re same.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
02/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re GS Yuasa.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with NEC re transactional data.	0.10	6	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence to Sony.	0.40	6	490.00	\$ 196.00
02/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
02/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re GS Yuasa, NEC production, task list, discovery.	1.00	11	490.00	\$ 490.00
02/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with LG re Kwak deposition and discovery responses.	0.60	6	490.00	\$ 294.00
02/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re expert data; telephone conference with Ed Leamer re economists.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
02/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re production deadlines.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
02/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Beatrice Nguyen and Rob McNary; memorandum to team re same.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
02/17/15	JONES, KAREN	Review of foreign language documents to decide on initial set of certified translations; deposition preparation - revisions to memo for S.H. Kwak deposition; analysis of defendant's proposed search terms.	8.00	1	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
02/17/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
02/17/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue to analyze evidence and draft Donny Lee (LGCAI) deposition preparation background memo; forward draft to L. Chan and H. Rim.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/17/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
02/17/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/17/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare NEC production for Econ One review.	0.30	10	325.00	\$ 97.50
02/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Panasonic production for loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare translations for Econ One review.	0.60	10	325.00	\$ 195.00
02/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize production files.	0.70	7	325.00	\$ 227.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
02/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoenas and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
02/18/15	BERNSTEIN, WILLIAM	Review meeting minutes and briefing.	1.00	11	975.00	\$ 975.00
02/18/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Aaron Sheanin re Toshiba interrogatory requests; draft email correspondence re same.	0.30	2	490.00	\$ 147.00
02/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re written discovery.	1.50	6	490.00	\$ 735.00
02/18/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team weekly-planning conference call.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
02/18/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin re expert stipulation.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
02/18/15	JONES, KAREN	Review of hot Japanese documents to decide on initial set of certified translations; deposition preparation; revisions to memo for S.H. Kwak deposition; analysis of defendant's proposed search terms; preparation of watch lists for defendants' custodians.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
02/18/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
02/18/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue to analyze evidence and draft Donny Lee (LGCAI) deposition preparation background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/18/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
02/18/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/18/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
02/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare documents cited in complaint for Econ One review.	0.40	10	325.00	\$ 130.00
02/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
02/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
02/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re translations for Econ One.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/19/15	BERNSTEIN, WILLIAM	Research re AJC issues; review order on motion to dismiss.	1.00	11	975.00	\$ 975.00
02/19/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/19/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Discovery hearing; co-counsel meeting re Toshiba.	2.00	14	675.00	\$ 1,350.00
02/19/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Lesley Weaver.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
02/19/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond with potential expert and co-counsel re potential retention.	0.30	10	515.00	\$ 154.50
02/19/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Research data production issues, conference with Econ One and co-counsel re same, research and review translation issues re same.	1.60	10	515.00	\$ 824.00
02/19/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
02/19/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue to analyze evidence and draft Donny Lee (LGCAI) deposition preparation background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/19/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
02/19/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/19/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	7.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,450.00
02/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
02/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
02/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re translations for D. Harvey.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
02/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
02/20/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise meet and confer letter re Sony redactions.	0.50	6	490.00	\$ 245.00
02/20/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Steve Williams re Lesley Weaver.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
02/20/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
02/20/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue to analyze evidence and draft Donny Lee (LGCAI) deposition preparation background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/20/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
02/20/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	5.30	7	350.00	\$ 1,855.00
02/20/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re load file issues.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re load files.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Panasonic production for co-counsel review.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Panasonic production for Econ One review.	0.10	10	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and revise master production index.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Panasonic production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
02/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
02/21/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	3.00	7	450.00	\$ 1,350.00
02/21/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	5.80	7	350.00	\$ 2,030.00
02/22/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	2.00	7	450.00	\$ 900.00
02/23/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with co-counsel re potential experts, including conference with B. Glackin re case.	0.50	10	490.00	\$ 245.00
02/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Defendants re custodian prioritization, including separate conference with plaintiffs re same.	0.60	6	490.00	\$ 294.00
02/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Rosa Abrantes-Metz re potential work, including separate conference with D. Harvey and B. Glackin.	1.00	10	490.00	\$ 490.00
02/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Aaron Sheanin re discovery.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re Toshiba discovery requests.	0.20	2	490.00	\$ 98.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re custodian prioritization.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re search terms and document review.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Shana Scarlett re expert teleconference; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Steve Williams re expert teleconference; draft email correspondence re same.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
02/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence to Sony re discovery and redactions.	0.70	6	490.00	\$ 343.00
02/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery and expert work.	3.30	11	490.00	\$ 1,617.00
02/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze defendant search term lists.	1.00	11	490.00	\$ 490.00
02/23/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re production deadline and request for admission to Toshiba.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
02/23/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re subpoena to Zelle; office conference with E. Fastiff re subpoena to Zelle.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
02/23/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review case information for purpose of revising 30(b)(6) deposition notice; office conference with L. Chan re California custodians.	1.20	11	675.00	\$ 810.00
02/23/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call re Rosa Abrantes-Metz; office conference with D. Harvey and L. Chan.	0.60	11	675.00	\$ 405.00
02/23/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Judith Zahid re subpoena response.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
02/23/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Rosa Abrantes-Metz (potential expert); office conference with L. Chan and D. Harvey.	1.00	11	675.00	\$ 675.00
02/23/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with potential expert, research same, conference with co-counsel re same.	1.60	10	515.00	\$ 824.00
02/23/15	HILTERMANN, KAYLA		0.90	10	325.00	\$ 292.50
02/23/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
02/23/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Analyze evidence, draft Donny Lee (LGCAI) deposition preparation background memo	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/23/15	RIM, HISUN	Create search terms for new production.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
02/23/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/23/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
02/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare complaint for B. Glackin review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	8	325.00	\$ 97.50
02/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
02/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00
02/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with DPPs and IPPs re search terms, including separate conference with Shana Scarlett re SDI search terms; draft email correspondence re same.	1.00	11	490.00	\$ 490.00
02/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and K. Jones re search terms, document review, and evidence synthesis.	1.00	11	490.00	\$ 490.00
02/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case status.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
02/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re search terms.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re Sony custodian prioritization.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
02/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with M. Baldwin re Casemap/Everlaw demo session.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
02/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery and document analysis.	1.90	11	490.00	\$ 931.00
02/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Toshiba re summary judgment and discovery.	0.40	6	490.00	\$ 196.00
02/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise LG custodian prioritization list.	0.20	3	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise NEC custodian list.	0.10	3	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise SDI custodian list.	0.20	3	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise Sony custodian list.	0.70	3	490.00	\$ 343.00
02/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Order on Joint Discovery Letter; draft email correspondence re same.	0.10	9	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Order re translation protocol.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Toshiba correspondence and discovery.	0.30	9	490.00	\$ 147.00
02/24/15	HARVEY, DEAN		0.70	10	515.00	\$ 360.50
02/24/15	JONES, KAREN	Review of foreign language documents to decide on initial set of certified translations; research to respond to SDI's proposed search terms.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
02/24/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
02/24/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Analyze evidence, draft Donny Lee (LGCAI) deposition preparation background memo	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/24/15	RIM, HISUN	Create search terms for new production.	7.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,275.00
02/24/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/24/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare native files for Econ One review.	0.60	10	325.00	\$ 195.00
02/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.90	9	325.00	\$ 292.50
02/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery requests and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleading and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
02/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translation protocol and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/25/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/25/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with co-leads re case strategy; draft email correspondence re same.	0.70	11	490.00	\$ 343.00
02/25/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with DPPs re search terms.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
02/25/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim and K. Jones re search terms.	0.80	11	490.00	\$ 392.00
02/25/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re Sony custodians.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
02/25/15	CHAN, LIN	Develop SDI search term list; confer with H. Rim and K. Jones re same.	2.30	11	490.00	\$ 1,127.00
02/25/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re Catalyst, search terms, and other discovery matters.	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/25/15	CHAN, LIN	Review LG custodian documents and draft memoranda.	1.70	11	490.00	\$ 833.00
02/25/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Ed Leamer; telephone conference with Steve Williams and Jeff Friedman; review case correspondence.	1.00	11	675.00	\$ 675.00
02/25/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Research, draft, and revise retention agreement for Dr. Abrantes-Metz, correspond with her re same.	0.70	10	515.00	\$ 360.50
02/25/15	JONES, KAREN	Review of foreign language documents to decide on initial set of certified translations; research to respond to SDI's proposed search terms.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
02/25/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Review, analyze SH Kwak memo. Draft, revise Donny Lee (LGCAI) deposition preparation background memo	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/25/15	RIM, HISUN	Create search terms for new production.	8.50	7	325.00	\$ 2,762.50
02/25/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/25/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production index.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
02/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.70	9	325.00	\$ 227.50
02/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Create deponent watch lists by defendant.	3.00	11	490.00	\$ 1,470.00
02/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Document review management call.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
02/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to Sony re custodian prioritization.	0.40	6	490.00	\$ 196.00
02/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft SDI search term list.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
02/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms, custodian preservation.	1.10	11	490.00	\$ 539.00
02/26/15	JONES, KAREN	Drafting counter proposal to respond to SDI's proposed search terms.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
02/26/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Draft, revise Donny Lee (LGCAI) deposition preparation background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/26/15	RIM, HISUN	Create search terms for new production.	8.80	7	325.00	\$ 2,860.00
02/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare translations for Econ One review.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize production files.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.70	7	325.00	\$ 227.50
02/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for review by Econ One.	0.50	10	325.00	\$ 162.50
02/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for translation.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
02/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
02/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re [REDACTED] for L. Chan.	1.00	9	325.00	\$ 325.00
02/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re loading of productions by Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review [REDACTED] and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Call Demetrius Lambrinos re LG deponents and defendant watch lists.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
02/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and K. Jones re SDI search term lists.	0.70	11	490.00	\$ 343.00
02/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence to NEC re privilege logs.	0.10	6	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft SDI search term list.	0.70	2	490.00	\$ 343.00
02/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms, discovery.	2.00	11	490.00	\$ 980.00
02/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Review search term protocol.	0.10	9	490.00	\$ 49.00
02/27/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Ed Leamer.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
02/27/15	JONES, KAREN	Drafting counter proposal to respond to SDI's proposed search terms.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
02/27/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Draft, revise Donny Lee (LGCAI) deposition preparation background memo	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/27/15	RIM, HISUN	Create search terms for new production.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
02/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Econ One re Sanyo production link.	0.10	10	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Econ One re translation priorities.	0.10	10	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re Sony productions for D. Harvey.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review calendar re pending deadlines.	0.10	11	325.00	\$ 32.50
02/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review NEC production and prepare for Econ One review.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review NEC production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
02/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review NEC production and prepare for translation.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re Sony load files for Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
02/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
03/02/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re search term lists.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
03/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and K. Jones re search term lists.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case strategy.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with co-counsel to prepare for Sony meet and confer.	0.40	6	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, evidence synthesis platforms, search terms, discovery meet and confer.	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
03/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re discovery.	0.60	6	490.00	\$ 294.00
03/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Review defendant custodians to draft watch list.	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
03/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Sony meet and confer correspondence and prepare for meet and confer.	0.50	6	490.00	\$ 245.00
03/02/15	JONES, KAREN	Drafting counter proposal to respond to All Defendants' proposed search terms; updating Key Terms for case.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/02/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
03/02/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Analyze evidence, draft Min Ho Chung (SDI) deposition preparation background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/02/15	RIM, HISUN	Create search terms for new production.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
03/02/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	3.70	7	350.00	\$ 1,295.00
03/02/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/03/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Call Demetrius Lambrinos, Shana Scarlett, and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs counsel re potential LG deponent.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Dan Owens and Shana Scarlett re search term list.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
03/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case strategy.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with G. Stuart re custodians.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re search terms.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft search term list.	0.80	11	490.00	\$ 392.00
03/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
03/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re potential deponents and custodians, search terms, and evidence synthesis platforms.	1.60	11	490.00	\$ 784.00
03/03/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft and send letter to class counsel firms.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
03/03/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re Kwak.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
03/03/15	JONES, KAREN	Research for and drafting of counter proposal to respond to All Defendants' proposed search terms.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/03/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
03/03/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Analyze evidence, draft Min Ho Chung (SDI) deposition preparation background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/03/15	RIM, HISUN	Create search terms for new production.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
03/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/04/15	BERNSTEIN, WILLIAM	Review discovery correspondence and responses.	0.50	7	975.00	\$ 487.50
03/04/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Attend Everlaw and Casemap demo session, including separate conference with B. Glackin and K. Jones.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
03/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with co-leads, B. Glackin, and D. Harvey re case strategy.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
03/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and K. Jones re search terms and document review.	0.70	11	490.00	\$ 343.00
03/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Shana Scarlett and K. Jones re search terms.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
03/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re case status.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
03/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft all-defendant search term list.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
03/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to LG re Kwak departure; email correspondence re same.	0.90	6	490.00	\$ 441.00
03/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft search term list.	0.10	2	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re case status and search terms.	1.40	11	490.00	\$ 686.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Casemap/Everlaw demonstration, including conference with K. Dugar.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for document review meeting, including review prior correspondence.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/04/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Demonstrations of evidence platforms; office conference with L. Chan and K. Jones re same.	1.50	11	675.00	\$ 1,012.50
03/04/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re Toshiba.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
03/04/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with co-leads.	0.60	11	675.00	\$ 405.00
03/04/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Attend weekly co-lead counsel call, prepare for same.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
03/04/15	JONES, KAREN	Research for and drafting of counter proposal to respond to All Defendants' proposed search terms; attending vendor meetings for evidence synthesis platform.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/04/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
03/04/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Analyze evidence, draft Min Ho Chung (SDI) deposition preparation background memo. Complete revising Donny Lee deposition preparation memo and forward to L. Chan and H. Rim.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/04/15	RIM, HISUN	Create search terms for new production.	4.80	7	325.00	\$ 1,560.00
03/04/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/04/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/05/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Call Demetrius Lambrinos re evidence synthesis platforms.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re Sony meet and confer call.	0.20	6	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim, K. Jones, and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re translation of search terms.	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
03/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re evidence synthesis platforms.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re foreign language search terms.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re search term list.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
03/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re case status.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
03/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Shana Scarlett re search term list and other discovery matters.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
03/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Document review management meeting.	0.80	11	490.00	\$ 392.00
03/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to LG re deponent.	0.30	6	490.00	\$ 147.00
03/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft search term list.	0.40	2	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery.	1.00	11	490.00	\$ 490.00
03/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with NEC re privilege logs and written discovery.	0.70	6	490.00	\$ 343.00
03/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re written discovery.	1.20	6	490.00	\$ 588.00
03/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with NEC, including reviewing prior correspondence.	0.60	6	490.00	\$ 294.00
03/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with Sony, including reviewing prior correspondence.	0.20	6	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/05/15	JONES, KAREN	Research for and drafting of counter proposal to respond to All Defendants' proposed search terms; coordinating with case-wide foreign language teams.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/05/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
03/05/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Analyze evidence, draft Min Ho Chung (SDI) deposition preparation background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/05/15	RIM, HISUN	Create search terms for new production	9.30	1	260.00	\$ 2,418.00
03/05/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/05/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/06/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Demetrius Lambrinos and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
03/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re search term list.	1.30	11	490.00	\$ 637.00
03/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with K. Jones and H. Rim re search term lists; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
03/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re search term list.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Veronica Glaze re search term lists.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to LG re departing deponents.	0.80	6	490.00	\$ 392.00
03/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft search term list.	0.50	2	490.00	\$ 245.00
03/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms and potential deponents.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
03/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence with Hitachi re custodial productions.	0.10	6	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Review notes re discovery status; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
03/06/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re search terms.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
03/06/15	JONES, KAREN	Research for and drafting of counter proposal to respond to All Defendants' and SDI's proposed search terms; coordinating with case-wide foreign language teams; preparation for depositions.	4.50	7	515.00	\$ 2,317.50
03/06/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
03/06/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Analyze evidence, draft Min Ho Chung (SDI) deposition preparation background memo	8.00	1	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/06/15	RIM, HISUN	Create search terms for new production.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
03/06/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare transactional data for Econ One review.	0.50	10	325.00	\$ 162.50
03/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare transactional data for translation.	0.30	10	325.00	\$ 97.50
03/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
03/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	1.20	7	325.00	\$ 390.00
03/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege logs and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
03/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re search terms.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
03/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re search terms.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft search term list.	1.20	2	490.00	\$ 588.00
03/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms and other discovery matters.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
03/07/15	RIM, HISUN	Create search terms for new production.	6.00	7	325.00	\$ 1,950.00
03/07/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	2.00	7	350.00	\$ 700.00
03/08/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft discovery request and related correspondence to LG.	0.40	2	490.00	\$ 196.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/08/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search term list.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
03/08/15	RIM, HISUN	Create search terms for new production.	5.50	7	325.00	\$ 1,787.50
03/08/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/09/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim re search terms, including conference with Shana Scarlett.	1.10	11	490.00	\$ 539.00
03/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Shana Scarlett and Dan Owen re search terms.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with A. McRen re CaseCloud.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ben Shiftan re watch list.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with C. Saunders re privilege logs.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
03/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Create chart of custodians.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to SDI, Sanyo, Panasonic, Hitachi and NEC re watch list.	1.90	6	490.00	\$ 931.00
03/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft discovery to LG re watch list.	0.80	2	490.00	\$ 392.00
03/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft search term list.	2.00	2	490.00	\$ 980.00
03/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze foreign language documents and isolate documents for translation.	0.20	7	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise draft letter brief re Toshiba production of worldwide transactional data.	0.40	8	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Order to submit supplemental information; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	9	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Panasonic and Sanyo privilege logs.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
03/09/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Shana Scarlett re subpoena and third party discovery, correspond with Econ One re same, conference with B. Glackin re same.	0.60	6	515.00	\$ 309.00
03/09/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of Japanese documents cited in TCAC to be sent out for certified translation for experts.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/09/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
03/09/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Analyze evidence, draft Min Ho Chung (SDI) deposition preparation background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/09/15	RIM, HISUN	Create search terms for new production.	10.00	7	325.00	\$ 3,250.00
03/09/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/09/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/10/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Shana Scarlett and H. Rim re search terms.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
03/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with C. Saunders re privilege logs.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re search term lists; draft email correspondence re same.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
03/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to SDI and NEC re watch lists.	0.50	6	490.00	\$ 245.00
03/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft search term lists.	0.90	2	490.00	\$ 441.00
03/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze memoranda re potential LG and SDI deponents.	1.00	11	490.00	\$ 490.00
03/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Order granting extension of time.	0.10	9	490.00	\$ 49.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Revise letter brief re Toshiba data.	0.40	8	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re discovery conference.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
03/10/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of Japanese documents cited in TCAC to be sent out for certified translation for experts.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/10/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
03/10/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Analyze evidence, draft Min Ho Chung (SDI) deposition preparation background memo. Draft email to K. Jones re Min Ho Chung (SDI/LGC) custodian files	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/10/15	RIM, HISUN	Create search terms for new production.	8.50	7	325.00	\$ 2,762.50
03/10/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/10/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/11/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Check Judge Ryu calendar and draft email correspondence re discovery hearing.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and K. Jones re document review and search terms.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
03/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Matt Boyle and E. Newman re document review.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re search terms.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Jones re document review and third consolidated amended complaint.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to Hitachi and Panasonic and Sanyo re watch lists.	0.60	6	490.00	\$ 294.00
03/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re potential deponent; draft email correspondence re same.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
03/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft search term list.	0.90	2	490.00	\$ 441.00
03/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms, hearing, Casemap, privilege logs, and document review.	1.80	11	490.00	\$ 882.00
03/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for discovery hearing, including reviewing papers and related discovery.	0.70	14	490.00	\$ 343.00
03/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with Sony re privilege logs.	1.60	6	490.00	\$ 784.00
03/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and draft letter brief re Toshiba worldwide data.	0.70	8	490.00	\$ 343.00
03/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise meet and confer correspondence to Sony.	0.50	6	490.00	\$ 245.00
03/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Review documents for translation; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	7	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/11/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re Toshiba letter; review Toshiba letter.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
03/11/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond with Dr. Metz re expert retention and related issues.	0.30	10	515.00	\$ 154.50
03/11/15	JONES, KAREN	Factual research for Toshiba's MSJ on fraudulent concealment; research for experts on industry reports.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/11/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
03/11/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Analyze evidence, draft Min Ho Chung (SDI) deposition preparation background memo. Meet with L. Chan and Matt Boyle to discuss Catalyst research project	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/11/15	RIM, HISUN	Create search terms for new production.	9.50	7	325.00	\$ 3,087.50
03/11/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/11/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
03/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare overlay files for loading by Catalyst.	1.50	7	325.00	\$ 487.50
03/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	11	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
03/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
03/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Panasonic production and prepare for Econ One review.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Panasonic production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
03/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
03/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re IIT reports for Econ One.	0.30	10	325.00	\$ 97.50
03/12/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Analyze draft search term list.	0.50	2	490.00	\$ 245.00
03/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Demetrius Lambrinos and Jessica Moy re privilege logs and written discovery.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
03/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case status.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re search term lists.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
03/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re search terms.	0.80	11	490.00	\$ 392.00
03/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re search terms.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re discovery hearing.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
03/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, search terms, Casemap, and privilege logs.	1.30	11	490.00	\$ 637.00
03/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re privilege logs and written discovery.	0.40	6	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/12/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	Meet with Bob Gralewski and B. Glackin re discovery.	0.40	11	725.00	\$ 290.00
03/12/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet with Bob Gralewski and E. Fastiff re discovery.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
03/12/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of Japanese documents cited in TCAC to be sent out for certified translation for experts; analysis of Japanese documents for discovery meeting with Sony; research for experts on industry report.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/12/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
03/12/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Analyze evidence, draft Min Ho Chung (SDI) deposition preparation background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/12/15	RIM, HISUN	Create search terms for new production.	12.30	7	325.00	\$ 3,997.50
03/12/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/12/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
03/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
03/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare IIT reports for Econ One review.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Panasonic production for loading by Catalyst.	1.10	7	325.00	\$ 357.50
03/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	11	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review hearing memorandum and save to file.	0.10	8	325.00	\$ 32.50
03/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
03/13/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Shana Scarlett and H. Rim re search terms.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re search terms.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to Sanyo re transactional data.	2.70	6	490.00	\$ 1,323.00
03/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft discovery correspondence and requests for production to LG.	0.50	2	490.00	\$ 245.00
03/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms and Sony privilege logs.	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
03/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise search term list.	0.40	2	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/13/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	[REDACTED]	2.50	11	725.00	\$ 1,812.50
03/13/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	[REDACTED]	2.20	14	675.00	\$ 1,485.00
03/13/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of Japanese documents to decide which to send for certified translation; training attorneys on Catalyst for deposition project.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/13/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
03/13/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Finish analyzing evidence and drafting Min Ho Chung (SDI) deposition preparation background memo. Set up Catalyst and meet with K. Jones re system searches.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/13/15	RIM, HISUN	Create search terms for new production.	3.30	1	260.00	\$ 858.00
03/13/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
03/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery requests for service.	0.70	2	325.00	\$ 227.50
03/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	8	325.00	\$ 97.50
03/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review emails from Econ One re status of translations.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re Sanyo data, privilege logs, translations, written discovery.	1.20	11	490.00	\$ 588.00
03/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Sony meet and confer correspondence.	0.10	6	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/16/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Catalyst re document review access.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re translations.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to Sanyo re transactional data.	0.60	10	490.00	\$ 294.00
03/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to Sony re watch list.	0.50	6	490.00	\$ 245.00
03/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery and search terms.	1.10	11	490.00	\$ 539.00
03/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re [REDACTED]; draft memorandum re same.	3.20	11	490.00	\$ 1,568.00
03/16/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of Japanese documents to decide which to send for certified translation; training attorneys on Catalyst for deposition projects; research for experts.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/16/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
03/16/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Contact Catalyst support and troubleshoot viewer issues for search project; forward draft of Min Ho Chung memo to > Chan and H. Rim; analyze Young Wook Chung deposition prep memo; search Catalyst for additional evidence re same.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/16/15	RIM, HISUN	Research documents for experts.	4.00	7	325.00	\$ 1,300.00
03/16/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/16/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sony production for Econ One review.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sony production for loading by Catalyst.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
03/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sony production for translation.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
03/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar re discovery dates.	0.10	11	325.00	\$ 32.50
03/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	1.00	8	325.00	\$ 325.00
03/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
03/17/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with M. Pilotin and B. Glackin re case status.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case status.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re document review and case management.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with E. Newman re document review.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with M. Pilotin re case status.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence re expert questions for Panasonic/Sanyo.	1.80	10	490.00	\$ 882.00
03/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to Hitachi re data.	0.90	10	490.00	\$ 441.00
03/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to Toshiba re watch list.	0.40	6	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
03/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms, transactional data, and translations.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
03/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Order re Joint Discovery Letter.	0.20	9	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN		0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
03/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re data letters.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
03/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re task list and Sawa Nagano.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
03/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with M. Pilotin and L. Chan re transition.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
03/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with M. Pilotin re transition to case.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
03/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review task list.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
03/17/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of Japanese documents to decide which to send for certified translation; research for experts (market reports).	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/17/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
03/17/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue analyzing and searching for additional evidence for Young Wook Chung deposition prep memo and revise accordingly.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with B. Glackin and L. Chan regarding upcoming document review assignments.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
03/17/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/17/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	6.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,100.00
03/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
03/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
03/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.70	9	325.00	\$ 227.50
03/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
03/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
03/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Call Ronnie Spiegel re translations.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
03/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and K. Jones re document review and evidence synthesis.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with co-leads re case strategy.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to Hitachi re data questions.	0.90	10	490.00	\$ 441.00
03/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to Sanyo re data questions.	0.40	10	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re translations, custodial productions, potential deponents, and data.	1.20	11	490.00	\$ 588.00
03/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meeting with H. Rim and K. Jones re evidence synthesis.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze documents re fraudulent concealment.	0.90	7	490.00	\$ 441.00
03/18/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Weekly team call; office conference with L. Chan.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
03/18/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of Japanese documents to decide which to send for certified translation; research for experts (market reports).	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/18/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Discuss Catalyst and additional evidence with L. Chan; revise Min Ho Chung deposition prep memo per Catalyst document verification and additional evidence.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in weekly telephone call with co-counsel, B. Glackin, and L. Chan.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
03/18/15	RIM, HISUN	Create glossaries for translation vendor.	3.00	7	325.00	\$ 975.00
03/18/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/18/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare filings re motions to dismiss for attorney review.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
03/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
03/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review expert invoice and save to file.	0.10	10	325.00	\$ 32.50
03/19/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Call and leave message for Demetrius Lambrinos re deponents.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Call with C. Saunders re privilege logs.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re market reports.	0.30	10	490.00	\$ 147.00
03/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with co-counsel and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re search term meet and confer.	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
03/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with co-counsel and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re written discovery issues.	1.00	11	490.00	\$ 490.00
03/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review and translations.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
03/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Document review management call.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
03/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to Sanyo re data.	0.40	10	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence to Sony re written discovery and privilege logs.	0.40	6	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re Jae Kil Kim.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
03/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re privilege logs, document production, and document review.	2.00	11	490.00	\$ 980.00
03/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re discoverability of documents produced to the European Commission.	0.80	11	490.00	\$ 392.00
03/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with defendants re search terms.	1.10	6	490.00	\$ 539.00
03/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze fraudulent concealment documents.	1.50	11	490.00	\$ 735.00
03/19/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re [REDACTED].	0.80	11	675.00	\$ 540.00
03/19/15	JONES, KAREN	Research for experts on industry reports; Japanese translations for names and industry lingo to provide to Consortia for certified translations; analysis of hot documents to be sent out for certified translation.	7.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
03/19/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
03/19/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue revising Min Ho Chung deposition prep memo per Catalyst document review and additional evidence.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/19/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in telephone call with co-counsel and counsel for direct purchasers regarding search terms.	0.20	6	435.00	\$ 87.00
03/19/15	RIM, HISUN	Research potential deponents.	4.00	7	325.00	\$ 1,300.00
03/19/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	6.50	7	350.00	\$ 2,275.00
03/19/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production index for L. Chan.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
03/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
03/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and save translated production files.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
03/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
03/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence with Econ One re status of translation requests.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
03/20/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Niyati Ahuja and H. Rim re market trend reports.	0.60	10	490.00	\$ 294.00
03/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re potential deponents; draft email re same.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re redactions, Catalyst, and written discovery.	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
03/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re [REDACTED].	2.40	11	490.00	\$ 1,176.00
03/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze defendant market trend reports.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Review discovery requests.	0.10	9	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/20/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review letter re [REDACTED]; email correspondence re [REDACTED]; telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin re same; office conference with L. Chan re same.	0.90	11	675.00	\$ 607.50
03/20/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	[REDACTED].	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
03/20/15	JONES, KAREN	Research for experts on industry reports; Japanese translations for names and industry lingo to provide to Consortra for certified translations; analysis of hot documents to be sent out for certified translation.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/20/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
03/20/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Finish revising Min Ho Chung deposition prep memo per Catalyst document review and additional evidence.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/20/15	RIM, HISUN	Create list of translation errors.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
03/20/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/20/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	7.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,450.00
03/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare filings re motions to dismiss for attorney review.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
03/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	11	325.00	\$ 32.50
03/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	1.00	9	325.00	\$ 325.00
03/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery requests and save to file.	0.20	8	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review expert retention agreement and save to file.	0.10	10	325.00	\$ 32.50
03/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re market reports for Econ One.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re written discovery and [REDACTED].	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Stipulation re NEC Tockin Corporation Answer Amendments.	0.10	9	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/21/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of hot documents to be sent out for certified translation.	1.00	7	515.00	\$ 515.00
03/21/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	1.00	7	350.00	\$ 350.00
03/21/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	3.00	7	350.00	\$ 1,050.00
03/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re translations, data, privilege logs, and document production.	0.70	11	490.00	\$ 343.00
03/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re [REDACTED].	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Order on Joint Discovery Letter and Order on LG Chem interrogatory responses.	0.30	9	490.00	\$ 147.00
03/23/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Call C. Saunders re privilege logs; email correspondence re same.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re fraudulent concealment.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re translations, document review, LG custodians, and data.	0.70	11	490.00	\$ 343.00
03/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re fraudulent concealment; draft memorandum re same.	4.90	11	490.00	\$ 2,401.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet with M. Boyle re work on case.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise Toshiba meet and confer correspondence.	0.20	6	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Review memorandum re potential deponent; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
03/23/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read discovery order and correspondence.	1.10	9	725.00	\$ 797.50
03/23/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re LG Chem letter; review same.	0.60	11	675.00	\$ 405.00
03/23/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of [REDACTED] documents and documents with Bad OCRs.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/23/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
03/23/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Revise Donny Lee deposition preparation memorandum per Catalyst document review and additional evidence.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/23/15	RIM, HISUN	Update Translation Glossary.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
03/23/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/23/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
03/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.70	9	325.00	\$ 227.50
03/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery requests and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
03/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re translations for L. Chan.	1.20	7	325.00	\$ 390.00
03/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/24/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Shana Scarlett re search terms; draft email correspondence re same.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.70	11	490.00	\$ 343.00
03/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re [REDACTED]; draft memorandum re same.	5.20	11	490.00	\$ 2,548.00
03/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re discovery responses and redactions.	1.20	6	490.00	\$ 588.00
03/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Review meet and confer letter re privilege logs; draft email correspondence re same; confer with C. Saunders re same.	0.40	6	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Review memorandum re potential deponent; draft email correspondence re same.	0.70	11	490.00	\$ 343.00
03/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Revise meet and confer correspondence to LG.	0.20	6	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/24/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of [REDACTED] documents and documents with Bad OCRs; Research on Toshiba meetings for summary judgment motion	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/24/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	5.00	7	450.00	\$ 2,250.00
03/24/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue revising Donny Lee deposition preparation memorandum per Catalyst document review and additional evidence.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/24/15	RIM, HISUN	Update Translation Glossary/Compile Translation Errors.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
03/24/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/24/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare protective orders for D. Harvey review.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
03/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re signed protective orders.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re translated production documents for L. Chan.	1.70	7	325.00	\$ 552.50
03/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated discovery and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
03/25/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/25/15	CHAN, LIN	Call with co-leads re case strategy.	0.80	11	490.00	\$ 392.00
03/25/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re Toshiba motion for summary judgment.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/25/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence re data.	1.60	10	490.00	\$ 784.00
03/25/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence with Toshiba re motion for summary judgment.	1.70	6	490.00	\$ 833.00
03/25/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re summary judgment and discovery.	2.10	11	490.00	\$ 1,029.00
03/25/15	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for and draft memorandum re [REDACTED].	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/25/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with defendants re search terms.	0.40	6	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/25/15	CHAN, LIN	Revise task list; draft email correspondence re same.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/25/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call.	0.60	11	675.00	\$ 405.00
03/25/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with co-counsel re discovery and other pending tasks, review correspondence re same.	0.80	6	515.00	\$ 412.00
03/25/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of [REDACTED] documents; Research on Toshiba meetings for summary judgment motion.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/25/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
03/25/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue revising Donny Lee deposition preparation memorandum per Catalyst document review and additional evidence.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/25/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in weekly telephone call.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00
03/25/15	RIM, HISUN	Update Translation Glossary/Compile Translation Errors.	2.00	1	260.00	\$ 520.00
03/25/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/25/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare documents re [REDACTED] for L. Chan review.	1.30	7	325.00	\$ 422.50
03/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Jae Kil Kim documents for L. Chan review.	2.00	7	325.00	\$ 650.00
03/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/26/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Call potential document reviewer re document review project.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim, K. Jones, and M. Pilotin re document review.	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
03/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with M. Pilotin re case status.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
03/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Document review management call.	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to SDI and Toshiba re data.	0.40	10	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence and stipulation re Toshiba motion for summary judgment; legal research re same; conference with Shana Scarlett and B. Glackin re same.	2.80	6	490.00	\$ 1,372.00
03/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re potential LG deponent.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, expert work, written discovery, Catalyst.	2.00	11	490.00	\$ 980.00
03/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for conference with H. Rim and K. Jones, including reviewing email correspondence and other notes.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
03/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Review LG subpoenas.	0.10	9	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Panasonic and Sanyo discovery; legal research re same.	0.40	9	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Panasonic and Sanyo subpoena to PC Connection.	0.10	9	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Toshiba discovery responses.	0.40	9	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/26/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	[REDACTED]	0.10	11	675.00	\$ 67.50
03/26/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review expert stipulation; memorandum re same.	0.50	9	675.00	\$ 337.50
03/26/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise correspondence and stipulation re Toshiba.	0.40	9	675.00	\$ 270.00
03/26/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
03/26/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Finalize Donny Lee deposition preparation memorandum per Catalyst document review and additional evidence; forward Dong Woo Lee and Min Ho Chung memos to L. Chan and H. Rim.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/26/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with L. Chan regarding transition and assignments.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
03/26/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in weekly document review meeting with L. Chan, K. Jones, and H. Rim.	1.00	11	435.00	\$ 435.00
03/26/15	RIM, HISUN	Translation for Experts.	6.70	1	260.00	\$ 1,742.00
03/26/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/26/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	8	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
03/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Jae Kil Kim documents for L. Chan review.	1.80	7	325.00	\$ 585.00
03/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sony production for Econ One review.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sony production for loading by Catalyst.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
03/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sony production for translation.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
03/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review answers to complaint and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
03/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.70	9	325.00	\$ 227.50
03/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re translations for L. Chan.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
03/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoenas and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
03/27/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Analyze fraudulent concealment evidence.	1.70	11	490.00	\$ 833.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Analyze Sony custodial and other evidence; draft email correspondence re same.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
03/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re Toshiba motion for summary judgment stipulation.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Jones re document review.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with potential document reviewer.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
03/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence to Toshiba re motion for summary judgment.	2.10	6	490.00	\$ 1,029.00
03/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re proposed Toshiba summary judgment motion, potential deponents, translations, Catalyst.	1.80	11	490.00	\$ 882.00
03/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Review document re market trends.	0.10	7	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Review proposed Hitachi search terms.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
03/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Review SDI answers to complaints.	1.10	9	490.00	\$ 539.00
03/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Toshiba conspiracy documents.	0.60	7	490.00	\$ 294.00
03/27/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of Japanese documents re Toshiba meetings; analysis of fraudulent concealment documents.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/27/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
03/27/15	RIM, HISUN	Translation for Experts.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
03/27/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/27/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare documents re ██████████ for L. Chan review.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Toshiba ██████████ documents for L. Chan review.	0.70	7	325.00	\$ 227.50
03/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare translated production documents for L. Chan review.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review LG Chem production and prepare for Econ One review.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review LG Chem production and prepare for loading to the database.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
03/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review NEC replacement production and prepare for Econ One review.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review NEC replacement production and prepare for loading to the database.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
03/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re translated production documents for L. Chan.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
03/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoenas and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
03/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re fraudulent concealment.	1.70	11	490.00	\$ 833.00
03/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Review meet and confer correspondence with Panasonic and Sanyo.	0.20	6	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/28/15	RIM, HISUN	Update Translation Glossary.	3.00	7	325.00	\$ 975.00
03/29/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of Complaint allegations and SDI responses.	2.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
03/30/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ben Shifan re NEC discovery responses.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence re data.	0.30	10	490.00	\$ 147.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, privilege logs, and search terms.	1.50	11	490.00	\$ 735.00
03/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Review memorandum re custodians.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
03/30/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of Complaint allegations and SDI responses; Japanese documents re Toshiba meetings and fraudulent concealment documents.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/30/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
03/30/15	RIM, HISUN	Update Translation Glossary/Cast of Characters.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
03/30/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/30/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	6.50	7	350.00	\$ 2,275.00
03/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sony [REDACTED] documents for L. Chan review.	4.60	7	325.00	\$ 1,495.00
03/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Toshiba [REDACTED] documents for L. Chan review.	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00
03/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence with Econ One re SDI presentations.	0.10	10	325.00	\$ 32.50
03/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
03/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review signed protective order and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
03/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
03/31/15	CHAN, LIN	Call H. Rim re review manual.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/31/15	CHAN, LIN	Call K. Dugar re Casemap and remote hosting.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/31/15	CHAN, LIN	Call Ronnie Spiegel re document review.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/31/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with E. Newman re document review.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
03/31/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with M. Boyle re document review work; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/31/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence re expert data questions.	1.00	10	490.00	\$ 490.00
03/31/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to NEC re custodians.	0.70	6	490.00	\$ 343.00
03/31/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re translations, settlement, and discovery.	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
03/31/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with SDI re search terms; draft email correspondence re same.	1.00	6	490.00	\$ 490.00
03/31/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise meet and confer correspondence to SDI re search terms.	0.20	6	490.00	\$ 98.00
03/31/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise meet and confer correspondence to Sony.	0.40	6	490.00	\$ 196.00
03/31/15	CHAN, LIN	Review NEC discovery responses.	0.10	9	490.00	\$ 49.00
03/31/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	[REDACTED]	0.20	11	725.00	\$ 145.00
03/31/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review correspondence with NEC; office conference with L. Chan re same.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
03/31/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of Complaint allegations and SDI responses.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
03/31/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/31/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Finish researching Catalyst for additional evidence for Young Wook Chung deposition preparation memorandum and forward findings to L. Chan; begin analyzing admissions and denials in SDI's Answers in response to Indirect Purchaser Plaintiffs' and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs' complaints and draft memo of findings.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/31/15	RIM, HISUN	Update Translation Glossary/Cast of Characters.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
03/31/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
03/31/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	7.50	7	350.00	\$ 2,625.00
03/31/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sony conspiracy documents for L. Chan review.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
03/31/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	1.00	9	325.00	\$ 325.00
03/31/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
03/31/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence with Econ One re translation status.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
03/31/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
04/01/15	BOYLE, MATTHEW	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/01/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and K. Jones re document review.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
04/01/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Jessica Moy and Cathy Smith re privilege logs.	1.20	11	490.00	\$ 588.00
04/01/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to NEC; confer with Ben Shiftan re same.	0.10	6	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/01/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re case strategy, translations, Toshiba summary judgment, privilege logs.	0.80	11	490.00	\$ 392.00
04/01/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re data.	1.80	6	490.00	\$ 882.00
04/01/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with Sony, including reviewing correspondence, data, and reviewing other memoranda.	1.10	6	490.00	\$ 539.00
04/01/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meeting with K. Jones and H. Rim, including reviewing prior email correspondence and case deadlines.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
04/01/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Toshiba meet and confer re discovery.	0.20	6	490.00	\$ 98.00
04/01/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Order on Joint Discovery letter.	0.10	9	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/01/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of [REDACTED]; Japanese documents re Toshiba meetings and fraudulent concealment documents; meetings with team.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
04/01/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
04/01/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue analyzing [REDACTED]; finish drafting memo of findings and forward to K. Jones.	8.00	9	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/01/15	RIM, HISUN	Update Cast of Characters/Casemap Names.	6.00	11	260.00	\$ 1,560.00
04/01/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/01/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Samsung files for Econ One review.	1.20	10	325.00	\$ 390.00
04/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on
Timekeeper: all

From 06/01/13
To 02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
04/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoena and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Demetrius Lambrinos, Shana Scarlett and B. Glackin re Toshiba summary judgment.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
04/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter with NEC re custodians and interrogatory responses.	0.10	6	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re Toshiba summary judgment motion, LG discovery, and Sony search terms.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
04/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re ██████████; draft email correspondence re same.	1.10	11	490.00	\$ 539.00
04/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re search terms; confer with Shana Scarlett re same.	0.90	6	490.00	\$ 441.00
04/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Toshiba re summary judgment.	1.80	6	490.00	\$ 882.00
04/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Toshiba meet and confer, including reviewing prior discovery and correspondence.	0.50	6	490.00	\$ 245.00
04/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise Sony search term list.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
04/02/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet and confer with Toshiba; office conference with L. Chan re same; review Toshiba discovery responses and correspondence; telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin re Toshiba; telephone conference with Shana Scarlett and Demetrius Lambrinos re Toshiba.	4.20	6	675.00	\$ 2,835.00
04/02/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of ██████████; Analysis of documents re ██████████; Meetings with team and call with co-counsel.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
04/02/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
04/02/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Cross check ██████████ ██████████ begin reviewing/analyzing hot documents relating to John Oh (SDI) and drafting deposition preparation background memo.	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/02/15	RIM, HISUN	Update Cast of Characters/Casemap Names.	8.00	11	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
04/02/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/02/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re Sony privilege logs.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re Sony privilege logs.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
04/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Jones re document review; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
04/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with M. Boyle re badly OCR'ed documents.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence with Sony re COMS data.	1.60	6	490.00	\$ 784.00
04/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re data, search terms, document review.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
04/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit memorandum re SDI answer.	1.20	11	490.00	\$ 588.00
04/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise memoranda re potential deponents.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
04/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Casemap contract.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Catalyst invoice.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Review list of badly OCR'ed documents; draft email correspondence re same; confer with M. Boyle re same.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
04/03/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of [REDACTED]; Japanese documents re [REDACTED] documents; illegibly produced documents; calls with team.	6.00	11	515.00	\$ 3,090.00
04/03/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
04/03/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue reviewing/analyzing hot documents relating to John Oh (SDI) and drafting deposition preparation background memorandum; verify bad scanned documents, update draft, and forward to K. Jones.	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/03/15	RIM, HISUN	Update Cast of Characters/Casemap Names.	8.00	11	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
04/03/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/03/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare conduct order for B. Glackin review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoena and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memoranda re potential deponents.	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
04/04/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	2.00	7	350.00	\$ 700.00
04/05/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	3.00	7	350.00	\$ 1,050.00
04/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with T. Lee re document review and translation work.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re potential deponents, settlement, translations, discovery meet and confer.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
04/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze memorandum re [REDACTED]; confer with K. Jones re same.	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
04/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise memoranda re potential LG and SDI deponents.	3.10	11	490.00	\$ 1,519.00
04/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Review NEC discovery responses.	0.60	9	490.00	\$ 294.00
04/06/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of complaint allegations and SDI responses; Japanese documents re [REDACTED]; illegibly produced documents; calls with team.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
04/06/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
04/06/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue reviewing/analyzing hot documents relating to John Oh (SDI) and drafting deposition prep background memo; discuss bad OCR document project with K. Jones; continue verifying bad OCR documents, documenting metadata, and updating memo draft.	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/06/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review correspondence.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
04/06/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review pleadings and court orders.	0.90	11	435.00	\$ 391.50
04/06/15	RIM, HISUN	Update Cast of Characters/Casemap Names.	8.00	11	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
04/06/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/06/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case orders for M. Pilotin review.	1.00	9	325.00	\$ 325.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Hitachi Maxell production and prepare for Econ One review.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Hitachi Maxell production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
04/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Hitachi Maxell production and prepare for translation.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re search terms.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re Sony meet and confer.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
04/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with M. Pilotin re status of meet and confers.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to LG re data.	0.40	6	490.00	\$ 196.00
04/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to Panasonic and Sanyo re privilege logs.	0.40	6	490.00	\$ 196.00
04/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re [REDACTED].	1.10	11	490.00	\$ 539.00
04/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re privilege logs, discovery, search terms, data.	2.20	11	490.00	\$ 1,078.00
04/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with LG re search terms.	0.90	6	490.00	\$ 441.00
04/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with NEC re search terms.	0.90	6	490.00	\$ 441.00
04/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze Sony conspiracy documents.	1.00	7	490.00	\$ 490.00
04/07/15	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	1.20	12	490.00	\$ 588.00
04/07/15	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	1.50	12	490.00	\$ 735.00
04/07/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	[REDACTED]	3.20	12	725.00	\$ 2,320.00
04/07/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis [REDACTED]; illegibly produced documents; calls with team.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
04/07/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
04/07/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Finish verifying bad OCR documents, documenting metadata and updating memo draft; send findings to K. Jones; revise John Oh (SDI) deposition preparation memo; revise OCR document memo re organization charts and deletions.	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/07/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer regarding search terms.	0.40	6	435.00	\$ 174.00
04/07/15	RIM, HISUN	Update Cast of Characters/Casemap Names.	8.00	11	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
04/07/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/07/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
04/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re translated Sony documents for L. Chan.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
04/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Toshiba production and prepare for loading to the database.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
04/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production document and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/08/15	CHAN, LIN	Call Demetrius Lambrinos re case status and settlement.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
04/08/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with E. Fastiff and Econ One re analysis of Sony data.	0.30	10	490.00	\$ 147.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/08/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim, K. Jones, and M. Pilotin re document review.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
04/08/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ben Shiftan re NEC custodians.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
04/08/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to LG re transactional data.	1.60	10	490.00	\$ 784.00
04/08/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to Panasonic and Sanyo re privilege logs.	1.90	6	490.00	\$ 931.00
04/08/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery and data.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
04/08/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with NEC re custodians.	0.40	6	490.00	\$ 196.00
04/08/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for conference with H. Rim and K. Jones, including reviewing memoranda and prior correspondence.	0.70	11	490.00	\$ 343.00
04/08/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with NEC, including reviewing prior correspondence, discovery responses, and custodian information.	1.50	6	490.00	\$ 735.00
04/08/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of ██████████ and illegibly produced documents; meetings with team.	7.00	11	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
04/08/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
04/08/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue revising John Oh (SDI) deposition preparation memo; begin drafting ██████████ summaries.	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/08/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer with NEC regarding interrogatory number 3 and custodians.	0.40	6	435.00	\$ 174.00
04/08/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in weekly document review check-in.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
04/08/15	RIM, HISUN	Update cast of characters and casemap Names; Meeting with team.	7.80	11	260.00	\$ 2,028.00
04/08/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/08/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	5.50	7	350.00	\$ 1,925.00
04/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading status.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Toshiba production for Econ One review.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
04/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re Sony finished products data for L. Chan.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
04/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Toshiba production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
04/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin and E. Fastiff re settlement and discovery disputes.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
04/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with D. Harvey re case status.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
04/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to LG re data.	0.20	10	490.00	\$ 98.00
04/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re potential LG deponent.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
04/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Hitachi re search terms.	0.70	6	490.00	\$ 343.00
04/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re privilege logs.	1.10	6	490.00	\$ 539.00
04/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Hitachi meet and confer re search terms, including reviewing prior lists, search term protocol, and email correspondence.	0.30	6	490.00	\$ 147.00
04/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Sony meet and confer re privilege logs, including reviewing redacted documents.	0.90	6	490.00	\$ 441.00
04/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise meet and confer letter to Panasonic and Sanyo re privilege logs.	0.20	6	490.00	\$ 98.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/09/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of ██████████ and illegibly produced documents; meetings with team; review of Japanese document for experts.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
04/09/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
04/09/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Analyze unreadable OCR documents for documents possibly fixed by re-scanning; update memo and forward to K. Jones; continue drafting ██████████ and forward sample to K. Jones and team.	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/09/15	RIM, HISUN	Update cast of characters and casemap Names research search terms.	8.00	11	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
04/09/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	4.50	7	350.00	\$ 1,575.00
04/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail co-counsel re status of translations for L. Chan.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare conspiracy documents for attorney review.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Jae Kil Kim document for co-counsel review.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
04/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare translated conspiracy document for L. Chan review.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
04/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
04/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.80	9	325.00	\$ 260.00
04/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Sony ██████████ documents re status of translations.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re translated ██████████ documents for L. Chan.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Niyati Ahuja and H. Rim re market reports and Sony data.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
04/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re Toshiba summary judgment motion.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with E. Newman re document review.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re search terms.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
04/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to Toshiba re motion for summary judgment.	1.30	6	490.00	\$ 637.00
04/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memoranda re potential deponents.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
04/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re data, search terms, Toshiba Motion for Summary Judgment, and discovery issues.	1.00	11	490.00	\$ 490.00
04/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise Hitachi search term list.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
04/10/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read defendants' amended answer.	0.60	9	725.00	\$ 435.00
04/10/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read defendants' discovery responses.	0.50	9	725.00	\$ 362.50
04/10/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read discovery correspondence.	0.40	9	725.00	\$ 290.00
04/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise letter to Toshiba.	0.90	9	675.00	\$ 607.50
04/10/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of ██████████; drafting summaries for memo.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
04/10/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
04/10/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Meet with L. Chan to discuss project status; finish ██████████ and forward to K. Jones; forward draft of JS Park to Word Processing for edits.	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/10/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review stipulation regarding Toshiba motion for summary judgment.	0.10	9	435.00	\$ 43.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/10/15	RIM, HISUN	Update cast of characters and casemap names; revise deposition memos; expert call; expert data preparation.	8.00	11	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
04/10/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	6.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,100.00
04/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re document translation status.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review re translated conspiracy documents for L. Chan.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoena and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production document and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
04/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re potential deponents.	3.30	11	490.00	\$ 1,617.00
04/11/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	1.50	7	350.00	\$ 525.00
04/12/15	JONES, KAREN	Memo on best [REDACTED] evidence.	4.00	11	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
04/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin, Demetrius Lambrinos, and Shana Scarlett re [REDACTED].	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
04/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re Toshiba Motion for Summary Judgment.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to Toshiba re Motion for Summary Judgment.	1.30	6	490.00	\$ 637.00
04/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memoranda re potential deponents.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
04/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery matters, search terms, and Toshiba Motion for Summary Judgment.	1.60	11	490.00	\$ 784.00
04/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms and foreign regulator documents.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
04/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with LG re search terms; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	6	490.00	\$ 245.00
04/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze NEC discovery responses; draft email correspondence re same.	0.30	9	490.00	\$ 147.00
04/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Review draft expert and other stipulations; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
04/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Review status of document production.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
04/13/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Further revision to Toshiba letter.	0.40	9	675.00	\$ 270.00
04/13/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review expert Stipulation.	0.20	9	675.00	\$ 135.00
04/13/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with L. Chan, Demetrius Lambrinos, and Shana Scarlett re Toshiba; review/revise correspondence re same; read [REDACTED]; telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin re Toshiba.	1.60	11	675.00	\$ 1,080.00
04/13/15	JONES, KAREN	Memo on [REDACTED]; re-coding Toshiba evidence based on research.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
04/13/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
04/13/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Begin reviewing and analyzing hot documents relating to Hee Kyoo Yeo (SDI) and drafting deposition prep background memo.	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/13/15	RIM, HISUN	Update cast of characters and casemap information.	8.00	11	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
04/13/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	5.00	7	350.00	\$ 1,750.00
04/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare initial disclosures for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
04/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re document translation status.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review custodial interrogatory and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Econ One invoice and save to file.	0.10	10	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms, class certification, document production, and proposed stipulations.	1.50	11	490.00	\$ 735.00
04/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re obtaining foreign regulator documents.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
04/14/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Jeff Amato letter re narrowing class; memorandum re same.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
04/14/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review proposed expert Stipulation and Federal Rules; memorandum re same.	0.60	11	675.00	\$ 405.00
04/14/15	JONES, KAREN	Memo on [REDACTED] evidence; re-coding Toshiba evidence based on research; factual research re [REDACTED].	6.00	11	515.00	\$ 3,090.00
04/14/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
04/14/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue reviewing and analyzing hot documents relating to Hee Kyoo Yeo (SDI) and drafting deposition prep background memo; discuss [REDACTED] document project with K. Jones.	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/14/15	RIM, HISUN	Search terms; revise deposition memo.	8.00	11	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
04/14/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/14/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail counsel re translation status.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/15/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with K. Jones and H. Rim re document review.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
04/15/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re transactional data, discovery.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
04/15/15	JONES, KAREN	Memo on [REDACTED] evidence; re-coding Toshiba evidence based on research; factual research re [REDACTED].	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
04/15/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
04/15/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Finish reviewing [REDACTED] documents, updating coding in Catalyst, and forward updated chart to K. Jones; continue reviewing and analyzing hot documents relating to Hee Kyoo Yeo (SDI) and drafting deposition prep background memo.	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/15/15	RIM, HISUN	Search terms; LiB mtg; NEC pricing authority individual information check.	8.00	11	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
04/15/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/15/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review and code Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Document review management call.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms, discovery, potential deponents.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
04/16/15	JONES, KAREN	Review of memo re [REDACTED]; analysis of [REDACTED] documents; research for Sanyo org charts.	7.00	11	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
04/16/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
04/16/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue reviewing and analyzing hot documents relating to Hee Kyoo Yeo (SDI) and drafting deposition prep background memo.	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/16/15	RIM, HISUN	[REDACTED] information check; search terms; LiB meeting.	8.00	11	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
04/16/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/16/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re loading Toshiba production.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence from Econ One re translation status.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re Toshiba production.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoena and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Toshiba data and prepare for loading to the database.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
04/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin; Draft correspondence to Jeff Amato; review stipulations; correspondence re same.	1.50	11	675.00	\$ 1,012.50
04/17/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of fraudulent concealment evidence and drafting memo; research for Sanyo org charts; status report to L. Chan.	7.00	11	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
04/17/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
04/17/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Finish reviewing and analyzing hot documents relating to Hee Kyoo Yeo (SDI) and drafting deposition prep background memo.	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/17/15	RIM, HISUN	Casemap information update; troubleshooting incorrect information on the doc custodian.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
04/17/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/17/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re Toshiba metadata issues.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
04/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re Toshiba metadata issues.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone call from Catalyst re Toshiba metadata issues.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence to NEC re custodians.	0.50	6	490.00	\$ 245.00
04/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms, potential document reviewers, potential deponents, and discovery stipulations.	1.40	11	490.00	\$ 686.00
04/18/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	3.00	7	350.00	\$ 1,050.00
04/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms, stipulation.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
04/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ben Shiftan re NEC custodians.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re Toshiba and document review.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
04/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Greg Stuart re document review.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re document review.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
04/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to NEC re custodians.	0.20	6	490.00	\$ 98.00
04/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, search terms, transactional data, Toshiba, time records, stipulations, and potential deponents.	2.40	11	490.00	\$ 1,176.00
04/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit memorandum re [REDACTED] evidence.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
04/20/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jim McGinnis; memorandum re same; review Toshiba memorandum.	0.90	11	675.00	\$ 607.50
04/20/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
04/20/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Revise summary section of Hee Kyoo Yeo (SDI) background memo; revise MH Chung memo with new data re the LG expense report document; begin analyzing hot documents relating to JS Park and revising background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/20/15	RIM, HISUN	Revise LIB Review Cheat Sheet/Cast of Characters.	8.00	11	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
04/20/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/20/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re coding new data fields.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
04/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re document coding issues.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
04/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG Chem production for Econ One review.	0.10	10	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG Chem production for translation.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review attorney representation agreement and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	1.10	9	325.00	\$ 357.50
04/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review LG Chem production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
04/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re LG Chem production for L. Chan.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
04/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and M. Pilotin re document review.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
04/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with LG re search terms, including separate conference with Shana Scarlett re same.	1.00	6	490.00	\$ 490.00
04/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Panasonic and Sanyo re search terms.	0.80	6	490.00	\$ 392.00
04/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Aaron Sheanin re LG letter.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with potential document reviewer.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
04/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to LG re data.	0.90	6	490.00	\$ 441.00
04/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memoranda re potential LG deponents.	2.80	11	490.00	\$ 1,372.00
04/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re [REDACTED].	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re [REDACTED].	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, privilege logs, transactional data, search terms.	2.20	11	490.00	\$ 1,078.00
04/21/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
04/21/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue analyzing hot documents relating to JS Park and revising background memo; send support ticket to Catalyst; begin market and sales data research project for experts.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review orders and protocols in case.	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
04/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Weekly document review check in.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
04/21/15	RIM, HISUN	LiB Meeting (M. Pilotin, L. Chan); delegating LiB tasks; market data information research.	8.00	11	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
04/21/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/21/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re production loading status.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
04/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
04/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re non-transactional documents sent to Econ One.	1.30	10	325.00	\$ 422.50
04/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Jessica Moy, Brian Clark, and Demetrius Lambrinos re Panasonic and Sanyo privilege log.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
04/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with co-leads re case strategy.	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
04/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with E. Newman re document review.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Sony re search terms.	0.60	6	490.00	\$ 294.00
04/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence and memorandum re case strategy.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
04/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re class certification, document review, search terms, and discovery.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
04/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with Sony re search terms, including reviewing prior proposals; confer with H. Rim re same.	1.40	6	490.00	\$ 686.00
04/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meeting with E. Newman, including reviewing email correspondence and memoranda.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
04/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Review litigation fund reconciliation and draft task list.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
04/22/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum to Ronnie Spiegel re document review.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
04/22/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin re Amato; review Amato letter; memorandum re same.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
04/22/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Administration of database.	0.50	7	340.00	\$ 170.00
04/22/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
04/22/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue analyzing hot documents relating to JS Park and revising background memo; meet with L. Chan to discuss projects status.	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Complete reviewing applicable orders and protocols.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
04/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in weekly telephone call.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00
04/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review meet and confer letter for privilege log dispute with Panasonic and Sony.	0.50	6	435.00	\$ 217.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/22/15	RIM, HISUN	Revise search terms (L. Chan, S. Scarlett - HBSS).	8.00	2	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
04/22/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/22/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare NEC files for Econ One review.	0.10	10	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare privilege logs for M. Pilotin review.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production log for documents sent to Econ One.	0.40	10	325.00	\$ 130.00
04/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated Samsung document and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with M. Pilotin, B. Glackin, Shana Scarlett, and Demetrius Lambrinos re Toshiba Motion for Summary Judgment.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
04/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re client.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re privilege logs.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re potential deponents.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
04/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with T. Lee re document review.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Document review management call.	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
04/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to Toshiba re Motion for Summary Judgment.	0.60	6	490.00	\$ 294.00
04/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review, search terms, Motion for Summary Judgment, class certification, and potential deponents.	2.30	11	490.00	\$ 1,127.00
04/23/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft letter to Amato; finalize same and send.	0.90	11	675.00	\$ 607.50
04/23/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise letter to Toshiba.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
04/23/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Shana Scarlett, Demetrius Lambrinos, L. Chan and M. Pilotin re Toshiba.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
04/23/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
04/23/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Finish analyzing hot documents relating to JS Park and revising background memo.	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in telephone call with L. Chan and co-counsel regarding potential deponents.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
04/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in weekly document reviewer call.	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
04/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letter to Toshiba regarding discovery and motion for summary judgment.	0.20	6	435.00	\$ 87.00
04/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Search for documents from [REDACTED].	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
04/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with B. Glackin, L. Chan, and co-counsel regarding response to Toshiba letter.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
04/23/15	RIM, HISUN	Search terms, LiB Management meeting, Toshiba Summary Judgment document review preparation.	8.00	11	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
04/23/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/23/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	7.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,450.00
04/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare documents re privilege logs for L. Chan review.	3.00	7	325.00	\$ 975.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare [REDACTED].	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
04/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Toshiba production for Econ One review.	0.10	10	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Toshiba production for translation.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
04/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re [REDACTED] for M. Pilotin.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
04/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Toshiba production and prepare for loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
04/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re Sony search terms; draft email correspondence re same.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
04/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re potential deponent.	0.70	11	490.00	\$ 343.00
04/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re transactional data, translations, Toshiba, search terms, document review.	1.10	11	490.00	\$ 539.00
04/24/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jeff Friedman re Casemap.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
04/24/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
04/24/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Begin analyzing hot documents relating to Shinichiro Nagata (Sanyo) and drafting background memo.	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/24/15	RIM, HISUN	Work on search terms; Toshiba summary judgment fact research; depo memo edits; phone meetings with L. Chan; translation glossary update.	8.00	11	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
04/24/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/24/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/25/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' documents for relevance.	1.00	7	350.00	\$ 350.00
04/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re class certification meet and confer.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise letter to Sony re privilege logs.	2.40	6	490.00	\$ 1,176.00
04/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with M. Pilotin, Jessica Moy, and Brian Clark re Panasonic and Sanyo privilege logs.	0.30	6	490.00	\$ 147.00
04/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with M. Pilotin re Sanyo/Panasonic meet and confer.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to Sony re transactional data.	0.70	6	490.00	\$ 343.00
04/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to Toshiba re Motion for Summary Judgment.	0.60	6	490.00	\$ 294.00
04/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re potential deponents, privilege logs, search terms.	1.20	11	490.00	\$ 588.00
04/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Panasonic and Sanyo re privilege logs.	1.00	6	490.00	\$ 490.00
04/27/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
04/27/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue analyzing hot documents relating to Shinichiro Nagata (Sanyo) and drafting background memo.	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/27/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for meet and confer regarding Panasonic / Sanyo privilege log; participate in meet and confer regarding Panasonic / Sanyo privilege log; follow-up correspondence and telephone calls with co-counsel.	1.90	6	435.00	\$ 826.50
04/27/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision, cheat sheet edits, Sanyo deponent memo preparation (Matsumoto).	8.00	11	325.00	\$ 2,600.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/27/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/27/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' documents for relevance.	6.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,100.00
04/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with C. Saunders re document review.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with G. Stuart re document review.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to Toshiba re Motion for Summary Judgment.	0.30	6	490.00	\$ 147.00
04/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
04/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re Toshiba Motion for Summary Judgment, discovery, search terms, transactional data.	1.50	11	490.00	\$ 735.00
04/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare subpoena for service.	0.30	2	490.00	\$ 147.00
04/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Review proposed Panasonic and Sanyo search terms; email re same.	0.20	2	490.00	\$ 98.00
04/28/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with Eric Somers re document review.	0.20	11	725.00	\$ 145.00
04/28/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Draft and revise subpoena to Zelle Hofman, supervise service of same.	1.20	2	515.00	\$ 618.00
04/28/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
04/28/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue analyzing hot documents relating to Shinichiro Nagata (Sanyo) and drafting background memo.	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review letter to counsel for Toshiba regarding scheduling for motion for summary judgment.	0.10	6	435.00	\$ 43.50
04/28/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision, Catalyst database call meeting, cheat sheet update, Toshiba summary judgment research, deposition memorandum update (Matsumoto).	8.00	11	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
04/28/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/28/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	7.50	7	350.00	\$ 2,625.00
04/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case citation for D. Harvey review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production documents for Econ One review.	1.00	10	325.00	\$ 325.00
04/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare subpoena for D. Harvey review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Y.W. Chung documents for L. Chan review.	0.70	7	325.00	\$ 227.50
04/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to Case Map.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
04/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
04/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin, M. Pilotin, Demetrius Lambrinos re case strategy.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
04/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
04/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms, discovery, document review.	2.30	11	490.00	\$ 1,127.00
04/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Review correspondence re transactional data; confer with Niyati Ahuja re same.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
04/29/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team conference call.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
04/29/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
04/29/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Begin analyzing hot documents relating to Hank Tsuda (Sanyo) and drafting background memo.	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/29/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue analyzing hot documents relating to Shinichiro Nagata (Sanyo) and drafting background memo.	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/29/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in weekly call; meet with B. Glackin and L. Chan regarding case assignments.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
04/29/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise Plaintiffs' discovery responses.	1.80	3	435.00	\$ 783.00
04/29/15	RIM, HISUN	LCHB batteries meeting (L. Chan); Toshiba summary judgment research, expert data preparation, search terms.	9.00	11	325.00	\$ 2,925.00
04/29/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/29/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery requests for attorney review.	0.20	2	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production index for attorney review.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production index re documents sent to Econ One.	0.70	10	325.00	\$ 227.50
04/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare subpoena for service.	0.20	2	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Y.W. Chung documents for L. Chan review.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
04/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize production files.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
04/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re transactional requests for L. Chan.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
04/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re loading of productions by Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Analysis re document review needs.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
04/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re Casemap and other discovery matters.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
04/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re Sony damages.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
04/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re document review.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
04/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Document review management call.	0.80	11	490.00	\$ 392.00
04/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re Casemap, search terms, privilege log, discovery responses, transactional data.	1.30	11	490.00	\$ 637.00
04/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re [REDACTED].	1.20	11	490.00	\$ 588.00
04/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer call with defendants re scope of class certification discovery and motion practice; conference with Aaron Sheanin and Shana Scarlett re same.	0.60	6	490.00	\$ 294.00
04/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with LG re search terms.	0.70	6	490.00	\$ 343.00
04/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with LG re search terms.	0.40	6	490.00	\$ 196.00
04/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Review meet and confer correspondence re class certification.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
04/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Review opt-out complaint.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
04/30/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jeff Amato re narrowing of class; telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin re same; telephone conference with Shana Scarlett re same.	0.90	11	675.00	\$ 607.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/30/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jeff Friedman and Steve Williams.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
04/30/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
04/30/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer regarding search terms.	0.20	6	435.00	\$ 87.00
04/30/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer with opposing counsel regarding narrowing class definition.	0.60	6	435.00	\$ 261.00
04/30/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Revisions to meet and confer letter regarding privilege logs for Panasonic and Sanyo.	0.70	6	435.00	\$ 304.50
04/30/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision; Batteries document review management meeting.	11.80	11	260.00	\$ 3,068.00
04/30/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/30/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
04/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re Toshiba production corruption issues.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
04/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare index re production documents sent to Econ One.	2.70	10	325.00	\$ 877.50
04/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare watch list correspondence for L. Chan review.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
04/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review NEC production and prepare for loading.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
04/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re Toshiba production file issues.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
04/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Toshiba production and prepare for loading.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
04/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Toshiba production re corruption issues.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
05/01/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re search terms.	0.30	6	490.00	\$ 147.00
05/01/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Shana Scarlett re LCDs subpoena.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/01/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re LG search terms, Toshiba, privilege logs, cost data.	1.00	11	490.00	\$ 490.00
05/01/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Toshiba re discovery and Motion for Summary Judgment; meet and confer with Aaron Sheanin, Shana Scarlett, and Demetrius Lambrinos re same.	0.80	6	490.00	\$ 392.00
05/01/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with Toshiba re Motion for Summary Judgment and Sean Collins.	0.60	6	490.00	\$ 294.00
05/01/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with White & Case re Sean Collins; telephone conference with plaintiff counsel re same.	0.80	6	675.00	\$ 540.00
05/01/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
05/01/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue analyzing hot documents relating to Hank Tsuda (Sanyo) and drafting background memorandum; draft project status email and send to L. Chan.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/01/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer with Toshiba regarding Sean Collins documents.	0.70	6	435.00	\$ 304.50
05/01/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	10.50	6	260.00	\$ 2,730.00
05/01/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/01/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	7.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,450.00
05/01/15	TAJIMA, SERA	Review Toshiba production corrupt files.	2.00	7	280.00	\$ 560.00
05/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re Toshiba corruption issues.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
05/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	1.40	7	325.00	\$ 455.00
05/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Toshiba files re corruption issues.	2.50	7	325.00	\$ 812.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From 06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To 02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and upload to Case Map.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
05/02/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	2.30	6	260.00	\$ 598.00
05/02/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	1.50	7	350.00	\$ 525.00
05/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence with Sony re transactional data.	0.20	6	490.00	\$ 98.00
05/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms and document review.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
05/03/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue analyzing hot documents relating to Hank Tsuda (Sanyo) and drafting background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/03/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	2.50	11	325.00	\$ 812.50
05/04/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Duplicate and compare data in a hard drive.	1.80	11	340.00	\$ 612.00
05/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and Shana Scarlett re Panasonic and Sanyo search terms.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
05/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with E. Fastiff re Sony settlement.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re Sony Japanese search terms.	1.20	6	490.00	\$ 588.00
05/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Phil Johnson re Sony damages model.	0.30	10	490.00	\$ 147.00
05/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with T. Lee re document review.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re document review plan.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms, document review, plaintiff firms, Toshiba Motion for Summary Judgment.	2.00	11	490.00	\$ 980.00
05/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Panasonic and Sanyo re search terms.	0.60	6	490.00	\$ 294.00
05/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re cost data.	0.20	6	490.00	\$ 98.00
05/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Review meet and confer letter to Sanyo and Panasonic re written discovery.	0.20	6	490.00	\$ 98.00
05/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Review subpoena to LCHB.	0.20	9	490.00	\$ 98.00
05/04/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	Emails with B. Glackin and L. Chan re document review.	0.10	11	725.00	\$ 72.50
05/04/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
05/04/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue analyzing hot documents relating to Hank Tsuda (Sanyo) and drafting background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/04/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	10.80	11	325.00	\$ 3,510.00
05/04/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/04/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sony production for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
05/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re loading of defense productions by Catalyst for attorney review.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare summary re plaintiffs and state claims for B. Glackin review.	0.50	11	325.00	\$ 162.50
05/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
05/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re status of translations.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re Toshiba production metadata fields for Catalyst.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
05/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Toshiba production re corrupt files.	2.00	7	325.00	\$ 650.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with C. Saunders re document review.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re interrogatory responses.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
05/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with E. Newman re document review.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re Sony search terms; revise search terms.	1.60	11	490.00	\$ 784.00
05/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with T. Lee re interrogatory responses; draft email correspondence re same.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
05/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to Toshiba re corrupted data files.	0.70	6	490.00	\$ 343.00
05/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re subpoena, privilege logs, document review, damages.	0.80	11	490.00	\$ 392.00
05/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re search terms.	0.50	6	490.00	\$ 245.00
05/05/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
05/05/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue analyzing hot documents relating to Hank Tsuda (Sanyo) and drafting background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/05/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer with Sony regarding search terms.	0.60	6	435.00	\$ 261.00
05/05/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	10.50	11	325.00	\$ 3,412.50
05/05/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/05/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	7.50	7	350.00	\$ 2,625.00
05/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Edit case calendar re response deadlines.	0.10	11	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
05/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review document subpoena and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
05/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with M. Pilotin and H. Rim re document review and search terms.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
05/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re search terms.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
05/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft and send letter to Toshiba re transactional data.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
05/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft interrogatory response re fraudulent concealment; confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re same.	0.60	3	490.00	\$ 294.00
05/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document production, potential deponents, search terms, Toshiba Motion of Summary Judgment.	2.20	11	490.00	\$ 1,078.00
05/06/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for conference with M. Pilotin and H. Rim re document review and transition plan; draft memorandum re same.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
05/06/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
05/06/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Finish revising Hank Tsuda (Sanyo) and Shinichiro Nagata (Sanyo) background memoranda; draft email and forward same to L. Chan; cross-check hot documents against current search strings; draft email to H. Rim reporting on non-responsive documents and listing additional search terms.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/06/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Weekly check in with document reviewers.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
05/06/15	RIM, HISUN	Meeting with L. Chan and M. Pilotin; cast of characters; search term revision.	10.00	11	260.00	\$ 2,600.00
05/06/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/06/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' documents for relevance.	5.00	7	350.00	\$ 1,750.00
05/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case strategy.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Document review management call.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
05/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
05/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re interrogatory responses, search terms, document review, Catalyst, case strategy, transactional data, potential deponents.	3.10	11	490.00	\$ 1,519.00
05/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with LG re search terms.	0.30	6	490.00	\$ 147.00
05/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze Toshiba production.	0.50	7	490.00	\$ 245.00
05/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise discovery responses.	0.80	3	490.00	\$ 392.00
05/07/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re task list.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
05/07/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
05/07/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer regarding Panasonic transactional data.	0.60	6	435.00	\$ 261.00
05/07/15	RIM, HISUN	Document review management meeting; [REDACTED] memo; telephone conference with R. Spiegel (HBSS); search term revision.	11.30	11	260.00	\$ 2,938.00
05/07/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/07/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Edit case calendar re third party subpoenas.	0.10	11	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review third party subpoenas and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/08/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with co-leads re case strategy.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
05/08/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft search terms; confer with H. Rim re same.	0.70	11	490.00	\$ 343.00
05/08/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms, stipulation, third party discovery.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
05/08/15	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re governmental classes.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
05/08/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with NEC re search terms.	0.60	6	490.00	\$ 294.00
05/08/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
05/08/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Begin analyzing hot documents relating to Steve Jaska (Sony) and drafting background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/08/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Weekly task call with co-counsel.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
05/08/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	10.80	11	325.00	\$ 3,510.00
05/08/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/08/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' documents for relevance.	7.50	7	350.00	\$ 2,625.00
05/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re NEC file issues for L. Chan.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re loading Sony document production by Catalyst.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/09/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' documents for relevance.	1.00	7	350.00	\$ 350.00
05/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re potential deponents.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
05/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re third party discovery.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/10/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	12.80	11	325.00	\$ 4,160.00
05/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re document review and governmental entities.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re discovery responses.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re discovery responses and potential deponents.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with G. Stuart re document review.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Jones re document review and fraudulent concealment project.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with T. Lee re document review.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memoranda re potential deponents, including reviewing relevant documents.	1.60	11	490.00	\$ 784.00
05/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms, document review and production, case strategy, Sony settlement.	1.40	11	490.00	\$ 686.00
05/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer re search terms.	0.50	6	490.00	\$ 245.00
05/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Revise LG search terms; confer with H. Rim re same.	2.00	11	490.00	\$ 980.00
05/11/15	CHAN, LIN		0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
05/11/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Lesley Weaver re document review and [REDACTED].	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
05/11/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Correspond with Econ One and with co-counsel re Sony damages, research same.	0.70	10	515.00	\$ 360.50
05/11/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of new [REDACTED] evidence and drafting memo; conferences with H. Rim and L. Chan re case status and projects; re-coding problem Hitachi documents.	7.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
05/11/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
05/11/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Revise/update Dong Woo Lee (LGC) background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/11/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer with opposing counsel regarding search terms.	0.60	6	435.00	\$ 261.00
05/11/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision; price increase announcement memorandum.	12.80	7	325.00	\$ 4,160.00
05/11/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/11/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail revised production log to Econ One.	0.10	10	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production log for Econ One review.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare subpoena for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production index re transactional data status.	0.80	7	325.00	\$ 260.00
05/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and revise status re transactional data productions for Ronnie Spiegel.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
05/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review production translations and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
05/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with C. Saunders re document review; email correspondence re same.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
05/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re search terms.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
05/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with M. Pilotin re case status and transition plan.	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
05/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to Toshiba re discovery.	0.70	6	490.00	\$ 343.00
05/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum and review documents re potential deponent.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
05/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re status of privilege log negotiations.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
05/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery, document review, case strategy, and translations.	1.80	11	490.00	\$ 882.00
05/12/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise letter re Sean Collins.	0.10	6	675.00	\$ 67.50
05/12/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of new [REDACTED] evidence and drafting memo; review of Japanese documents in Catalyst to propose revisions to Sony search terms.	7.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
05/12/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
05/12/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Finish revising/updating Dong Woo Lee (LGC) background memo; begin revising/updating Shinichiro Nagata (Sanyo) background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/12/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review materials in preparation for transition of work; meet with L. Chan to discuss transition of work.	2.20	11	435.00	\$ 957.00
05/12/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review meet and confer letter regarding Toshiba discovery.	0.10	6	435.00	\$ 43.50
05/12/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision; cast of characters; coding form review.	9.50	11	260.00	\$ 2,470.00
05/12/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/12/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Hitachi production for translation.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
05/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG witness documents for co-counsel review.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG witness documents for L. Chan review.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
05/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production log for co-counsel review.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status update re loading productions by Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
05/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re Sony ESI issues and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re transactional data for Econ One.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re missing defense productions and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	1.80	7	325.00	\$ 585.00
05/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
05/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Document review meeting with M. Pilotin, H. Rim, and K. Jones.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
05/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to Toshiba re discovery.	0.30	6	490.00	\$ 147.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re potential deponent; review documents re same.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
05/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft NEC search terms.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
05/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms discovery, potential deponents.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
05/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for document review meeting.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
05/13/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with P. Johnson re Sony data, conference with B. Glackin re same.	0.60	10	515.00	\$ 309.00
05/13/15	JONES, KAREN	Review of Japanese documents in Catalyst to propose revisions to Sony search terms; managing ██████████ project.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
05/13/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
05/13/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Finish revising/updating Shinichiro Nagata (Sanyo) background memo; begin revising/updating Hank Tsuda (Sanyo) background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/13/15	PILOTIN, MARC	██████████	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
05/13/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with K. Jones and H. Rim regarding document review projects.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
05/13/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise contract regarding CaseMap platform.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
05/13/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Weekly document review meeting.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
05/13/15	RIM, HISUN	Meeting with M. Pilotin and L. Chan; ██████████ memo; cast of characters; search term revision.	12.80	7	260.00	\$ 3,328.00
05/13/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/13/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' documents for relevance.	7.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,450.00
05/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Correspondence with Econ One re transactional data.	0.40	10	325.00	\$ 130.00
05/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
05/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG witness documents for L. Chan review.	0.80	7	325.00	\$ 260.00
05/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare productions for loading by Catalyst.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
05/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
05/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.50	11	325.00	\$ 162.50
05/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.70	11	325.00	\$ 227.50
05/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
05/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re productions missing from Catalyst for Chan Lovell.	0.70	7	325.00	\$ 227.50
05/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00
05/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with co-leads re case strategy; separate conference with B. Glackin and M. Pilotin re same.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
05/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with M. Pilotin re Sony damages estimate.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Document review management meeting.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
05/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft Hitachi search terms.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft NEC search terms.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
05/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms, discovery, transactional data, Catalyst.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
05/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with LG re search terms; draft notes re same.	0.60	6	490.00	\$ 294.00
05/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Review memoranda re case strategy.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
05/14/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with co-lead counsel; office conference with L. Chan and M. Pilotin.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
05/14/15	JONES, KAREN	Review of Japanese documents in Catalyst to propose revisions to Sony search terms; conference and calls with team.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
05/14/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
05/14/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Finish revising/updating Hank Tsuda (Sanyo) background memo and forward to L. Chan; begin revising/updating Jong Sun Park (SDI) background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/14/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer telephone call regarding LG search terms.	0.50	6	435.00	\$ 217.50
05/14/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in weekly document review manager call.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
05/14/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for weekly lead counsel coordination call and participate in the same.	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
05/14/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review questionnaire from expert regarding [REDACTED]; telephone call with expert regarding questions; draft letter regarding the same.	1.60	12	435.00	\$ 696.00
05/14/15	RIM, HISUN	Document review management meeting; coding form; search term revision.	9.30	11	260.00	\$ 2,418.00
05/14/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/14/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
05/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG witness documents for co-counsel review.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG witness documents for L. Chan review.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
05/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Panasonic productions for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
05/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sanyo productions for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
05/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading for co-counsel.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
05/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re missing production documents on the database.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re Toshiba transactional data on production log.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
05/15/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence re Hitachi search terms.	0.20	6	490.00	\$ 98.00
05/15/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft Hitachi search terms.	0.70	6	490.00	\$ 343.00
05/15/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document production, search terms, transactional data, Catalyst.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
05/15/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Panasonic and Sanyo re search terms.	1.60	6	490.00	\$ 784.00
05/15/15	JONES, KAREN	Review of Japanese documents in Catalyst for revisions to Sony search terms.	8.00	1	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
05/15/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
05/15/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Finish revising/updating Jong Sun Park (SDI) background memo; begin revising/updating HK Yeo (SDI) background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/15/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	9.00	11	325.00	\$ 2,925.00
05/15/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG witness documents for L. Chan review.	2.50	7	325.00	\$ 812.50
05/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production index.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/16/15	JONES, KAREN	Review of documents in Catalyst for revisions to search terms; drafting proposal for new search terms.	2.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
05/16/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/16/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' documents for relevance.	1.00	7	350.00	\$ 350.00
05/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memoranda re potential deponents.	1.40	11	490.00	\$ 686.00
05/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re translations, document production.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
05/18/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Assistance in accessing discs and copy data to network.	1.70	7	340.00	\$ 578.00
05/18/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Copy data of flash drive.	0.60	7	340.00	\$ 204.00
05/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re search terms.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
05/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re search terms; draft email correspondence re same	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
05/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with T. Lee re document review and search terms.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memoranda re potential deponents; review documents re same.	1.20	11	490.00	\$ 588.00
05/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft search terms.	0.80	11	490.00	\$ 392.00
05/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document production, search terms, transactional data.	0.70	11	490.00	\$ 343.00
05/18/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Duplication of Electronic discovery production.	1.00	7	340.00	\$ 340.00
05/18/15	JONES, KAREN	Review of Japanese documents in Catalyst for revisions to Sony search terms; drafting proposal for new search terms to Sony.	7.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
05/18/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
05/18/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue revising/updating HK Yeo (SDI) background memo.	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letter regarding Sony data; correspondence with co-counsel regarding the same.	0.20	12	435.00	\$ 87.00
05/18/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	8.00	11	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
05/18/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re production loading issues.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
05/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading.	4.50	7	325.00	\$ 1,462.50
05/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/19/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Burn production data from network and copy to hard drive. Confirm downloaded data.	1.50	7	340.00	\$ 510.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/19/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Check and compare copy. Create label.	0.50	7	340.00	\$ 170.00
05/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Aaron Shearin re Sean Collins and Toshiba documents.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
05/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin and M. Pilotin re Toshiba.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
05/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, M. Pilotin re case strategy; confer with B. Troxel re document production.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
05/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re Toshiba letter.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re search terms.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
05/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to Toshiba re document production.	1.60	6	490.00	\$ 784.00
05/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re potential deponent.	0.70	11	490.00	\$ 343.00
05/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re Toshiba document review.	0.80	11	490.00	\$ 392.00
05/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re Toshiba document review; email correspondence re same.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
05/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms, deponents, transactional data, and Toshiba production.	0.70	11	490.00	\$ 343.00
05/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Review April time records.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
05/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Review document production issues.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
05/19/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Case Map contracts; memorandum re same.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
05/19/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise Toshiba letter.	0.40	9	675.00	\$ 270.00
05/19/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Toshiba correspondence; meet with L. Chan re same.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
05/19/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team meeting with M. Pilotin and L. Chan.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
05/19/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Duplication of electronic discovery production.	1.00	7	340.00	\$ 340.00
05/19/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with LCHB team re discovery status and next steps, prepare for same.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
05/19/15	HARVEY, DEAN		0.20	10	515.00	\$ 103.00
05/19/15	JONES, KAREN	Review of documents in Catalyst for revisions to Sony and Panasonic search terms; drafting proposal for new search terms.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
05/19/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
05/19/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Finish revising/updating HK Yeo (SDI) background memo and begin revising Min Ho Chung (SDI/LGC) background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/19/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letter to Toshiba regarding discovery.	0.10	6	435.00	\$ 43.50
05/19/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review materials to develop document review plan.	1.00	11	435.00	\$ 435.00
05/19/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Team meeting with B. Glackin, D. Harvey, and L. Chan.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
05/19/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	8.00	11	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
05/19/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/19/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
05/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG witness documents for L. Chan review.	1.20	7	325.00	\$ 390.00
05/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare steering committee order for B. Glackin review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
05/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	2.50	7	325.00	\$ 812.50
05/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim, M. Pilotin, K. Jones re document review.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
05/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with M. Pilotin re document review.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ronnie Spiegel re document review plan.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
05/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with T. Lee re reviewing Toshiba hard copy documents.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re Toshiba document review.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
05/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft Panasonic/Sanyo search terms; confer with H. Rim re same.	0.60	6	490.00	\$ 294.00
05/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with LG re discovery responses and search terms.	0.50	6	490.00	\$ 245.00
05/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for document review meeting, including reviewing prior email correspondence.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
05/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Panasonic/Sanyo interrogatories.	0.10	9	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/20/15	HARVEY, DEAN		0.70	12	515.00	\$ 360.50
05/20/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of new fraudulent concealment evidence; revisions to memo; price announcement memo.	7.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
05/20/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
05/20/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue revising/updating Min Ho Chung (SDI/LGC)background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Handle cost fund disbursements.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
05/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer with LG Chem regarding discovery.	0.40	6	435.00	\$ 174.00
05/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for direct purchaser plaintiffs regarding hard copy review of Toshiba documents; correspondence with T. Lee and K. Dugar regarding the same.	0.50	7	435.00	\$ 217.50
05/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Weekly check in with document review managers.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
05/20/15	RIM, HISUN	LCHB LiB meeting (M.Pilotin/L.Chan/K.Jones); search term revision.	10.00	7	325.00	\$ 3,250.00
05/20/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/20/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re passwords for encrypted productions.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
05/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail counsel re status of production loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG discovery responses for M. Pilotin for review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG witness documents for co-counsel review.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production log for co-counsel review.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare SDI witness documents for L. Chan review.	0.70	7	325.00	\$ 227.50
05/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	11	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
05/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery requests and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re loading of productions by Catalyst.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
05/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoenas and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead conference call re case strategy.	0.70	11	490.00	\$ 343.00
05/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference re document review.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
05/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with M. Pilotin and Ronnie Spiegel re review team.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
05/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re case status and strategy, search terms, potential deponents.	1.20	11	490.00	\$ 588.00
05/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with LG re search terms.	0.80	6	490.00	\$ 392.00
05/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise LG search term list.	1.80	11	490.00	\$ 882.00
05/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise task list.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/21/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Case Map database.	1.00	11	675.00	\$ 675.00
05/21/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
05/21/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of [REDACTED]; revisions to memorandum.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
05/21/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
05/21/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue revising/updating Min Ho Chung (SDI/LGC) background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Compile litigation task list.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
05/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding review of hard copy documents in New York.	0.10	7	435.00	\$ 43.50
05/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with co-counsel and expert regarding [REDACTED]; review and revise letter and send to opposing counsel.	0.40	12	435.00	\$ 174.00
05/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in weekly co-lead counsel call.	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
05/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in weekly telephone call with document review managers.	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
05/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with co-counsel regarding document review staffing.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
05/21/15	RIM, HISUN	LiB document review management meeting; search term revision.	10.00	7	325.00	\$ 3,250.00
05/21/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/21/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails from Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
05/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery requests for M. Pilotin review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review calendar re pending discovery dates.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Demetrius Lambrinos, M. Pilotin, Ronnie Spiegel, and Shinae Kim-Helms re deponent memos, including separate conference with B. Glackin and M. Pilotin re same.	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
05/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with C. Saunders re document review.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with G. Stuart re document review.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re search terms.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
05/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Jones re document review.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with M. Pilotin re subpoena of LCD documents.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re potential deponent.	2.80	11	490.00	\$ 1,372.00
05/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re potential deponents.	0.80	11	490.00	\$ 392.00
05/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft Panasonic/Sanyo search term list.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
05/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re potential deponents, search terms, document review.	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
05/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Toshiba meet and confer correspondence.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
05/22/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum re depositions.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
05/22/15	JONES, KAREN	Revisions and editing of Japanese search term proposals.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
05/22/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
05/22/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Finish revising/updating Min Ho Chung (SDI/LGC) background memo; draft email and forward links to memos to L. Chan.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review correspondence from Toshiba regarding document productions; confer with L. Chan regarding the same.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
05/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with co-counsel regarding deponent memoranda; confer with B. Glackin regarding document review platform; correspondence with co-counsel regarding document review.	1.40	7	435.00	\$ 609.00
05/22/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	9.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,925.00
05/22/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/22/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re translated document production for K. Jones.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
05/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
05/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re document overlay.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re deponent memos.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
05/23/15	JONES, KAREN	Drafting revisions to proposed search terms.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
05/25/15	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
05/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memoranda re potential deponents.	3.90	11	490.00	\$ 1,911.00
05/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms, deponent memos, and transactional data.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
05/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sanyo re transactional data.	0.80	6	490.00	\$ 392.00
05/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sony re search terms.	0.60	6	490.00	\$ 294.00
05/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Revise Panasonic/Sanyo search terms; Confer with H. Rim re proposed Panasonic/Sanyo search terms.	1.10	11	490.00	\$ 539.00
05/26/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of [REDACTED]; revisions to memorandum.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
05/26/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
05/26/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft correspondence regarding reviewer staffing.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
05/26/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Meet and confer with Sanyo regarding transactional data.	1.40	6	435.00	\$ 609.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/26/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review correspondence from Toshiba regarding discovery; confer with L. Chan regarding the same; correspondence with co-counsel regarding the same.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
05/26/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
05/26/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/26/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re status of production loading and overlays.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
05/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare productions for loading.	2.50	7	325.00	\$ 812.50
05/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re LG Chem productions for co-counsel.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
05/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
05/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with M. Pilotin, H. Rim, and K. Jones re document review.	0.70	11	490.00	\$ 343.00
05/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memoranda re potential deponents.	2.00	11	490.00	\$ 980.00
05/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft Sony search terms.	1.20	11	490.00	\$ 588.00
05/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
05/27/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of [REDACTED]; revisions to memorandum; analysis of new document productions to plan document review.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
05/27/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
05/27/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Attend weekly document review manager meeting.	0.90	11	435.00	\$ 391.50
05/27/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding document review staffing; draft letter to steering committee firms regarding the same.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
05/27/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft case task list and deadlines.	0.90	11	435.00	\$ 391.50
05/27/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Follow up correspondence with co-counsel and opposing counsel regarding Toshiba meet and confer letter regarding Sean Collins.	0.50	6	435.00	\$ 217.50
05/27/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review deponent memos.	1.60	11	435.00	\$ 696.00
05/27/15	RIM, HISUN	LCHB LiB meeting (M.Pilotin/L.Chan/K.Jones); price increase announcement memorandum; cast of characters; search term revision.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
05/27/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/27/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' documents for relevance	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re status of reproductions and overlays.	1.30	7	325.00	\$ 422.50
05/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare order re steering committee for M. Pilotin review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare productions for loading.	1.50	7	325.00	\$ 487.50
05/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Toshiba production for co-counsel review.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
05/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare witness documents for L. Chan review.	1.50	7	325.00	\$ 487.50
05/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Y.S. Kim documents for co-counsel review.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
05/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re NEC production for co-counsel.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
05/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Call with G. Stuart re document review; email correspondence re same.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Demetrius Lambrinos and M. Pilotin re discovery.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
05/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with re document review.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
05/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with C. Saunders re document review; email correspondence re same.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to Panasonic and Sanyo re transactional data.	1.90	6	490.00	\$ 931.00
05/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memoranda re [REDACTED].	1.80	11	490.00	\$ 882.00
05/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery and document review.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
05/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with LG re search terms.	0.10	6	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sanyo re transactional data.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
05/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Review docket.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
05/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Review memorandum re [REDACTED] documents.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/28/15	JONES, KAREN	Planning strategy for next wave of document review; analysis of [REDACTED] - working with G. Stuart.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
05/28/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
05/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with Jessica Moy regarding privilege logs; draft correspondence to Sony regarding the same.	0.60	6	435.00	\$ 261.00
05/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft class certification task list; correspondence regarding weekly call,	1.00	11	435.00	\$ 435.00
05/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Follow-up correspondence with Toshiba regarding meet and confer.	0.20	6	435.00	\$ 87.00
05/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer regarding LG search terms.	0.10	6	435.00	\$ 43.50
05/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer with Sanyo regarding transactional data.	0.70	6	435.00	\$ 304.50
05/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in weekly document review manager telephone call.	1.10	11	435.00	\$ 478.50
05/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with co-counsel regarding [REDACTED] and [REDACTED].	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
05/28/15	RIM, HISUN	LiB document review management meeting; search term revision; coding form revision.	8.00	6	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
05/28/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/28/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
05/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail counsel re status of production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare index re production logs.	0.70	7	325.00	\$ 227.50
05/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Samsung production for loading by Catalyst.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
05/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare witness documents for L. Chan review.	1.50	7	325.00	\$ 487.50
05/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re Sony privilege log for M. Pilotin.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoena and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead call, including separate conference with B. Glackin, M. Pilotin, and D. Harvey.	0.80	11	490.00	\$ 392.00
05/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ben Shiftan re [REDACTED].	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case status.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
05/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with M. Pilotin re case status.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
05/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with M. Pilotin re [REDACTED].	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
05/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memoranda re [REDACTED].	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
05/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re search terms, document production, stipulations, and transactional data.	1.00	11	490.00	\$ 490.00
05/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re class certification.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
05/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Review memoranda re case status.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
05/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Toshiba letter re motion and pre-filing conference; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	9	490.00	\$ 98.00
05/29/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with co-leads.	0.80	11	675.00	\$ 540.00
05/29/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Attend co-lead conference call, prepare for same; research data issues.	1.20	10	515.00	\$ 618.00
05/29/15	JONES, KAREN	Planning strategy for next wave of document review; analysis of [REDACTED].	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
05/29/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
05/29/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with L. Chan regarding transition; review Sony search terms.	1.20	11	435.00	\$ 522.00
05/29/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding Japanese-language review.	0.20	7	435.00	\$ 87.00
05/29/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Follow up regarding LG Chem document production.	0.20	7	435.00	\$ 87.00
05/29/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in weekly call; internal team meeting regarding work management.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00
05/29/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review Toshiba search terms; telephone call with Shana Scarlet and Don Sawyer regarding search terms.	0.50	6	435.00	\$ 217.50
05/29/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision; coding form revision.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
05/29/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/29/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare index re privilege logs.	0.70	9	325.00	\$ 227.50
05/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare privilege logs for M. Pilotin review.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
05/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare witness documents for L. Chan review.	2.00	7	325.00	\$ 650.00
05/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize electronic case files.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
05/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege logs and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
05/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review redaction log and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
05/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Toshiba production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
05/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
05/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memoranda [REDACTED].	1.70	11	490.00	\$ 833.00
05/30/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
05/30/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
05/30/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' documents for relevance.	2.00	7	350.00	\$ 700.00
05/31/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memoranda re potential deponents.	5.60	11	490.00	\$ 2,744.00
05/31/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with K. Jones and H. Rim regarding document review plan.	0.30	7	435.00	\$ 130.50
05/31/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Follow up regarding [REDACTED].	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
05/31/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review NEC documents.	0.70	7	435.00	\$ 304.50
05/31/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review privilege log from Samsung; legal research on privilege in Korea.	0.60	7	435.00	\$ 261.00
05/31/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review Toshiba letter regarding pre-filing conference; review prior correspondence on issue.	0.20	8	435.00	\$ 87.00
06/01/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet and confer with Toshiba; review Toshiba correspondence.	1.50	6	675.00	\$ 1,012.50
06/01/15	JONES, KAREN	Planning strategy for next wave of document review; meetings with team; analysis of new Toshiba fraudulent concealment evidence and adding to memorandum.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
06/01/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
06/01/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with T. Lee regarding availability for document review; review documents.	0.20	7	435.00	\$ 87.00
06/01/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft letter to Court regarding Toshiba pre-filing letter; review previous correspondence; telephone call with co-counsel regarding letter.	1.10	8	435.00	\$ 478.50
06/01/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Meet and confer with Sony regarding search terms.	0.50	6	435.00	\$ 217.50
06/01/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Meet with H. Rim and K. Jones regarding document review workflow.	0.60	7	435.00	\$ 261.00
06/01/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer regarding Toshiba and Sean Collins documents.	1.10	6	435.00	\$ 478.50
06/01/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letter to Sanyo and Panasonic regarding data.	0.90	10	435.00	\$ 391.50
06/01/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review report from document reviewers regarding hard copy document review in New York.	0.20	7	435.00	\$ 87.00
06/01/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision; coding form revision; meeting with M. Pilotin/K. Jones; fraudulent concealment project.	7.30	11	260.00	\$ 1,898.00
06/01/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/01/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re status of overlay production.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence re summary judgment motions for M. Pilotin review.	1.50	9	325.00	\$ 487.50
06/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	11	325.00	\$ 162.50
06/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Plaintiff's production and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From 06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To 02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading for co-counsel.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/02/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft, review and revise letter to Court responding to Toshiba pre-filing letter; review/revise discovery meet and confer letter.	2.70	8	675.00	\$ 1,822.50
06/02/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Pay invoices.	0.10	11	675.00	\$ 67.50
06/02/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Respond to email re Toshiba.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
06/02/15	JONES, KAREN	Planning strategy for next wave of document review; analysis of new Toshiba fraudulent concealment evidence; review of G. Stuart's additions to memorandum and analysis of Japanese documents.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
06/02/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
06/02/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding Toshiba search terms; review proposed search terms.	1.30	6	435.00	\$ 565.50
06/02/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft letter to court regarding Toshiba motion for summary judgment; telephone calls with B. Glackin regarding the same.	2.80	8	435.00	\$ 1,218.00
06/02/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft meet and confer letter to Toshiba; correspondence with B. Glackin regarding the same.	1.10	6	435.00	\$ 478.50
06/02/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letters to Panasonic and Sanyo regarding transactional data; correspondence with co-counsel regarding the same.	0.40	10	435.00	\$ 174.00
06/02/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review letter to NEC Tokin regarding data; correspondence with co-counsel regarding the same.	0.40	10	435.00	\$ 174.00
06/02/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with co-counsel regarding NEC and NEC Tokin production.	0.30	6	435.00	\$ 130.50
06/02/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Phil Johnson regarding data.	0.20	10	435.00	\$ 87.00
06/02/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Steven Sklaver regarding document reviewers; correspondence with B. Glackin regarding the same; correspondence with Ronnie Spiegel regarding the same.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
06/02/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revisions.	4.30	6	260.00	\$ 1,118.00
06/02/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/02/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
06/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	8	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review NEC production and prepare for loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re NEC production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re productions loaded to Catalyst.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
06/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re TFT-LCD defendant families for M. Pilotin.	0.10	11	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Toshiba production and prepare for loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/03/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with co-lead counsel; revise to response to Toshiba motion for summary judgment; draft letters on subpoena issue; office conference with M. Pilotin; review draft email to Toshiba.	3.00	11	675.00	\$ 2,025.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/03/15	JONES, KAREN	Meeting with team to plan document review and responses to motions; analysis of fraudulent concealment evidence; editing memorandum re same.	4.00	11	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
06/03/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
06/03/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence and telephone call with Ronnie Spiegel regarding document review process.	1.00	11	435.00	\$ 435.00
06/03/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with Steven Sklaver and David Young regarding document reviewers.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
06/03/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Follow up with co-counsel and counsel for direct purchasers regarding Toshiba search terms.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
06/03/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in telephone call with co-counsel regarding opposing counsel's letter concerning plaintiffs' document production and discovery responses.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
06/03/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for weekly call, draft task list; participate in weekly call.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00
06/03/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letter to court regarding pre-filing conference on Toshiba's motion for summary judgment;	1.60	8	435.00	\$ 696.00
06/03/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise meet and confer letter to Toshiba; send meet and confer letter to Toshiba.	0.20	6	435.00	\$ 87.00
06/03/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review information for potential class representatives.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
06/03/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Weekly meeting with document review managers.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
06/03/15	RIM, HISUN	Meeting with M. Pilotin and K .Jones; coding form revision.	8.00	11	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
06/03/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/03/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail counsel re status of production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery responses for M. Pilotin review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare search term protocol for M. Pilotin review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	11	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	1.00	11	325.00	\$ 325.00
06/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re service of subpoena.	0.20	11	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Panasonic production and prepare for loading.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
06/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoena and save to file.	0.10	11	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/04/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with M. Pilotin re deposition planning.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
06/04/15	JONES, KAREN	Call with co-leads to plan document review; analysis of fraudulent concealment evidence; editing memorandum re same.	6.00	11	515.00	\$ 3,090.00
06/04/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
06/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with co-counsel regarding document productions.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
06/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with co-counsel regarding document review process; participate in weekly document review telephone call; correspondence with B. Glackin regarding document review workflow; telephone call with T. Lee regarding document review.	2.10	11	435.00	\$ 913.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with steering committee firms regarding document review.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
06/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft letter regarding potential class representatives.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
06/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer regarding plaintiffs' documents production.	1.00	6	435.00	\$ 435.00
06/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer with opposing counsel regarding indirect purchaser plaintiffs' subpoena.	0.50	6	435.00	\$ 217.50
06/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer with Sony regarding data questionnaire for mediation; draft follow up letter regarding the same.	0.90	12	435.00	\$ 391.50
06/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Respond to correspondence of co-counsel regarding potential document custodians for Toshiba.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
06/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise co-counsel's letter to Sanyo regarding answers to data questions.	0.40	10	435.00	\$ 174.00
06/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review documents for potential LG deponents.	0.30	7	435.00	\$ 130.50
06/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review letters from opposing counsel responding to data questions from experts; correspondence with B. Troxel regarding same.	0.10	10	435.00	\$ 43.50
06/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review memo on LG employee Donny Lee; correspondence with co-counsel regarding the same.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
06/04/15	RIM, HISUN	Document review management meeting; TSB MSJ review; coding form revision; review of folder 2014 documents.	8.00	11	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
06/04/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/04/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	7.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,450.00
06/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re production loading.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
06/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re letter to Court.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
06/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production correspondence for co-counsel review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re privilege log correspondence for M. Pilotin review.	2.30	9	325.00	\$ 747.50
06/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare subpoena for mail service.	1.00	2	325.00	\$ 325.00
06/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	11	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	11	325.00	\$ 162.50
06/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Sanyo production and prepare for loading to the database.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
06/05/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Steve Williams re [REDACTED]	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
06/05/15	JONES, KAREN	Plan coding for next document review; meetings with team; analysis of [REDACTED]; editing memo re same.	6.00	11	515.00	\$ 3,090.00
06/05/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
06/05/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with H. Rim and K. Jones regarding document review project.	0.90	11	435.00	\$ 391.50
06/05/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding [REDACTED].	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
06/05/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review [REDACTED]; confer with [REDACTED] regarding the same.	0.70	10	435.00	\$ 304.50
06/05/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review deponent memoranda.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/05/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review status of production for custodians.	0.90	11	435.00	\$ 391.50
06/05/15	RIM, HISUN	Call meeting with Ronnie Spiegel at HBSS; coding form revision.	8.00	11	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
06/05/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/05/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/08/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Decrypt files and copy to a thumb drive.	1.10	7	340.00	\$ 374.00
06/08/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum to Jeff Friedman and Steve Williams [REDACTED].	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
06/08/15	JONES, KAREN	Plan coding for next document review; analysis of [REDACTED]; editing memorandum re same.	5.00	11	515.00	\$ 2,575.00
06/08/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
06/08/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue reviewing/analyzing hot documents relating to Steve Jaska (Sony) and drafting background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/08/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding Toshiba search terms.	0.20	6	435.00	\$ 87.00
06/08/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with expert regarding [REDACTED]; correspondence with co-counsel regarding expert [REDACTED].	0.40	10	435.00	\$ 174.00
06/08/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	8.00	11	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
06/08/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/08/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
06/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare NEC productions for loading by Catalyst.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
06/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading for attorney review.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar re pending deadlines.	0.10	11	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
06/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re data correspondence for M. Pilotin.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoena and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/09/15	JONES, KAREN	Plan coding for next document review; [REDACTED]; editing memo re same.	4.00	11	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
06/09/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
06/09/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue reviewing/analyzing hot documents relating to Steve Jaska (Sony) and drafting background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/09/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in meet and confer call with LG Chem; review and revise search terms.	0.80	6	435.00	\$ 348.00
06/09/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise correspondence to opposing counsel regarding transactional data; confer with B. Troxel regarding logging transactional data.	0.40	10	435.00	\$ 174.00
06/09/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	8.00	6	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
06/09/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/09/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare data correspondence for M. Pilotin review.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare log of data correspondence for M. Pilotin.	1.60	7	325.00	\$ 520.00
06/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.90	9	325.00	\$ 292.50
06/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re data correspondence for M. Pilotin.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise task list for weekly call; circulate.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
06/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Weekly team call.	0.60	11	675.00	\$ 405.00
06/10/15	JONES, KAREN	Searches and re-coding of cost letters and fraudulent concealment evidence; editing memo re fraudulent concealment evidence.	6.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,090.00
06/10/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
06/10/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue reviewing/analyzing hot documents relating to Steve Jaska (Sony) and drafting background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/10/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in weekly co-lead counsel planning call.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
06/10/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with co-counsel regarding LG deponents and document review project.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
06/10/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	7.30	6	260.00	\$ 1,898.00
06/10/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/10/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	6.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,100.00
06/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Case Map contract and save to file.	0.10	11	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/11/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
06/11/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assistance with migration of database to vendor.	1.00	7	340.00	\$ 340.00
06/11/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with Sony re data questions, draft letter re same, correspond with Econ One re same.	0.70	10	515.00	\$ 360.50
06/11/15	JONES, KAREN	Planning next wave of document review; editing cheat sheet and manual; call with co-lead firms and meetings with team.	7.00	11	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
06/11/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
06/11/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue reviewing/analyzing hot documents relating to [REDACTED] and drafting background memorandum.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/11/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with D. Harvey [REDACTED].	0.10	12	435.00	\$ 43.50
06/11/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with [REDACTED].	0.20	10	435.00	\$ 87.00
06/11/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Meeting with K. Jones and H. Rim regarding document review.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
06/11/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in weekly document review manager telephone call.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00
06/11/15	RIM, HISUN	LiB document review management meeting (M. Pilotin/K. Jones); create assignment folders; revise manual/cheatsheet guide.	8.00	11	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
06/11/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	3.30	7	350.00	\$ 1,155.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/11/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	8	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re certified translations for M. Pilotin.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
06/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare witness documents for M. Pilotin review.	0.60	11	325.00	\$ 195.00
06/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	11	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review certified translations and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/12/15	DUGAR, KIRTI	Follow up on set up of CaseMap Shared database with vendor Omega; follow up with A. Grant on transfer of documents and existing coding.	1.00	7	430.00	\$ 430.00
06/12/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with Steve Williams [REDACTED].	0.20	12	725.00	\$ 145.00
06/12/15	JONES, KAREN	Planning next wave of document review; reviewing new cheat sheet and manual; review of Toshiba MSJ evidence; planning next wave of deposition review.	5.00	11	515.00	\$ 2,575.00
06/12/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
06/12/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue reviewing/analyzing hot documents relating to Steve Jaska (Sony) and drafting background memorandum.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/12/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review search terms; telephone call with counsel for direct purchasers regarding search terms.	0.90	11	435.00	\$ 391.50
06/12/15	RIM, HISUN	Revise manual/cheatsheet guide; coding form revision; search term revision.	8.00	11	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
06/12/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	6.30	7	350.00	\$ 2,205.00
06/12/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
06/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar re response deadlines.	0.30	11	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.40	11	325.00	\$ 130.00
06/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
06/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re status of data correspondence for M. Pilotin.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
06/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review LG production and prepare for loading to the database.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoena and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Toshiba productions and prepare for loading.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
06/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/13/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	2.00	7	350.00	\$ 700.00
06/14/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letter to Sanyo regarding responses to expert questions.	0.60	10	435.00	\$ 261.00
06/15/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assistance with migration of database. Duplication of database.	1.00	7	340.00	\$ 340.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/15/15	JONES, KAREN	Updating Key Terms List for next wave of document review; review of evidence on Toshiba custodians for depositions; searching for Eguchi evidence for deposition.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
06/15/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
06/15/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue reviewing/analyzing documents relating to Steve Jaska (Sony) and drafting background memo.	8.00	11	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC		0.80	12	435.00	\$ 348.00
06/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Follow up correspondence regarding document review and document productions.	0.20	6	435.00	\$ 87.00
06/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer with Panasonic and Sanyo regarding search terms; review Toshiba search terms and correspondence regarding the same.	2.10	6	435.00	\$ 913.50
06/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letters to Panasonic and Sanyo regarding data questions.	0.50	10	435.00	\$ 217.50
06/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone with co-counsel and counsel for direct purchaser plaintiffs' regarding LG Chem deponents.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
06/15/15	RIM, HISUN	Draft discovery requests; search term revision.	4.00	6	260.00	\$ 1,040.00
06/15/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba review; new review prep; call meeting with Ronnie Spiegel (HBSS)/K. Jones.	4.00	11	260.00	\$ 1,040.00
06/15/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence for M. Pilotin review.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare overlay files for loading by Catalyst.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Toshiba production for loading by Catalyst.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit data correspondence log.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
06/16/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Training with new database.	1.00	7	340.00	\$ 340.00
06/16/15	JONES, KAREN	Batteries: Toshiba depo prep (Eguchi).	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
06/16/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
06/16/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue reviewing/analyzing documents relating to Steve Jaska (Sony) and drafting background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Check in with document reviewers; review resumes.	1.40	11	435.00	\$ 609.00
06/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding discovery requests.	0.20	3	435.00	\$ 87.00
06/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with B. Glackin regarding LG deponents.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
06/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise privilege letter regarding ongoing meet and confer to Panasonic and Sanyo.	1.10	6	435.00	\$ 478.50
06/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise Toshiba search terms.	0.60	6	435.00	\$ 261.00
06/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review search terms for Panasonic and Sanyo, prepare for meet and confer; participate in meet and confer regarding search terms.	1.50	6	435.00	\$ 652.50
06/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Ronnie Spiegel regarding document review.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
06/16/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision; meet/confer on Pana/Sanyo search terms.	11.30	6	260.00	\$ 2,938.00
06/16/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	5.00	7	350.00	\$ 1,750.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence for M. Pilotin review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery responses for M. Pilotin review.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re NEC production loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	3	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re Toshiba discovery requests for M. Pilotin.	0.60	3	325.00	\$ 195.00
06/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Toshiba productions and prepare for loading.	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00
06/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Toshiba transactional data file and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/17/15	JONES, KAREN	Toshiba deposition preparation (Eguchi); training call and meetings with team.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
06/17/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
06/17/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue reviewing/analyzing hot documents relating to Steve Jaska (Sony) and drafting background memo.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Meet and confer with NEC regarding search terms.	1.20	6	435.00	\$ 522.00
06/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Meet with K. Jones and H. Rim regarding document review projects.	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
06/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare responses to Toshiba's discovery requests; telephone call with counsel for direct purchaser plaintiffs regarding the same.	2.60	3	435.00	\$ 1,131.00
06/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and answer questions regarding document review.	0.20	7	435.00	\$ 87.00
06/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise search terms.	0.60	6	435.00	\$ 261.00
06/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Teleconference with document reviewers.	1.00	7	435.00	\$ 435.00
06/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Jonathan Cuneo regarding document review.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
06/17/15	RIM, HISUN	Creating assignment folders for merits review; meeting M. Pilotin/K. Jones; reviewer Catalyst training.	3.50	7	260.00	\$ 910.00
06/17/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	4.50	11	325.00	\$ 1,462.50
06/17/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	5.00	7	350.00	\$ 1,750.00
06/17/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare complaint for M. Pilotin review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery responses for M. Pilotin review.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re custodial files for H. Rim.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar re deposition.	0.10	11	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar re discovery responses.	0.10	11	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery requests and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re discovery responses for M. Pilotin.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoena and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on
Timekeeper: all

From 06/01/13
To 02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Toshiba production and prepare for loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production document and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/18/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with M. Pilotin re case issues.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
06/18/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Organizational call with Ed Leamer and Phil Johnson.	0.60	10	675.00	\$ 405.00
06/18/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise responses to Request for Admissions.	0.60	3	675.00	\$ 405.00
06/18/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise responses to Requests for Admissions and Requests for Productions.	1.30	3	675.00	\$ 877.50
06/18/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with experts re data issues.	0.50	10	515.00	\$ 257.50
06/18/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	6.00	7	450.00	\$ 2,700.00
06/18/15	NEWMAN, ELIZABETH	Continue reviewing/analyzing hot documents relating to Steve Jaska (Sony) and drafting background memo.	5.30	7	350.00	\$ 1,855.00
06/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with B. Glackin regarding case assignments.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
06/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with B. Glackin regarding deponents.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
06/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence and telephone calls regarding document review staffing.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
06/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise discovery responses; telephone call with direct purchaser plaintiffs' counsel regarding the same.	0.90	3	435.00	\$ 391.50
06/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise search terms.	1.40	11	435.00	\$ 609.00
06/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review custodian memos.	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
06/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with co-leads regarding expert work.	0.50	10	435.00	\$ 217.50
06/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with vendor regarding CaseMap contract; correspondence regarding the same.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
06/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Weekly document reviewer telephone call.	1.00	11	435.00	\$ 435.00
06/18/15	RIM, HISUN	Library document review management meeting; Toshiba review.	8.00	11	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
06/18/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	3.00	7	350.00	\$ 1,050.00
06/18/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re loading of defense productions by Catalyst.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
06/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Toshiba files for loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare witness documents for M. Pilotin review.	0.70	7	325.00	\$ 227.50
06/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review case calendar re pending deposition dates.	0.10	11	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/19/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Assistance with duplicating media.	1.80	11	340.00	\$ 612.00
06/19/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with Gerard Stranch re Tennessee plaintiffs.	0.20	11	725.00	\$ 145.00
06/19/15	JONES, KAREN	Searching for best documents for Toshiba depositions.	4.00	11	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
06/19/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	6.00	7	450.00	\$ 2,700.00
06/19/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with co-counsel regarding class representatives.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
06/19/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with Phil Johnson regarding Sanyo data.	0.20	10	435.00	\$ 87.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on
Timekeeper: all

From 06/01/13
To 02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/19/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Final review of letter to Panasonic and Sanyo regarding privilege logs.	0.10	6	435.00	\$ 43.50
06/19/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	8.00	11	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
06/19/15	SAUNDERS, CAMERON	Review and code defendants' documents for relevance.	3.00	7	350.00	\$ 1,050.00
06/19/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
06/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Hitachi production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
06/20/15	JONES, KAREN	Searching for best documents for Toshiba depositions.	4.00	11	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
06/21/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	4.00	7	450.00	\$ 1,800.00
06/22/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with M. Pilotin re discovery responses, depositions, etc.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
06/22/15	JONES, KAREN	Calls with team re searching for best documents for Toshiba depositions; review/training of new Japanese-language coders and coding call.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
06/22/15	JONES, KAREN	Searching for best documents for Toshiba depositions; review/training of new Japanese-language coders.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
06/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding CaseMap database.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
06/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding document review; correspondence with co-lead counsel team regarding potential LG deponents.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
06/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding Toshiba discovery responses; telephone call with counsel for direct purchasers regarding the same.	0.60	3	435.00	\$ 261.00
06/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with Aaron Sheanin regarding data questionnaires; correspondence with experts regarding data questionnaires.	0.30	10	435.00	\$ 130.50
06/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review progress regarding search terms.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
06/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with direct purchaser plaintiffs regarding Samsung privilege logs.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
06/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Ronnie Spiegel regarding document review; confer with B. Glackin regarding document review staffing and projects.	0.50	7	435.00	\$ 217.50
06/22/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba review; managing review.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
06/22/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' documents for relevance.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize production files.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/23/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise Toshiba discovery responses.	0.30	3	675.00	\$ 202.50
06/23/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise letter to Craig Seebald.	0.80	11	675.00	\$ 540.00
06/23/15	JONES, KAREN	Calls with team re searching for best documents for Toshiba depositions; review/training of new Japanese-language coders and coding call.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
06/23/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
06/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with team regarding document review; contact potential candidate for contract attorney position.	0.20	7	435.00	\$ 87.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Document review; confer with G. Stuart regarding findings.	0.60	7	435.00	\$ 261.00
06/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer with Samsung regarding privilege log; follow up telephone call with co-counsel regarding the same.	0.90	6	435.00	\$ 391.50
06/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in weekly document reviewer call.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
06/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letter regarding document reviewer.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
06/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise search terms.	2.20	6	435.00	\$ 957.00
06/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise Toshiba discovery responses.	0.40	3	435.00	\$ 174.00
06/23/15	RIM, HISUN	Managing review; review QC; call meeting for Toshiba review.	3.00	7	260.00	\$ 780.00
06/23/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	6.00	11	325.00	\$ 1,950.00
06/23/15	STUART, GREGORY	Meet with M. Pilotin regarding document database search tasks.	0.30	11	350.00	\$ 105.00
06/23/15	STUART, GREGORY	Participate in weekly document review team conference call.	0.50	11	350.00	\$ 175.00
06/23/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' catalogs, part decorders, and product cross-reference guides.	7.30	7	350.00	\$ 2,555.00
06/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence for service.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare documentreviewer correspondence for B. Glackin review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
06/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review LG Chem production and prepare for loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re battery characteristics for Econ One.	0.50	10	325.00	\$ 162.50
06/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re missing bates numbers for co-counsel.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
06/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoenas and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/24/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read discovery letters.	0.40	9	725.00	\$ 290.00
06/24/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Weekly team call.	0.70	11	675.00	\$ 472.50
06/24/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Download of documents.	2.00	7	340.00	\$ 680.00
06/24/15	JONES, KAREN	Meeting with Lieff, Cabraser team; QC and training of new Japanese-language coders.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
06/24/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	6.00	7	450.00	\$ 2,700.00
06/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding scheduling meet and confer regarding data questions.	0.10	10	435.00	\$ 43.50
06/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with potential document reviewer.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
06/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Document review meeting with K. Jones and H. Rim.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
06/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft weekly task list and prepare for weekly telephone call.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
06/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in weekly call with co-lead counsel.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00
06/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise search terms; correspondence regarding search terms.	2.70	6	435.00	\$ 1,174.50
06/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise Toshiba discovery responses.	0.30	3	435.00	\$ 130.50
06/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review direct purchaser plaintiffs' draft letter to Sony regarding discovery.	0.20	6	435.00	\$ 87.00
06/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Revise letter regarding privilege log.	0.20	6	435.00	\$ 87.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/24/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision; LGC search term meet and confer.	5.00	6	260.00	\$ 1,300.00
06/24/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba deposition preparation; Quality control/training reviewers.	1.00	7	260.00	\$ 260.00
06/24/15	RIM, HISUN	Weekly document review check-in with LCHB team.	2.00	11	260.00	\$ 520.00
06/24/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' catalogs, part decorders, and product cross-reference guides.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare documents re battery specifications for Econ One review.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
06/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review NEC production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
06/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Plaintiffs' productions and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re Toshiba custodial files for M. Pilotin.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
06/25/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs' discovery responses to Toshiba.	0.30	9	725.00	\$ 217.50
06/25/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with direct purchasers re depositions; office conference with M. Pilotin re same.	1.00	11	675.00	\$ 675.00
06/25/15	JONES, KAREN	Call with Co-Lead counsel; training of new Japanese-language coders; research on Eguchi for Toshiba depositions.	4.00	11	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
06/25/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
06/25/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding search terms; review and revise search terms; participate in meet and confer regarding the same.	2.30	6	435.00	\$ 1,000.50
06/25/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with various vendors regarding deposition reporting services.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
06/25/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Follow up regarding document review.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
06/25/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Aaron Sheanin regarding data letters; draft letter regarding the same.	0.90	10	435.00	\$ 391.50
06/25/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with direct purchaser plaintiffs regarding depositions.	1.20	11	435.00	\$ 522.00
06/25/15	RIM, HISUN	Managing document review; Quality control/training reviewers.	3.00	7	260.00	\$ 780.00
06/25/15	RIM, HISUN	NEC search term meet and confer; LCHB search term meeting re same.	4.00	6	325.00	\$ 1,300.00
06/25/15	RIM, HISUN	Review manager weekly call with co-leads.	1.00	11	260.00	\$ 260.00
06/25/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' catalogs, part decorders, and product cross-reference guides.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re status of production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare contact information re court reporters for M. Pilotin.	0.20	11	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery responses for service.	1.00	3	325.00	\$ 325.00
06/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare documents re battery specifications for Econ One review.	1.00	10	325.00	\$ 325.00
06/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Hitachi files for Econ One review.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Samsung production for loading.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
06/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Revise proof of service.	0.30	8	325.00	\$ 97.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/26/15	JONES, KAREN	Advanced search term training; training of new Japanese-language coders; research on Eguchi for Toshiba depositions.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
06/26/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
06/26/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise search strings.	1.20	11	435.00	\$ 522.00
06/26/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and send data letters.	1.00	10	435.00	\$ 435.00
06/26/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with potential deposition vendor.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
06/26/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Sony regarding data questions; draft letter regarding data questions.	1.50	12	435.00	\$ 652.50
06/26/15	RIM, HISUN	Deponent selection preparation.	1.00	11	260.00	\$ 260.00
06/26/15	RIM, HISUN	Managing document review; quality control/training reviewers; Toshiba deposition preparation; Catalyst search training.	7.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,275.00
06/26/15	STUART, GREGORY	Participate in Catalyst advanced search training conference call.	1.30	7	350.00	\$ 455.00
06/26/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' catalogs, part decorders, and product cross-reference guides.	6.80	7	350.00	\$ 2,380.00
06/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re status of field mapping.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review certified translations and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/27/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	5.00	7	450.00	\$ 2,250.00
06/28/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	5.00	7	450.00	\$ 2,250.00
06/29/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review memorandums re prospective deponents.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
06/29/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with co-counsel re deponent selection.	1.00	11	675.00	\$ 675.00
06/29/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with co-counsel re workflow.	1.40	11	675.00	\$ 945.00
06/29/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jeff Friedman and Demetrius Lambrinos re [REDACTED] telephone conference with [REDACTED]; correspondence to [REDACTED]; correspondence to [REDACTED].	1.00	11	675.00	\$ 675.00
06/29/15	JONES, KAREN	Analysis of documents coded to date to prioritize Japanese depositions; call with team re same.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
06/29/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
06/29/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition target selection meeting.	7.00	11	260.00	\$ 1,820.00
06/29/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	0.10	11	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/29/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba deposition preparation.	0.90	7	260.00	\$ 234.00
06/29/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' catalogs, part decorders, and product cross-reference guides.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
06/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
06/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit log of data correspondence.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
06/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review data correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
06/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review LG Chem production and prepare for loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review redaction logs and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Toshiba production and prepare for loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/30/15	FASTIFF, ERIC		0.30	12	725.00	\$ 217.50
06/30/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	Read Ward v. Apple re necessary parties.	0.80	9	725.00	\$ 580.00
06/30/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN		0.60	12	675.00	\$ 405.00
06/30/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Ronnie Spiegel memorandums re workflow and document review.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
06/30/15	JONES, KAREN	Research on Eguchi for Toshiba depositions; working on depo prep plan with team.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
06/30/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba documents (including custodial documents for Iwasaki, Koide, Eguchi, Hirayama, and Tatsukawa).	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
06/30/15	RIM, HISUN	Managing document review; Toshiba deposition preparation.	4.50	7	260.00	\$ 1,170.00
06/30/15	RIM, HISUN	Sony search term meet and confer.	2.00	6	260.00	\$ 520.00
06/30/15	RIM, HISUN	Weekly document review call.	1.50	11	260.00	\$ 390.00
06/30/15	STUART, GREGORY	Participate in weekly document review team conference call.	0.30	11	350.00	\$ 105.00
06/30/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' catalogs, part decoders, and product cross-reference guides.	7.70	7	350.00	\$ 2,695.00
06/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
06/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
06/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review production and prepare for loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
07/01/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey re Toshiba.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
07/01/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with K. Jones and H. Rim re document review; follow up memorandums to Ronnie Spiegel.	1.20	11	675.00	\$ 810.00
07/01/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Toshiba papers.	0.30	9	675.00	\$ 202.50
07/01/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Weekly team call; telephone conference with Demetrius Lambrinos.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
07/01/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assistance with troubleshooting of casemap database. Attention to transition of casemap database.	0.50	7	340.00	\$ 170.00
07/01/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with B. Glackin re Toshiba summary judgment issues, review briefs and supporting materials re same.	1.30	11	515.00	\$ 669.50
07/01/15	JONES, KAREN	Research on Eguchi for Toshiba depositions; review of Toshiba MSJ pleadings; working on depo prep plan with team; meetings with team re inputting evidence into CaseMap.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
07/01/15	LEE, TRACY	Document review.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
07/01/15	RIM, HISUN	LCHB document review strategy meeting.	5.00	11	260.00	\$ 1,300.00
07/01/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	1.00	11	325.00	\$ 325.00
07/01/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba deposition preparation; Managing document review.	2.00	7	260.00	\$ 520.00
07/01/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' catalogs, part decoders, and product cross-reference guides.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
07/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
07/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare filings re Toshiba summary judgment for D. Harvey review.	1.20	9	325.00	\$ 390.00
07/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
07/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Toshiba filing for K. Jones review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
07/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare translated production documents for attorney review.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
07/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production index.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
07/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
07/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
07/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize files re translated production documents.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
07/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	1.00	9	325.00	\$ 325.00
07/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review filings re Toshiba motion for summary judgment and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
07/02/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet and confer with Toshiba.	0.50	6	675.00	\$ 337.50
07/02/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Direct Purchasers re deposition planning.	0.60	11	675.00	\$ 405.00
07/02/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Ed Leamer and Phil Johnson.	0.90	11	675.00	\$ 607.50
07/02/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Ronnie Spiegel.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
07/02/15	JONES, KAREN	Preparation of document selections for Eguchi deposition; review of Toshiba MSJ pleadings; call with co-lead team re document review and depositions.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
07/02/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba's unnamed custodial file.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
07/02/15	RIM, HISUN	Review manager weekly call with co-leads.	1.00	11	260.00	\$ 260.00
07/02/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba deposition preparation; Quality check/training reviewers.	5.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,300.00
07/02/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba search term meet and confer; Search term revision.	2.00	6	260.00	\$ 520.00
07/02/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' catalogs, part decoders, and product cross-reference guides.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
07/05/15	JONES, KAREN	Research on Eguchi for Toshiba depositions.	11.00	11	515.00	\$ 5,665.00
07/06/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Toshiba Motion for Summary Judgment; review CaseMap database to prepare for Sony mediation; review Sony mediation statement.	1.90	9	675.00	\$ 1,282.50
07/06/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Toshiba search terms.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
07/06/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assistance with troubleshooting of database.	1.00	7	340.00	\$ 340.00
07/06/15	JONES, KAREN	Research on Eguchi for Toshiba depositions.	11.00	11	515.00	\$ 5,665.00
07/06/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba's unnamed custodial file.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
07/06/15	RIM, HISUN	Managing document review; training reviewers; creating folders for batch assignments; toshiba deposition preparation.	7.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,275.00
07/06/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	1.00	11	325.00	\$ 325.00
07/06/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' catalogs, part decoders, and product cross-reference guides.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
07/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare documents cited in the complaint for expert review.	0.70	10	325.00	\$ 227.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	8	325.00	\$ 65.00
07/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
07/07/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	[REDACTED]	1.50	12	725.00	\$ 1,087.50
07/07/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Co-lead counsel call.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
07/07/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review database re Toshiba facts/evidence.	2.60	11	675.00	\$ 1,755.00
07/07/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review expert stipulation; memorandum re same.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
07/07/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	[REDACTED]	0.30	12	675.00	\$ 202.50
07/07/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise Toshiba 30(b)(6) deposition notice.	0.80	2	675.00	\$ 540.00
07/07/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Attend weekly call, prepare for same, conference with B. Glackin re same.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
07/07/15	JONES, KAREN	Research on Eguchi for Toshiba depositions; call with coding team; meetings with LCHB team.	11.00	11	515.00	\$ 5,665.00
07/07/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba's unnamed custodial file.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
07/07/15	RIM, HISUN	HML meet and confer; search term revision.	2.00	6	325.00	\$ 650.00
07/07/15	RIM, HISUN	Training reviewers; creating folders for batch assignments; creating hot doc samples for reviewers; Toshiba deposition preparation.	5.00	7	325.00	\$ 1,625.00
07/07/15	RIM, HISUN	Weekly document review call with reviewers.	1.00	11	260.00	\$ 260.00
07/07/15	STUART, GREGORY	Participate in weekly document review team conference call.	0.50	11	350.00	\$ 175.00
07/07/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' catalogs, part decoders, and product cross-reference guides.	7.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,450.00
07/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
07/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare mediation statements for E. Fastiff review.	0.20	12	325.00	\$ 65.00
07/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
07/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and prepare status re production loading.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
07/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review certified translations and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
07/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
07/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading.	1.30	7	325.00	\$ 422.50
07/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review mediation statements and save to file.	0.20	12	325.00	\$ 65.00
07/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone call from potential class member re case status.	0.10	11	325.00	\$ 32.50
07/08/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	[REDACTED]	9.50	12	725.00	\$ 6,887.50
07/08/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	[REDACTED]	9.00	12	675.00	\$ 6,075.00
07/08/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Attention to duplication of electronic discovery materials.	1.00	7	340.00	\$ 340.00
07/08/15	JONES, KAREN	Research on Eguchi documents for Toshiba depositions.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
07/08/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Toshiba's unnamed custodial file.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
07/08/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	0.10	6	260.00	\$ 26.00
07/08/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba deposition preparation.	2.20	7	260.00	\$ 572.00
07/08/15	RIM, HISUN	Training reviewers.	1.00	11	260.00	\$ 260.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/08/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' catalogs, part decorders, and product cross-reference guides.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
07/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading.	0.70	7	325.00	\$ 227.50
07/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading.	1.20	7	325.00	\$ 390.00
07/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare orders for B. Glackin review.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
07/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production log for co-counsel review.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
07/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
07/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review product specification documents and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
07/09/15	JONES, KAREN	Research on Eguchi documents for Toshiba depositions; call with co-leads re document review.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
07/09/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Tachihara (Sanyo) documents and Toshiba documents.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
07/09/15	RIM, HISUN	Review manager weekly call with co-leads; Toshiba deponent selection.	1.50	11	260.00	\$ 390.00
07/09/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba deposition preparation; training reviewers.	3.30	7	325.00	\$ 1,072.50
07/10/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with Steve Williams, Steve Berman and Jeff Friedman re [REDACTED].	0.20	12	725.00	\$ 145.00
07/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review proposed expert stipulation email with Aaron Sheanin.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
07/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin re deposition.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
07/10/15	JONES, KAREN	Research on Eguchi documents for Toshiba depositions; drafting memorandum re same.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
07/10/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Tachihara (Sanyo) documents and Toshiba documents.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
07/10/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba deposition preparation.	6.30	7	260.00	\$ 1,638.00
07/10/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' catalogs, part decorders, and product cross-reference guides.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
07/12/15	JONES, KAREN	Research on Eguchi documents for Toshiba depositions; drafting memorandum re same.	2.00	11	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
07/12/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Maintenance of CaseMap database.	0.20	7	435.00	\$ 87.00
07/12/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba deposition preparation.	5.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,300.00
07/13/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	Email and telephone conference with Steve Williams re [REDACTED].	0.20	12	725.00	\$ 145.00
07/13/15	JONES, KAREN	Research on Eguchi documents for Toshiba depositions; drafting memorandum re same.	5.00	11	515.00	\$ 2,575.00
07/13/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Tachihara (Sanyo) documents and Toshiba documents.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
07/13/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Document review.	0.10	7	435.00	\$ 43.50
07/13/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer call with LG Chem.	0.50	6	435.00	\$ 217.50
07/13/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review summary judgment briefing.	0.60	9	435.00	\$ 261.00
07/13/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba deposition preparation; Training reviewers.	6.80	7	260.00	\$ 1,768.00
07/13/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' catalogs, part decorders, and product cross-reference guides.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
07/14/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Duplicate media such as hard drives and thumb drive.	2.00	11	340.00	\$ 680.00
07/14/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with defendants re expert stipulation; office conference with M. Pilotin re same; telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin re same; review expert stipulation.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
07/14/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jill Manning and Jessica Moy re Toshiba.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
07/14/15	JONES, KAREN	Research on Eguchi documents for Toshiba depositions; drafting memorandum re same.	6.00	11	515.00	\$ 3,090.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/14/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Tachihara (Sanyo) documents and Toshiba documents.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
07/14/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with B. Glackin regarding Toshiba depositions; telephone call with counsel for direct purchasers regarding the same.	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
07/14/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in meet and confer regarding expert stipulation.	0.70	6	435.00	\$ 304.50
07/14/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in meet and confer with Hitachi Maxell regarding search terms; telephone call with H. Rim regarding the same.	1.30	6	435.00	\$ 565.50
07/14/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision; batteries search term meet and confer with HML.	1.00	6	325.00	\$ 325.00
07/14/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba deposition preparation; training reviewers.	6.00	7	325.00	\$ 1,950.00
07/14/15	RIM, HISUN	Weekly document review call with reviewers.	1.00	11	260.00	\$ 260.00
07/14/15	STUART, GREGORY	Participate in weekly document review team conference call.	0.40	11	350.00	\$ 140.00
07/14/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' catalogs, part decoders, and product cross-reference guides.	7.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,450.00
07/14/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Toshiba motion for summary judgment and supporting declarations.	0.60	9	350.00	\$ 210.00
07/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading issues.	1.30	7	325.00	\$ 422.50
07/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re transactional data productions for M. Pilotin.	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00
07/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare summary judgment filings for M. Pilotin review.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
07/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.70	9	325.00	\$ 227.50
07/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading.	2.00	7	325.00	\$ 650.00
07/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
07/15/15	BERNSTEIN, WILLIAM	Conference with B. Glackin [REDACTED].	0.20	12	975.00	\$ 195.00
07/15/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with E. Fastiff [REDACTED].	0.20	12	675.00	\$ 135.00
07/15/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with W. Bernstein [REDACTED].	0.20	12	675.00	\$ 135.00
07/15/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call re weekly task list.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
07/15/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Steve Williams and Jeff Friedman [REDACTED].	0.20	12	675.00	\$ 135.00
07/15/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Analysis of memory usage for electronic discovery database.	1.00	7	340.00	\$ 340.00
07/15/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with co-lead counsel re case management and discovery tasks; review expert data analysis and correspondence re same.	0.70	11	515.00	\$ 360.50
07/15/15	JONES, KAREN	Research on Eguchi documents for Toshiba depositions; drafting memorandum re same.	4.50	11	515.00	\$ 2,317.50
07/15/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Tachihara (Sanyo) documents and Toshiba documents.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
07/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with H. Rim regarding document review; confer with B. Glackin regarding Toshiba document review.	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
07/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with K. Dugar regarding CaseMap usage.	0.30	7	435.00	\$ 130.50
07/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with expert regarding request for product specifications; correspondence with expert regarding LG Chem capacity issues.	0.60	10	435.00	\$ 261.00
07/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in weekly telephone call with co-lead counsel.	1.00	11	435.00	\$ 435.00
07/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	[REDACTED]	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
07/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and analyze bids for deposition companies.	1.20	11	435.00	\$ 522.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letter to LG Chem regarding meet and confer.	0.20	6	435.00	\$ 87.00
07/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review correspondence from counsel for Panasonic and Sanyo regarding privilege logs; correspondence with counsel for direct purchaser plaintiffs regarding the same.	0.40	6	435.00	\$ 174.00
07/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review correspondence from Hitachi Maxell regarding search terms; correspondence with counsel for direct purchasers regarding the same.	0.40	6	435.00	\$ 174.00
07/15/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision; batteries search term meet and confer with HML.	0.10	11	325.00	\$ 32.50
07/15/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba deposition preparation; collecting key terms for reviewers.	7.90	7	325.00	\$ 2,567.50
07/15/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' catalogs, part decoders, and product cross-reference guides.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
07/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
07/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare complaint response for attorney review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
07/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
07/16/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	Edit Sony memorandum of understanding.	0.20	12	725.00	\$ 145.00
07/16/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum to Jessica Moy and Jill Manning re Toshiba depositions.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
07/16/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Tachihara (Sanyo) documents and Toshiba documents.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
07/16/15	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Check documents if they are supported types.	1.00	7	340.00	\$ 340.00
07/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding Toshiba declarant scheduling; compile log of discussions regarding scheduling deposition of Hiroshi Fukai; telephone call with Aaron Sheanin regarding the same; review and revise deposition notice.	1.30	11	435.00	\$ 565.50
07/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with co-counsel regarding document review; correspondence with team members regarding document review projects.	0.30	7	435.00	\$ 130.50
07/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in meet and confer with Hitachi Maxell regarding search terms.	0.90	6	435.00	\$ 391.50
07/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Respond to inquiries regarding case.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
07/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review comments from reviewers regarding Toshiba documents.	0.90	7	435.00	\$ 391.50
07/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Phil Johnson regarding product specification documents.	0.40	10	435.00	\$ 174.00
07/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Ronnie Spiegel regarding document review.	0.50	7	435.00	\$ 217.50
07/16/15	RIM, HISUN	Folding batches; Toshiba deposition follow up.	2.00	7	260.00	\$ 520.00
07/16/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision; search term meet and confer with HML.	6.00	6	325.00	\$ 1,950.00
07/16/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' catalogs, part decoders, and product cross-reference guides.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
07/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
07/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading by Catalyst.	2.00	7	325.00	\$ 650.00
07/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery responses for M. Pilotin review.	1.50	9	325.00	\$ 487.50
07/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading for counsel.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
07/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
07/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone inquiry re potential class member.	0.30	11	325.00	\$ 97.50
07/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Econ One work plan, budget.	0.30	10	675.00	\$ 202.50
07/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Expert Witness resume.	0.30	9	675.00	\$ 202.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin re deponent, letter.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
07/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Econ One.	0.50	10	675.00	\$ 337.50
07/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Ed Leamer.	0.80	10	675.00	\$ 540.00
07/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jeff Friedman and Steve Williams [REDACTED].	0.20	10	675.00	\$ 135.00
07/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jeff Friedman [REDACTED].	0.30	10	675.00	\$ 202.50
07/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with [REDACTED].	0.60	10	675.00	\$ 405.00
07/17/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference call with co-counsel and experts re initial data review and questions.	0.70	10	515.00	\$ 360.50
07/17/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with M. Pilotin re Toshiba depositions, research same.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
07/17/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Tachihara (Sanyo) documents and Toshiba documents.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
07/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Evaluate deposition bids; correspondence with B. Glackin and co-counsel regarding the same.	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
07/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review documents designated hot by document review team; document review for depositions; confer with D. Harvey regarding Toshiba deposition.	2.10	7	435.00	\$ 913.50
07/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with experts regarding damages work.	0.90	10	435.00	\$ 391.50
07/17/15	RIM, HISUN	Deponent selections.	6.00	11	260.00	\$ 1,560.00
07/17/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' catalogs, part decoders, and product cross-reference guides.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
07/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading by Catalyst.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
07/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery responses for M. Pilotin review.	2.50	9	325.00	\$ 812.50
07/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare draft complaint for M. Pilotin review.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
07/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re defense production loading errors.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
07/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	1.20	9	325.00	\$ 390.00
07/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
07/20/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft circular correspondence to Jeff Amato re expert stipulation; review draft 30(b)(6) notice; telephone conference with Demetrius Lambrinos re depositions.	0.90	11	675.00	\$ 607.50
07/20/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Demetrius Lambrinos re depositions; office conference with M. Pilotin re depositions; review C.V. of potential tech expert; memorandum re LG deponents.	2.10	11	675.00	\$ 1,417.50
07/20/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with [REDACTED].	0.20	10	675.00	\$ 135.00
07/20/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assistance with duplication of electronic discovery.	1.00	7	340.00	\$ 340.00
07/20/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with M. Pilotin re Toshiba depositions, review and research materials re same.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
07/20/15	JONES, KAREN	Research on new list of Japanese deponents for next deposition preparation projects; call with co-lead counsel.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
07/20/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Tachihara (Sanyo) documents and Toshiba documents.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
07/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding document review.	0.10	7	435.00	\$ 43.50
07/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding Toshiba depositions; correspondence regarding LG depositions; telephone call with counsel for direct purchaser plaintiffs regarding deposition scheduling; follow up correspondence with B. Glackin regarding depositions.	1.70	11	435.00	\$ 739.50
07/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with H. Rim regarding search terms; review proposed search terms from LGC.	0.10	6	435.00	\$ 43.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in weekly document reviewer telephone call; follow-up telephone call with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding depositions.	1.20	11	435.00	\$ 522.00
07/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letter to Sanyo regarding expert questions.	0.30	10	435.00	\$ 130.50
07/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review modified search terms from LGC; correspondence with opposing counsel re same.	0.40	6	435.00	\$ 174.00
07/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review Toshiba notices of deposition.	0.10	2	435.00	\$ 43.50
07/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for direct purchaser plaintiffs regarding depositions and check interpreters.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
07/20/15	RIM, HISUN	Review manager weekly call with co-leads; Creating folders for batch assignments; Toshiba deposition preparation.	3.50	7	260.00	\$ 910.00
07/20/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	4.50	6	260.00	\$ 1,170.00
07/20/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review defendants' catalogs, part decoders, and product cross-reference guides.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
07/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
07/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare complaint for expert review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
07/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading by Catalyst.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
07/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition notice for M. Pilotin review.	0.10	2	325.00	\$ 32.50
07/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition protocol for B. Glackin review.	0.10	2	325.00	\$ 32.50
07/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.20	11	325.00	\$ 65.00
07/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize interrogatory responses.	0.60	11	325.00	\$ 195.00
07/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
07/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Sony production re file loading issues.	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00
07/21/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft expert stipulation; draft letter to Jeff Amato re same.	0.80	6	675.00	\$ 540.00
07/21/15	JONES, KAREN	Attendance on all reviewer call; meeting with LCHB team re same.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
07/21/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for Matsumoto deposition.	7.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
07/21/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Tachihara (Sanyo) documents and Toshiba documents.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
07/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding Sam Kim deposition.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
07/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with co-leads regarding Panasonic / Sanyo issues with privilege logs; telephone call with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding the same; review document production;	1.60	11	435.00	\$ 696.00
07/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft and send correspondence to Hitachi Maxell regarding search terms; correspondence with direct purchaser plaintiffs regarding the same.	1.40	6	435.00	\$ 609.00
07/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft letter to Sony regarding transactional data; correspondence with expert regarding the same; send to Sony.	0.50	10	435.00	\$ 217.50
07/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise expert stipulation.	0.50	6	435.00	\$ 217.50
07/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review correspondence regarding deposition vendors.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
07/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review LG Chem search terms; correspondence with H. Rim regarding the same.	0.40	6	435.00	\$ 174.00
07/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review time entries and correspondence with H. Rim and K. Jones regarding the same.	1.50	11	435.00	\$ 652.50
07/21/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	3.50	11	260.00	\$ 910.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/21/15	RIM, HISUN	Training reviewers; Creating folders for batch assignment.	3.50	7	325.00	\$ 1,137.50
07/21/15	RIM, HISUN	Weekly document review call with reviewers.	1.00	11	260.00	\$ 260.00
07/21/15	STUART, GREGORY	Participate in weekly document review team conference call.	0.50	11	350.00	\$ 175.00
07/21/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review all English Toshiba documents.	7.50	7	350.00	\$ 2,625.00
07/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
07/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
07/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery responses for M. Pilotin review.	2.00	9	325.00	\$ 650.00
07/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare privilege log for M. Pilotin review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
07/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
07/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit calendar re deposition notices.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
07/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize interrogatory responses.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
07/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
07/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defendant production index and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
07/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
07/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review production subpoena and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
07/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Sony production and prepare for loading.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
07/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading issues.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
07/22/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Assistance in troubleshooting download and extract production data.	1.50	7	340.00	\$ 510.00
07/22/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Finalize expert stipulation and letter to Jeff Amato.	0.50	6	675.00	\$ 337.50
07/22/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft task list.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
07/22/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
07/22/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Weekly conference with co-lead counsel.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
07/22/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for Matsumoto deposition.	7.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
07/22/15	JONES, KAREN	Meetings with LCHB team re priorities and preparation for depositions.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
07/22/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Tachihara (Sanyo) documents and Toshiba documents.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
07/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with B. Glackin regarding expert stipulation.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
07/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in document review manager meeting with H. Rim and K. Jones.	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
07/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in weekly call with co-lead counsel, including preparing task list.	1.00	11	435.00	\$ 435.00
07/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Quality control for document review.	0.60	7	435.00	\$ 261.00
07/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review proposed task list for motion for summary judgment from direct purchaser plaintiffs.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
07/22/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	1.00	11	325.00	\$ 325.00
07/22/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba deposition preparation.	6.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,560.00
07/22/15	RIM, HISUN	Weekly document review meeting with LCHB team.	1.00	11	260.00	\$ 260.00
07/22/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review all English Toshiba documents.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
07/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery responses for M. Pilotin review.	0.70	9	325.00	\$ 227.50
07/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG Chem production for loading.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
07/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare NEC production for loading.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
07/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit data correspondence log.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
07/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
07/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review issues re production download problems.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
07/23/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for Matsumoto deposition; review of Panasonic production for loading errors.	7.50	7	515.00	\$ 3,862.50
07/23/15	JONES, KAREN	Review Manager Weekly Call.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
07/23/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Tachihara (Sanyo) documents and Toshiba documents.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
07/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Check in with C. Saunders and G. Stuart regarding document review.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
07/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in meet and confer with counsel for Hitachi Maxell, and follow-up work and correspondence regarding the same; review and revise search terms for LG Chem and correspondence with opposing counsel regarding the same.	4.50	6	435.00	\$ 1,957.50
07/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise meet and confer letter to Sanyo regarding data questions.	0.10	6	435.00	\$ 43.50
07/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review problems with production of documents from Panasonic and Sanyo; correspondence with team regarding the same.	0.30	7	435.00	\$ 130.50
07/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Weekly co-lead call regarding document review.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
07/23/15	RIM, HISUN	Foldering batches; Toshiba deposition follow up.	3.50	7	260.00	\$ 910.00
07/23/15	RIM, HISUN	Review manager weekly call with co-leads.	0.50	7	260.00	\$ 130.00
07/23/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision; Search term meet and confer with HML.	4.00	6	260.00	\$ 1,040.00
07/23/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Matsumoto (Sanyo) documents.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
07/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.30	4	325.00	\$ 97.50
07/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
07/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery responses for M. Pilotin review.	1.20	9	325.00	\$ 390.00
07/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
07/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
07/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
07/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading issues.	1.30	7	325.00	\$ 422.50
07/24/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for Matsumoto deposition.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
07/24/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Tachihara (Sanyo) documents and Toshiba documents.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
07/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with experts regarding documents needed; confer with G. Stuart regarding reviewing such documents.	0.50	10	435.00	\$ 217.50
07/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with K. Jones regarding document review and custodians.	0.10	7	435.00	\$ 43.50
07/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review brief regarding LG Chem interrogatory responses.	0.10	9	435.00	\$ 43.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/24/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	0.50	7	260.00	\$ 130.00
07/24/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	7.50	11	325.00	\$ 2,437.50
07/24/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Matsumoto (Sanyo) documents.	5.00	7	350.00	\$ 1,750.00
07/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
07/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
07/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading issues.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
07/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit data correspondence index.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
07/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production index.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
07/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
07/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoenas and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
07/26/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review new correspondence; ECF filings.	0.40	9	675.00	\$ 270.00
07/26/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Matsumoto (Sanyo) documents.	1.00	7	350.00	\$ 350.00
07/27/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Prepare and upload production data to Catalyst database.	1.00	7	340.00	\$ 340.00
07/27/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for Matsumoto deposition.	8.00	7	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
07/27/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Tachihara (Sanyo) documents and Toshiba documents.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
07/27/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with co-counsel regarding production and translation of documents from LG Chem; review documents.	0.30	7	435.00	\$ 130.50
07/27/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with counsel for direct purchaser plaintiffs and co-counsel regarding check interpreters.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
07/27/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with counsel for direct purchaser plaintiffs regarding bids from deposition vendors; correspondence with deposition vendors regarding the same.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
07/27/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with opposing counsel regarding search terms.	0.40	6	435.00	\$ 174.00
07/27/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with team regarding document review assignments.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
07/27/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review task list for motion for summary judgment by direct purchaser plaintiffs; begin drafting outline to opposition to motion for summary judgment, and legal research for the same.	1.10	8	435.00	\$ 478.50
07/27/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	0.50	7	260.00	\$ 130.00
07/27/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	7.50	11	325.00	\$ 2,437.50
07/27/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Matsumoto (Sanyo) documents.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
07/28/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	Review notice and claim administration, draft request for production.	0.20	12	725.00	\$ 145.00
07/28/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for Matsumoto deposition.	3.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,545.00
07/28/15	JONES, KAREN	Weekly document review call; drafting and distributing notes from call.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
07/28/15	LEE, TRACY	Review Tachihara (Sanyo) documents and Toshiba documents.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
07/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with G. Stuart regarding searching for documents requested by experts.	0.20	10	435.00	\$ 87.00
07/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with deposition reporting vendors regarding bids.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
07/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with H. Rim and K. Jones regarding document review.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft and send correspondence to opposing counsel to follow up on questions regarding transaction data.	0.80	10	435.00	\$ 348.00
07/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Meet and confer with LG Chem regarding search terms; review and revise search terms; correspondence regarding the same; confer with H. Rim regarding the same.	1.60	6	435.00	\$ 696.00
07/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and comment on defendants' proposal regarding interpreters; confer with B. Glackin regarding the same.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00
07/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for direct purchaser plaintiffs regarding data questionnaires sent to opposing counsel and follow-up on the same.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
07/28/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	7	260.00	\$ 52.00
07/28/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision; search term meet and confer with LGC.	7.80	6	325.00	\$ 2,535.00
07/28/15	STUART, GREGORY	Participate in weekly document review team conference call.	0.30	11	350.00	\$ 105.00
07/28/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Matsumoto (Sanyo) documents.	7.70	7	350.00	\$ 2,695.00
07/29/15	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with Steven Sklaver re case status.	0.20	11	725.00	\$ 145.00
07/29/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review, approve proposal to run report re reviewers.	0.10	11	675.00	\$ 67.50
07/29/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin re Sony extension.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
07/29/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN		0.30	12	675.00	\$ 202.50
07/29/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for Matsumoto deposition.	3.50	7	515.00	\$ 1,802.50
07/29/15	JONES, KAREN	Weekly document review check-in.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
07/29/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
07/29/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with co-counsel and B. Glackin regarding document reviewer audits.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
07/29/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with LG Chem regarding search terms; review and revise search terms.	0.60	6	435.00	\$ 261.00
07/29/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer with NEC and NEC Tokin regarding search terms.	0.70	6	435.00	\$ 304.50
07/29/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare task list for weekly co-lead call, and confer with B. Glackin regarding the same.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
07/29/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise search terms for Panasonic and Sanyo.	0.60	6	435.00	\$ 261.00
07/29/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review documents for Eguchi deposition.	0.20	7	435.00	\$ 87.00
07/29/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for direct purchaser plaintiffs regarding Rule 30(b)(6) notices, opposition to motion for summary judgment, and interpreters.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
07/29/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Weekly meeting with H. Rim and K. Jones regarding document review.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
07/29/15	RIM, HISUN	LCHB weekly document review check-in.	0.50	11	260.00	\$ 130.00
07/29/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	8.00	11	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
07/29/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Matsumoto (Sanyo) documents.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
07/30/15	FASTIFF, ERIC		2.50	12	725.00	\$ 1,812.50
07/30/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson re expert budget.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
07/30/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Research materials for Fujitomo deposition.	0.70	4	515.00	\$ 360.50
07/30/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Research opposition to Toshiba motion for summary judgment.	1.30	8	515.00	\$ 669.50
07/30/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Review Toshiba motion for summary judgment and supporting papers.	1.20	9	515.00	\$ 618.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/30/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for Matsumoto deposition.	7.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
07/30/15	JONES, KAREN	Review manager weekly call and LCHB discussion re projects from call.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
07/30/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
07/30/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with B. Glackin regarding interpreters.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
07/30/15	RIM, HISUN	Review manager weekly call with co-leads.	0.50	11	260.00	\$ 130.00
07/30/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision; search term meet and confer with HML.	11.30	6	325.00	\$ 3,672.50
07/30/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Matsumoto (Sanyo) documents.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
07/31/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Prepare for Fujitomo deposition, conference with B. Glackin and M. Pilotin re same.	1.30	4	515.00	\$ 669.50
07/31/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for Matsumoto deposition.	6.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,090.00
07/31/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
07/31/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with B. Glackin regarding case staffing and document review.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00
07/31/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with D. Harvey regarding Toshiba depositions.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
07/31/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with plaintiffs and opposing counsel regarding interpreters.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
07/31/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in meet and confer with NEC and NEC Tokin regarding search terms.	0.80	6	435.00	\$ 348.00
07/31/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for LG Chem regarding search terms.	0.30	6	435.00	\$ 130.50
07/31/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding depositions.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
07/31/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision; search meet and confer with NEC/NEC-T.	10.30	6	325.00	\$ 3,347.50
07/31/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Matsumoto (Sanyo) documents.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
08/03/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Assistance with troubleshooting production data download.	0.70	11	340.00	\$ 238.00
08/03/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with M. Pilotin, K. Jones and H. Rim re document review status.	0.60	11	675.00	\$ 405.00
08/03/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with M. Pilotin re deposition preparation.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
08/03/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with co-counsel.	0.80	11	675.00	\$ 540.00
08/03/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for Matsumoto deposition.	4.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
08/03/15	JONES, KAREN	Meet with LCHB team; plan for upcoming depositions.	2.00	11	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
08/03/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
08/03/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with B. Glackin, H. Rim, and K. Jones re document review and case staffing; telephone call with co-counsel re the same.	2.30	11	435.00	\$ 1,000.50
08/03/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with B. Glackin re document review and case planning.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/03/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with co-counsel re deposition dates and document review; telephone call re the same.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/03/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with H. Rim re search terms; correspondence with opposing counsel re search term meet and confer.	0.40	6	435.00	\$ 174.00
08/03/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise direct purchaser plaintiffs' letter to Toshiba regarding finished products data.	0.10	10	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/03/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Aaron Sheanin regarding expert reports and analysis, and follow up with co-counsel regarding the same.	0.20	10	435.00	\$ 87.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/03/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding depositions, follow-up correspondence with direct purchaser plaintiffs' counsel regarding the same.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
08/03/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	1.00	7	260.00	\$ 260.00
08/03/15	RIM, HISUN	LCHB LiB document review meeting.	1.30	11	260.00	\$ 338.00
08/03/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision; meet and confer.	5.70	6	260.00	\$ 1,482.00
08/03/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Matsumoto (Sanyo) documents.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
08/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
08/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
08/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
08/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	1.30	7	325.00	\$ 422.50
08/04/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN		0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
08/04/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for Matsumoto deposition.	6.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,090.00
08/04/15	JONES, KAREN	Weekly document review call; draft and distribute notes from call; meet with LCHB team; answer reviewer questions.	2.00	11	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
08/04/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
08/04/15	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Copy flash drive to flash drive.	1.50	7	340.00	\$ 510.00
08/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with B. Glackin re document review and upcoming depositions.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
08/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with co-counsel and counsel for Toshiba re discovery responses and interpreters.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
08/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with experts re transactional data questions, correspondence with counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re the same.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
08/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review documents for Toshiba depositions.	0.40	7	435.00	\$ 174.00
08/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review revised deposition vendor bids and correspondence with co-counsel re the same.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
08/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for Sony re discovery issues and settlement, and correspondence with B. Glackin re the same.	0.10	12	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Demetrius Lambrinos re Toshiba letter regarding discovery responses.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
08/04/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	1.00	7	260.00	\$ 260.00
08/04/15	RIM, HISUN	Document review all reviewer meeting	0.50	11	260.00	\$ 130.00
08/04/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	6.50	11	325.00	\$ 2,112.50
08/04/15	STUART, GREGORY	Participate in weekly document review team conference call.	0.20	11	350.00	\$ 70.00
08/04/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Matsumoto (Sanyo) documents.	7.80	7	350.00	\$ 2,730.00
08/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
08/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00
08/05/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with co-leads.	0.80	11	675.00	\$ 540.00
08/05/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for Matsumoto and Eguchi depositions.	7.50	7	515.00	\$ 3,862.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/05/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
08/05/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in telephone call with Demetrius Lambrinos re depositions and court reporter.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
08/05/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in telephone call with [REDACTED].	1.70	11	435.00	\$ 739.50
08/05/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in weekly meeting with co-lead counsel.	1.00	11	435.00	\$ 435.00
08/05/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review documents for Toshiba depositions.	2.40	7	435.00	\$ 1,044.00
08/05/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re deposition assignments; follow up correspondence with co-lead counsel re the same.	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
08/05/15	RIM, HISUN	Deponent selection strategy.	0.40	7	260.00	\$ 104.00
08/05/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	7.60	11	325.00	\$ 2,470.00
08/05/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Matsumoto (Sanyo) documents.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
08/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
08/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading issues.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
08/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Toshiba documents for M. Pilotin review.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
08/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
08/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review expert agreement and save to file.	0.10	10	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/06/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with M. Pilotin re document review.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
08/06/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for Fukai and Eguchi depositions.	4.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
08/06/15	JONES, KAREN	Weekly Document Review Check-in; LCHB meetings to re-align workload.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
08/06/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
08/06/15	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Copy flash drive to flash drive.	1.50	7	340.00	\$ 510.00
08/06/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with counsel for direct purchaser plaintiffs regarding certified translations for Toshiba deposition, and review documents for the same.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
08/06/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft outline for opposition to Toshiba motion for summary judgment.	1.80	8	435.00	\$ 783.00
08/06/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in weekly meeting with document review managers, and follow-up regarding the same.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
08/06/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for, confer with B. Glackin for, and participate in meet and confer with Toshiba regarding discovery responses; correspondence with co-counsel and counsel for direct purchaser plaintiffs re the same.	2.20	6	435.00	\$ 957.00
08/06/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review revised deposition vendor bids and correspondence with vendors and co-counsel regarding the same.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
08/06/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for direct purchaser plaintiffs regarding interpreters.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/06/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	1.00	7	260.00	\$ 260.00
08/06/15	RIM, HISUN	LCHB weekly document review check-in.	0.50	11	260.00	\$ 130.00
08/06/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision; search term meet and confer with HML.	8.00	6	260.00	\$ 2,080.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/06/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Matsumoto (Sanyo) documents.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
08/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading issues.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
08/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery responses for M. Pilotin review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare instructions re loading issues for Catalyst.	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00
08/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare productions for loading by Catalyst.	1.30	7	325.00	\$ 422.50
08/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
08/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
08/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re data issues.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
08/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re Sony loading issues.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/07/15	JONES, KAREN	Call with co-counsel and deposition preparation team re evidence needed for Toshiba summary judgment motion.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
08/07/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for Fukai and Eguchi depositions.	3.50	7	515.00	\$ 1,802.50
08/07/15	LEE, TRACY	Review foreign language documents for relevance.	8.00	7	450.00	\$ 3,600.00
08/07/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with co-counsel re search terms and interpreters.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
08/07/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs, LGC, and NEC / NEC Tokin re search term agreements.	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
08/07/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re meet and confer with Toshiba.	0.20	6	435.00	\$ 87.00
08/07/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review deposition vendor bids and correspondence re the same; telephone calls with vendors.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00
08/07/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with directs re motion for summary judgment assignments; follow up correspondence with co-counsel re the same.	1.10	11	435.00	\$ 478.50
08/07/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	8.30	11	325.00	\$ 2,697.50
08/07/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba deposition preparation strategy meeting.	1.00	11	260.00	\$ 260.00
08/07/15	STUART, GREGORY	Review Matsumoto (Sanyo) documents.	8.00	7	350.00	\$ 2,800.00
08/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
08/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
08/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Fukai documents.	1.30	7	675.00	\$ 877.50
08/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call re deposition assignments; review Fukai documents.	1.50	11	675.00	\$ 1,012.50
08/10/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for motion for summary judgment response and Eguchi and Fukai depositions.	4.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
08/10/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with B. Glackin regarding opposition to Toshiba motion for summary judgment; correspondence with co-counsel regarding the same.	0.20	8	435.00	\$ 87.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/10/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with co-counsel regarding data questions and expert issues.	0.20	10	435.00	\$ 87.00
08/10/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in telephone call with co-counsel regarding deposition assignments, follow-up correspondence regarding the same.	1.00	11	435.00	\$ 435.00
08/10/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and edit search terms and confer with H. Rim regarding the same; correspondence with opposing counsel regarding the same.	4.80	6	435.00	\$ 2,088.00
08/10/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review deposition vendor bids and correspondence regarding the same with vendors and co-counsel.	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
08/10/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone calls with co-counsel and counsel for direct purchaser plaintiffs regarding Toshiba Rule 30(b)(6) deposition notice.	1.20	11	435.00	\$ 522.00
08/10/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding interpreters.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
08/10/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
08/10/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	3.20	11	325.00	\$ 1,040.00
08/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery responses for attorney review.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
08/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
08/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
08/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review retention agreement and save to file.	0.10	10	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review testimony re e-mail destruction for M. Pilotin.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
08/11/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin re deposition location; review hearing transcript and deposition protocol re location; office conference with regarding M. Pilotin re deposition location issue.	1.10	11	675.00	\$ 742.50
08/11/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for MSJ response and Eguchi and Fukai depositions.	4.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
08/11/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with experts and counsel for direct purchaser plaintiffs regarding questions about defendant data.	0.10	10	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/11/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft weekly task list.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/11/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review deposition vendor bids and correspondence regarding the same with vendors and co-counsel.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
08/11/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for direct purchaser plaintiffs regarding deposition scheduling, confer with B. Glackin regarding the same, correspondence with co-counsel regarding the same.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
08/11/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for direct purchaser plaintiffs regarding Hitachi search terms; review and revise search terms; correspondence with H. Rim regarding search terms.	0.40	6	435.00	\$ 174.00
08/11/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for Sony regarding search terms and settlement.	0.50	12	435.00	\$ 217.50
08/11/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding [REDACTED].	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
08/11/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Jaclyn Verducci regarding document reviewer, correspondence with human resources regarding the same.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/11/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Ronnie Spiegel regarding document review.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
08/11/15	RIM, HISUN	Document review all reviewer meeting.	0.60	11	260.00	\$ 156.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/11/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	7.40	11	325.00	\$ 2,405.00
08/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hiroshi Fukai deposition preparation.	5.00	4	325.00	\$ 1,625.00
08/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
08/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review testimony re e-mail destruction for M. Pilotin.	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00
08/12/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence to Frank Hogue.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
08/12/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise letter to defense counsel.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
08/12/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with co-counsel; telephone conference with Shana Scarlett, Aaron Sheanin and Demetrius Lambrinos.	2.00	11	675.00	\$ 1,350.00
08/12/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jeff Amato re depositions.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
08/12/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Attend co-lead counsel weekly call.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
08/12/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for MSJ response and Eguchi and Fukai depositions.	3.50	7	515.00	\$ 1,802.50
08/12/15	JONES, KAREN	LCHB meeting.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
08/12/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with H. Rim regarding Hitachi search terms; correspondence with opposing counsel regarding the same.	0.70	6	435.00	\$ 304.50
08/12/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with counsel for direct purchaser plaintiffs and co-counsel regarding late Toshiba production; correspondence with B. Troxel and H. Rim regarding document review for the same.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
08/12/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with Nate Cihlar regarding translation objections.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/12/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Legal research for opposition to motion for summary judgment, review briefs from Animators case.	0.30	8	435.00	\$ 130.50
08/12/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in weekly meeting with co-lead counsel counsel.	1.50	11	435.00	\$ 652.50
08/12/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise direct purchaser plaintiffs' letter regarding NEC regarding data questions.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/12/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise direct purchaser plaintiffs' letter to Hitachi regarding Sumoto deposition.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/12/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for direct purchaser plaintiffs regarding Toshiba motion for summary judgment, and follow-up correspondence with co-counsel regarding the same.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
08/12/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for Panasonic and Sanyo regarding depositions.	0.40	6	435.00	\$ 174.00
08/12/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Weekly meeting with H. Rim and K. Jones.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
08/12/15	RIM, HISUN	LCHB weekly document review check-in.	0.50	11	260.00	\$ 130.00
08/12/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	7.50	11	325.00	\$ 2,437.50
08/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading issues.	0.80	7	325.00	\$ 260.00
08/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading issues.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
08/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re case counsel for M. Pilotin.	1.10	9	325.00	\$ 357.50
08/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoena and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/13/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meeting re Fukai documents.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
08/13/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Fukai documents.	0.90	7	675.00	\$ 607.50
08/13/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN		2.10	12	675.00	\$ 1,417.50
08/13/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for Fukai deposition.	6.50	7	515.00	\$ 3,347.50
08/13/15	JONES, KAREN	Weekly Document Review Check-in; LCHB meetings re upcoming depositions and translations.	1.50	11	515.00	\$ 772.50
08/13/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with B. Glackin, H. Rim, and K. Jones regarding preparation for Fukai deposition.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
08/13/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with co-counsel regarding document review staffing.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
08/13/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft letter to defense counsel regarding setting deadlines for search terms and production; confer with counsel for direct purchaser plaintiffs regarding the same.	1.30	6	435.00	\$ 565.50
08/13/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise search terms for Panasonic and Sanyo, confer with H. Rim regarding the same; correspondence with opposing counsel regarding the same.	1.10	6	435.00	\$ 478.50
08/13/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with experts regarding data, follow up with co-counsel regarding the same.	0.70	10	435.00	\$ 304.50
08/13/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Travel to and attend hearing on motion to compel; confer with co-counsel and counsel for direct purchaser plaintiffs thereafter regarding case strategy.	3.30	14	435.00	\$ 1,435.50
08/13/15	RIM, HISUN	Review manager weekly call with co-leads; LCHB deposition preparation strategy – Toshiba Fukai.	7.00	11	260.00	\$ 1,820.00
08/13/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	8.40	11	325.00	\$ 2,730.00
08/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
08/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit log re data correspondence.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
08/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
08/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
08/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re motion to compel filings for M. Pilotin.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
08/14/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for Fukai deposition; drafting memo to hand off Matsumoto deposition preparation to Hagens firm.	5.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,575.00
08/14/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with Help Desk and H. Mottershead re setting up shared memorandum repository with co-counsel; correspondence with co-counsel re the same.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
08/14/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with expert and Demetrius Lambrinos regarding documents expert needs.	0.20	10	435.00	\$ 87.00
08/14/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in telephone call with co-counsel regarding document review staffing.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00
08/14/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise search terms, confer with H. Rim regarding the same.	1.70	11	435.00	\$ 739.50
08/14/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review letter from Toshiba regarding plaintiffs' production; draft response.	2.50	6	435.00	\$ 1,087.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/14/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Revise letter to defense counsel regarding setting deadlines for search terms and production.	0.10	6	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/14/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	10.00	6	260.00	\$ 2,600.00
08/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading issues.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
08/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense production and prepare for loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
08/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with Sawa Nagano regarding document review.	0.10	7	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letter to Toshiba regarding document production.	0.90	6	435.00	\$ 391.50
08/17/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Attention to training of co-counsel with use of casemap database.	2.00	7	340.00	\$ 680.00
08/17/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for Fukai deposition.	3.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,545.00
08/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with co-counsel re document review and other projects.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
08/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Document review for Toshiba motion for summary judgment.	0.10	9	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Document review for upcoming depositions, correspondence with Sawa Nagano re the same.	0.90	11	435.00	\$ 391.50
08/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Document review for upcoming depositions, correspondence with Sawa Nagano re the same; prepare for Fujitomo and Eguchi depositions.	2.60	11	435.00	\$ 1,131.00
08/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft letter to Hitachi with questions re data.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00
08/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer with counsel for Panasonic and Sanyo regarding Rule 30(b)(6) deposition notice.	1.10	6	435.00	\$ 478.50
08/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in call with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re case strategy.	1.00	11	435.00	\$ 435.00
08/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letter to Toshiba re belated document productions.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00
08/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review deposition vendor bids and correspondence re the same with vendors and co-counsel.	0.30	9	435.00	\$ 130.50
08/17/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation; answer reviewer questions on document review.	2.00	7	260.00	\$ 520.00
08/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	1.00	4	325.00	\$ 325.00
08/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading and status.	0.70	7	325.00	\$ 227.50
08/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
08/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
08/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review third party data and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
08/18/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assistance with training of co-counsel.	3.00	1	340.00	\$ 1,020.00
08/18/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Attend expert call, prepare for same, conference with M. Pilotin re same.	0.80	10	515.00	\$ 412.00
08/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Compile list of documents experts have requested; correspondence with co-counsel and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re the same.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
08/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with co-counsel re document review and other projects.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
08/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re depositions and other projects.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft letter to Toshiba re inadvertently produced documents and privilege logs.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
08/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Preparation for Fujitomo and Eguchi depositions; correspondence with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding the same.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in telephone call with expert witnesses and co-counsel.	1.00	11	435.00	\$ 435.00
08/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letter to Hitachi Maxell regarding data questions.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
08/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review letter from Toshiba regarding Rule 30(b)(6) notices; prepare for and participate in meet and confer regarding depositions; follow-up with co-counsel and counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding the same.	0.80	6	435.00	\$ 348.00
08/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review Toshiba documents.	0.50	7	435.00	\$ 217.50
08/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Gabe Zeldin regarding deposition exhibits.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
08/18/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation; answer reviewer questions on document review.	3.70	7	260.00	\$ 962.00
08/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.40	4	325.00	\$ 130.00
08/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading.	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00
08/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit data correspondence log.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re Sanyo production file issues.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
08/19/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Administration of database; QC of database; specific handling of further training on database.	3.00	7	340.00	\$ 1,020.00
08/19/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for Fukai deposition.	3.50	7	515.00	\$ 1,802.50
08/19/15	JONES, KAREN	LCHB meeting.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
08/19/15	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Copy flash drive to another drive.	1.00	11	340.00	\$ 340.00
08/19/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with expert regarding questions about defendants' data.	0.20	10	435.00	\$ 87.00
08/19/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with opposing counsel regarding search terms.	0.20	6	435.00	\$ 87.00
08/19/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Document review and correspondence related to the same.	1.60	7	435.00	\$ 696.00
08/19/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft administrative motion regarding Kubo deposition and scheduling of deadline for opposition to Toshiba motion for summary judgment.	7.50	8	435.00	\$ 3,262.50
08/19/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft task list for weekly call, and prepare for weekly telephone call.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
08/19/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and comment on objections to Toshiba translations.	0.10	9	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/19/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Revise letter to Toshiba regarding inadvertently produced documents and privilege logs.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
08/19/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Weekly meeting with H. Rim and K. Jones regarding document review.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
08/19/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation; train document reviewers.	4.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,040.00
08/19/15	RIM, HISUN	LCHB weekly document review check-in.	0.60	11	260.00	\$ 156.00
08/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
08/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re status of production loading issues.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
08/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense production for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
08/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare file for Catalyst loading.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production correspondence for M. Pilotin review.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare translations for M. Pilotin review.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit data correspondence log.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
08/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re translation status.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review emails re status of document removal by Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/20/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise motion to continue Kubo deposition; review email correspondence and case filings.	1.10	8	675.00	\$ 742.50
08/20/15	JONES, KAREN	Co-counsel call and LCHB meeting.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
08/20/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for Fukai deposition.	5.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,575.00
08/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with opposing counsel regarding search terms.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
08/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Document review and correspondence related to the same.	0.70	7	435.00	\$ 304.50
08/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft administrative motion regarding Kubo deposition and scheduling of deadline for opposition to Toshiba motion for summary judgment; telephone calls with counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding the same; correspondence with co-counsel and counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding the same; prepare and file the same.	5.40	8	435.00	\$ 2,349.00
08/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Preparation for Fujitomo and Eguchi depositions; correspondence with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding the same.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
08/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding Toshiba document requests.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
08/20/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	1.30	7	260.00	\$ 338.00
08/20/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	5.00	11	325.00	\$ 1,625.00
08/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading issues.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
08/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare motion to continue deposition for filing.	0.60	8	325.00	\$ 195.00
08/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production tracking log for H. Rim review.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
08/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Toshiba deposition preparation.	0.20	4	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/21/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review for Fukai deposition.	2.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
08/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confirm deletion of inadvertently produced documents, correspondence with opposing counsel regarding the same.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
08/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with experts and counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding expert-requested documents.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
08/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with opposing counsel regarding search terms; prepare for and participate in meet and confer regarding the same; consult with H. Rim regarding the same.	2.10	6	435.00	\$ 913.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with vendor, counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs, and opposing counsel regarding clawback.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Legal research for Toshiba motion for summary judgment, including review of authority from Animators case; begin drafting portion of brief.	0.10	8	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for deposition of Hisashi Fujitomo.	1.40	11	435.00	\$ 609.00
08/21/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	0.60	7	260.00	\$ 156.00
08/21/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision; meet and confer with NEC/NEC-Tokin.	8.10	6	260.00	\$ 2,106.00
08/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Delete files and prepare status re Toshiba clawback.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
08/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading status.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
08/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re motion to continue deposition.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
08/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
08/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
08/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize pleadings files.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
08/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review expert invoice and save to file.	0.10	10	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
08/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Toshiba deposition preparation.	0.70	4	325.00	\$ 227.50
08/22/15	JONES, KAREN	Selecting certified translations for Fukai deposition.	2.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
08/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise search terms for NEC and NEC Tokin; confer with H. Rim regarding the same; correspondence with opposing counsel regarding the same.	1.00	6	435.00	\$ 435.00
08/22/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	0.20	11	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/23/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	0.50	7	260.00	\$ 130.00
08/23/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	0.80	11	325.00	\$ 260.00
08/24/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Troubleshoot and assistance with duplication of media.	2.80	11	340.00	\$ 952.00
08/24/15	JONES, KAREN	Selecting certified translations for Fukai deposition.	3.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,545.00
08/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with co-counsel regarding document review and other projects.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
08/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding depositions and other projects.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
08/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with opposing counsel regarding attendance at depositions.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
08/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft letter to Samsung and Panasonic and Sanyo regarding data questions.	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
08/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft letter to Samsung regarding data questions.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
08/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in meet and confer with Hitachi Maxell regarding search terms.	0.10	6	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in meet and confer with Hitachi Maxell regarding search terms; confer with H. Rim regarding revisions; review and revise search terms.	1.10	6	435.00	\$ 478.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for deposition of Daiichiro Eguchi.	0.50	4	435.00	\$ 217.50
08/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for deposition of Hisashi Fujitomo.	1.70	4	435.00	\$ 739.50
08/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Aaron Sheanin regarding Toshiba opposition and collection of documents for experts; follow up with experts regarding the same.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
08/24/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	7	260.00	\$ 52.00
08/24/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	9.50	11	325.00	\$ 3,087.50
08/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.30	4	325.00	\$ 97.50
08/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit data correspondence log.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review certified translations and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
08/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense production and prepare for loading.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
08/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re translations for M. Pilotin.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoena to third party and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Toshiba deposition preparation.	0.50	4	325.00	\$ 162.50
08/25/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Assistance with downloading production and loading to Catalyst. Troubleshoot file share access.	1.00	11	340.00	\$ 340.00
08/25/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Assistance with troubleshooting file share site and download production.	0.80	11	340.00	\$ 272.00
08/25/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review deposition protocol; memorandum regarding same.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
08/25/15	JONES, KAREN	Selecting certified translations for Fukai deposition.	5.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,575.00
08/25/15	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Check corrupted zip file.	0.50	7	340.00	\$ 170.00
08/25/15	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Copy flash drive to flash drive.	2.00	7	340.00	\$ 680.00
08/25/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with H. Rim regarding Hitachi Maxell and Panasonic/Sanyo search terms.	2.10	11	435.00	\$ 913.50
08/25/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Legal research for and draft opposition to motion for summary judgment.	3.60	8	435.00	\$ 1,566.00
08/25/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in telephone call regarding Kubo deposition.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/25/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for deposition of Hisashi Fujitomo; correspondence with opposing counsel regarding the same.	1.00	4	435.00	\$ 435.00
08/25/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare task list for weekly call.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
08/25/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	11.10	11	325.00	\$ 3,607.50
08/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading issues.	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00
08/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare index re state law claims for M. Pilotin review.	1.00	8	325.00	\$ 325.00
08/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sanyo load files for Brian Miller review.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit data correspondence log.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
08/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading.	0.70	7	325.00	\$ 227.50
08/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Toshiba deposition preparation.	1.70	4	325.00	\$ 552.50
08/26/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Update production data that needs to be uploaded to Catalyst.	0.30	11	340.00	\$ 102.00
08/26/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call; review deposition protocol; memorandum regarding same; emails with Ed Leamer.	0.90	11	675.00	\$ 607.50
08/26/15	JONES, KAREN	LCHB meeting.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
08/26/15	JONES, KAREN	Toshiba's new production for Fukai deposition.	3.50	7	515.00	\$ 1,802.50
08/26/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Legal research for and draft opposition to motion for summary judgment.	0.40	8	435.00	\$ 174.00
08/26/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in weekly telephone call with co-counsel.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
08/26/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for deposition of Hisashi Fujitomo; correspondence with opposing counsel and counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding the same.	1.40	4	435.00	\$ 609.00
08/26/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review documents sent by co-counsel.	0.10	7	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/26/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Weekly meeting with H. Rim and K. Jones regarding document review.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
08/26/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	2.30	7	260.00	\$ 598.00
08/26/15	RIM, HISUN	LCHB weekly document review check-in.	0.30	11	260.00	\$ 78.00
08/26/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	5.80	11	325.00	\$ 1,885.00
08/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	8	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare protective order for M. Pilotin review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
08/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Toshiba deposition preparation.	1.10	4	325.00	\$ 357.50
08/27/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review: Toshiba's new production for Fukai deposition.	4.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
08/27/15	O'ROURKE SCANLON, SUZANNE	Discuss with B. Troxel use of database.	0.20	11	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/27/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding depositions and other projects.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/27/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with opposing counsel regarding search terms.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/27/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in deposition of Hisashi Fujitomo.	13.50	4	435.00	\$ 5,872.50
08/27/15	RIM, HISUN	Check interpreting at Fujitomo deposition.	11.90	4	260.00	\$ 3,094.00
08/27/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	0.10	11	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
08/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG production documents for M. Pilotin review.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re protective order exhibit for co-counsel.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
08/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoena and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translation and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Toshiba deposition preparation.	2.50	4	325.00	\$ 812.50
08/28/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jennie Anderson regarding document review.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
08/28/15	JONES, KAREN	Toshiba's new production for Fukai deposition; selection of certified translations; drafting background memo for deposition.	7.00	7	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
08/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with opposing counsel regarding search terms; prepare for and participate in meet and confer regarding the same; consult with H. Rim regarding the same.	0.80	6	435.00	\$ 348.00
08/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in deposition of Hisashi Fujitomo.	10.30	4	435.00	\$ 4,480.50
08/28/15	RIM, HISUN	Assigning document review batches to reviewers.	0.10	7	260.00	\$ 26.00
08/28/15	RIM, HISUN	Check interpreting at Fujitomo deposition.	11.90	4	260.00	\$ 3,094.00
08/28/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	0.10	6	260.00	\$ 26.00
08/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit data correspondence log.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
08/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize pleadings files.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery requests and save to file.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
08/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review signed protective orders and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translation objections and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
08/29/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	0.20	6	260.00	\$ 52.00
08/30/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for deposition of Daiichiro Eguchi.	0.70	4	435.00	\$ 304.50
08/31/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Respond to email correspondence.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
08/31/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review: Toshiba's new production for Fukai deposition; selection of certified translations; analysis of Fujitomo deposition and Eguchi exhibits for Fukai deposition.	4.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
08/31/15	O'ROURKE SCANLON, SUZANNE	Review procedure for searching for documents on Catalyst database.	0.20	11	325.00	\$ 65.00
08/31/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with opposing counsel regarding search terms; prepare for and participate in meet and confer regarding the same; consult with H. Rim regarding the same.	2.40	6	435.00	\$ 1,044.00
08/31/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for deposition of Daiichiro Eguchi.	2.60	4	435.00	\$ 1,131.00
08/31/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise Toshiba 30(b)(6) notice.	0.30	2	435.00	\$ 130.50
08/31/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Aaron Sheanin regarding search terms and deposition notice.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
08/31/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with [REDACTED].	0.90	11	435.00	\$ 391.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/31/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with court reporting service.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/31/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding depositions.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
08/31/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition Preparation.	4.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,040.00
08/31/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision; search term meet and confer.	1.80	6	325.00	\$ 585.00
09/01/15	CABRASER, ELIZABETH	Conference with E. Fastiff re status and strategy for October 2nd status conference.	0.30	11	975.00	\$ 292.50
09/01/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Assistance in data to be loaded, copy, prepare and upload production to Catalyst.	2.00	11	340.00	\$ 680.00
09/01/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review: Toshiba's new production for Fukai deposition; selection of certified translations; analysis of Fujitomo deposition and Eguchi exhibits for Fukai deposition.	5.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,575.00
09/01/15	O'ROURKE SCANLON, SUZANNE	Run through procedure for downloading documents from Catalyst Insight database.	0.20	11	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/01/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with opposing counsel regarding search terms; prepare for and participate in meet and confer regarding the same; consult with H. Rim regarding the same.	0.60	6	435.00	\$ 261.00
09/01/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft weekly task list.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
09/01/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in deposition of Daiichiro Eguchi.	12.00	4	435.00	\$ 5,220.00
09/01/15	RIM, HISUN	Assigning Document Review Batches.	0.10	7	260.00	\$ 26.00
09/01/15	RIM, HISUN	Check Interpreting at Eguchi (Toshiba) Deposition.	10.00	4	260.00	\$ 2,600.00
09/01/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	3.60	11	325.00	\$ 1,170.00
09/02/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Search and confirm production documents loaded in Catalyst case.	0.30	11	340.00	\$ 102.00
09/02/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Ed Leamer and Phil Johnson.	0.70	10	675.00	\$ 472.50
09/02/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Ed Leamer; memorandum to Phil Johnson.	0.50	10	675.00	\$ 337.50
09/02/15	JONES, KAREN	Document review: Toshiba's new production for Fukai deposition; selection of certified translations; analysis of Fujitomo deposition and Eguchi exhibits for Fukai deposition.	4.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
09/02/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with opposing counsel regarding search terms; prepare for and participate in meet and confer regarding the same; consult with H. Rim regarding the same.	1.00	6	435.00	\$ 435.00
09/02/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in deposition of Daiichiro Eguchi.	7.90	4	435.00	\$ 3,436.50
09/02/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Aaron Sheanin regarding search terms.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
09/02/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with B. Glackin regarding expert issues; review expert letters; correspondence with expert regarding data.	0.40	10	435.00	\$ 174.00
09/02/15	RIM, HISUN	Assigning Document Review Batches.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/02/15	RIM, HISUN	Check Interpreting at Eguchi (Toshiba) Deposition.	9.70	4	260.00	\$ 2,522.00
09/02/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	0.20	11	260.00	\$ 52.00
09/03/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft memorandum to team regarding experts.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
09/03/15	JONES, KAREN	Preparation for Fukai deposition.	3.00	7	515.00	\$ 1,545.00
09/03/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with co-counsel regarding document review.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
09/03/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with opposing counsel regarding search terms.	0.50	6	435.00	\$ 217.50
09/03/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise joint letter brief regarding interrogatories.	0.40	8	435.00	\$ 174.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/03/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding expert review; draft letter to counsel for Samsung SDI regarding Sam Kim deposition.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
09/03/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with expert.	0.30	10	435.00	\$ 130.50
09/03/15	RIM, HISUN	Assigning document review searches for deposition preparation; deposition preparation.	3.20	7	325.00	\$ 1,040.00
09/04/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Copy, prepare and upload production data to Catalyst.	1.60	11	340.00	\$ 544.00
09/04/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum to team regarding experts; team call.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
09/04/15	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Decrypt media and copy contents to the P drive for database uploading.	1.50	7	340.00	\$ 510.00
09/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding search terms.	1.20	6	435.00	\$ 522.00
09/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with opposing counsel regarding search terms.	0.90	6	435.00	\$ 391.50
09/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in weekly call with co-lead counsel.	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
09/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise joint letter brief regarding interrogatories.	0.10	8	435.00	\$ 43.50
09/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review expert correspondence; confer with document reviewer regarding searching for battery specification sheets; document review for experts.	1.50	10	435.00	\$ 652.50
09/04/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Update weekly task list.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
09/04/15	RIM, HISUN	Assigning document review searches for deposition preparation; deposition preparation.	1.60	7	325.00	\$ 520.00
09/04/15	RIM, HISUN	Search term revision.	2.20	11	325.00	\$ 715.00
09/06/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
09/07/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Document review for experts; correspondence with document reviewers regarding the same.	0.90	10	435.00	\$ 391.50
09/07/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft letter to Hitachi Maxell regarding search term agreements.	0.50	6	435.00	\$ 217.50
09/08/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Analysis of duplicate data loaded in Catalyst database.	0.40	11	340.00	\$ 136.00
09/08/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Modify MPilotin's status and privileges in Catalyst database.	0.20	11	340.00	\$ 68.00
09/08/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding search terms.	0.30	6	435.00	\$ 130.50
09/08/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft letter to Sony regarding data questions.	0.50	10	435.00	\$ 217.50
09/08/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise joint letter brief regarding interrogatories.	0.50	8	435.00	\$ 217.50
09/08/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review correspondence regarding LG Chem watch list.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
09/08/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Ed Leamer regarding topics needed for analysis; review documents for expert analysis; correspondence and telephone calls with co-counsel and document reviewers regarding the same; correspondence with Niyati Ahuja regarding the same.	2.10	10	435.00	\$ 913.50
09/08/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	2.30	4	325.00	\$ 747.50
09/09/15	JONES, KAREN	LCHB meetings; preparation for deposition preparation hand-off to co-lead counsel.	1.00	7	515.00	\$ 515.00
09/09/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with co-counsel regarding documents from deposition.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
09/09/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft letter to Sony regarding data questions.	0.30	10	435.00	\$ 130.50
09/09/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Meet with H. Rim and K. Jones regarding document review.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
09/09/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in weekly call with co-lead counsel.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/09/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone calls with experts regarding topics for analysis; document review for experts; correspondence and telephone calls with document reviewers regarding collection of documents for experts.	3.60	11	435.00	\$ 1,566.00
09/09/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for Panasonic and Sanyo regarding search terms.	0.10	6	435.00	\$ 43.50
09/09/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	7.70	7	325.00	\$ 2,502.50
09/09/15	RIM, HISUN	LCHB weekly document review check-in.	0.30	11	260.00	\$ 78.00
09/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with M. Pilotin regarding hearing on Kwak.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
09/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Weekly team call; draft memorandum regarding expert tasks.	1.90	11	675.00	\$ 1,282.50
09/10/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding depositions and exhibits with co-counsel and vendor.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
09/10/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Document review for experts; communications with document reviewers regarding the same; respond to requests from experts regarding information.	1.80	10	435.00	\$ 783.00
09/10/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise task list; prepare for and participate in weekly telephone call with co-lead counsel.	0.90	11	435.00	\$ 391.50
09/10/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review correspondence to opposing counsel regarding indirect purchaser plaintiffs' discovery issues.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
09/10/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review revisions to deposition protocol.	0.10	9	435.00	\$ 43.50
09/10/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for Sony regarding data questions.	0.20	10	435.00	\$ 87.00
09/10/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Travel to, attend, and travel from hearing regarding S.H. Kwak deposition; correspondence with co-counsel and H. Rim and K. Jones regarding results of hearing.	2.40	14	435.00	\$ 1,044.00
09/10/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition Preparation.	7.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,820.00
09/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Delete production documents re NEC privileged material.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
09/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
09/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re document loading issues.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
09/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition files for H. Rim review.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
09/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
09/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit document production log.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
09/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize deposition files.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
09/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	1.30	9	325.00	\$ 422.50
09/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review LG Chem production re loading issues.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/11/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Document review for experts; communications with document reviewers regarding the same.	1.10	7	435.00	\$ 478.50
09/11/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in meeting with direct purchaser plaintiffs regarding document review and Rule 30(b)(6) depositions.	3.20	11	435.00	\$ 1,392.00
09/11/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review correspondence from opposing counsel regarding data questions and compile list of the same; correspondence with co-counsel regarding the same.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
09/11/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition Preparation.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit data correspondence log for M. Pilotin.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
09/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	2.50	9	325.00	\$ 812.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
09/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
09/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Toshiba production and prepare for loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
09/12/15	JONES, KAREN	Preparation of search history for Fukai depo.	4.00	7	515.00	\$ 2,060.00
09/12/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition Preparation.	4.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,040.00
09/14/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with [REDACTED].	1.00	10	675.00	\$ 675.00
09/14/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Document review for experts; communications with document reviewers regarding the same; review letters regarding data questions to determine completion.	2.70	10	435.00	\$ 1,174.50
09/14/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft opposition to Toshiba motion for summary judgment.	2.90	8	435.00	\$ 1,261.50
09/14/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Follow up with Lesley Weaver regarding discovery for governmental entities.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
09/14/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letter with data questions to Toshiba.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
09/14/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call regarding search of documents for indirect purchaser plaintiffs.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
09/14/15	RIM, HISUN	Document review for Toshiba motion for summary judgment.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare cited evidence comparison for M. Pilotin review.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
09/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare coding documents for Econ One review.	1.10	10	325.00	\$ 357.50
09/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re outstanding discovery issues for M. Pilotin.	1.50	2	325.00	\$ 487.50
09/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare translations for H. Rim review.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
09/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize deposition files and exhibits on Text Map.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
09/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
09/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
09/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with B. Glackin regarding Tachihara deposition.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
09/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with counsel for Toshiba regarding certified translation of deposition exhibit.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
09/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with expert regarding documents.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
09/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Deposition and document review planning; correspondence with document reviewers regarding review; correspondence with counsel for direct purchasers regarding the same.	1.90	11	435.00	\$ 826.50
09/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Document review for experts; communications with document reviewers regarding the same.	0.50	7	435.00	\$ 217.50
09/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft letter to counsel for LG Chem regarding data questions and Rule 30(b)(6) deposition.	1.10	11	435.00	\$ 478.50
09/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft opposition to Toshiba motion for summary judgment.	0.10	8	435.00	\$ 43.50
09/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft task list for co-lead weekly call.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
09/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer with Toshiba regarding Indirect Purchaser Plaintiff discovery.	0.60	6	435.00	\$ 261.00
09/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letter with data questions to Toshiba.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
09/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review order regarding deposition of SH Kwak.	0.10	9	435.00	\$ 43.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding data letters; follow up correspondence regarding the same.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
09/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding document translations.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
09/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with H. Rim regarding document review.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
09/15/15	RIM, HISUN	Preparation for Toshiba motion for summary judgment; deposition preparation.	7.40	7	325.00	\$ 2,405.00
09/15/15	RIM, HISUN	Strategy discussion on deposition preparation.	0.60	11	325.00	\$ 195.00
09/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail with Catalyst re load status.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts for attorney review.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
09/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare opt-out information for M. Pilotin review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare product code documents for M. Pilotin review.	1.50	7	325.00	\$ 487.50
09/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar re deposition notices.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense production and prepare for loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
09/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibits and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/16/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Weekly Team call; office conference with M. Pilotin.	0.90	11	675.00	\$ 607.50
09/16/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Download of electronic discovery and copy to alternate media (hard drive)	1.00	7	340.00	\$ 340.00
09/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding deposition exhibits.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
09/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with document reviewers regarding expert document projects; planning document review projects and correspondence with co-counsel and expert regarding the same; weekly telephone call with document reviewers.	2.90	11	435.00	\$ 1,261.50
09/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in meet and confer with LG Chem regarding Rule 30(b)(6) depositions.	0.90	6	435.00	\$ 391.50
09/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in weekly call with co-lead counsel.	0.90	11	435.00	\$ 391.50
09/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare letters to Panasonic, Sanyo, and Sony regarding data questions.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
09/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding data letters; follow up correspondence regarding the same.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
09/16/15	RIM, HISUN	All Reviewer Meeting; Lithium – LCHB weekly document review check-in.	0.30	11	325.00	\$ 97.50
09/16/15	RIM, HISUN	Preparation for Toshiba motion for summary judgment; deposition preparation.	7.70	7	325.00	\$ 2,502.50
09/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense production for loading by Catalyst.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
09/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition exhibit index.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
09/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare documents for Econ One review.	3.20	10	325.00	\$ 1,040.00
09/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare product code documents for M. Pilotin review.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
09/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition exhibit index.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
09/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review verifications and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Emails re class representative discovery.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
09/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Left message for Lesley Weaver.	0.10	11	675.00	\$ 67.50
09/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin regarding case management conference.	0.70	11	675.00	\$ 472.50
09/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jeff Amato; memorandum regarding same.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
09/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with experts regarding data questions and document review.	0.40	10	435.00	\$ 174.00
09/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Document review and correspondence with document reviewers.	0.70	7	435.00	\$ 304.50
09/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in call with co-counsel regarding document collection from clients.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
09/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in telephone call with co-counsel and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding Rule 30(b)(6) topics for Toshiba.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
09/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letters to Panasonic, Sanyo, and Sony regarding data questions; prepare letter to Samsung regarding the same.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
09/17/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding summary judgment opposition.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
09/17/15	RIM, HISUN	Preparation for Toshiba motion for summary judgment; deposition preparation.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
09/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare documents for Econ One review.	4.00	10	325.00	\$ 1,300.00
09/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit data correspondence log.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
09/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
09/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Packer contracts and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
09/18/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jeff Amato; draft correspondence to Jeff Amato regarding defense motion to compel.	0.90	11	675.00	\$ 607.50
09/18/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jeff Amato; telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin; memorandum regarding same (extension of class certification schedule).	0.80	11	675.00	\$ 540.00
09/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Call with co-counsel regarding substitution motion; correspondence with B. Glackin regarding the same.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
09/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Document review planning and correspondence with document reviewers.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
09/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding Hitachi data.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
09/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for Hitachi regarding search terms.	0.10	6	435.00	\$ 43.50
09/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for Sony regarding search terms.	0.10	6	435.00	\$ 43.50
09/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with expert witness about data questions; correspondence with B. Glackin and co-counsel regarding the same; follow up with experts regarding data documents.	0.80	10	435.00	\$ 348.00
09/18/15	RIM, HISUN	Preparation for Toshiba motion for summary judgment; deposition preparation.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail to Catalyst re production loading.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Link deposition exhibits in Text Map.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition exhibit for H. Rim review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcript for H. Rim review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production documents for Econ One review.	3.00	10	325.00	\$ 975.00
09/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production for loading by Catalyst.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
09/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare report documents for M. Pilotin review.	0.80	10	325.00	\$ 260.00
09/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleading and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with document reviewers regarding expert document projects; planning document review projects and correspondence with co-counsel and expert regarding the same.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
09/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise joint case management statement; correspondence with co-counsel regarding the same.	1.70	8	435.00	\$ 739.50
09/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise joint discovery letter regarding discovery from withdrawing class representatives.	0.80	8	435.00	\$ 348.00
09/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review correspondence from defendants regarding expert data; confer with expert and counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding the same; confer with document reviewers regarding review projects for experts.	1.00	11	435.00	\$ 435.00
09/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding Hitachi data letter.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
09/21/15	RIM, HISUN	Preparation for Toshiba motion for summary judgment; deposition preparation.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
09/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.50	4	325.00	\$ 162.50
09/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare documents for Econ One review.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG specification documents for Econ One review.	0.70	10	325.00	\$ 227.50
09/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Samsung specification documents for Econ One review.	1.20	10	325.00	\$ 390.00
09/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re document loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit data correspondence log.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
09/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
09/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
09/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/22/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Duplicate and compare media.	0.80	11	340.00	\$ 272.00
09/22/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Edit brief regarding discovery of deposing class representatives.	0.90	8	675.00	\$ 607.50
09/22/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Edit motion to substitute class representatives; telephone conference with Demetrius Lambrinos; telephone conference with M. Pilotin.	0.80	8	675.00	\$ 540.00
09/22/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
09/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with B. Glackin regarding Tachihara deposition.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
09/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with document reviewers and co-counsel regarding document projects; planning document review projects; telephone call with counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding review of new Toshiba documents; document review.	1.30	7	435.00	\$ 565.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in meet and confer with Panasonic and Sanyo regarding Rule 30(b)(6) deposition topics.	0.80	6	435.00	\$ 348.00
09/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in weekly call with document reviewers; follow up telephone calls with document reviewers.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
09/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise brief regarding class member substitution; confer with B. Glackin regarding the same.	0.80	8	435.00	\$ 348.00
09/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise joint discovery letter regarding discovery from withdrawing class representatives.	0.70	8	435.00	\$ 304.50
09/22/15	RIM, HISUN	All Reviewer Meeting; Lithium – LCHB weekly document review check-in.	0.30	11	325.00	\$ 97.50
09/22/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation; preparation for Toshiba motion for summary judgment.	7.70	7	325.00	\$ 2,502.50
09/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
09/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare client documents for attorney review.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
09/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit data correspondence log.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
09/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.80	9	325.00	\$ 260.00
09/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review NEC production and prepare for loading.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
09/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Panasonic and Sanyo productions and prepare for loading.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
09/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege logs and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/23/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with John Dominguez [REDACTED].	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
09/23/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Work on expert budgeting document; telephone conference with Phil Johnson regarding same.	1.20	11	675.00	\$ 810.00
09/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence and telephone calls with document reviewers about review projects; planning for review projects; send documents to experts.	0.90	11	435.00	\$ 391.50
09/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Meet and confer with Toshiba regarding data questions.	0.60	6	435.00	\$ 261.00
09/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in telephone call with LG Chem regarding Rule 30(b)(6) deposition.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
09/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in team call regarding Rule 30(b)(6) deposition notice for Toshiba; participate in meet and confer regarding the same.	1.60	6	435.00	\$ 696.00
09/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in weekly call with co-lead counsel.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
09/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and edit time entries.	1.40	11	435.00	\$ 609.00
09/23/15	RIM, HISUN	Preparation for Toshiba motion for summary judgment; deposition preparation.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
09/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production encryption.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare documents for expert review.	3.00	10	325.00	\$ 975.00
09/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
09/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
09/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Review prior correspondence with [REDACTED].	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
09/24/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise draft case management conference statement.	2.00	8	675.00	\$ 1,350.00
09/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence and telephone calls with document reviewers about review projects; planning for review projects; send documents to experts.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
09/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding [REDACTED].	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
09/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft letter to Toshiba regarding data questions.	1.50	11	435.00	\$ 652.50
09/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in telephone call with Sony regarding data questions.	1.40	11	435.00	\$ 609.00
09/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise brief on opposition to motion for summary judgment.	0.10	8	435.00	\$ 43.50
09/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise joint case management statement; correspondence with co-counsel regarding the same.	2.60	8	435.00	\$ 1,131.00
09/24/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Aaron Sheanin regarding data questions.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
09/24/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Toshiba documents for attorney review.	0.90	7	325.00	\$ 292.50
09/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to files.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
09/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Toshiba roadmap documents and save to file.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
09/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translation index and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/25/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/approve final revisions to case management conference statement.	0.20	9	675.00	\$ 135.00
09/25/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Check in with H. Rim regarding document review.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
09/25/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with B. Glackin regarding LG Chem Rule 30(b)(6) deposition and staffing; telephone call with Shana Scarlett regarding LG Chem Rule 30(b)(6) deposition.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
09/25/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence and telephone calls with document reviewers about review projects; planning for review projects; send documents to experts.	2.00	11	435.00	\$ 870.00
09/25/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise brief on opposition to motion for summary judgment.	1.00	8	435.00	\$ 435.00
09/25/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise joint case management statement; correspondence with co-counsel regarding the same.	0.50	8	435.00	\$ 217.50
09/25/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review exhibits from Fujitomo and Eguchi depositions; correspondence with Lit Support regarding uploading to CaseMap.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
09/25/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with co-counsel regarding Rule 30(b)(6) topics.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
09/25/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for NEC regarding data.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
09/25/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	5.50	7	260.00	\$ 1,430.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
09/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Toshiba documents for expert review.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
09/25/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/27/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Document review for experts and correspondence with document reviewers regarding projects for experts.	0.70	7	435.00	\$ 304.50
09/27/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise brief on opposition to motion for summary judgment.	1.60	8	435.00	\$ 696.00
09/28/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Set up access to file transfer site; upload documents to CaseMap database.	1.20	11	340.00	\$ 408.00
09/28/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence to Winston & Strawn regarding deposition scheduling; telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin regarding same.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
09/28/15	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Assist attorney with Casemap issue.	1.00	7	340.00	\$ 340.00
09/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Document review for experts and correspondence with document reviewers regarding projects for experts.	0.20	7	435.00	\$ 87.00
09/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise brief on opposition to motion for summary judgment.	6.00	8	435.00	\$ 2,610.00
09/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone calls with co-counsel regarding Takeshima deposition; prepare notice of deposition for Fumitsugu Tachihara; confer with B. Glackin regarding depositions.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00
09/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with co-counsel regarding class representative depositions.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
09/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with co-counsel regarding LG Chem Rule 30(b)(6) deposition and Takeshima deposition; correspondence with B. Glackin regarding the same.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
09/28/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with co-counsel regarding Toshiba Rule 30(b)(6) deposition.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
09/28/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation; Casemap input.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
09/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sony documents for Econ One review.	1.30	10	325.00	\$ 422.50
09/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit draft deposition notice.	0.50	8	325.00	\$ 162.50
09/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
09/29/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Assistance with analysis of data, download from file transfer site and copy data to a flash drive.	1.70	11	340.00	\$ 578.00
09/29/15	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Download documents from sharefile.	1.00	7	340.00	\$ 340.00
09/29/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Check in with H. Rim regarding document review.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
09/29/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with co-counsel regarding production of Toshiba documents.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
09/29/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Document review for experts and correspondence with document reviewers regarding projects for experts.	0.90	7	435.00	\$ 391.50
09/29/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise brief on opposition to motion for summary judgment.	0.70	8	435.00	\$ 304.50
09/29/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise deposition notices; confer with co-counsel regarding the same.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/29/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Select documents for binders for E. Cabraser and B. Glackin for case management conference.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
09/29/15	RIM, HISUN	Document review for deposition preparation.	6.60	7	325.00	\$ 2,145.00
09/29/15	RIM, HISUN	LCHB Weekly Document Review Check-in; check-in call for deposition preparation.	0.50	11	325.00	\$ 162.50
09/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Case management hearing preparation.	1.30	11	325.00	\$ 422.50
09/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail potential class member re case status.	0.10	11	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense documents for expert review.	2.00	10	325.00	\$ 650.00
09/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
09/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery verification and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review LG Chem production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
09/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege logs and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/30/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence and telephone calls with co-counsel regarding planning for depositions; participate in meet and confer with counsel for NEC TOKIN regarding Takeshima deposition	1.00	6	435.00	\$ 435.00
09/30/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review direct purchaser plaintiffs' draft of opposition to summary judgment motion; review and revise indirect purchaser plaintiffs' portion of motion.	3.40	8	435.00	\$ 1,479.00
09/30/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with expert and follow up regarding the same.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
09/30/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation; document review re same.	5.20	7	325.00	\$ 1,690.00
09/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition scheduling.	0.30	4	325.00	\$ 97.50
09/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition notice for service.	1.20	2	325.00	\$ 390.00
09/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare NEC production for loading by Catalyst.	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00
09/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize deposition video files.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
09/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review complaints re Toshiba status for M. Pilotin.	1.10	9	325.00	\$ 357.50
09/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
09/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
09/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
09/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
10/01/15	CABRASER, ELIZABETH	Legal research / prepare for 10/2/15 case management conference.	2.80	11	975.00	\$ 2,730.00
10/01/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with M. Pilotin regarding case management conference.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
10/01/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with Phil Johnson regarding scheduling.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
10/01/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Preparation for case management conference; memorandum to E. Cabraser regarding same.	1.00	11	675.00	\$ 675.00
10/01/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Econ One memorandum regarding scheduling; review M. Pilotin memorandum regarding scheduling.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/01/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with co-leads.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
10/01/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Bruce Simon regarding case management conference.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
10/01/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jennie Anderson regarding case management conference; memorandum regarding same.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
10/01/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson regarding scheduling.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
10/01/15	PILOTIN, MARC		0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
10/01/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence regarding upcoming depositions.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
10/01/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with co-counsel regarding document review; follow up with document reviewers; document review planning.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
10/01/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with expert regarding collected documents; document review for expert witness.	0.70	7	435.00	\$ 304.50
10/01/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in weekly call with co-lead counsel; follow up with E. Cabraser regarding the same; prepare for upcoming case management conference.	2.90	11	435.00	\$ 1,261.50
10/01/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and prepare hard copy delivery of mediation brief.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
10/01/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letter to Hitachi Maxell regarding data questions.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
10/01/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with co-counsel regarding case management conference.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
10/01/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation; Casemap input.	7.00	7	260.00	\$ 1,820.00
10/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Case management hearing preparation.	1.10	11	325.00	\$ 357.50
10/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit data correspondence log.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
10/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
10/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
10/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re deposition scheduling.	0.30	4	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/02/15	CABRASER, ELIZABETH	Confer with B. Glackin re litigation strategy.	0.30	11	975.00	\$ 292.50
10/02/15	CABRASER, ELIZABETH	Pre- and post- CMC conferences with Co-counsel (strategy).	1.30	11	975.00	\$ 1,267.50
10/02/15	CABRASER, ELIZABETH	Prep, attend, participate in Case Management Conference/ex parte conference.	2.50	14	975.00	\$ 2,437.50
10/02/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Case management conference; prepare for same.	4.00	14	675.00	\$ 2,700.00
10/02/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Duplication of electronic discovery.	2.00	7	340.00	\$ 680.00
10/02/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding summary judgment opposition.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
10/02/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft letter to Sony regarding transactional data.	1.50	11	435.00	\$ 652.50
10/02/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Follow up correspondence regarding upcoming depositions; correspondence regarding document review for the same.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
10/02/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Respond to notice of inadvertent production.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/02/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with counsel for Mitsui regarding subpoena on LCHB; follow up regarding the same.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
10/02/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	2.80	7	260.00	\$ 728.00
10/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Sanyo conduct document to co-counsel.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence for M. Pilotin review.	0.20	8	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re LG Chem production loading issues.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
10/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re NEC clawback request.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
10/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoena and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/03/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	1.00	7	260.00	\$ 260.00
10/04/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	0.40	7	260.00	\$ 104.00
10/05/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with B. Glackin and H. Rim regarding Takeshima deposition; telephone call with counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs and opposing counsel regarding the same.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00
10/05/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with Shana Scarlett regarding indirect purchaser plaintiff subpoena on LCHB.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
10/05/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise opposition to Toshiba motion for summary judgment.	3.00	8	435.00	\$ 1,305.00
10/05/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with co-counsel regarding counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding documents for Fukai deposition.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
10/05/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with document reviewers regarding LG Chem roadmap review project; correspondence with document reviewers regarding projects for expert; correspondence with expert regarding documents needed.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
10/05/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation; Casemap Input	7.70	7	260.00	\$ 2,002.00
10/05/15	RIM, HISUN	Planning meeting re Takeshima deposition.	0.30	11	260.00	\$ 78.00
10/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.80	4	325.00	\$ 260.00
10/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare claim purchase information for M. Pilotin.	1.00	9	325.00	\$ 325.00
10/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare counsel contact information for M. Pilotin review.	0.20	11	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense production for loading.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
10/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.30	11	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
10/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoenas and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/06/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN		4.50	11	675.00	\$ 3,037.50
10/06/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Attention to re-organization of database	2.00	7	340.00	\$ 680.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/06/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Check in with H. Rim regarding document review.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
10/06/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with counsel for NEC Corporation regarding Takeshima deposition.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
10/06/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with document reviewers regarding projects for expert; correspondence with expert regarding documents needed.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
10/06/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise opposition to Toshiba motion for summary judgment.	1.00	8	435.00	\$ 435.00
10/06/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation; CaseMap input.	7.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,275.00
10/06/15	RIM, HISUN	Lithium – LCHB weekly document review check-in.	0.20	11	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.30	4	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class purchase information for M. Pilotin review.	1.50	8	325.00	\$ 487.50
10/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense production for loading.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
10/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	11	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	8	325.00	\$ 130.00
10/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review expert retainer and save to file.	0.10	10	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoenas and save to file.	0.40	8	325.00	\$ 130.00
10/07/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Assist with preparation for Fukai deposition.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00
10/07/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Attend Fukai deposition.	1.30	4	435.00	\$ 565.50
10/07/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for weekly meeting with co-lead counsel; correspondence regarding the same.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
10/07/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letter to Sony regarding data questions.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
10/07/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise opposition to motion for summary judgment; telephone call with co-counsel regarding the same.	1.00	8	435.00	\$ 435.00
10/07/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review draft request for admission to Toshiba; correspondence with co-counsel regarding the same.	0.30	9	435.00	\$ 130.50
10/07/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review opposition to motion to amend complaint; draft reply brief; legal research for the same.	3.60	8	435.00	\$ 1,566.00
10/07/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba- Fukai Deposition.	12.00	4	260.00	\$ 3,120.00
10/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.10	4	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading.	1.50	7	325.00	\$ 487.50
10/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare filings for M. Pilotin review.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize production files.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
10/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Econ One invoice and save to file.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/08/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review and respond to emails regarding hearing, settlement and deposition protocol.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
10/08/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Assist with preparation for Fukai deposition.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
10/08/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with document reviewers, co-counsel, and counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding document review.	1.50	11	435.00	\$ 652.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/08/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise opposition to LG Chem's motion for relief.	0.60	8	435.00	\$ 261.00
10/08/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise request for admission.	0.20	8	435.00	\$ 87.00
10/08/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review opposition to motion to amend complaint; draft reply brief; legal research for the same; confer with B. Glackin regarding the same.	5.50	8	435.00	\$ 2,392.50
10/08/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba- Fukai Deposition.	10.80	4	260.00	\$ 2,808.00
10/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re state plaintiffs for M. Pilotin.	1.20	9	325.00	\$ 390.00
10/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Toshiba roadmap documents for M. Pilotin review.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
10/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
10/09/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Assist with preparation for Fukai deposition.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
10/09/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft reply brief in support of motion to withdraw and substitute.	6.10	8	435.00	\$ 2,653.50
10/09/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Mika Otsubo regarding document review project; correspondence with other document reviewers regarding review.	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
10/09/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba- Fukai Deposition.	11.80	4	260.00	\$ 3,068.00
10/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense documents for Econ One review.	0.30	10	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare motion to dismiss order for M. Pilotin review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sony production for co-counsel review.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
10/11/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with expert regarding document review; correspondence with document reviewers regarding review projects.	0.90	11	435.00	\$ 391.50
10/11/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft reply brief in support of motion to withdraw and substitute.	7.70	8	435.00	\$ 3,349.50
10/12/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with M. Pilotin regarding brief regarding plaintiffs.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
10/12/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise reply brief re class representative substitutions.	1.80	8	675.00	\$ 1,215.00
10/12/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with expert regarding document review; correspondence with document reviewers regarding review projects.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
10/12/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise reply brief in support of motion to withdraw and substitute.	6.50	8	435.00	\$ 2,827.50
10/12/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	9.10	7	260.00	\$ 2,366.00
10/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re status of reproductions.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
10/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare orders re class representatives for M. Pilotin review.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
10/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
10/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit data correspondence log.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
10/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	1.00	9	325.00	\$ 325.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	1.00	9	325.00	\$ 325.00
10/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review opposition to motion for relief and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/13/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with M. Pilotin regarding brief and deposition scheduling.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
10/13/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise brief.	0.70	8	675.00	\$ 472.50
10/13/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise reply brief re substitution issue.	1.80	8	675.00	\$ 1,215.00
10/13/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
10/13/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Check in with H. Rim regarding document review.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
10/13/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with expert regarding document review; correspondence with document reviewers regarding review projects.	0.90	11	435.00	\$ 391.50
10/13/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Participate in coordination call with direct action plaintiffs.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
10/13/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise reply brief in support of motion to withdraw and substitute.	4.00	8	435.00	\$ 1,740.00
10/13/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	7.70	7	260.00	\$ 2,002.00
10/13/15	RIM, HISUN	LCHB weekly document review check-in.	0.30	11	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re reproduction overlay.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare contract documents for attorney review.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
10/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG documents for M. Pilotin review.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare reply brief re motion to remove for filing.	3.00	8	325.00	\$ 975.00
10/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare reproduction overlays for Catalyst.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review answers to complaints and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
10/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery verification and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/14/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with expert regarding document review; correspondence with document reviewers regarding review projects.	0.70	11	435.00	\$ 304.50
10/14/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft weekly task list.	0.30	11	435.00	\$ 130.50
10/14/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation; Casemap input.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
10/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re status of NEC document issues.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re reproduction status.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re motion to substitute reply.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
10/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare document review index for M. Pilotin.	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00
10/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review catalog documents and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review complaint responses and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
10/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re production overlap and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00
10/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review procedures re adding users to translation folder on Share File.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re NEC document issues.	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00
10/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with expert regarding document review; correspondence with document reviewers regarding review projects.	0.90	11	435.00	\$ 391.50
10/15/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Travel to, attend, and travel from hearing regarding motion to compel.	1.90	14	435.00	\$ 826.50
10/15/15	RIM, HISUN	Take deposition.	10.60	4	325.00	\$ 3,445.00
10/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare documents for Econ One review.	1.30	10	325.00	\$ 422.50
10/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re NEC native file issues with Catalyst.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
10/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re reproduction issues.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
10/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Palo Alto production and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/16/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Steve Williams regarding [REDACTED].	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
10/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with counsel for NEC regarding Takeshima deposition.	0.10	11	435.00	\$ 43.50
10/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise opposition to Toshiba motion for summary judgment.	2.70	8	435.00	\$ 1,174.50
10/16/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review data letters to experts; correspondence with experts regarding additional documents; correspondence with document reviewers regarding document review for experts.	1.20	11	435.00	\$ 522.00
10/16/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba- Kubo Deposition.	11.10	4	260.00	\$ 2,886.00
10/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare index of potential deposition documents.	0.60	4	325.00	\$ 195.00
10/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re NEC production issues.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleading and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/18/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with document reviewers regarding review projects.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
10/19/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with Direct Purchaser Plaintiff and Indirect Purchaser Plaintiff counsel.	1.00	11	675.00	\$ 675.00
10/19/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with B. Glackin and B. Troxel regarding case.	0.20	11	435.00	\$ 87.00
10/19/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone with co-counsel and counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding deposition planning.	1.40	11	435.00	\$ 609.00
10/19/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation, and Casemap input.	5.90	7	260.00	\$ 1,534.00
10/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Log documents re financial statements and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts for B. Glackin review.	1.30	9	325.00	\$ 422.50
10/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare filings re class representative substitution for B. Glackin review.	1.00	9	325.00	\$ 325.00
10/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare NEC documents for translation.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re NEC production document issues.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit data correspondence log.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.80	9	325.00	\$ 260.00
10/20/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Duplicate, compare and create label for hard drives.	2.00	11	340.00	\$ 680.00
10/20/15	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate and obtain Lexis cases for B. Troxel.	0.40	11	290.00	\$ 116.00
10/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Check in with H. Rim regarding document review.	0.50	7	435.00	\$ 217.50
10/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with counsel for Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding expert letters; correspondence with opposing counsel regarding the same.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00
10/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with document reviewers regarding review projects.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
10/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and draft supplemental responses to Toshiba requests for admission.	0.10	3	435.00	\$ 43.50
10/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise opposition to Toshiba motion for summary judgment.	0.40	8	435.00	\$ 174.00
10/20/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise Takeshima deposition notice; correspondence with co-counsel and opposing counsel regarding the same.	0.60	2	435.00	\$ 261.00
10/20/15	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Filing preparation re opposition to summary judgment.	0.20	8	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case authorities re class representative substitution and discovery for B. Glackin review.	3.00	9	325.00	\$ 975.00
10/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence for M. Pilotin review.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition notice for service.	1.00	8	325.00	\$ 325.00
10/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with document reviewers regarding review projects; coordination regarding depositions.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
10/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and draft supplemental responses to Toshiba requests for admission.	1.20	3	435.00	\$ 522.00
10/21/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review documents for opposition to motion for summary judgment.	0.70	9	435.00	\$ 304.50
10/21/15	RIM, HISUN	Prepare for Toshiba motion for summary judgment.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
10/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading by Catalyst.	0.70	7	325.00	\$ 227.50
10/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts for attorney review.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
10/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.10	8	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review NEC production re native file issues.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translation objections and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/22/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Lead counsel team call.	0.60	11	675.00	\$ 405.00
10/22/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Attend weekly co-lead call.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
10/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Prepare for and participate in weekly call with co-counsel.	0.90	11	435.00	\$ 391.50
10/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise opposition to Toshiba motion for summary judgment.	3.40	8	435.00	\$ 1,479.00
10/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise supplemental interrogatory response to LG Chem.	0.10	3	435.00	\$ 43.50
10/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with NEC Tokin regarding data questions.	0.50	11	435.00	\$ 217.50
10/22/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with NEC Tokin regarding data questions; review draft letter to NEC Corporation regarding data letters.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
10/22/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba motion for summary judgment preparation; deposition preparation; Casemap input.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Filing preparation re opposition to summary judgment motion.	2.00	8	325.00	\$ 650.00
10/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense production for loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts for attorney review.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
10/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery response for service.	0.50	3	325.00	\$ 162.50
10/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare notice of withdrawal for M. Pilotin review.	0.10	8	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	8	325.00	\$ 130.00
10/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re outstanding defense productions.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/23/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assistance with duplication of electronic discovery.	2.00	7	340.00	\$ 680.00
10/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with expert and co-counsel regarding document review; correspondence with correspondence with document reviewers regarding the same.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00
10/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise letter to Sony regarding data.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
10/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise opposition to Toshiba motion for summary judgment.	3.00	8	435.00	\$ 1,305.00
10/23/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Telephone call with Sony regarding data questions.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
10/23/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba motion for summary judgment preparation; deposition preparation.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re document loading.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
10/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading by Catalyst.	1.20	7	325.00	\$ 390.00
10/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts and exhibits for attorney review.	2.00	9	325.00	\$ 650.00
10/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare plea agreement for M. Pilotin review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sony production for M. Pilotin review.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
10/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
10/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibits and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/25/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise supplemental brief.	0.50	8	675.00	\$ 337.50
10/26/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise supplement brief regarding Kwak; review Batteries correspondence.	0.50	8	675.00	\$ 337.50
10/26/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jim McGinnis; office conference with M. Pilotin.	0.70	11	675.00	\$ 472.50
10/26/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and research Toshiba Motion for Summary Judgment.	1.60	8	515.00	\$ 824.00
10/26/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with D. Harvey regarding opposition to motion for summary judgment.	0.60	11	435.00	\$ 261.00
10/26/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Confer with Samsung SDI regarding case issues and proffer.	0.80	11	435.00	\$ 348.00
10/26/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Correspondence with experts regarding document review; correspondence with document reviewers regarding document review.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
10/26/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Draft letter to counsel for Panasonic and Sanyo regarding data letter.	0.40	11	435.00	\$ 174.00
10/26/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise opposition to Toshiba motion for summary judgment.	0.60	8	435.00	\$ 261.00
10/26/15	PILOTIN, MARC	Review and revise opposition to Toshiba motion for summary judgment; confer with D. Harvey regarding the same.	0.90	8	435.00	\$ 391.50
10/26/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba motion for summary judgment preparation; deposition preparation.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
10/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production encryption issue.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.30	8	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.30	8	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege log and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/26/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Review email correspondence regarding discovery and class certification.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
10/27/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for hearing; correspondence regarding amending complaint.	1.50	11	675.00	\$ 1,012.50
10/27/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for hearing on class representative substitution/discovery; telephone conference with Phil Johnson; telephone conference with Ed Leamer.	1.50	11	675.00	\$ 1,012.50
10/27/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with M. Pilotin and H. Rim re Toshiba document review and other discovery issues, research same.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
10/27/15	RIM, HISUN	Lithium – LCHB Weekly Document Review Check-in.	0.60	11	260.00	\$ 156.00
10/27/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba motion for summary judgment preparation; deposition preparation.	7.40	7	325.00	\$ 2,405.00
10/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.50	4	325.00	\$ 162.50
10/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare briefing re class certification opposition for B. Glackin review.	1.00	9	325.00	\$ 325.00
10/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense documents for Econ One review.	0.20	10	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production documents for review by Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs' counsel.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
10/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/27/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoena and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/28/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for hearing.	1.20	14	675.00	\$ 810.00
10/28/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for hearing; team call with Steve Williams; review October 2014 order; telephone conference with Jeff Amato.	2.40	14	675.00	\$ 1,620.00
10/28/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba motion for summary judgment opposition preparation; deposition preparation; document review re same.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	1.00	4	325.00	\$ 325.00
10/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Discovery hearing preparation.	0.30	14	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Discovery letter hearing preparation.	0.20	14	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading issues.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
10/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production documents for review by Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs' counsel.	2.00	7	325.00	\$ 650.00
10/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Toshiba production for loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
10/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re production encryption issues.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/29/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba motion for summary judgment opposition preparation; deposition preparation.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re production loading.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production documents for review by Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs' counsel.	1.50	7	325.00	\$ 487.50
10/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare productions for loading by Catalyst.	1.40	7	325.00	\$ 455.00
10/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
10/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar re pending deadlines.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
10/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
10/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/30/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Hearing on substituting plaintiffs; prepare for same.	2.00	14	675.00	\$ 1,350.00
10/30/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
10/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts and exhibits for Text Map.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re documents for Direct Purchaser Plaintiff counsel.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
10/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review transcripts and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/02/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Download, prepare data and upload to CaseMap.	0.60	11	340.00	\$ 204.00
11/02/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise draft opp'n to Toshiba MSJ.	2.30	8	515.00	\$ 1,184.50
11/02/15	RIM, HISUN	Casemap input; deposition preparation.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
11/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts and exhibits for attorney review.	1.50	9	325.00	\$ 487.50
11/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
11/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege log and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re discovery documents for Direct Purchaser counsel.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
11/03/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Duplicate media and create hard drive label.	0.80	11	340.00	\$ 272.00
11/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with M. Pilotin regarding status of case and upcoming deadlines.	1.00	11	490.00	\$ 490.00
11/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Review task list.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
11/03/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise opposition to Toshiba motion for summary judgment.	5.30	8	515.00	\$ 2,729.50
11/03/15	RIM, HISUN	Casemap input; deposition preparation; Toshiba motion for summary judgment opposition preparation.	6.50	7	325.00	\$ 2,112.50
11/03/15	RIM, HISUN	Lithium: LCHB check-in for Toshiba motion for summary judgment opposition.	0.10	11	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare documents for Direct Purchase counsel review.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
11/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
11/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/04/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Duplicate flash drive and hard drive. Create label and compare files.	1.50	11	340.00	\$ 510.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

From 06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To 02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/04/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN		2.50	12	675.00	\$ 1,687.50
11/04/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call; [REDACTED]	0.90	11	675.00	\$ 607.50
11/04/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Lesley Weaver; emails with Steve Williams and Jeff Friedman regarding deposition schedule; review deposition schedule and task list.	1.40	11	675.00	\$ 945.00
11/04/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Attend co-lead class counsel case management call.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
11/04/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise opposition to Toshiba motion for summary judgment (1.8), conference with co-counsel re same (.7).	2.50	8	515.00	\$ 1,287.50
11/04/15	RIM, HISUN	Casemap Input; deposition preparation; Toshiba motion for summary judgment opposition preparation.	7.60	7	260.00	\$ 1,976.00
11/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re downloading encryption issues.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
11/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re loading status.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
11/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to court reporter re transcript order issues.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Order hearing transcript.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
11/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition exhibits for Text Map.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
11/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts for attorney review.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LCD trial filings for B. Glackin review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare protective order for B. Glackin review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
11/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
11/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Econ One invoice and save to file.	0.10	10	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review production files and prepare for loading.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
11/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/05/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise opposition to Toshiba's motion for summary judgment, conference with co-counsel re same.	3.40	8	515.00	\$ 1,751.00
11/05/15	RIM, HISUN	Casemap Input; Toshiba Motion for Summary Judgment Opposition Preparation.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production overlay.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading by Catalyst.	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00
11/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare documents for Direct Purchaser counsel review.	1.50	7	325.00	\$ 487.50
11/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleading and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/05/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/06/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with co-counsel and MCA counsel re potential motion for summary judgment, research same.	0.60	6	515.00	\$ 309.00
11/06/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Research evidence re opposition to Toshiba MSJ.	1.30	8	515.00	\$ 669.50
11/06/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba motion for summary judgment opposition preparation.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
11/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re NEC clawback.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re load status.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare documents for Direct Purchaser review.	2.50	7	325.00	\$ 812.50
11/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.70	9	325.00	\$ 227.50
11/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery requests and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/06/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege log and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/08/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba motion for summary judgment opposition preparation.	1.60	7	325.00	\$ 520.00
11/09/15	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Pull requested slip opinion per L. Chan.	0.30	11	325.00	\$ 97.50
11/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with D. Harvey, Jessica Moy, Mary Russell regarding opposition to Motion for Summary Judgment.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
11/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding case status.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
11/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with D. Harvey regarding case status.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
11/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with D. Harvey regarding Toshiba summary judgment motion.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
11/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding Opposition to motion for summary judgment.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
11/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft administrative motion to seal, including reviewing local and chamber rules; confer with Jessica Moy regarding same.	2.60	8	490.00	\$ 1,274.00
11/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze Fujitomo deposition transcript.	1.50	9	490.00	\$ 735.00
11/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise Toshiba summary judgment opposition brief, including reviewing supporting evidence.	1.50	8	490.00	\$ 735.00
11/09/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jeff Friedman and Steve Williams.	0.70	11	675.00	\$ 472.50
11/09/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Duplication of electronic discovery.	1.00	7	340.00	\$ 340.00
11/09/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Research and revise opposition to Toshiba MSJ and supporting papers, conference with co-counsel, L. Chan, and B. Glackin re same.	2.60	8	515.00	\$ 1,339.00
11/09/15	RIM, HISUN	Toshiba motion for summary judgment opposition preparation; deposition preparation.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
11/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Filing preparation re opposition to Toshiba summary judgment motion.	1.20	8	325.00	\$ 390.00
11/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare roadmap documents for Direct Purchaser counsel review.	2.00	7	325.00	\$ 650.00
11/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
11/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
11/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re document clawback.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re motion dates for L. Chan.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
11/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise and perform legal research for opposition to Toshiba's motion for summary judgment.	8.90	8	490.00	\$ 4,361.00
11/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise letter regarding MCA summary judgment motion.	0.30	8	490.00	\$ 147.00
11/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum to team regarding EconOne update.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
11/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
11/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review discovery rule cases; memorandum to team regarding same.	1.00	11	675.00	\$ 675.00
11/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft Toshiba opposition to summary judgment; give edits to L. Chan.	1.10	9	675.00	\$ 742.50
11/10/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise opp'n to motion for summary judgment and supporting papers, conference with co-counsel re same.	2.60	8	515.00	\$ 1,339.00
11/10/15	RIM, HISUN	Preparation of opposition to Toshiba motion for summary judgment; deposition preparation.	9.50	7	260.00	\$ 2,470.00
11/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.30	4	325.00	\$ 97.50
11/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Filing preparation re opposition to Toshiba summary judgment.	2.00	8	325.00	\$ 650.00
11/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading by Catalyst.	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00
11/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead strategy call.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
11/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Gabe Zeldin regarding administrative motion to seal.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
11/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
11/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise letter re MCA motion for summary judgment.	0.10	8	490.00	\$ 49.00
11/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Review documents for Toshiba motion for summary judgment opposition; draft statement of facts; draft opposition brief.	7.00	8	490.00	\$ 3,430.00
11/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Review email correspondence re discovery matters.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
11/11/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise brief (Toshiba motion).	2.60	8	675.00	\$ 1,755.00
11/11/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with co-counsel.	0.70	11	675.00	\$ 472.50
11/11/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Duplication of electronic discovery media.	3.00	7	340.00	\$ 1,020.00
11/11/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Review, research, and revise opp'n to Toshina MSJ motion and supporting papers, conference with co-counsel re same.	9.60	8	515.00	\$ 4,944.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/11/15	RIM, HISUN	Preparation of opposition to Toshiba motion for summary judgment; deposition preparation.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.80	4	325.00	\$ 260.00
11/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Opposition to Toshiba summary judgment preparation.	0.60	8	325.00	\$ 195.00
11/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case filings for D. Harvey review.	0.60	8	325.00	\$ 195.00
11/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare complaints for D. Harvey review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
11/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts for attorney review.	1.00	9	325.00	\$ 325.00
11/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize deposition files.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize production files.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/12/15	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Pull case 623 F2d 627 per L. Chan.	0.20	11	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding Tachihara deposition preparation.	0.20	4	490.00	\$ 98.00
11/12/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft Opposition to Toshiba's motion for summary judgment and related administrative motion to seal, including preparing for filing and reviewing documents; conference with D. Harvey and B. Troxel regarding same.	11.70	8	490.00	\$ 5,733.00
11/12/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Legal research regarding discovery rule.	0.90	11	675.00	\$ 607.50
11/12/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Revise and research opposition to Toshiba MSJ and supporting papers, conference with co-counsel re same.	7.20	8	515.00	\$ 3,708.00
11/12/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	7.90	7	260.00	\$ 2,054.00
11/12/15	RIM, HISUN	LCHB check-in for deposition preparation.	0.10	11	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.50	4	325.00	\$ 162.50
11/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/12/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Filing preparation re opposition to summary judgment.	6.50	8	325.00	\$ 2,112.50
11/13/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft brief and supporting papers, including reviewing evidence.	16.60	8	490.00	\$ 8,134.00
11/13/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Final review of Toshiba summary judgment opposition; office conference with L. Chan regarding same.	0.50	9	675.00	\$ 337.50
11/13/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise opposition to Toshiba motion for summary judgment and supporting papers, conference with co-counsel re same, supervise e-filing of same.	7.30	8	515.00	\$ 3,759.50
11/13/15	O'ROURKE SCANLON, SUZANNE	Assist with filing of motion for summary judgment.	1.50	8	325.00	\$ 487.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/13/15	O'ROURKE SCANLON, SUZANNE	Prepare exhibits for motion for summary judgment filing.	2.00	8	325.00	\$ 650.00
11/13/15	O'ROURKE SCANLON, SUZANNE	Read email from B. Troxel; look at exhibits on P-drive for filing.	0.10	8	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/13/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
11/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Filing preparation re opposition to Toshiba summary judgment motion.	8.00	8	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
11/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/13/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/16/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Prepare deposition exhibits and load to CaseMap database.	0.50	11	340.00	\$ 170.00
11/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and Jessica Moy regarding Tachihara deposition.	0.50	4	490.00	\$ 245.00
11/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding preparation for Tachihara deposition.	0.30	4	490.00	\$ 147.00
11/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Troxel and D. Harvey regarding motion to seal.	1.40	11	490.00	\$ 686.00
11/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding Tachihara deposition.	0.10	4	490.00	\$ 49.00
11/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
11/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare and review chamber's copy of Plaintiffs' Opposition to Toshiba Summary Judgment Motion.	0.90	8	490.00	\$ 441.00
11/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Tachihara deposition, including reviewing documents.	0.80	4	490.00	\$ 392.00
11/16/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
11/16/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson.	0.60	11	675.00	\$ 405.00
11/16/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with L. Chan re opposition to Toshiba motion for summary judgment.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
11/16/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation, including document review.	7.80	7	325.00	\$ 2,535.00
11/16/15	RIM, HISUN	LCHB check-in for deposition preparation.	0.20	11	260.00	\$ 52.00
11/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	1.00	4	325.00	\$ 325.00
11/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/16/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re opposition to summary judgment.	6.80	8	325.00	\$ 2,210.00
11/17/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Format, duplicate and compare media.	1.50	11	340.00	\$ 510.00
11/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list; draft email correspondence regarding same.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
11/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Tachihara deposition, including reviewing potential exhibits.	1.80	4	490.00	\$ 882.00
11/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Takeshima deposition.	1.80	4	675.00	\$ 1,215.00
11/17/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation, including document review.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
11/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.40	4	325.00	\$ 130.00
11/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail court reporter re hearing transcript.	0.10	14	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading status.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
11/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production loading status index for Catalyst review.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize pleadings files.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
11/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
11/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense production and prepare for loading.	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00
11/17/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft email correspondence to Court regarding Opposition to Toshiba Motion for Summary Judgment.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
11/18/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jeff Friedman regarding experts.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
11/18/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Attention to upload of electronic discovery documents into electronic discovery database.	2.00	7	340.00	\$ 680.00
11/18/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation, including document review.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
11/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	3.00	4	325.00	\$ 975.00
11/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail court reporter re transcript status.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare filings for L. Chan review.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
11/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production overlay for Catalyst.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
11/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
11/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition errata and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production duplicates by Catalyst.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/18/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoena and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Tachihara deposition, including reviewing documents, Casemap reports; confer with H. Rim regarding same.	1.00	4	490.00	\$ 490.00
11/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Takeshima deposition, including reviewing documents; confer with H. Rim regarding same.	2.10	4	490.00	\$ 1,029.00
11/19/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Upload of depositions and other electronic discovery materials into electronic discovery database.	5.00	7	340.00	\$ 1,700.00
11/19/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation, including document review.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
11/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	3.00	4	325.00	\$ 975.00
11/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail to Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare roadmap documents for Direct Purchaser counsel review.	2.00	7	325.00	\$ 650.00
11/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/19/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/20/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review, sign Sony settlement agreement.	0.30	12	675.00	\$ 202.50
11/20/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on
Timekeeper: all

From 06/01/13
To 02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/20/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation, including document review.	7.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,275.00
11/20/15	RIM, HISUN	LCHB check-in for deposition preparation.	1.00	11	260.00	\$ 260.00
11/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	5.00	4	325.00	\$ 1,625.00
11/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail court reporter re hearing transcript.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
11/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
11/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
11/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review settlement agreement and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/20/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/21/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation, including document review.	4.60	7	325.00	\$ 1,495.00
11/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Tachihara deposition, including drafting outline, reviewing documents.	6.10	4	490.00	\$ 2,989.00
11/22/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation, including document review.	4.50	7	325.00	\$ 1,462.50
11/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Tachihara deposition, including review documents and drafting memorandum; confer with B. Glackin regarding same.	2.90	4	490.00	\$ 1,421.00
11/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Takeshima deposition, including reviewing documents, drafting deposition outline.	1.70	4	490.00	\$ 833.00
11/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise motion to compel regarding Donny Lee.	0.10	8	490.00	\$ 49.00
11/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Review hearing transcript regarding class representatives; draft email correspondence regarding same.	0.40	9	490.00	\$ 196.00
11/23/15	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate and obtain docket for L. Chan.	0.20	11	290.00	\$ 58.00
11/23/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation, including document review.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
11/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	5.80	4	325.00	\$ 1,885.00
11/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
11/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding Tachihara deposition.	0.20	4	490.00	\$ 98.00
11/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Tachihara deposition, including reviewing new documents.	0.30	4	490.00	\$ 147.00
11/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Takeshima deposition; including reviewing documents, drafting memorandum, and conference with Jessica Moy and B. Glackin.	8.10	4	490.00	\$ 3,969.00
11/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Review letter brief and attached exhibits.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
11/24/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Tachihara deposition.	3.70	4	675.00	\$ 2,497.50
11/24/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation, including document review.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
11/24/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	10.00	4	325.00	\$ 3,250.00
11/25/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin and Jessica Moy regarding Tachihara deposition.	0.80	4	490.00	\$ 392.00
11/25/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ben Shiftan regarding Takeshima deposition; confer with H. Rim regarding same.	0.70	4	490.00	\$ 343.00
11/25/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/25/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Tachihara deposition, including reviewing documents and conference with H. Rim and S. O'Roarke Scanlon.	2.30	4	490.00	\$ 1,127.00
11/25/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Takeshima deposition.	0.40	4	490.00	\$ 196.00
11/25/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare Notice of Substitution of Counsel for J.A. Kruse and D. Harvey, including reviewing local rules and email correspondence regarding same.	0.70	8	490.00	\$ 343.00
11/25/15	CHAN, LIN	Review prior orders for motion to amend.	0.50	8	490.00	\$ 245.00
11/25/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Tachihara deposition; review motion to amend; meet with Jessica Moy.	7.50	4	675.00	\$ 5,062.50
11/25/15	O'ROURKE SCANLON, SUZANNE	Assemble deposition binders.	9.00	4	325.00	\$ 2,925.00
11/25/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	10.30	4	325.00	\$ 3,347.50
11/26/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation, including document review.	3.20	7	325.00	\$ 1,040.00
11/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Tachihara deposition.	2.80	4	490.00	\$ 1,372.00
11/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Takeshima deposition.	4.50	4	490.00	\$ 2,205.00
11/27/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft/revise motion to amend complaint.	2.50	8	675.00	\$ 1,687.50
11/27/15	MIARMI, MICHAEL	E-mail correspondence with B. Glackin re American Pipe issues.	0.10	8	550.00	\$ 55.00
11/27/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation, including document review.	0.70	7	325.00	\$ 227.50
11/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Takeshima deposition.	4.80	4	490.00	\$ 2,352.00
11/28/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Matsumoto transcript for Tachihara deposition preparation.	4.40	4	675.00	\$ 2,970.00
11/28/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation, including document review.	1.90	7	325.00	\$ 617.50
11/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Tachihara deposition, including reviewing translations.	0.60	4	490.00	\$ 294.00
11/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Takeshima deposition.	2.60	4	490.00	\$ 1,274.00
11/29/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Deposition preparation for Tachihara deposition.	4.70	4	675.00	\$ 3,172.50
11/29/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation, including document review.	7.80	7	325.00	\$ 2,535.00
11/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference call with Demetrius Lambrinos and check interpreter re Takeshima and other depositions.	0.60	4	490.00	\$ 294.00
11/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin, H. Rim, B. Troxel re Tachihara deposition.	0.30	4	490.00	\$ 147.00
11/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Jeffrey Amato, B. Glackin, and H. Rim re Tachihara deposition.	0.40	4	490.00	\$ 196.00
11/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Troxel re Tachihara deposition preparation.	0.20	4	490.00	\$ 98.00
11/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy re Tachihara deposition.	0.40	4	490.00	\$ 196.00
11/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re expert data questions.	0.50	10	490.00	\$ 245.00
11/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Tachihara deposition, including reviewing documents.	3.70	4	490.00	\$ 1,813.00
11/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise motion to amend.	1.70	8	490.00	\$ 833.00
11/30/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with H. Rim and L. Chan regarding Tachihara deposition.	0.50	4	675.00	\$ 337.50
11/30/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare Tachihara deposition; telephone conference with Mike Hamburger regarding amendment of complaint.	6.10	11	675.00	\$ 4,117.50
11/30/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jeff Amato regarding Tachihara.	0.50	4	675.00	\$ 337.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/30/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation, including document review.	6.80	7	325.00	\$ 2,210.00
11/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	10.50	4	325.00	\$ 3,412.50
12/01/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Duplicate and compare of production materials.	2.00	11	340.00	\$ 680.00
12/01/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
12/01/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Tachihara deposition.	4.70	4	490.00	\$ 2,303.00
12/01/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Takeshima deposition.	0.10	4	490.00	\$ 49.00
12/01/15	CHAN, LIN	Travel for Tachihara deposition.	7.50	4	490.00	\$ 3,675.00
12/01/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Travel to and prepare for deposition of Fumitsugu Tachihara.	10.60	4	675.00	\$ 7,155.00
12/01/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	12.50	7	260.00	\$ 3,250.00
12/01/15	TAYLOR, JAMES	Deposition preparation: review exhibit folders; print additional exhibits; update counsels' materials.	5.00	7	305.00	\$ 1,525.00
12/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	5.00	4	325.00	\$ 1,625.00
12/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
12/01/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review productions and prepare for loading.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
12/02/15	CHAN, LIN	Second chair Tachihara deposition.	11.50	4	490.00	\$ 5,635.00
12/02/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Deposition of Fumitsugu Tachihara; prepare for same.	10.70	11	675.00	\$ 7,222.50
12/02/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation, including document review.	6.70	7	325.00	\$ 2,177.50
12/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	4.50	4	325.00	\$ 1,462.50
12/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
12/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading issues.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
12/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare notice of substitution for service.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
12/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare productions for loading by Catalyst.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
12/02/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
12/03/15	CHAN, LIN	Second chair Tachihara deposition.	9.50	4	490.00	\$ 4,655.00
12/03/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Deposition of Fumitsugu Tachihara. Return travel from same.	15.00	4	675.00	\$ 10,125.00
12/03/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation, including document review.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
12/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	4.00	4	325.00	\$ 1,300.00
12/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
12/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading issues.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
12/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re NEC clawback.	0.90	7	325.00	\$ 292.50
12/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
12/03/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Second chair Tachihara deposition.	8.00	4	490.00	\$ 3,920.00
12/04/15	CHAN, LIN	Travel from Tachihara deposition.	9.00	4	490.00	\$ 4,410.00
12/04/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Continued return travel from deposition of Fumitsugu Tachihara.	6.50	4	675.00	\$ 4,387.50
12/04/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Teleconf. Aaron Shearin re Tachihara deposition.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
12/04/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Attention to administration of electronic discovery database.	2.00	7	340.00	\$ 680.00
12/04/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	5.50	4	325.00	\$ 1,787.50
12/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading status.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
12/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re NEC clawback.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/04/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/05/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Takeshima deposition.	3.80	4	490.00	\$ 1,862.00
12/05/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/06/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/07/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Organize and prepare interrogatories responses and deposition transcripts; upload these data to CaseMap.	2.00	11	340.00	\$ 680.00
12/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead strategy call.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
12/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re casemap and discovery.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
12/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Jones re casemap.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
12/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list; confer with B. Glackin re discovery and class certification.	0.70	11	490.00	\$ 343.00
12/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re Takeshima and Chung depositions and class certification.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
12/07/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Takeshima deposition, including reviewing documents and confer with H. Rim.	3.70	4	490.00	\$ 1,813.00
12/07/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re Takeshima deposition.	0.30	4	675.00	\$ 202.50
12/07/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call; team meeting.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
12/07/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Ed Leamer; review Takeshima documents; telephone conference with Phil Johnson, Jeff Friedman and Demetrius Lambrinos.	1.60	11	675.00	\$ 1,080.00
12/07/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
12/07/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Import of deposition designations.	6.00	7	340.00	\$ 2,040.00
12/07/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Participate in weekly co-lead conference call.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
12/07/15	JONES, KAREN	Analyze evidence and input into Case Map.	6.00	11	515.00	\$ 3,090.00
12/07/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	7.60	7	260.00	\$ 1,976.00
12/07/15	RIM, HISUN	LCHB check-in for deposition preparation.	0.40	4	325.00	\$ 130.00
12/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	5.10	4	325.00	\$ 1,657.50
12/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Remove privileged materials per NEC clawback request.	1.20	7	325.00	\$ 390.00
12/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/07/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
12/08/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery issues.	0.10	11	490.00	\$ 49.00
12/08/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Takeshima deposition, including reviewing documents and conference with B. Glackin.	8.70	4	490.00	\$ 4,263.00
12/08/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re Takeshima deposition.	1.30	4	675.00	\$ 877.50
12/08/15	GRANT, ANTHONY	Administration of electronic discovery database. Assistance with upgrade.	2.00	7	340.00	\$ 680.00
12/08/15	JONES, KAREN	Analyze evidence and input into Case Map.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
12/08/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation, including document review.	8.00	7	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
12/08/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	6.00	4	325.00	\$ 1,950.00
12/09/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Takeshima deposition, including reviewing documents.	8.20	4	490.00	\$ 4,018.00
12/09/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with lawyers taking Chung deposition.	0.60	4	675.00	\$ 405.00
12/09/15	JONES, KAREN	Analyzing evidence and inputting into Case Map.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
12/09/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation.	8.00	7	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
12/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	5.50	4	325.00	\$ 1,787.50
12/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
12/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/09/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
12/10/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for and take Takeshima deposition.	11.40	4	490.00	\$ 5,586.00
12/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum to experts re drafts.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
12/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with Jeff Friedman re Chung deposition.	0.20	4	675.00	\$ 135.00
12/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re Takeshima deposition.	0.60	4	675.00	\$ 405.00
12/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review damages estimate.	0.30	9	675.00	\$ 202.50
12/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise escrow proposals; memorandum re same.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
12/10/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Work on escrow agreement.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
12/10/15	JONES, KAREN	Analyzing evidence and inputting into Case Map.	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
12/10/15	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation, including document review.	5.00	7	325.00	\$ 1,625.00
12/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	4.50	4	325.00	\$ 1,462.50
12/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
12/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re Hitachi clawback request.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
12/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	1.50	9	325.00	\$ 487.50
12/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
12/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/10/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
12/11/15	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for and take Takeshima deposition.	10.00	4	490.00	\$ 4,900.00
12/11/15	JONES, KAREN	Analyzing evidence and inputting into Case Map.	7.00	11	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
12/11/15	RIM, HISUN	CA allegation research.	6.00	10	260.00	\$ 1,560.00
12/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	1.00	4	325.00	\$ 325.00
12/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Filing preparation re class certification.	2.50	8	325.00	\$ 812.50
12/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
12/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/11/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
12/12/15	JONES, KAREN	Analyzing evidence and inputting into Case Map.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
12/13/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise escrow agreement.	1.00	9	675.00	\$ 675.00
12/13/15	JONES, KAREN	Analyzing evidence and inputting into Case Map.	2.00	11	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
12/14/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Assistance in accessing database and analysis in printing from CaseMap.	1.50	11	340.00	\$ 510.00
12/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery and class certification.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
12/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Legal research re class certification.	1.00	10	490.00	\$ 490.00
12/14/15	CHAN, LIN	Review recommendation re motion to amend.	0.30	9	490.00	\$ 147.00
12/14/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Email with experts.	0.10	11	675.00	\$ 67.50
12/14/15	JONES, KAREN	Analyzing evidence and inputting into Case Map.	3.00	11	515.00	\$ 1,545.00
12/14/15	RIM, HISUN	CA allegation research.	7.20	10	260.00	\$ 1,872.00
12/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	1.00	4	325.00	\$ 325.00
12/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re production totals.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts for H. Rim review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
12/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery status for L. Chan.	3.00	11	325.00	\$ 975.00
12/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare files re Hitachi Maxell clawback request.	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00
12/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	8	325.00	\$ 97.50
12/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	8	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
12/14/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings re motion to quash and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
12/15/15	BATA, RAMI	Locating and downloading cited cases from defense opposition to IPP motion to amend	0.40	9	280.00	\$ 112.00
12/15/15	CHAN, LIN	Amnesty applicant proffer call.	1.00	11	490.00	\$ 490.00
12/15/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Jones re document review.	0.10	7	490.00	\$ 49.00
12/15/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum re amnesty applicant proffer.	1.30	11	490.00	\$ 637.00
12/15/15	CHAN, LIN	Review case status and prior filings.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/15/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Opposition to Motion to Amend.	0.70	8	490.00	\$ 343.00
12/15/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Toshiba Reply in support of summary judgment; legal research re same.	1.50	8	490.00	\$ 735.00
12/15/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review list of plaintiffs subject to possible dismissal.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
12/15/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and research Toshiba's reply brief in support of motion for summary judgment.	2.10	9	515.00	\$ 1,081.50
12/15/15	JONES, KAREN	Analyzing evidence and inputting into Case Map.	5.00	11	515.00	\$ 2,575.00
12/15/15	RIM, HISUN	CA allegation research.	8.00	10	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
12/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
12/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case status for L. Chan review.	0.50	11	325.00	\$ 162.50
12/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification filings for attorney review.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
12/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare files re clawback request.	1.00	11	325.00	\$ 325.00
12/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare summary judgment filings for attorney review.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
12/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
12/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
12/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery response and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
12/15/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review motion to quash and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
12/16/15	CARNAM, TODD	Pull cases from brief for L. Chan.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
12/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Call Jessica Moy re Toshiba motion; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
12/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Call with Ed Leamer and Phil Johnson re expert analysis.	1.00	10	490.00	\$ 490.00
12/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead strategy call.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
12/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference call with non-testifying experts.	0.50	10	490.00	\$ 245.00
12/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin and D. Harvey re Toshiba motion, motion to amend, and class certification.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
12/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
12/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re expert work and class certification.	0.70	11	490.00	\$ 343.00
12/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re Toshiba motion, class certification.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
12/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for reply brief re motion to amend.	0.50	8	490.00	\$ 245.00
12/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Review draft expert report.	0.70	10	490.00	\$ 343.00
12/16/15	CHAN, LIN	Revise outline for class certification brief.	0.30	8	490.00	\$ 147.00
12/16/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Email Jeff Amato re page limits; telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin re same; email re escrow.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
12/16/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with D. Harvey and L. Chan re Toshiba briefs and class certification drafting issues.	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
12/16/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Ed Leamer draft.	0.30	9	675.00	\$ 202.50
12/16/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Ed Leamer and Phil Johnson.	0.90	11	675.00	\$ 607.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/16/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Weekly team call.	0.50	11	675.00	\$ 337.50
12/16/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with co-lead counsel re weekly call.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
12/16/15	JONES, KAREN	Analyzing evidence for class certification motion [REDACTED]	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
12/16/15	RIM, HISUN	CA allegation research.	8.00	10	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
12/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re class certification brief.	0.20	10	490.00	\$ 98.00
12/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft outline for class certification brief.	0.30	10	490.00	\$ 147.00
12/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re SDI data.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
12/17/15	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for and draft reply brief in support of motion to amend.	8.30	8	490.00	\$ 4,067.00
12/17/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise Class Certification brief outline; office conference L. Chan re same.	0.80	10	675.00	\$ 540.00
12/17/15	JONES, KAREN	Analyzing evidence for class certification motion (California contacts & American subsidiaries).	8.00	10	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
12/17/15	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate and obtain statutes for L. Chan.	0.20	10	290.00	\$ 58.00
12/17/15	RIM, HISUN	CA allegation research.	8.00	10	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
12/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft Reply re Motion to Amend; conference with Colleen Cleary and B. Glackin re same.	2.10	8	490.00	\$ 1,029.00
12/18/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re Kondo deposition, Toshiba, motion, and privilege clawback.	1.20	11	490.00	\$ 588.00
12/18/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review [REDACTED] re motion to amend; teleconference with L. Chan re same.	0.50	8	675.00	\$ 337.50
12/18/15	JONES, KAREN	Analyzing evidence for class certification motion [REDACTED]	8.00	11	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
12/18/15	RIM, HISUN	CA allegation research.	0.20	10	260.00	\$ 52.00
12/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft Reply re Motion to Amend.	7.20	8	490.00	\$ 3,528.00
12/19/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Opposition to Motion to File Under Seal.	0.20	8	490.00	\$ 98.00
12/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft reply brief re motion to amend.	0.90	8	490.00	\$ 441.00
12/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re clawback and privilege issues.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
12/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re LCD data, opposition to Panasonic motion to file under seal, and Kwak deposition.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
12/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for class certification; draft email correspondence re same.	0.90	10	490.00	\$ 441.00
12/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise Objection to new evidence.	1.00	8	490.00	\$ 490.00
12/20/15	CHAN, LIN	Review LG discovery responses.	0.20	9	490.00	\$ 98.00
12/20/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Review and revise objections to Toshiba reply evidence, correspond with co-counsel re same.	3.50	8	515.00	\$ 1,802.50
12/21/15	BATA, RAMI	Locating cases for L. Chan	0.70	11	280.00	\$ 196.00
12/21/15	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Duplicate media and compare data.	1.00	11	340.00	\$ 340.00
12/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with co-counsel and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re protective order and [REDACTED]	0.90	11	490.00	\$ 441.00
12/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re response to Toshiba reply brief.	0.60	11	490.00	\$ 294.00
12/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re using LCD data, class certification briefing, and motion to amend.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
12/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re response to Toshiba reply brief, Kwak deposition, [REDACTED].	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for reply brief re motion to amend; revise brief.	4.90	8	490.00	\$ 2,401.00
12/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise opposition to motion to seal.	0.30	8	490.00	\$ 147.00
12/21/15	CHAN, LIN	Revise discovery request re Kwak.	0.30	2	490.00	\$ 147.00
12/21/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review and comment on letter to Eva Cole.	0.30	6	675.00	\$ 202.50
12/21/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review tolling section of reply brief; telephone conference with L. Chan re same.	0.40	9	675.00	\$ 270.00
12/21/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with L. Chan re various case issues.	0.20	11	675.00	\$ 135.00
12/21/15	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with co-counsel and counsel for direct purchaser plaintiffs re Toshiba reply evidence, prepare for same, correspond with co-counsel re same.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
12/21/15	JONES, KAREN	Analyzing evidence for class certification motion [REDACTED]	7.50	10	515.00	\$ 3,862.50
12/21/15	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate and obtain case for L. Chan.	0.20	11	290.00	\$ 58.00
12/21/15	RIM, HISUN	California allegation research.	8.00	10	260.00	\$ 2,080.00
12/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re Panasonic [REDACTED] request.	0.40	7	325.00	\$ 130.00
12/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare summary judgment filings for D. Harvey review.	3.00	9	325.00	\$ 975.00
12/21/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review productions and prepare for loading.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
12/22/15	BATA, RAMI	Locating cases for L. Chan	2.90	11	280.00	\$ 812.00
12/22/15	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Find, download, and save DRAM class certification cases per L. Chan.	2.00	10	325.00	\$ 650.00
12/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re letter to Panasonic; email correspondence re same.	0.40	11	490.00	\$ 196.00
12/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft reply brief re motion to amend; revise amended pleading.	5.00	8	490.00	\$ 2,450.00
12/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for and draft class certification brief.	3.40	10	490.00	\$ 1,666.00
12/22/15	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise meet and confer letter re Kondo deposition.	0.30	6	490.00	\$ 147.00
12/22/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin.	0.30	11	675.00	\$ 202.50
12/22/15	JONES, KAREN	Analyzing evidence for class certification motion [REDACTED]	8.00	10	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
12/22/15	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate and obtain cases cited in two briefs, for L. Chan.	1.20	11	290.00	\$ 348.00
12/22/15	RIM, HISUN	CA allegation research.	4.00	10	325.00	\$ 1,300.00
12/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification filings for L. Chan review.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re Panasonic [REDACTED] request.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
12/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
12/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
12/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
12/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review document productions and prepare for loading.	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00
12/22/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege logs and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
12/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief.	4.60	10	490.00	\$ 2,254.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft reply brief in support of motion to amend.	1.60	8	490.00	\$ 784.00
12/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
12/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re brief in support of motion to amend, [REDACTED].	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
12/23/15	CHAN, LIN	Review Objections to Report and Recommendation.	0.50	9	490.00	\$ 245.00
12/23/15	RIM, HISUN	CA Allegation Research.	5.30	10	260.00	\$ 1,378.00
12/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
12/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re [REDACTED].	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re expert data for B. Glackin.	1.30	7	325.00	\$ 422.50
12/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
12/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
12/23/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review productions and prepare for loading.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
12/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Confer with expert re data.	0.70	10	490.00	\$ 343.00
12/24/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief.	3.40	10	490.00	\$ 1,666.00
12/24/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Teleconference with Dr. Ed Leamer, plaintiff counsel and Econ One; manage cost fund and arrange payment of expert bills.	1.30	10	675.00	\$ 877.50
12/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief.	6.50	10	490.00	\$ 3,185.00
12/26/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
12/26/15	RIM, HISUN	CA allegation research.	3.70	10	325.00	\$ 1,202.50
12/27/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief.	3.40	10	490.00	\$ 1,666.00
12/27/15	RIM, HISUN	CA allegation research.	3.10	10	325.00	\$ 1,007.50
12/28/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re SDI data.	0.20	11	490.00	\$ 98.00
12/28/15	RIM, HISUN	CA allegation research.	8.00	10	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
12/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re [REDACTED].	0.60	7	325.00	\$ 195.00
12/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification filings for L. Chan review.	0.40	9	325.00	\$ 130.00
12/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production for loading by Catalyst.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
12/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re [REDACTED] request.	1.00	7	325.00	\$ 325.00
12/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production index.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
12/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/28/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
12/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief; conference with Demetrius Lambrinos and H. Rim re same.	9.50	10	490.00	\$ 4,655.00
12/29/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re watch list, class certification briefing.	0.50	11	490.00	\$ 245.00
12/29/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review and respond to various email correspondence re class certification; review draft expert reports of Drs. Leamer and Abrantes-Metz.	2.10	10	675.00	\$ 1,417.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/29/15	RIM, HISUN	CA allegation research.	7.70	10	325.00	\$ 2,502.50
12/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.10	4	325.00	\$ 32.50
12/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
12/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute Minnesota filings re motion to quash and save to file.	0.30	9	325.00	\$ 97.50
12/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re depositions for L. Chan.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
12/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
12/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.60	9	325.00	\$ 195.00
12/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re ██████ request.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege logs and save to file.	0.20	9	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/29/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief.	6.70	10	490.00	\$ 3,283.00
12/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re ██████, discovery, translation objections.	0.30	11	490.00	\$ 147.00
12/30/15	CHAN, LIN	Expert call for class certification.	0.70	10	490.00	\$ 343.00
12/30/15	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Teleconference with experts; teleconference with Phil Johnson and Econ One; review draft class certification brief; teleconference with L. Chan re same; review draft expert reports.	3.50	10	675.00	\$ 2,362.50
12/30/15	RIM, HISUN	CA allegation research.	8.00	10	325.00	\$ 2,600.00
12/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
12/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification filings for L. Chan review.	1.60	9	325.00	\$ 520.00
12/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
12/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
12/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.30	7	325.00	\$ 97.50
12/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	325.00	\$ 162.50
12/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege log and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
12/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review productions and prepare for loading.	0.50	7	325.00	\$ 162.50
12/30/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re ██████ request.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
12/31/15	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief.	2.80	10	490.00	\$ 1,372.00
12/31/15	RIM, HISUN	CA Allegation research.	5.70	10	325.00	\$ 1,852.50
12/31/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/31/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	7	325.00	\$ 65.00
12/31/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	325.00	\$ 32.50
12/31/15	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re Panasonic ██████.	0.10	7	325.00	\$ 32.50
01/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief.	4.90	10	515.00	\$ 2,523.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/01/16	RIM, HISUN	CA allegation research.	0.70	10	345.00	\$ 241.50
01/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief.	8.50	10	515.00	\$ 4,377.50
01/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft stipulation re class certification page limits.	0.30	8	515.00	\$ 154.50
01/02/16	RIM, HISUN	CA allegation research.	0.20	10	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief.	7.80	10	515.00	\$ 4,017.00
01/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft stipulation re page limits.	0.20	8	515.00	\$ 103.00
01/03/16	RIM, HISUN	CA allegation research.	0.90	10	345.00	\$ 310.50
01/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Call with experts re damages model.	1.10	10	515.00	\$ 566.50
01/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief; email correspondence re same.	9.30	10	515.00	\$ 4,789.50
01/04/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Finalize escrow agreement.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
01/04/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re class certification brief.	0.40	10	700.00	\$ 280.00
01/04/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Respond to emails re class certification briefing.	0.40	10	700.00	\$ 280.00
01/04/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with experts; telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin re experts; memorandum to team re same.	3.00	11	700.00	\$ 2,100.00
01/04/16	JONES, KAREN	Calls and emails with team to determine next steps for class certification motion.	0.80	11	415.00	\$ 332.00
01/04/16	RIM, HISUN	California allegation research.	10.90	10	345.00	\$ 3,760.50
01/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Filing preparation re class certification.	0.20	8	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition exhibit index.	3.00	9	345.00	\$ 1,035.00
01/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize deposition files.	0.70	9	345.00	\$ 241.50
01/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
01/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading.	0.70	7	345.00	\$ 241.50
01/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
01/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re status of discovery responses for L. Chan.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
01/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief.	6.50	10	515.00	\$ 3,347.50
01/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Toshiba re privilege logs.	1.00	6	515.00	\$ 515.00
01/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise briefing re motion to stay motion to amend; email correspondence re same.	0.20	8	515.00	\$ 103.00
01/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Review Toshiba privilege log and related correspondence to prepare for meet and confer call.	0.60	6	515.00	\$ 309.00
01/05/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Work on class certification brief; review expert drafts; multiple teleconferences with Phil Johnson, Jeff Friedman and Steve Williams.	8.40	10	700.00	\$ 5,880.00
01/05/16	RIM, HISUN	California allegation research.	12.40	10	345.00	\$ 4,278.00
01/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition exhibits for co-counsel review.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
01/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery plans for H. Rim review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare privilege logs for L. Chan review.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
01/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare translation protocol for H. Rim review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	8	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize deposition files.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.60	9	345.00	\$ 207.00
01/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibits and save to file.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
01/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.10	8	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	8	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/06/16	CARNAM, TODD	Pull certain dockets and send to L. Chan.	0.10	10	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief; confer with B. Glackin re same.	7.00	10	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
01/06/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft inserts for class certification brief; telephone conference with Phil Johnson; office conference with L. Chan.	1.40	10	700.00	\$ 980.00
01/06/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise Notice of Withdrawal; telephone conference with Jeff Friedman re same; email exchanges re same.	1.50	8	700.00	\$ 1,050.00
01/06/16	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate antitrust cases referencing the appropriateness of aggregate damages, for B. Glackin.	0.80	10	310.00	\$ 248.00
01/06/16	RIM, HISUN	California allegation research.	9.70	10	345.00	\$ 3,346.50
01/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Filing preparation re class certification.	0.60	8	345.00	\$ 207.00
01/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition exhibits for co-counsel review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production index.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
01/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
01/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re translations for L. Chan.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief, including conferences with B. Glackin and co-counsel.	7.70	10	515.00	\$ 3,965.50
01/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Revise and file stipulation re page limits.	0.60	8	515.00	\$ 309.00
01/07/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan; telephone conference with Shana Scarlett; telephone conference with Demetrius Lambrinos; review draft Williams declaration.	2.00	11	700.00	\$ 1,400.00
01/07/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson, Aaron Shearin, Jeff Friedman, Shana Scarlett and L. Chan re overcharge models; memorandums re same.	2.80	11	700.00	\$ 1,960.00
01/07/16	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate and obtain cases for L. Chan.	0.30	1	310.00	\$ 93.00
01/07/16	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate cases discussing Article III standing requirements for Cartwright Act claims, for L. Chan.	0.50	1	310.00	\$ 155.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

From 06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To 02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/07/16	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate cases discussing [REDACTED], for L. Chan.	0.60	1	310.00	\$ 186.00
01/07/16	RIM, HISUN	California allegation research.	9.30	10	345.00	\$ 3,208.50
01/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re stipulation.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
01/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts for co-counsel review.	0.60	9	345.00	\$ 207.00
01/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review production and prepare for loading.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
01/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/08/16	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Meeting to discuss staffing to support preparation for filing the Class Certification brief.	0.50	10	345.00	\$ 172.50
01/08/16	CARNAM, TODD	Meet with senior paralegals re pitching in on upcoming filing.	0.50	10	345.00	\$ 172.50
01/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Troxel and H. Motterstead re class certification filing.	0.40	10	515.00	\$ 206.00
01/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief; prepare for class certification filing; confer with B. Troxel re same.	6.70	10	515.00	\$ 3,450.50
01/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence to Toshiba.	0.30	6	515.00	\$ 154.50
01/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery and class certification.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
01/08/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Teleconference Shana Scarlett, office conferences Lin Yee Chan; teleconferences Bruce Simon, Aaron Sheanin regression modeling; review class certification brief.	1.90	10	700.00	\$ 1,330.00
01/08/16	GLIOZZO, NINA	Meeting re class certification filing.	0.60	10	335.00	\$ 201.00
01/08/16	RIM, HISUN	California allegation research.	7.50	10	345.00	\$ 2,587.50
01/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Class certification preparation.	3.50	8	345.00	\$ 1,207.50
01/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/09/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with co-counsel re class certification brief.	0.30	10	515.00	\$ 154.50
01/09/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re class certification brief.	0.30	10	515.00	\$ 154.50
01/09/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief.	7.70	10	515.00	\$ 3,965.50
01/09/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Work on class certification brief and expert reports.	9.00	10	700.00	\$ 6,300.00
01/09/16	RIM, HISUN	California allegation research.	1.80	10	345.00	\$ 621.00
01/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief.	9.50	10	515.00	\$ 4,892.50
01/10/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise class certification brief; telephone conference with Ed Leamer and Phil Johnson.	4.50	10	700.00	\$ 3,150.00
01/10/16	RIM, HISUN	CA allegation research.	7.20	10	345.00	\$ 2,484.00
01/11/16	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Cite check the 50 State Appendix of antitrust statutes.	5.10	10	345.00	\$ 1,759.50
01/11/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re class certification.	0.20	10	515.00	\$ 103.00
01/11/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief.	10.50	10	515.00	\$ 5,407.50
01/11/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/comment on draft Metz report.	0.90	9	700.00	\$ 630.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/11/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Ed Leamer memorandum re [REDACTED] telephone conference with Ed Leamer; memorandum to co-counsel.	0.90	11	700.00	\$ 630.00
01/11/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review revisions to brief by co-counsel.	0.50	10	700.00	\$ 350.00
01/11/16	RIM, HISUN	CA allegation research.	12.10	10	345.00	\$ 4,174.50
01/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail to Catalyst re [REDACTED] documents.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification brief for filing.	8.00	8	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
01/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense production and prepare for loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re [REDACTED] documents on Catalyst.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/12/16	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Cite check the 50 State Appendix of antitrust statutes.	2.20	10	345.00	\$ 759.00
01/12/16	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Duplicate hard drive and confirm data copied.	1.00	11	360.00	\$ 360.00
01/12/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief and supporting papers; conference with B. Glackin and Demetrius Lambrinos re same.	7.00	10	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
01/12/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise class certification brief.	3.20	10	700.00	\$ 2,240.00
01/12/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jeff Friedman re brief; telephone conference with Demetrius Lambrinos re brief; office conference with L. Chan re brief.	1.40	10	700.00	\$ 980.00
01/12/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson; review casemap database re expert reports; memorandums to team.	3.30	10	700.00	\$ 2,310.00
01/12/16	RIM, HISUN	California allegation research.	14.20	10	345.00	\$ 4,899.00
01/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail from Catalyst re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification brief for filing.	4.50	8	345.00	\$ 1,552.50
01/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege logs and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review productions and prepare for loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/13/16	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Cite check the indirect purchaser plaintiffs' motion for class certification brief.	1.70	10	345.00	\$ 586.50
01/13/16	CARNAM, TODD	Cite check brief.	2.20	10	345.00	\$ 759.00
01/13/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief.	6.20	10	515.00	\$ 3,193.00
01/13/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re expert model and class certification; confer with H. Rim re same.	0.60	10	515.00	\$ 309.00
01/13/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise class certification papers; teleconference with Jeff Friedman re expert work; multiple teleconferences with Phil Johnson, Ed Leamer; teleconference with Bruce Simon, Aaron Sheanin re expert work and possible extension; multiple email memos re expert work.	6.40	10	700.00	\$ 4,480.00
01/13/16	RIM, HISUN	California allegation research.	12.30	10	345.00	\$ 4,243.50
01/13/16	TEXIER, RICHARD	Cite checking brief in support to class certification; emails from and to team.	4.10	8	345.00	\$ 1,414.50
01/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Filing preparation re class certification.	10.00	8	345.00	\$ 3,450.00
01/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare productions for loading by Catalyst.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re class certification briefing.	0.20	10	515.00	\$ 103.00
01/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft administrative motion.	0.80	8	515.00	\$ 412.00
01/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief, accompanying sealing motion; email correspondence re same.	3.00	10	515.00	\$ 1,545.00
01/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re class certification briefing.	0.50	10	515.00	\$ 257.50
01/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise stipulation re extension of time on class certification.	0.20	10	515.00	\$ 103.00
01/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Review expert reports.	2.00	10	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
01/14/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise class certification papers; multiple emails and telephone conferences with experts and various co-counsel re finalization of papers.	7.80	10	700.00	\$ 5,460.00
01/14/16	RIM, HISUN	California Allegation Research.	7.30	10	345.00	\$ 2,518.50
01/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	8	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Filing preparation re class certification.	2.00	8	345.00	\$ 690.00
01/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense production for loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and confirm deposition scheduling.	0.10	4	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re document loading on Catalyst.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re class certification; draft class certification brief.	7.00	10	515.00	\$ 3,605.00
01/15/16	RIM, HISUN	California allegation research.	8.00	10	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
01/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Class certification filing preparation.	0.30	8	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/16/16	RIM, HISUN	California allegation research.	1.80	10	345.00	\$ 621.00
01/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft motion to seal re class certification briefing; review expert reports.	2.00	10	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
01/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re class certification brief.	0.10	10	515.00	\$ 51.50
01/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief.	0.20	10	515.00	\$ 103.00
01/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft motion to seal and supporting papers.	0.30	10	515.00	\$ 154.50
01/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re expert work and class certification.	0.30	10	515.00	\$ 154.50
01/19/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise Abrantes-Metz report; telephone conference with Phil Johnson; office conference with L. Chan re brief; memorandums to team.	4.80	10	700.00	\$ 3,360.00
01/19/16	RIM, HISUN	California allegation research.	7.20	10	345.00	\$ 2,484.00
01/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Filing preparation re class certification.	0.20	8	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review pleadings and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/20/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief.	2.90	10	515.00	\$ 1,493.50
01/20/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft motion to seal class certification papers.	1.60	10	515.00	\$ 824.00
01/20/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery and class certification.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
01/20/16	RIM, HISUN	California allegation research.	10.00	10	345.00	\$ 3,450.00
01/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence for H. Rim review.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare exhibits for attorney review.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone call re batteries inquiry.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief and supporting papers.	9.10	10	515.00	\$ 4,686.50
01/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Panasonic re watch list and clawbacks.	0.70	6	515.00	\$ 360.50
01/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with Panasonic.	0.40	6	515.00	\$ 206.00
01/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Revise motion to amend complaint.	1.50	8	515.00	\$ 772.50
01/21/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Further review of expert reports.	0.70	10	700.00	\$ 490.00
01/21/16	GRANT, ANTHONY	Maintenance of electronic discovery database.	1.00	7	360.00	\$ 360.00
01/21/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap input.	7.30	7	345.00	\$ 2,518.50
01/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail to Catalyst re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification motion for filing.	12.50	8	345.00	\$ 4,312.50
01/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery responses for H. Rim review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production correspondence for H. Rim review.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
01/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
01/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review production and prepare for loading.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
01/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/22/16	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Prepare and upload data to file transfer site; update site access.	1.00	11	360.00	\$ 360.00
01/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief.	14.00	10	515.00	\$ 7,210.00
01/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Class certification filing.	13.50	10	700.00	\$ 9,450.00
01/22/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap input; class certification wrap-up.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
01/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filing system and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification motion for filing.	14.00	8	345.00	\$ 4,830.00
01/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review.	0.40	7	515.00	\$ 206.00
01/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter re Panasonic re watch list; email correspondence re same.	2.10	6	515.00	\$ 1,081.50
01/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Review letter to court re class certification brief and chambers' copy.	0.20	10	515.00	\$ 103.00
01/25/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap input.	5.30	7	345.00	\$ 1,828.50
01/25/16	RIM, HISUN	LCHB check-in for Casemap.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/25/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail from Catalyst re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/25/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re class certification motion.	6.00	10	345.00	\$ 2,070.00
01/25/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification filings for co-counsel review.	0.10	10	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/25/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare motion to compel filings for L. Chan review.	0.20	8	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/25/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class certification filings and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/25/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/26/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re discovery.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
01/26/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Veronica Glaze re translations.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
01/26/16	CHAN, LIN	Provide notice to third parties re confidential information; confer with Shana Scarlett re same.	0.50	10	515.00	\$ 257.50
01/26/16	GRANT, ANTHONY	Administration of electronic discovery database.	2.00	7	360.00	\$ 720.00
01/26/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap input.	6.80	7	345.00	\$ 2,346.00
01/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification filings for attorney review.	5.00	9	345.00	\$ 1,725.00
01/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification filings for expert review.	0.30	10	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification filings for H. Rim review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare disclosures for attorney review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Direct Purchaser class certification filings and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Steven Williams and Demetrius Lambrinos re case strategy.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
01/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Nathan Cihlar re translation issues.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
01/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Correct Ed Leamer Report.	1.30	10	515.00	\$ 669.50
01/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to court re lodestar report.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
01/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list; review motions to compel.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
01/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery issues and case management.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
01/27/16	GRANT, ANTHONY	Maintenance of electronic discovery database.	1.00	7	360.00	\$ 360.00
01/27/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap Input	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case docket for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re class certification exhibit.	0.50	10	345.00	\$ 172.50
01/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification filings for attorney review.	3.50	9	345.00	\$ 1,207.50
01/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery order comparison for L. Chan review.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare exhibits for H. Rim review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize expert backup data re class certification.	0.40	10	345.00	\$ 138.00
01/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re pending hearing dates for L. Chan.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Call with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs re watchlist.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
01/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re Leamer report.	0.20	10	515.00	\$ 103.00
01/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re watchlist issues.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
01/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Panasonic re [REDACTED] and watchlist.	0.90	6	515.00	\$ 463.50
01/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with Panasonic and Sanyo.	0.30	6	515.00	\$ 154.50
01/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit meet and confer letters re discovery.	0.30	6	515.00	\$ 154.50
01/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise discovery requests.	0.40	9	515.00	\$ 206.00
01/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Review Order re amended discovery procedures.	0.20	9	515.00	\$ 103.00
01/28/16	GRANT, ANTHONY	Administration of electronic discovery database; import of documents into electronic discovery database; preparation of documents in electronic discovery database for review.	1.00	7	360.00	\$ 360.00
01/28/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap Input	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
01/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification filings for H. Rim review.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production index.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
01/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
01/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize expert backup data re class certification.	0.50	10	345.00	\$ 172.50
01/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.60	9	345.00	\$ 207.00
01/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Direct Purchaser declarations and save to file.	0.20	10	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re translations.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
01/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Panasonic production re technical problems.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead call re strategy.	0.90	11	515.00	\$ 463.50
01/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery.	1.30	11	515.00	\$ 669.50
01/29/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with co-counsel.	0.90	11	700.00	\$ 630.00
01/29/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Cadio Zirpoli, Carl Hammar skjold; review various discovery correspondence.	0.90	11	700.00	\$ 630.00
01/29/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Shana Scarlett; review correspondence.	0.80	11	700.00	\$ 560.00
01/29/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap Input	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
01/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition exhibits for H. Rim review.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.60	9	345.00	\$ 207.00
01/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/01/16	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Confirm loaded documents and upload data.	0.50	11	360.00	\$ 180.00
02/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery and expert work; confer with Phil Johnson.	2.10	11	515.00	\$ 1,081.50
02/01/16	GRANT, ANTHONY	Upload of electronic discovery documents to electronic discovery database.	1.00	7	360.00	\$ 360.00
02/01/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap input.	7.80	7	345.00	\$ 2,691.00
02/01/16	RIM, HISUN	Check-in for Casemap	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
02/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare expert reports for Econ One review.	0.20	10	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare expert reports for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re Toshiba production.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition exhibit index.	1.00	9	345.00	\$ 345.00
02/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
02/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Phil Johnson re expert report.	0.10	10	515.00	\$ 51.50
02/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re correcting Leamer report.	0.10	10	515.00	\$ 51.50
02/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery issues.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
02/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare corrected report for filing; file corrected report.	1.00	10	515.00	\$ 515.00
02/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit case management conference statement; email correspondence re same.	0.70	8	515.00	\$ 360.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/02/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap Input	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
02/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production issues.	0.60	7	345.00	\$ 207.00
02/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
02/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts and exhibits for Text Map.	0.60	9	345.00	\$ 207.00
02/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare docket for L. Chan review.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare exhibit pages for L. Chan review.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare productions for loading by Catalyst.	0.80	7	345.00	\$ 276.00
02/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition exhibit index.	1.00	9	345.00	\$ 345.00
02/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production index.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
02/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review documents in Case Map.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Plaintiff's production and save to file.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re duplicate production loading issues by Catalyst.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
02/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re Hitachi clawback.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re Toshiba production.	0.70	7	345.00	\$ 241.50
02/03/16	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Assistance with analysis of exporting/converting document from CaseMap.	0.30	11	360.00	\$ 108.00
02/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead call re case strategy.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
02/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review and discovery.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
02/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer correspondence with NEC re watchlist.	0.50	6	515.00	\$ 257.50
02/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery issues.	0.90	11	515.00	\$ 463.50
02/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise case management conference statement.	0.20	8	515.00	\$ 103.00
02/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Review depositions; draft email correspondence re same.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
02/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Review discovery re SDI.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
02/03/16	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Assist paralegal regarding issue with downloaded files.	1.00	7	360.00	\$ 360.00
02/03/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap input; deponent selection research.	5.90	7	345.00	\$ 2,035.50
02/03/16	RIM, HISUN	Check-in re Casemap.	0.50	11	345.00	\$ 172.50
02/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
02/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Chambers copy re corrected expert report.	0.60	9	345.00	\$ 207.00
02/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition status for L. Chan.	0.60	9	345.00	\$ 207.00
02/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts and exhibits for Text Map.	1.00	9	345.00	\$ 345.00
02/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts for L. Chan.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition errata and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review LG production re native file issues.	0.70	7	345.00	\$ 241.50
02/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re duplicate production loading issues by Catalyst.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery issues and case management conference statement.	0.90	11	515.00	\$ 463.50
02/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise case management conference statement.	0.10	8	515.00	\$ 51.50
02/04/16	RIM, HISUN	Deponent selection research.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
02/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.80	7	345.00	\$ 276.00
02/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts and exhibits for Text Map.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production for loading by Catalyst.	1.00	7	345.00	\$ 345.00
02/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re depositions for H. Rim review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review hearing report.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege log and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading issues for Catalyst.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/05/16	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Download production data from file transfer site.	1.00	11	360.00	\$ 360.00
02/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs and others re letters rogatory.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
02/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery issues.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
02/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and analyze documents and discovery to determine deponents.	1.40	11	515.00	\$ 721.00
02/05/16	RIM, HISUN	Deponent selection research.	2.40	7	345.00	\$ 828.00
02/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare custodial pricing information for H. Rim review.	0.60	7	345.00	\$ 207.00
02/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production index.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery verifications and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review production and prepare for loading.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
02/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Review documents and discovery and select deponents.	0.90	11	515.00	\$ 463.50
02/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Review documents and discovery; draft memorandum re new deponents.	2.50	11	515.00	\$ 1,287.50
02/07/16	RIM, HISUN	Deponent selection strategy.	0.50	11	345.00	\$ 172.50
02/08/16	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Download, prepare and saved data to the specified location. Confirm downloaded files.	1.00	11	360.00	\$ 360.00
02/08/16	RIM, HISUN	Deponent selection research.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
02/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense production for loading by Catalyst.	1.10	7	345.00	\$ 379.50
02/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition exhibit index.	1.00	9	345.00	\$ 345.00
02/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review case management statement.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/09/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re case status.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
02/09/16	RIM, HISUN	Deponent selection research.	0.60	7	345.00	\$ 207.00
02/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification files for attorney review.	0.70	9	345.00	\$ 241.50
02/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition files for war room.	1.20	9	345.00	\$ 414.00
02/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize class certification files.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and revise deposition exhibit index.	3.50	9	345.00	\$ 1,207.50
02/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class certification order in Optical Disk Drives litigation.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibits and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review e-mails re deposition preparation.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead strategy call.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
02/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs and others re deposition through letters rogatory.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
02/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
02/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re case strategy and potential deponents.	1.30	11	515.00	\$ 669.50
02/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for status conference, including reviewing recent filings.	2.90	14	515.00	\$ 1,493.50
02/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Review meet and confer letter with Panasonic and Sanyo.	0.40	6	515.00	\$ 206.00
02/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Review Tachihara deposition transcript and other discovery.	0.60	9	515.00	\$ 309.00
02/10/16	RIM, HISUN	Deponent selection research.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
02/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.30	4	345.00	\$ 103.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts and exhibits for war room.	1.50	9	345.00	\$ 517.50
02/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare docket for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare filings for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition exhibit index.	1.50	9	345.00	\$ 517.50
02/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.70	9	345.00	\$ 241.50
02/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re class representative discovery status.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery correspondence.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re third party production download.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/11/16	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Assistance with analysis of updating production metadata load file.	0.50	11	360.00	\$ 180.00
02/11/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review and potential deponents.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
02/11/16	FASTIFF, ERIC	Prepare for case management conference.	1.50	14	750.00	\$ 1,125.00
02/11/16	GRANT, ANTHONY	Attention to troubleshooting discovery issues with vendor.	1.00	7	360.00	\$ 360.00
02/11/16	RIM, HISUN	Check-in re document review.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/11/16	RIM, HISUN	Deponent selection research.	2.00	7	345.00	\$ 690.00
02/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re production loading issues.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
02/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation.	1.50	14	345.00	\$ 517.50
02/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading issues.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
02/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
02/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and exhibits and prepare for war room.	1.00	9	345.00	\$ 345.00
02/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review productions and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	1.00	7	345.00	\$ 345.00
02/12/16	CABRASER, ELIZABETH	Confer with E. Fastiff, B. Glackin re case management, strategy, execution, class certification.	0.90	11	1,000.00	\$ 900.00
02/12/16	CABRASER, ELIZABETH	Prepare for Case Management Conference; confer with co-counsel and Defendants Panel re same.	1.60	14	1,000.00	\$ 1,600.00
02/12/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Eric Somers re case status; email correspondence re same.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
02/12/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise reply in support of motion to amend.	0.70	8	515.00	\$ 360.50
02/12/16	CHAN, LIN	Review documents re potential deponents; email correspondence re same; confer with H. Rim.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/12/16	RIM, HISUN	Deponent selection research.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
02/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
02/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re Plaintiffs' deposition transcripts re erratas.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
02/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re Sanyo production loading for H. Rim.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize production files.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
02/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and exhibits and prepare for war room.	3.00	9	345.00	\$ 1,035.00
02/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Aaron Sheanin re Toshiba oral argument.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
02/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re potential deponents.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
02/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
02/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re potential deponents, document review, Toshiba summary judgment, motion to seal, and other discovery matters.	2.10	11	515.00	\$ 1,081.50
02/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Sawai deposition.	1.30	4	515.00	\$ 669.50
02/16/16	RIM, HISUN	Deponent selection research; deposition preparation - Sawai.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
02/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading issues.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
02/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts and exhibits for review.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
02/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
02/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production index.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re Sanyo production loading issues for H. Rim.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re transcripts for L. Chan.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead strategy call; email correspondence re same.	0.70	11	515.00	\$ 360.50
02/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re motion to seal and discovery.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
02/17/16	CHAN, LIN	H. Rim meeting re document review.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
02/17/16	RIM, HISUN	Check-in re document review.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/17/16	RIM, HISUN	Deponent selection research; deposition preparation - Sawai.	7.80	7	345.00	\$ 2,691.00
02/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	3.50	4	345.00	\$ 1,207.50
02/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.60	9	345.00	\$ 207.00
02/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Toshiba production for loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re U.S. Legal contracts for L. Chan.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference re Gail Murphy deposition.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
02/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery and litigation fund; confer with B. Troxel re same.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
02/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Sawai deposition, including reviewing documents.	0.20	4	515.00	\$ 103.00
02/18/16	OCAMPO, ERWIN	Copy hard drive.	2.00	7	360.00	\$ 720.00
02/18/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Sawai.	5.80	7	345.00	\$ 2,001.00
02/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	2.70	4	345.00	\$ 931.50
02/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.70	7	345.00	\$ 241.50
02/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation re motion to amend.	1.50	14	345.00	\$ 517.50
02/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re discovery loading issues with Catalyst.	0.70	7	345.00	\$ 241.50
02/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review U.S. Legal contracts and save to file.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery issues.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
02/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise joint letter brief re letters rogatory; email correspondence re same.	0.50	8	515.00	\$ 257.50
02/19/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Sawai, including document review.	7.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,415.00
02/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation re motion to amend.	3.50	14	345.00	\$ 1,207.50
02/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense production for loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare sealing motions for L. Chan review.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re case status.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
02/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
02/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jennie Anderson re possible deposition.	0.10	4	515.00	\$ 51.50
02/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
02/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re class member inquiry, clawback documents, draft stipulation, Toshiba motion, deponents.	1.10	11	515.00	\$ 566.50
02/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Panasonic re Nakae and privilege clawbacks.	0.60	6	515.00	\$ 309.00
02/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Sawai deposition, including reviewing documents.	0.60	4	515.00	\$ 309.00
02/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Review correspondence re privilege clawbacks.	0.70	11	515.00	\$ 360.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Review motion for preliminary approval of Sony settlement.	0.20	9	515.00	\$ 103.00
02/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Strategy call re Panasonic clawback documents.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
02/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Administer cost fund.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
02/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Forward information re claims administrator.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
02/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re case issues.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
02/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review and approve draft discovery correspondence.	0.30	9	700.00	\$ 210.00
02/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise Stipulation re depositions of outgoing plaintiffs.	1.00	9	700.00	\$ 700.00
02/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Demetrius Lambrinos re Nakae deposition.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
02/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Panasonic counsel re Nakae deposition.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
02/22/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition Preparation - Sawai, including document review.	7.70	7	345.00	\$ 2,656.50
02/22/16	RIM, HISUN	Litigation Strategy, Analysis and Case Management.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.70	4	345.00	\$ 241.50
02/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail potential class member re sales history.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation re motion to amend.	1.50	14	345.00	\$ 517.50
02/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re clawback request.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
02/23/16	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Format, duplicate and compare electronic discovery media.	2.00	11	360.00	\$ 720.00
02/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re clawback issues.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
02/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jennie Anderson re Sawai deposition; email correspondence re same.	0.60	4	515.00	\$ 309.00
02/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence re litigation fund.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
02/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
02/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery issues.	1.50	11	515.00	\$ 772.50
02/23/16	RIM, HISUN	Deponent selection; Casemap input.	4.60	7	345.00	\$ 1,587.00
02/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.60	4	345.00	\$ 207.00
02/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading by Catalyst.	1.00	7	345.00	\$ 345.00
02/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re clawback request.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	1.40	9	345.00	\$ 483.00
02/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.70	9	345.00	\$ 241.50
02/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
02/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege logs and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
02/24/16	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Duplication of discovery materials.	1.20	11	360.00	\$ 432.00
02/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead strategy call; office conference with B. Glackin afterward.	0.70	11	515.00	\$ 360.50
02/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs and Jennie Anderson re Sawai deposition.	0.70	4	515.00	\$ 360.50
02/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jennie Anderson re deposition.	0.20	4	515.00	\$ 103.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re case strategy; draft memoranda re same.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
02/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Review motion to amend briefing and create preparation materials.	0.70	14	515.00	\$ 360.50
02/24/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review litigation fund letter, task list, various email correspondence.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
02/24/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Stipulation re outgoing class representatives.	0.20	9	700.00	\$ 140.00
02/24/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call.	0.60	11	700.00	\$ 420.00
02/24/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap input.	5.50	7	345.00	\$ 1,897.50
02/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.50	4	345.00	\$ 172.50
02/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
02/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
02/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re production loading.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense production and prepare for loading.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
02/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference re deposition instructions.	0.70	11	515.00	\$ 360.50
02/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Eric Somers, Demetrius Lambrinos, and Krysta Pachman re Hyams deposition.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
02/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Eric Somers re Hyams deposition; email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
02/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery issues.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
02/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Motion to Amend hearing, including reviewing briefs and creating hearing preparation materials.	2.60	14	515.00	\$ 1,339.00
02/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Research for Nakae deposition; email correspondence re same.	0.60	4	515.00	\$ 309.00
02/25/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Email correspondence re settlement demands.	0.30	12	700.00	\$ 210.00
02/25/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Scheduling calls and correspondence re Nakae deposition.	0.80	11	700.00	\$ 560.00
02/25/16	GLIOZZO, NINA	Assemble binder for L. Chan.	1.40	9	335.00	\$ 469.00
02/25/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap input.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
02/26/16	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Assistance in accessing account in CaseMap.	0.30	11	360.00	\$ 108.00
02/26/16	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Prepare and upload data to CaseMap file transfer site; confirm that data is loaded.	1.00	11	360.00	\$ 360.00
02/26/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re motion to amend hearing; draft email correspondence re same.	0.20	14	515.00	\$ 103.00
02/26/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery issues and motion to amend hearing preparation.	0.90	11	515.00	\$ 463.50
02/26/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for motion to amend hearing.	3.00	14	515.00	\$ 1,545.00
02/26/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for hearing on motions to amend.	1.50	14	700.00	\$ 1,050.00
02/26/16	GLIOZZO, NINA	Organize class representative files; prepare and assemble binders for L. Chan.	7.60	14	335.00	\$ 2,546.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/26/16	HARVEY, DEAN	Conference with co-counsel re preparing for Toshiba MSJ argument.	3.10	11	540.00	\$ 1,674.00
02/26/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap input.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
02/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for motion to amend hearing.	0.60	14	515.00	\$ 309.00
02/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re hearing re motion to amend.	0.10	14	515.00	\$ 51.50
02/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for motion to amend hearing.	8.70	14	515.00	\$ 4,480.50
02/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise letter brief re J. Joe deposition.	0.10	8	515.00	\$ 51.50
02/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise letter brief re Korean letters rogatory.	0.50	8	515.00	\$ 257.50
02/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference call re hearing preparation for motion to amend.	1.00	14	515.00	\$ 515.00
02/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with co-counsel re hearing re motion to amend.	0.50	14	515.00	\$ 257.50
02/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with D. Harvey re Toshiba summary judgment hearing.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
02/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
02/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for hearing re motion to amend.	10.20	14	515.00	\$ 5,253.00
02/29/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for hearing.	4.00	14	700.00	\$ 2,800.00
02/29/16	GLIOZZO, NINA	Organize class representative files; finalized index and binders for L. Chan.	2.80	14	335.00	\$ 938.00
02/29/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap input.	1.30	7	345.00	\$ 448.50
02/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re [REDACTED] request.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re production loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation.	6.50	14	345.00	\$ 2,242.50
02/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
02/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re [REDACTED] request.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Attend motion to amend hearing.	1.80	14	515.00	\$ 927.00
03/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Cadjo Zirpoli re Sawai deposition; email correspondence re same.	0.20	4	515.00	\$ 103.00
03/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for motion to amend hearing.	2.50	14	515.00	\$ 1,287.50
03/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Travel from motion to amend hearing.	1.30	14	515.00	\$ 669.50
03/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Travel to court and prepare for hearing re motion to amend.	0.80	14	515.00	\$ 412.00
03/01/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for and argue motion to amend.	5.90	14	700.00	\$ 4,130.00
03/01/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap input.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
03/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation re motion to amend.	4.00	14	345.00	\$ 1,380.00
03/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production for loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From 06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To 02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re password encryption issues for document production.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead strategy call; confer with B. Glackin re same.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
03/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Aaron Sheanin and Cadio Zirpoli re Sawai deposition.	0.10	4	515.00	\$ 51.50
03/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re discovery issues.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
03/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
03/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence re litigation fund.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
03/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft statement re motion to amend.	0.20	8	515.00	\$ 103.00
03/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
03/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery issues.	1.40	11	515.00	\$ 721.00
03/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise Sony preliminary approval brief.	1.30	8	515.00	\$ 669.50
03/02/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review correspondence.	0.50	9	700.00	\$ 350.00
03/02/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap input; deposition preparation - Sawai, including document review.	5.80	7	345.00	\$ 2,001.00
03/02/16	RIM, HISUN	Check-in re document review.	0.50	11	345.00	\$ 172.50
03/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.30	4	345.00	\$ 103.50
03/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
03/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
03/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
03/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft submission to court re motion to amend.	0.20	8	515.00	\$ 103.00
03/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery.	0.70	11	515.00	\$ 360.50
03/03/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence re deposition scheduling.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
03/03/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Sawai, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
03/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Acer production and save to file.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review plaintiff documents and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
03/04/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; Casemap input.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
03/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review docket re pending hearing dates.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege logs and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re class certification issues.	0.10	10	515.00	\$ 51.50
03/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery issues.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
03/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re document review.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
03/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list; email correspondence re same.	0.70	11	515.00	\$ 360.50
03/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
03/07/16	RIM, HISUN	Check-in re document review.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/07/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	1.10	7	345.00	\$ 379.50
03/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.30	4	345.00	\$ 103.50
03/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
03/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
03/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
03/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead call re strategy.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
03/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re statement re Apple products.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
03/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re class certification.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
03/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
03/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare and file supplemental statement re motion to amend.	0.40	8	515.00	\$ 206.00
03/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for co-lead call and review Apple statement.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
03/08/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review L. Chan memorandum re [REDACTED].	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
03/08/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Weekly team call.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
03/08/16	GRANT, ANTHONY	Attention to upload of documents to electronic discovery database.	1.00	7	360.00	\$ 360.00
03/08/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap input; deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
03/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.30	4	345.00	\$ 103.50
03/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation re discovery brief.	0.50	14	345.00	\$ 172.50
03/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence for H. Rim review.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.60	9	345.00	\$ 207.00
03/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition subpoena and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re status of deposition notices.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/09/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Shinae Kim-Helms re translations; email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/09/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery.	1.40	11	515.00	\$ 721.00
03/09/16	CHAN, LIN	Review defendants' submission re motion to amend.	0.20	9	515.00	\$ 103.00
03/09/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Manage cost fund.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
03/09/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise preliminary approval brief.	0.50	8	700.00	\$ 350.00
03/09/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap Input; Deposition Preparation - Nakae, including document review.	6.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,070.00
03/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.40	4	345.00	\$ 138.00
03/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re supplemental motion to amend submission.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
03/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
03/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review LG Chem production and prepare for loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege log and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery issues.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
03/10/16	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assistance with upload of electronic discovery documents.	1.00	7	360.00	\$ 360.00
03/10/16	RIM, HISUN	CaseMap input; deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
03/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail counsel re production encryption issue.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
03/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading status.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
03/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re [REDACTED].	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
03/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re production encryption issue.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
03/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review plaintiffs' productions and save to file.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege logs and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/11/16	RIM, HISUN	CaseMap input; deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	5.30	7	345.00	\$ 1,828.50
03/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.30	4	345.00	\$ 103.50
03/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	8	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail [REDACTED].	0.10	1	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on
Timekeeper: all

From 06/01/13
To 02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re [REDACTED] requests.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
03/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery requests for co-counsel review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery responses for co-counsel review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare overlay for loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re [REDACTED] requests.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
03/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.70	9	345.00	\$ 241.50
03/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
03/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/13/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
03/13/16	CHAN, LIN	Review motions to seal.	0.20	9	515.00	\$ 103.00
03/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Consortra, Veronica Glaze, and Shinae Kim-Helms regarding translations; email correspondence regarding same.	0.90	11	515.00	\$ 463.50
03/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery, including editing letter brief; confer with B. Glackin regarding same.	2.40	11	515.00	\$ 1,236.00
03/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Email to court regarding hearing demonstrative.	0.10	8	515.00	\$ 51.50
03/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for call with Consortra.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
03/14/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review copious correspondence re plaintiff and defendant deposition scheduling; office conference with L. Chan re case issues including clawback brief; manage escrow account; telephone conference with Eva Cole re Nakae deposition; email correspondence re scheduling Ed Leamer deposition conditions at Osaka consulate; review transcript of hearing before Magistrate Judge Ryu; review order re motion to amend.	2.20	11	700.00	\$ 1,540.00
03/14/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap input; deposition preparation - Nakae.	4.30	7	345.00	\$ 1,483.50
03/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re document deletion.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
03/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare bank statements for B. Glackin review.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
03/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chart re motion to amend for chambers.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare index re deposition notices for L. Chan.	1.00	8	345.00	\$ 345.00
03/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare time estimate re Japanese depositions for L. Chan.	0.70	8	345.00	\$ 241.50
03/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding amended complaint.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
03/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding document review; email correspondence regarding same.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
03/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list; confer with B. Glackin regarding case strategy.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery issues; conference B. Glackin and B. Troxel regarding same.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
03/15/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence to Eva Cole regarding Nakae deposition; telephone conference with Valerie Williams and Donald Houser regarding same; office conference with L. Chan regarding same.	1.50	11	700.00	\$ 1,050.00
03/15/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan regarding deposition scheduling, expert issues.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
03/15/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Valerie Williams regarding Nakae deposition.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
03/15/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap input.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
03/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare discovery responses for attorney review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
03/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead call regarding strategy.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
03/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions and other discovery issues.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
03/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Review Toshiba summary judgment order; email correspondence regarding same.	0.30	9	515.00	\$ 154.50
03/16/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with co-counsel.	0.80	11	700.00	\$ 560.00
03/16/16	HARVEY, DEAN	Review order denying Toshiba motion for summary judgment, conference with co-counsel re same.	0.60	11	540.00	\$ 324.00
03/16/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap input; deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	3.50	7	345.00	\$ 1,207.50
03/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare reservation check re Osaka depositions.	0.60	4	345.00	\$ 207.00
03/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
03/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery requests and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding Nakae deposition.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
03/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
03/17/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap input.	7.90	7	345.00	\$ 2,725.50
03/17/16	RIM, HISUN	Check-in re document review.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re overlay status.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
03/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification filing for co-counsel review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re overly for H. Rim.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
03/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re deposition transcript for co-counsel.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery issues.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
03/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise Fourth Amended Complaint.	0.80	8	515.00	\$ 412.00
03/18/16	FASTIFF, ERIC	Telephone conference with Lesley Weaver regarding discovery [REDACTED].	0.30	11	750.00	\$ 225.00
03/18/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Manage cost fund.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
03/18/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap input.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
03/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Catalyst issues re duplicate documents for H. Rim.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review LG Chem production and prepare for loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/20/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery issues.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
03/20/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise discovery letter brief.	0.30	8	515.00	\$ 154.50
03/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding discovery and document review.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
03/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery issues.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
03/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer correspondence regarding depositions.	0.30	6	515.00	\$ 154.50
03/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise letter briefs.	0.50	8	515.00	\$ 257.50
03/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Revise Toshiba motion for summary judgment Opposition brief for filing.	0.90	8	515.00	\$ 463.50
03/21/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap input; deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	6.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,070.00
03/21/16	RIM, HISUN	Lithium - LCHB check-in.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
03/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re [REDACTED] request.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
03/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice response and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review interrogatories and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review productions and prepare for loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
03/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review productions re clawback request.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
03/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Steve Williams and B. Glackin regarding claims administrator.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
03/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
03/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with defendants regarding deposition time limits.	0.70	6	515.00	\$ 360.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer regarding deposition time limits.	0.20	6	515.00	\$ 103.00
03/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare Toshiba motion for summary judgment opposition for filing in unredacted form.	0.50	8	515.00	\$ 257.50
03/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet and confer with defendants regarding deposition protocol; telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin regarding briefing; draft outline regarding briefing.	2.10	6	700.00	\$ 1,470.00
03/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Matthew Kent regarding deposition protocol.	0.70	11	700.00	\$ 490.00
03/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Mike Scarborough regarding Stipulation regarding answers.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
03/22/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
03/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.10	4	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding deposition protocol issue.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
03/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding Nakae deposition preparation.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
03/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding settlement and discovery.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
03/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Nakae deposition.	1.30	4	515.00	\$ 669.50
03/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare unsealed Opposition to Toshiba motion for summary judgment for filing.	2.20	8	515.00	\$ 1,133.00
03/23/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review record regarding deposition protocol letter brief.	0.70	8	700.00	\$ 490.00
03/23/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Work on letter brief regarding deposition protocol; telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin and Matthew Kent regarding same.	3.00	8	700.00	\$ 2,100.00
03/23/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae.	5.50	7	345.00	\$ 1,897.50
03/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.80	4	345.00	\$ 276.00
03/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare filings re deposition protocols for B. Glackin review.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
03/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare filings re discovery stay for B. Glackin review.	1.00	9	345.00	\$ 345.00
03/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare response deadlines for L. Chan review.	0.10	3	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re ██████ request.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re ██████ request.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare summary judgment exhibits for filing.	2.50	8	345.00	\$ 862.50
03/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
03/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review docket re ordering transcript.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone calls with class member re tax forms.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with court clerk regarding regarding-filing of unsealed documents regarding Opposition to Toshiba Motion for Summary Judgment.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
03/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
03/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery; conference with H. Rim and B. Glackin regarding same.	1.20	11	515.00	\$ 618.00
03/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for brief regarding deposition protocol.	0.70	8	515.00	\$ 360.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise stipulation regarding answering complaint.	0.20	8	515.00	\$ 103.00
03/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Review Order regarding J. Joe deposition.	0.20	9	515.00	\$ 103.00
03/24/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft letter brief.	2.70	8	700.00	\$ 1,890.00
03/24/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft letter brief re deposition protocol.	1.50	8	700.00	\$ 1,050.00
03/24/16	RIM, HISUN	Deponent selection; deposition preparation - Nakae; catalyst troubleshooting for document review.	6.80	7	345.00	\$ 2,346.00
03/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare filings re discovery stay for B. Glackin review.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
03/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare orders for B. Glackin review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition index for attorney review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.70	9	345.00	\$ 241.50
03/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery requests and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege logs and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Call with Jennie Anderson regarding Sawai deposition.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
03/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead call.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
03/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery and class certification.	1.10	11	515.00	\$ 566.50
03/25/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Co-lead team call.	0.80	11	700.00	\$ 560.00
03/25/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise deposition protocol brief.	0.90	8	700.00	\$ 630.00
03/25/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Mike Scarborough regarding Samsung depositions.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
03/25/16	RIM, HISUN	Deponent selection; deposition preparation - Nakae; casemap input.	4.30	7	345.00	\$ 1,483.50
03/25/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Order hearing transcript.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/28/16	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Assistance accessing account in CaseMap.	0.30	11	360.00	\$ 108.00
03/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Call with Lesley Weaver; conference with B. Glackin and Steve Williams; confer with B. Glackin.	1.20	11	515.00	\$ 618.00
03/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding Nakae deposition.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
03/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding amending class certification brief and discovery issues.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
03/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding document review.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
03/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding amending class certification brief.	0.70	11	515.00	\$ 360.50
03/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
03/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise letter brief regarding deposition protocol; review defendants' portion.	1.70	8	515.00	\$ 875.50
03/28/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise deposition protocol brief.	0.40	8	700.00	\$ 280.00
03/28/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Lesley Weaver regarding [REDACTED]; draft correspondence regarding same; revise deposition protocol brief; review defendants brief.	3.40	11	700.00	\$ 2,380.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/28/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap input; deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	6.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,070.00
03/28/16	RIM, HISUN	Lithium - LCHB Check-in.	0.50	11	345.00	\$ 172.50
03/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare transcript order form for filing.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Shana Scarlett regarding J. Joe and Direct Purchaser Plaintiff depositions; confer with B. Glackin regarding same and work assignments.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
03/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery issue and governmental entities.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
03/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise discovery letter regarding plaintiff discovery responses.	0.10	6	515.00	\$ 51.50
03/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Revise deposition protocol brief.	0.30	8	515.00	\$ 154.50
03/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Revise letter to steering committee firm.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
03/29/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Read, review, finalize and file deposition protocol letter brief.	4.40	8	700.00	\$ 3,080.00
03/29/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; Catalyst issue troubleshooting.	6.80	7	345.00	\$ 2,346.00
03/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.50	4	345.00	\$ 172.50
03/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare payment re hearing transcript.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
03/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
03/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review productions and prepare for loading.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
03/30/16	CHAN, LIN	Call Jennie Anderson regarding depositions.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
03/30/16	CHAN, LIN	Call with co-leads regarding case strategy.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
03/30/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding ██████ issue.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
03/30/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
03/30/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
03/30/16	CHAN, LIN	Review class certification briefing.	0.40	9	515.00	\$ 206.00
03/30/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence regarding expert preparation meeting.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
03/30/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence to Eva Cole regarding Nakae deposition.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
03/30/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence to Jeff Amato regarding errata.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
03/30/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Email correspondence regarding Preliminary approval papers.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
03/30/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum to Lesley Weaver regarding errata.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
03/30/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review City of Richmond deposition transcript and class certification papers.	0.50	9	700.00	\$ 350.00
03/30/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Cadio Zirpoli regarding Nakae deposition.	0.30	4	700.00	\$ 210.00
03/30/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Weekly team call.	0.60	11	700.00	\$ 420.00
03/30/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; Catalyst issue troubleshooting for document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
03/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
03/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition notice for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
03/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
03/31/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding Caleb Batey.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
03/31/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence to Bob Gralowski.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
03/31/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Read and revise preliminary approval brief and correspondence to Lesley Weaver.	2.90	8	700.00	\$ 2,030.00
03/31/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition Preparation - Nakae; Catalyst Issue Troubleshooting; Deponent Selection.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
04/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery and named plaintiffs.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
04/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Review draft letter brief.	0.10	8	515.00	\$ 51.50
04/01/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review, revise, finalize and send letter to Lesley Weaver.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
04/01/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition Preparation - Nakae.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
04/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft proposed order regarding deposition; review rules.	0.50	8	515.00	\$ 257.50
04/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery hearing and other discovery issues.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
04/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin, Aaron Sheanin, and Mike Scarborough regarding SDI witnesses.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
04/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding document review.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
04/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy regarding discovery issues.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
04/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery.	1.20	11	515.00	\$ 618.00
04/04/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Mike Scarborough.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
04/04/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	6.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,070.00
04/04/16	RIM, HISUN	Lithium - LCHB Check-in.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
04/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re plaintiffs' transcripts for co-counsel.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding Shimizu and Nakae depositions, class certification, and other discovery matters; confer with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding same.	1.30	11	515.00	\$ 669.50
04/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Hitachi regarding privilege logs.	1.00	6	515.00	\$ 515.00
04/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Review draft stipulation regarding Mississippi sub-class.	0.10	8	515.00	\$ 51.50
04/05/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
04/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.50	4	345.00	\$ 172.50
04/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare payment re hearing transcript.	0.40	14	345.00	\$ 138.00
04/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review invoices and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re document loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft court order regarding Nakae deposition.	0.40	8	515.00	\$ 206.00
04/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list; email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	1.10	11	515.00	\$ 566.50
04/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
04/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Legal research regarding unavailability exceptions; draft memorandum regarding same.	3.20	11	515.00	\$ 1,648.00
04/06/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	6.50	7	345.00	\$ 2,242.50
04/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.40	4	345.00	\$ 138.00
04/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail court reporter re hearing transcript.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production for loading.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
04/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Susman Godfrey regarding deposition transcripts.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
04/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding translations and depositions.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
04/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Review hearing transcript; email correspondence regarding same.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
04/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Review motion for relief from non-dispositive pretrial order; email correspondence regarding same.	0.50	9	515.00	\$ 257.50
04/07/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Email correspondence with Lisa Skylar regarding [REDACTED]	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
04/07/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
04/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.10	4	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts for L. Chan review.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
04/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re document clawback request.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery and settlement.	0.90	11	515.00	\$ 463.50
04/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Review draft preliminary approval papers.	1.00	8	515.00	\$ 515.00
04/08/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Sony comment to settlement papers.	0.70	9	700.00	\$ 490.00
04/08/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Lisa Skylar regarding [REDACTED]; memorandum to Steve Williams and Jeff Friedman regarding same.	0.80	11	700.00	\$ 560.00
04/08/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	6.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,070.00
04/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Remove files re Panasonic and Sanyo clawback request.	4.30	7	345.00	\$ 1,483.50
04/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery requests and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review local rules re deadlines for motion for relief.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft court order regarding Nakae.	0.40	8	515.00	\$ 206.00
04/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding class representative depositions.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Review correspondence regarding Shimokomaki and SDI watchlist.	0.10	6	515.00	\$ 51.50
04/11/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
04/11/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review class certification reports and motion to prepare for expert depositions.	4.30	9	700.00	\$ 3,010.00
04/11/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Steve Williams and Jeff Friedman regarding expert bills.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
04/11/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae., including document review.	6.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,070.00
04/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail from Catalyst re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re [REDACTED] status.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare overlay for loading by Catalyst.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
04/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production files for [REDACTED] request.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition exhibit index.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition log.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.60	9	345.00	\$ 207.00
04/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibits and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition summary and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
04/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review invoices and prepare for payment.	0.20	10	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re [REDACTED] request.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/12/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum regarding SDI Proffer.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
04/12/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
04/12/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
04/12/16	CHAN, LIN	SDI Proffer Call.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
04/12/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Manage tax matter for escrow fund.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
04/12/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review correspondence regarding corrections to class certification brief.	0.10	11	700.00	\$ 70.00
04/12/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
04/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
04/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re duplicate document loading by Catalyst.	0.60	7	345.00	\$ 207.00
04/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re privileged documents for L. Chan.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
04/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition exhibit index.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
04/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibits and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/13/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding Nakae and document review.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
04/13/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft erratum for class certification brief; research rules; email correspondence regarding same.	1.50	8	515.00	\$ 772.50
04/13/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding meet and confer with Hitachi regarding privilege logs.	0.20	6	515.00	\$ 103.00
04/13/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding SDI and class representative discovery.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
04/13/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Hitachi regarding privilege logs.	0.40	6	515.00	\$ 206.00
04/13/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Leamer deposition.	2.20	10	515.00	\$ 1,133.00
04/13/16	RIM, HISUN	Check-in with L. Chan re document review.	0.50	11	345.00	\$ 172.50
04/13/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	5.70	7	345.00	\$ 1,966.50
04/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	1.00	4	345.00	\$ 345.00
04/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail status re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re duplicate production issues.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
04/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
04/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition files for Text Map.	0.60	9	345.00	\$ 207.00
04/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re duplicate production issues.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
04/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re overlay documents.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
04/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition log and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review proffer notes and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with experts regarding deposition.	0.80	10	515.00	\$ 412.00
04/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery issues; confer with B. Glackin regarding same.	1.20	11	515.00	\$ 618.00
04/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Leamer deposition, including drafting memorandum, reviewing expert reports and record.	1.00	10	515.00	\$ 515.00
04/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Review Order regarding LG objections to Judge Ryu's order; email correspondence regarding same.	0.10	9	515.00	\$ 51.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/14/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson and Ed Leamer.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
04/14/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	6.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,070.00
04/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft and file errata; confer with B. Glackin regarding same; email regarding same.	1.50	11	515.00	\$ 772.50
04/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery.	0.70	11	515.00	\$ 360.50
04/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Leamer deposition.	2.00	10	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
04/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Nakae deposition, including making necessary arrangements.	0.10	4	515.00	\$ 51.50
04/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Review discovery responses.	0.20	9	515.00	\$ 103.00
04/15/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review errata filing.	0.20	9	700.00	\$ 140.00
04/15/16	GRANT, ANTHONY	Administration of database.	1.00	7	360.00	\$ 360.00
04/15/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
04/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
04/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Leamer deposition.	7.60	10	515.00	\$ 3,914.00
04/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding discovery hearing.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
04/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding document review.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
04/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft court order regarding Nakae deposition; legal research regarding same; confer with B. Troxel regarding same.	0.30	8	515.00	\$ 154.50
04/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Leamer deposition.	1.00	10	515.00	\$ 515.00
04/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Nakae deposition.	0.60	4	515.00	\$ 309.00
04/18/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review [REDACTED].	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
04/18/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; expert deposition preparation - Leamer.	5.80	7	345.00	\$ 2,001.00
04/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	3.00	4	345.00	\$ 1,035.00
04/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re duplicate production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare analysis re [REDACTED] for B. Glackin.	0.80	10	345.00	\$ 276.00
04/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re errata.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
04/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
04/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
04/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
04/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
04/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Leamer deposition preparation; email correspondence regarding same.	2.70	10	515.00	\$ 1,390.50
04/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Review discovery responses.	0.20	9	515.00	\$ 103.00
04/19/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet with Bruce Simon and Aaron Sheanin regarding expert issues.	1.50	11	700.00	\$ 1,050.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/19/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; expert deposition preparation - Leamer; Catalyst troubleshooting, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
04/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.30	4	345.00	\$ 103.50
04/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re duplicate production project.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/20/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding Toshiba discovery.	0.90	11	515.00	\$ 463.50
04/20/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit discovery brief.	0.30	8	515.00	\$ 154.50
04/20/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Collect and review reports and transcripts for Ed Leamer deposition preparation.	1.50	10	700.00	\$ 1,050.00
04/20/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review L. Chan memorandum regarding Ed Leamer deposition preparation; email correspondence with L. Chan and Batteries team regarding Catalyst, hearing, deposition and other issues.	1.00	11	700.00	\$ 700.00
04/20/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Aaron regarding hearing preparation.	0.30	14	700.00	\$ 210.00
04/20/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding hearing preparation.	0.50	14	700.00	\$ 350.00
04/20/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Ed Leamer and Phil Johnson regarding deposition preparation.	0.50	10	700.00	\$ 350.00
04/20/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson regarding Ed Leamer deposition preparation.	0.70	10	700.00	\$ 490.00
04/20/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Weekly team call.	0.60	11	700.00	\$ 420.00
04/20/16	RIM, HISUN	Check-in with L. Chan re document review.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
04/20/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; Catalyst troubleshooting for document review.	5.20	7	345.00	\$ 1,794.00
04/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	4.00	4	345.00	\$ 1,380.00
04/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re duplicate production project.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
04/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare billing report re Econ One for B. Glackin review.	1.50	10	345.00	\$ 517.50
04/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare translation folder for co-counsel access.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding Nakae deposition and other discovery issues.	1.20	11	515.00	\$ 618.00
04/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Leamer deposition.	0.20	10	515.00	\$ 103.00
04/21/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review materials to prepare for defense of Ed Leamer deposition.	5.90	10	700.00	\$ 4,130.00
04/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.40	4	345.00	\$ 138.00
04/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition erratas and save to file.	0.10	8	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.20	8	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
04/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re Sony transactional data status.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
04/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoenas and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery; review deposition transcript, memoranda regarding depositions, discovery.	1.30	11	515.00	\$ 669.50
04/22/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	5.80	7	345.00	\$ 2,001.00
04/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.30	4	345.00	\$ 103.50
04/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
04/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery objection and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Leamer deposition.	3.60	10	515.00	\$ 1,854.00
04/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Travel to Los Angeles for Leamer deposition.	3.50	10	515.00	\$ 1,802.50
04/24/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Leamer deposition.	2.50	10	700.00	\$ 1,750.00
04/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft court order regarding Nakae deposition.	0.10	8	515.00	\$ 51.50
04/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Dr. Leamer deposition, including conference with Dr. Leamer.	6.50	10	515.00	\$ 3,347.50
04/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Revise meet and confer letter.	0.50	6	515.00	\$ 257.50
04/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Travel to and from Leamer deposition preparation meeting.	0.60	10	515.00	\$ 309.00
04/25/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Leamer deposition.	6.00	10	700.00	\$ 4,200.00
04/25/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Read and respond to case related emails regarding expert deposition; prepare expert billing; memorandum to team regarding Leamer preparation.	0.90	11	700.00	\$ 630.00
04/25/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; research on batteries; Catalyst troubleshooting for document review.	5.30	7	345.00	\$ 1,828.50
04/25/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.30	4	345.00	\$ 103.50
04/25/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare productions for loading by Catalyst.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
04/25/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re ██████████ for B. Glackin review.	3.00	10	345.00	\$ 1,035.00
04/25/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/25/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/26/16	CHAN, LIN	Defend Dr. Leamer deposition.	8.50	10	515.00	\$ 4,377.50
04/26/16	CHAN, LIN	Travel to and from Dr. Leamer deposition.	5.30	10	515.00	\$ 2,729.50
04/26/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Defend Leamer deposition, return from same.	13.50	10	700.00	\$ 9,450.00
04/26/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; Catalyst troubleshooting; SDI deponent research, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
04/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.60	4	345.00	\$ 207.00
04/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re ██████████ for B. Glackin review.	0.70	10	345.00	\$ 241.50
04/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition erratas and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
04/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re document loading issues.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Eric Somers regarding Ames deposition.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
04/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding document review.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
04/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding upcoming depositions.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
04/27/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Conference with L. Chan regarding various case tasks.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
04/27/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum to team and Dr. Abrantes-Metz regarding Leamer deposition; review order on deposition protocol motion.	0.80	11	700.00	\$ 560.00
04/27/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
04/27/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan re document review.	0.40	11	345.00	\$ 138.00
04/27/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; Catalyst troubleshooting for document review.	6.40	7	345.00	\$ 2,208.00
04/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.30	4	345.00	\$ 103.50
04/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	1.00	9	345.00	\$ 345.00
04/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding Van Patten.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
04/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Finalize Nakae Court Order; draft stipulation; conference with B. Glackin and B. Troxel regarding same; email correspondence regarding same.	1.50	8	515.00	\$ 772.50
04/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Review deposition notices; confer with Jessica Moy regarding same; email correspondence regarding same.	1.10	11	515.00	\$ 566.50
04/28/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Stipulation regarding Nakae deposition; office conference with L. Chan regarding same.	0.30	8	700.00	\$ 210.00
04/28/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation: Nakae; Catalyst troubleshooting; SDI deponent research, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
04/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.60	4	345.00	\$ 207.00
04/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare instructions for Catalyst re overlay project.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
04/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re status of depositions for L. Chan.	0.10	4	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft court order; email correspondence regarding same.	0.70	8	515.00	\$ 360.50
04/29/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jeff Friedman regarding expert costs; memorandum to Steve Williams regarding same.	0.80	10	700.00	\$ 560.00
04/29/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; Catalyst troubleshooting; SDI deponent research, including document review.	2.50	7	345.00	\$ 862.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
04/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re Japan deposition.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
04/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re time report.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
04/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
04/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
04/30/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding class representative depositions and class member inquiries.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
05/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum regarding Leamer deposition.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
05/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Call Judith Zahid regarding Nakae court order.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
05/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jerrod Patterson regarding discovery.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
05/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum regarding Leamer deposition.	1.60	11	515.00	\$ 824.00
05/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
05/02/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; Catalyst troubleshooting for document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
05/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.30	4	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review productions and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Don Houser regarding Nakae deposition.	0.20	4	515.00	\$ 103.00
05/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to Osaka consulate regarding Nakae deposition.	0.30	4	515.00	\$ 154.50
05/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft Leamer deposition memorandum.	3.00	11	515.00	\$ 1,545.00
05/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding class member inquiries.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
05/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with defendants regarding Leamer deposition.	0.80	6	515.00	\$ 412.00
05/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer regarding Leamer deposition.	0.30	6	515.00	\$ 154.50
05/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Nakae deposition; email correspondence regarding same; confer with Judith Zahid regarding same.	0.70	4	515.00	\$ 360.50
05/03/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; Catalyst troubleshooting for document review.	5.50	7	345.00	\$ 1,897.50
05/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.40	4	345.00	\$ 138.00
05/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/04/16	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Assistance with analysis of produced documents.	0.30	11	360.00	\$ 108.00
05/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Panasonic regarding Nakae deposition; email correspondence regarding same; draft correspondence regarding same.	1.10	4	515.00	\$ 566.50
05/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding case strategy.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
05/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding document review.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding Panasonic witnesses and other discovery issues.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
05/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Nakae deposition, including reviewing documents.	0.10	4	515.00	\$ 51.50
05/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Research requirements for deposition in Japan; draft correspondence regarding same.	1.30	11	515.00	\$ 669.50
05/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Revise task list.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
05/04/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with M. Hasting re Catalyst troubleshooting; confer with L. Chan re document review.	0.70	11	345.00	\$ 241.50
05/04/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; Catalyst troubleshooting; Panasonic deponent research, including document review.	4.60	7	345.00	\$ 1,587.00
05/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.80	4	345.00	\$ 276.00
05/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re document loading by Catalyst.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
05/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibits and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re status of LG Chem overlay documents and prepare for co-counsel review.	1.40	7	345.00	\$ 483.00
05/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re duplicate production loading by Catalyst.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with co-leads regarding expert stipulation and discovery.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
05/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding Osaka deposition; email correspondence regarding same.	0.50	4	515.00	\$ 257.50
05/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft discovery letter brief regarding expert stipulation.	1.00	8	515.00	\$ 515.00
05/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Make arrangements for Nakae deposition.	0.10	4	515.00	\$ 51.50
05/05/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; Catalyst troubleshooting; Panasonic deponent research, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
05/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.50	4	345.00	\$ 172.50
05/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re deposition transcript for L. Chan.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re duplicate production loading by Catalyst.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
05/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding Nakae deposition, translations, and Casemap.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
05/06/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Letter to Phil Johnson; research file and invoices regarding same.	2.90	11	700.00	\$ 2,030.00
05/06/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; Catalyst troubleshooting; Panasonic deponent research, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
05/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.10	4	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Econ One correspondence for mailing.	0.30	10	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Econ One invoices for B. Glackin review.	0.30	10	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition subpoena and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re Econ One correspondence for B. Glackin.	0.20	10	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding class member inquiries.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
05/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter brief regarding expert stipulation.	0.20	8	515.00	\$ 103.00
05/09/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding expert stipulation.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
05/09/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding document review.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
05/09/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter brief regarding expert stipulation; legal research regarding same.	4.40	8	515.00	\$ 2,266.00
05/09/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan regarding expert stipulation brief; telephone conference with Bruce Simon regarding same; memorandum to co-lead counsel regarding expert costs.	1.80	11	700.00	\$ 1,260.00
05/09/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan re Document Review.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/09/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; Catalyst troubleshooting; Panasonic deponent research, including document review.	6.70	7	345.00	\$ 2,311.50
05/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.70	4	345.00	\$ 241.50
05/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail potential class members re purchase history.	0.50	11	345.00	\$ 172.50
05/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading status.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
05/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare e-mails for H. Rim re Catalyst duplication removal project.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading.	0.60	7	345.00	\$ 207.00
05/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibits and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review third party production and prepare for loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Apply for deposition visa.	0.70	11	515.00	\$ 360.50
05/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding Nakae deposition and case status.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
05/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding case status.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
05/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding expert report.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
05/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with defendants and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding expert stipulation.	0.30	6	515.00	\$ 154.50
05/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer regarding expert stipulation.	0.20	6	515.00	\$ 103.00
05/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise letter brief regarding expert stipulation.	0.80	8	515.00	\$ 412.00
05/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Review deposition transcript; draft email correspondence regarding same.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
05/10/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet and confer regarding expert stipulation.	0.60	6	700.00	\$ 420.00
05/10/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	[REDACTED]; telephone conference with Shana Scarlett regarding expert stipulation issues; telephone conference with Lisa Skylar.	1.10	11	700.00	\$ 770.00
05/10/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan regarding Nakae deposition.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
05/10/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review documents from Econ One.	0.70	11	700.00	\$ 490.00
05/10/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin regarding expert stipulation issues.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
05/10/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson regarding materials considered.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/10/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Visa application (Nakae deposition).	0.80	4	700.00	\$ 560.00
05/10/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; Catalyst troubleshooting; Panasonic deponent research, including document review.	3.70	7	345.00	\$ 1,276.50
05/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.10	4	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production documents for B. Glackin review.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
05/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member email re purchases.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/11/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
05/11/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Nakae deposition, including applying for visa.	1.90	4	515.00	\$ 978.50
05/11/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit letter to SDI regarding amnesty cooperation.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
05/11/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Dr. Noll transcript; review SDI ACPERA letter; telephone conference with Shana Scarlett.	2.00	11	700.00	\$ 1,400.00
05/11/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Visa application (Nakae deposition).	1.20	4	700.00	\$ 840.00
05/11/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; Catalyst troubleshooting; Panasonic deponent research; Certified translation review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
05/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with class member re purchases.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re [REDACTED] for B. Glackin review.	0.70	10	345.00	\$ 241.50
05/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
05/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review settlement objections and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/12/16	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Duplicate requested production hard drive; compare and confirm data.	0.80	11	360.00	\$ 288.00
05/12/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to Panasonic regarding Nakae deposition.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
05/12/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery; draft and review meet and confer correspondence.	0.70	11	515.00	\$ 360.50
05/12/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Dr. Roger Noll deposition transcript.	4.90	9	700.00	\$ 3,430.00
05/12/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review [REDACTED]; correspondence regarding same.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
05/12/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Bruce Simon regarding expert stipulation issues.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
05/12/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition Preparation - Nakae; Catalyst troubleshooting; SDI deposition planning, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
05/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.10	4	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail class member re purchase history.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense production for loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/13/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jeff Friedman and Steve Williams.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
05/13/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Lisa Skylar.	0.60	11	700.00	\$ 420.00
05/13/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition Preparation - Nakae; Catalyst troubleshooting for document review.	6.80	7	345.00	\$ 2,346.00
05/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.60	4	345.00	\$ 207.00
05/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail counsel re status of deposition transcripts.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts and exhibits for Text Map.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Econ One billing status for B. Glackin review.	0.20	10	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Acer production and prepare for loading.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
05/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production index.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize deposition files.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence with class member.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense production and save to file.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review e-mails re duplication deletion project by Catalyst.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re Econ One correspondence for B. Glackin.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Cadio Zirpoli regarding document review.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
05/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding document review.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
05/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
05/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery issues.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
05/16/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft letter to Phil Johnson.	2.90	11	700.00	\$ 2,030.00
05/16/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan re Document Review.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/16/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition Preparation - Nakae, including document review.	7.70	7	345.00	\$ 2,656.50
05/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Econ One invoices for B. Glackin review.	0.10	10	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege logs and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Erika Smilevski regarding Nakae deposition.	0.30	4	515.00	\$ 154.50
05/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter brief regarding experts.	1.00	8	515.00	\$ 515.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
05/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery, including revising meet and confer letter.	0.90	11	515.00	\$ 463.50
05/17/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Left message for Ian Papendick.	0.10	11	700.00	\$ 70.00
05/17/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet with Phil Johnson.	2.50	11	700.00	\$ 1,750.00
05/17/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; Catalyst troubleshooting.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
05/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.30	4	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re duplicate loading issues.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare docket for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production index for H. Rim review.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re Panasonic and Sanyo load file issues for H. Rim.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
05/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare withdrawal motion for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
05/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
05/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery requests and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Hitachi production and prepare for loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege log and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoena and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
05/18/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Ian Papendick.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
05/18/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	4.00	7	345.00	\$ 1,380.00
05/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
05/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoena and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/19/16	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Copy, organize and upload requested documents in CaseMap database; load to file transfer site.	1.00	11	360.00	\$ 360.00
05/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
05/19/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN		0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
05/19/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Abrantes-Metz transcript.	1.50	9	700.00	\$ 1,050.00
05/19/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition Preparation - Nakae; Catalyst troubleshooting; Casemap entry- Nakae.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
05/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re duplicate document project.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcript for attorney review.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare instructions re duplicate document project for Catalyst.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re deposition billing for L. Chan.	0.60	4	345.00	\$ 207.00
05/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition errata and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibits and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review redaction log and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/20/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Abrantes-Metz transcript.	1.50	9	700.00	\$ 1,050.00
05/20/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review memorandums regarding potential deponents.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
05/20/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
05/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibits and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding case status.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
05/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding document review.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
05/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
05/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with defendants regarding expert stipulation.	0.30	6	515.00	\$ 154.50
05/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with LG regarding privilege logs.	0.50	6	515.00	\$ 257.50
05/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with defendants regarding expert stipulation.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
05/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Sony preliminary approval hearing.	0.90	14	515.00	\$ 463.50
05/23/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Tachihara apology letters; draft correspondence regarding same.	1.20	11	700.00	\$ 840.00
05/23/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference regarding expert Stipulation with opposing counsel; draft revised Stipulation.	1.00	11	700.00	\$ 700.00
05/23/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan re Document Review.	0.40	11	345.00	\$ 138.00
05/23/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	5.90	7	345.00	\$ 2,035.50
05/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.50	4	345.00	\$ 172.50
05/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation.	1.30	14	345.00	\$ 448.50
05/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Samsung document for loading by Catalyst.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re current deposition log for L. Chan.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re Samsung document for co-counsel.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/24/16	BALLAN, EVAN	Attend settlement class approval hearing in district court.	2.20	10	345.00	\$ 759.00
05/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding preliminary approval hearing.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
05/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Email Osaka Consulate regarding room reservation for Nakae deposition.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
05/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Sony settlement approval hearing, including reviewing papers and related filings.	1.40	14	515.00	\$ 721.00
05/24/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with E. Cabraser regarding settlement approval hearing.	0.30	14	700.00	\$ 210.00
05/24/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson regarding bills.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
05/24/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
05/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition confirmation.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare settlement filings for B. Glackin review.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
05/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
05/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review LG production and prepare for loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Settlement hearing preparation.	0.30	14	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jerrod Patterson regarding [REDACTED]	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
05/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Legal research regarding state law claims.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
05/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Review opposition briefs to class certification; confer with B. Glackin regarding same.	0.20	9	515.00	\$ 103.00
05/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Review prior discovery requests; confer with B. Glackin regarding same.	2.80	11	515.00	\$ 1,442.00
05/25/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft correspondence to Phil Johnson.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
05/25/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft letter to Eva Cole; office conference with L. Chan regarding same.	0.70	11	700.00	\$ 490.00
05/25/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review class certification opposition papers.	2.10	9	700.00	\$ 1,470.00
05/25/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Eva Cole correspondence; office conference with L. Chan regarding same.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
05/25/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; search for early period documents and business cards.	6.80	7	345.00	\$ 2,346.00
05/25/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	1.10	4	345.00	\$ 379.50
05/25/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/25/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/25/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
05/25/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
05/25/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review opposition filings re class certification and save to file.	1.50	9	345.00	\$ 517.50
05/26/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
05/26/16	CHAN, LIN	Review opposition class certification briefing.	1.10	9	515.00	\$ 566.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/26/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft letter regarding Tachihara.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
05/26/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with Shana Scarlett regarding [REDACTED]	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
05/26/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review class certification opposition papers; telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin; telephone conference with Bruce Simon; finalize Tachihara letter; revise expert stipulation.	2.70	11	700.00	\$ 1,890.00
05/26/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise expert stipulation.	0.30	8	700.00	\$ 210.00
05/26/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding Tachihara documents.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
05/26/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
05/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.40	4	345.00	\$ 138.00
05/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence for service.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class certification opposition exhibits and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class certification opposition papers re missing expert report.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
05/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding lodestar, translations, depositions.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
05/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Nakae deposition.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
05/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Review Dr. Leamer errata.	1.30	11	515.00	\$ 669.50
05/27/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Class Certification opposition materials.	2.70	9	700.00	\$ 1,890.00
05/27/16	INNES-GAWN, SIOBHAN	Start reading Margaret Guerin-Calvert expert report and finding authorities cited by report.	1.70	10	345.00	\$ 586.50
05/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
05/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review production and prepare for loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Review website for settlement; email correspondence regarding same.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
05/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Review class certification briefing.	1.10	9	515.00	\$ 566.50
05/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Review documents in preparation for Nakae deposition.	0.20	7	515.00	\$ 103.00
05/29/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	5.00	7	345.00	\$ 1,725.00
05/30/16	CHAN, LIN	Review class certification opposition briefing.	1.00	9	515.00	\$ 515.00
05/31/16	CHAN, LIN	Co-Lead strategy meeting.	2.00	11	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
05/31/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft court order and stipulation regarding Tachihara deposition; email correspondence regarding same.	0.50	8	515.00	\$ 257.50
05/31/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter regarding Nakae deposition.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
05/31/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions and class certification; confer with Shana Scarlett regarding same.	1.10	11	515.00	\$ 566.50
05/31/16	CHAN, LIN	Office conference with B. Glackin regarding class certification briefing and case strategy.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
05/31/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for co-lead strategy meeting, including email correspondence.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

From 06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To 02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
05/31/16	CHAN, LIN	Review class certification opposition briefing.	0.20	9	515.00	\$ 103.00
05/31/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft correspondence [REDACTED]	0.70	11	700.00	\$ 490.00
05/31/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet with co-lead counsel.	2.00	11	700.00	\$ 1,400.00
05/31/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan regarding Class Certification filings.	0.30	10	700.00	\$ 210.00
05/31/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft stipulation regarding Tachihara.	0.20	9	700.00	\$ 140.00
05/31/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review memorandum [REDACTED]	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
05/31/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
05/31/16	GRANT, ANTHONY	Attention to loading of electronic discovery materials.	1.00	7	360.00	\$ 360.00
05/31/16	INNES-GAWN, SIOBHAN	Conduct Westlaw searches to find orders and opinions referring to defense expert, Margaret Guerin-Calvert; write email listing cases and what opinion does/refers to and send to B. Glackin.	2.00	10	345.00	\$ 690.00
05/31/16	INNES-GAWN, SIOBHAN	Create list of sources; search library for sources; talk with R. Mukherji and G. Nigulas about finding books and ordering books and articles; send list of books and articles needed to librarians to get price quotes.	3.50	10	345.00	\$ 1,207.50
05/31/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	6.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,070.00
05/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	1.70	4	345.00	\$ 586.50
05/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
05/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
05/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with defense counsel re expert data downloading issues.	0.40	10	345.00	\$ 138.00
05/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare backup data for attorney review.	0.60	9	345.00	\$ 207.00
05/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
05/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare expert data for attorney review.	1.00	10	345.00	\$ 345.00
05/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare expert reports for Econ One review.	1.00	10	345.00	\$ 345.00
05/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
06/01/16	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Gather articles and/or prices for S. Innes-Gawn.	1.40	10	345.00	\$ 483.00
06/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with plaintiffs regarding Panasonic regarding Shimizu documents.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
06/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding Nakae deposition.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
06/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Dugar regarding Casemap.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
06/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter regarding Panasonic documents; legal research regarding same.	0.40	6	515.00	\$ 206.00
06/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery issues.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
06/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding Nakae deposition.	1.00	4	515.00	\$ 515.00
06/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Review Leamer errata; email correspondence regarding same.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
06/01/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum regarding settlement proposals; review damages information.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
06/01/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Class Certification opposition materials.	0.70	10	700.00	\$ 490.00
06/01/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/01/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Steve Williams and Jeff Friedman.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
06/01/16	INNES-GAWN, SIOBHAN	Save articles found by R. Mukherji; look through prices found; create spreadsheet with citations and info.	1.00	10	345.00	\$ 345.00
06/01/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan re document review.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
06/01/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; Catalyst troubleshooting; early Sanyo document research.	7.70	7	345.00	\$ 2,656.50
06/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	6.20	4	345.00	\$ 2,139.00
06/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare expert report for expert review.	0.10	10	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions and other discovery matters.	1.30	11	515.00	\$ 669.50
06/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Nakae deposition, including reviewing documents and drafting memorandum.	0.40	4	515.00	\$ 206.00
06/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise letter brief regarding Tachihara deposition.	0.10	8	515.00	\$ 51.50
06/02/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence to Panasonic.	0.10	11	700.00	\$ 70.00
06/02/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum regarding [REDACTED]	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
06/02/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Nakae deposition preparation.	2.00	4	700.00	\$ 1,400.00
06/02/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jeff Friedman.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
06/02/16	INNES-GAWN, SIOBHAN	Create spreadsheet with citing authorities and publications of Margaret Guerin-Calvert and prices to obtain.	1.80	10	345.00	\$ 621.00
06/02/16	INNES-GAWN, SIOBHAN	Look at [REDACTED] citations and begin researching literature on [REDACTED].	1.20	10	345.00	\$ 414.00
06/02/16	INNES-GAWN, SIOBHAN	Read Margaret Guerin-Calvert's expert report and identify authorities cited re [REDACTED].	1.90	10	345.00	\$ 655.50
06/02/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
06/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	2.00	4	345.00	\$ 690.00
06/03/16	BATA, RAMI	Calculate length of deposition for L. Chan.	1.20	4	300.00	\$ 360.00
06/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters; legal research regarding same.	2.30	11	515.00	\$ 1,184.50
06/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Office conference with B. Glackin regarding depositions and Tachihara.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
06/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Nakae deposition, including reviewing documents and drafting memorandum.	6.30	4	515.00	\$ 3,244.50
06/03/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence regarding Tachihara deposition and documents.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
06/03/16	INNES-GAWN, SIOBHAN	Meet with B. Glackin re question on which books and articles to order; email R. Mukherji, B. Glackin, and M. Baldwin re questions relating to ordering books.	0.20	10	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/03/16	INNES-GAWN, SIOBHAN	Research economic literature on [REDACTED]	1.40	10	345.00	\$ 483.00
06/03/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
06/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
06/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Nakae deposition, including reviewing prior discovery and drafting memorandum.	3.60	4	515.00	\$ 1,854.00
06/05/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
06/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy regarding Tachihara.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
06/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Matt Smith regarding meet and confer letter; email correspondence regarding same.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
06/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Panasonic/Sanyo regarding Tachihara; confer with B. Glackin regarding same.	0.50	6	515.00	\$ 257.50
06/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Nakae deposition, including reviewing documents and drafting memorandum.	7.50	4	515.00	\$ 3,862.50
06/06/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet/confer with Panasonic regarding Tachihara.	0.80	6	700.00	\$ 560.00
06/06/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Schedule expert call.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
06/06/16	INNES-GAWN, SIOBHAN	Save articles to P drive folder; update spreadsheet of documents.	0.40	10	345.00	\$ 138.00
06/06/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
06/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	1.50	4	345.00	\$ 517.50
06/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare file share access for co-counsel.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with co-counsel and experts regarding class certification reply; email correspondence regarding same.	1.10	11	515.00	\$ 566.50
06/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding document review and Nakae deposition.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
06/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter regarding Nakae documents.	0.10	6	515.00	\$ 51.50
06/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum regarding Nakae deposition.	1.90	4	515.00	\$ 978.50
06/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Toshiba regarding privilege logs.	0.70	6	515.00	\$ 360.50
06/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Review Defendants' class certification briefing papers.	0.20	9	515.00	\$ 103.00
06/07/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Call with co-counsel and experts.	1.00	11	700.00	\$ 700.00
06/07/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Nakae deposition preparation.	0.80	4	700.00	\$ 560.00
06/07/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Nakae deposition preparation; schedule expert call.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
06/07/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review opposition expert reports and outline responses.	1.10	9	700.00	\$ 770.00
06/07/16	INNES-GAWN, SIOBHAN	Research economic literature on [REDACTED]; email G. Nigulas about new and other articles; discuss why two articles are taking longer to obtain with G. Nigulas.	1.20	10	345.00	\$ 414.00
06/07/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan re document review.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
06/07/16	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	7.70	7	345.00	\$ 2,656.50
06/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	5.00	4	345.00	\$ 1,725.00
06/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review productions and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to Panasonic regarding Nakae documents.	0.20	6	515.00	\$ 103.00
06/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
06/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding Nakae deposition.	0.70	11	515.00	\$ 360.50
06/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Nakae deposition, including drafting memorandum and reviewing documents; confer with B. Glackin regarding same.	2.00	4	515.00	\$ 1,030.00
06/08/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Nakae deposition preparation.	4.60	4	700.00	\$ 3,220.00
06/08/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan re document review.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/08/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; Sanyo/Panasonic custodian research.	7.90	7	345.00	\$ 2,725.50
06/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	5.50	4	345.00	\$ 1,897.50
06/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on
Timekeeper: all

From 06/01/13
To 02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/09/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
06/09/16	CHAN, LIN	Review documents to prepare for Nakae deposition.	1.70	4	515.00	\$ 875.50
06/09/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Nakae deposition preparation; telephone conference with Steve Williams and Jeff Friedman.	3.70	11	700.00	\$ 2,590.00
06/09/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, Masunaga, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
06/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	6.50	4	345.00	\$ 2,242.50
06/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Steve Williams, Demetrius Lambrinos, and B. Glackin regarding governmental entities.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
06/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding case status.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
06/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy regarding Panasonic privilege log, production, and Nakae deposition.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
06/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding Nakae deposition and other discovery matters; confer with B. Troxel regarding same.	1.90	11	515.00	\$ 978.50
06/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Review Nakae exhibits.	1.50	4	515.00	\$ 772.50
06/10/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Organize and review materials for Nakae deposition preparation.	1.60	4	700.00	\$ 1,120.00
06/10/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise task list; correspondence regarding settlement.	1.00	11	700.00	\$ 700.00
06/10/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Aya Kobori regarding Samsung deposition; email correspondence regarding same.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
06/10/16	INNES-GAWN, SIOBHAN	Update spreadsheet with authorities obtained for Margaret Guerin-Calvert's report; skim article re [REDACTED].	0.20	10	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/10/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, Masunaga; Sanyo/Panasonic custodian research, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
06/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	6.00	4	345.00	\$ 2,070.00
06/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review hearing transcripts and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/11/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
06/13/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding custodians.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
06/13/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding Nakae deposition and document production; draft memorandum regarding same; confer with H. Rim regarding same; review document production regarding same.	5.90	11	515.00	\$ 3,038.50
06/13/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding Requests for Production.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
06/13/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Manage cost fund / invoices.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
06/13/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review SDI letter; telephone conference with Shana Scarlett regarding same.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
06/13/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Shimizu transcript and exhibits.	3.40	9	700.00	\$ 2,380.00
06/13/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Sony deposition correspondence.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
06/13/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan re document review.	0.40	11	345.00	\$ 138.00
06/13/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; Sanyo/Panasonic custodian research.	7.60	7	345.00	\$ 2,622.00
06/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	1.00	4	345.00	\$ 345.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare privilege logs for L. Chan review.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
06/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare watch list correspondence for H. Rim review.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
06/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.80	9	345.00	\$ 276.00
06/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
06/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoenas and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter regarding custodians.	0.40	6	515.00	\$ 206.00
06/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Review Direct Purchaser Plaintiff Nakae exhibits in preparation for Nakae deposition.	1.30	4	515.00	\$ 669.50
06/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Review documents for translation and use in deposition.	0.30	7	515.00	\$ 154.50
06/14/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Shimizu deposition.	2.60	9	700.00	\$ 1,820.00
06/14/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise letter regarding additional custodians.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
06/14/16	INNES-GAWN, SIOBHAN	Skim article on point pricing as part of identifying good economic articles on the subject.	0.20	10	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/14/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan re document review.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/14/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; Sanyo/Panasonic custodian research, including document review.	7.80	7	345.00	\$ 2,691.00
06/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	3.90	4	345.00	\$ 1,345.50
06/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare docket for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production index.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition errata and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review direct purchaser production and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review revised deposition exhibit and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with co-leads regarding class certification.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
06/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to Sanyo and Panasonic; email correspondence regarding same; confer with Jessica Moy regarding same.	0.80	6	515.00	\$ 412.00
06/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding NEC witnesses and watchlist.	1.70	11	515.00	\$ 875.50
06/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Review documents for Nakae deposition and other discovery matters; email correspondence regarding same.	1.70	11	515.00	\$ 875.50
06/15/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan regarding deponents.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
06/15/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review and edit meet and confer letter regarding new Panasonic custodians; review ██████████; memorandum regarding same.	0.60	11	700.00	\$ 420.00
06/15/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call.	0.60	11	700.00	\$ 420.00
06/15/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; Sanyo/Panasonic custodian research.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	2.10	4	345.00	\$ 724.50
06/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
06/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense production and save to file.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim regarding document review; email correspondence regarding same.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
06/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
06/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Nakae deposition; email correspondence regarding same.	1.70	4	515.00	\$ 875.50
06/16/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan regarding Nakae.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
06/16/16	INNES-GAWN, SIOBHAN	Update list of Guerin-Calvert authorities obtained; research literature on [REDACTED]	0.70	10	345.00	\$ 241.50
06/16/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan re document review.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/16/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; defendant early production document review; Sanyo/Panasonic custodian research.	7.90	7	345.00	\$ 2,725.50
06/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
06/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production load status.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition exhibits for co-counsel review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG Chem overlay for loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production log for co-counsel review.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re Hitachi Maxell production numbers for H. Rim.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
06/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Citibank statements and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	1.40	9	345.00	\$ 483.00
06/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition errata and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
06/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibits and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
06/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review plaintiffs' production and save to file.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege log and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review scheduling order and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
06/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Nakae deposition, including reviewing documents.	4.40	4	515.00	\$ 2,266.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Review Kondo deposition transcript.	1.80	9	515.00	\$ 927.00
06/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Travel to Osaka for Nakae deposition.	11.00	4	515.00	\$ 5,665.00
06/17/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Travel to and prepare for Nakae deposition.	8.50	4	700.00	\$ 5,950.00
06/17/16	INNES-GAWN, SIOBHAN	Research economics literature on [REDACTED].	0.60	10	345.00	\$ 207.00
06/17/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; Sanyo/Panasonic custodian research; defendant early production document review.	9.30	7	345.00	\$ 3,208.50
06/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
06/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare productions for loading by Catalyst.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
06/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.70	9	345.00	\$ 241.50
06/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and revise calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition errata and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/18/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Travel to and prepare for Nakae deposition.	9.00	4	700.00	\$ 6,300.00
06/18/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition Preparation - Nakae.	0.80	7	345.00	\$ 276.00
06/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
06/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Nakae deposition, including review exhibits; email correspondence regarding same; conference with B. Glackin and Jessica Moy regarding same.	6.60	4	515.00	\$ 3,399.00
06/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Review Shimizu deposition transcript.	0.50	9	515.00	\$ 257.50
06/19/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Nakae deposition.	4.30	4	700.00	\$ 3,010.00
06/19/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	3.80	7	345.00	\$ 1,311.00
06/20/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding Nakae deposition and other discovery matters.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
06/20/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Nakae deposition; confer with B. Glackin regarding same.	3.60	4	515.00	\$ 1,854.00
06/20/16	CHAN, LIN	Review Shimizu deposition transcript.	2.50	9	515.00	\$ 1,287.50
06/20/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Nakae deposition.	4.90	4	700.00	\$ 3,430.00
06/20/16	INNES-GAWN, SIOBHAN	Research economic literature on [REDACTED].	0.70	10	345.00	\$ 241.50
06/20/16	RIM, HISUN	Sanyo/Panasonic custodian research; Defendant early production document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
06/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	1.00	4	345.00	\$ 345.00
06/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
06/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG Chem production for loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
06/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition exhibit index.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
06/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
06/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	8	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.20	8	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review plaintiffs production and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege logs and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum regarding Nakae deposition.	0.20	4	515.00	\$ 103.00
06/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
06/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Nakae deposition.	2.10	4	515.00	\$ 1,081.50
06/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Second chair Nakae deposition.	9.00	4	515.00	\$ 4,635.00
06/21/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Depose Nakae.	8.80	4	700.00	\$ 6,160.00
06/21/16	INNES-GAWN, SIOBHAN	Research economic literature on [REDACTED].	1.00	10	345.00	\$ 345.00
06/21/16	RIM, HISUN	Sanyo/Panasonic custodian research, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
06/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.50	4	345.00	\$ 172.50
06/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense production and prepare for loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
06/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum regarding Nakae deposition.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
06/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Nakae deposition.	0.60	4	515.00	\$ 309.00
06/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Review Shimizu deposition transcript.	0.20	9	515.00	\$ 103.00
06/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Second chair Nakae deposition; confer with B. Glackin regarding same.	10.00	4	515.00	\$ 5,150.00
06/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Depose Nakae.	8.50	4	700.00	\$ 5,950.00
06/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet with L. Chan to plan third day of Nakae deposition.	0.50	4	700.00	\$ 350.00
06/22/16	RIM, HISUN	Sanyo/Panasonic custodian research; deposition preparation - Nakae, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
06/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.70	4	345.00	\$ 241.50
06/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
06/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcript for H. Rim review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.70	9	345.00	\$ 241.50
06/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
06/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review sealing declarations and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft memorandum regarding Nakae deposition.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
06/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	1.20	11	515.00	\$ 618.00
06/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Nakae deposition.	1.00	4	515.00	\$ 515.00
06/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Second chair Nakae deposition, including travel.	8.00	4	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
06/23/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Depose Nakae.	8.50	4	700.00	\$ 5,950.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

From 06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To 02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/23/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Email with Judith Zahid regarding expert stipulation issues; telephone conference with Judith Zahid regarding same.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
06/23/16	INNES-GAWN, SIOBHAN	Research economics literature on [REDACTED]; email G. Nigulas re purchasing article; save relevant articles; summarize main idea of each relevant article.	4.30	10	345.00	\$ 1,483.50
06/23/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation - Nakae; new Hitachi production review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
06/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Nakae deposition.	1.60	4	515.00	\$ 824.00
06/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Second chair Nakae deposition.	4.50	4	515.00	\$ 2,317.50
06/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Travel back from Nakae deposition (Japan to San Francisco).	16.00	4	515.00	\$ 8,240.00
06/24/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Depose Nakae; return home from deposition.	19.40	4	700.00	\$ 13,580.00
06/24/16	INNES-GAWN, SIOBHAN	Continue researching economic literature; look through spreadsheet of sources to identify which sources have not arrived; email G. Nigulas to request more articles and ask about sources that have not arrived; summarize more articles.	3.60	10	345.00	\$ 1,242.00
06/24/16	MUKHERJI, RENEE	Locate articles and book chapters for S. Innes-Gawn.	0.50	1	310.00	\$ 155.00
06/24/16	RIM, HISUN	New Hitachi production review; Catalyst duplicate troubleshooting; Defendants' early production document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
06/26/16	RIM, HISUN	Document review re Nakae.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
06/27/16	BOUZAT, FACUNDO	Review documents in preparation for opposition to Daubert motion for B. Glackin.	2.00	7	345.00	\$ 690.00
06/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Attend SDI proffer; draft memorandum regarding same.	0.90	11	515.00	\$ 463.50
06/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
06/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Review Tachihara documents; draft email correspondence regarding same.	0.40	7	515.00	\$ 206.00
06/27/16	INNES-GAWN, SIOBHAN	Put books that Margaret Guerin-Calvert cites in her expert report in B. Glackin's office; email B. Glackin with spreadsheet of authorities and publications; finish writing email to B. Glackin re economic literature on [REDACTED]	0.80	10	345.00	\$ 276.00
06/27/16	RIM, HISUN	Catalyst duplicate troubleshooting; document research - Tachihara, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
06/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Correspondence with class member re purchase history.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.50	4	345.00	\$ 172.50
06/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition summary and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
06/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Samsung proffer and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re plaintiff's production for counsel.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re Samsung production attachment issues.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoenas and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/28/16	BOUZAT, FACUNDO	Review documents related to Batteries case, discuss case with B. Glackin, and begin research for opposition to Daubert motion for B. Glackin.	5.70	8	345.00	\$ 1,966.50
06/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding class certification.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
06/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding document review.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
06/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list; research related case; conference with counsel regarding same.	1.10	11	515.00	\$ 566.50
06/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
06/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Review class notice and related filings; email correspondence regarding same.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
06/28/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with F. Bouzat regarding research assignment.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
06/28/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review notice; memorandum regarding same.	0.40	9	700.00	\$ 280.00
06/28/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson; memorandum to team regarding ascertainability.	0.80	11	700.00	\$ 560.00
06/28/16	INNES-GAWN, SIOBHAN	Update spreadsheet of authorities and publications; put books in B. Glackin's office; email B. Glackin to let him know.	0.10	10	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/28/16	RIM, HISUN	Foreign language document review and management projects.	7.70	7	345.00	\$ 2,656.50
06/28/16	RIM, HISUN	Sanyo/Panasonic Custodian Research - Confer with L. Chan re Document Review.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
06/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.50	8	345.00	\$ 172.50
06/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition erratas and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone calls with class member re purchase history.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/29/16	BOUZAT, FACUNDO	Research and begin writing sections for opposition to Daubert motion for B. Glackin.	4.00	8	345.00	\$ 1,380.00
06/29/16	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Assistance in loading requested documents. Download, organize and upload new data to file transfer site.	0.70	11	360.00	\$ 252.00
06/29/16	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Preparation of requested documents that needs to be uploaded into e-discovery database.	0.50	11	360.00	\$ 180.00
06/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead call; office conference with B. Glackin regarding case strategy.	0.70	11	515.00	\$ 360.50
06/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery and class certification matters.	1.20	11	515.00	\$ 618.00
06/29/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call.	0.60	11	700.00	\$ 420.00
06/29/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Judith Zahid regarding expert stipulation.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
06/29/16	RIM, HISUN	Sanyo/Panasonic custodian research; Casemap document upload.	6.80	7	345.00	\$ 2,346.00
06/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	1.00	9	345.00	\$ 345.00
06/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
06/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense production and prepare for loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
06/30/16	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Research regarding citing authority for this Brado v. Vocera Communications, i.e., subsequent cases citing, relying upon, or distinguishing it per L. Chan.	0.40	8	345.00	\$ 138.00
06/30/16	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Assistance in uploading requested documents to e-discovery database. Preparation/organize data.	0.50	11	360.00	\$ 180.00
06/30/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin and co-counsel regarding case strategy.	0.70	11	515.00	\$ 360.50
06/30/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
06/30/16	CHAN, LIN	Legal research regarding discovery.	1.10	11	515.00	\$ 566.50
06/30/16	CHIPLOCK, DANIEL	Telephone call and emails with B. Glackin re issue concerning Defendants' document production and [REDACTED].	0.40	11	675.00	\$ 270.00
06/30/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call regarding [REDACTED].	0.60	11	700.00	\$ 420.00
06/30/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Judith Zahid regarding expert stipulation.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
06/30/16	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assistance with import of electronic discovery materials into electronic discovery database.	4.00	7	360.00	\$ 1,440.00
06/30/16	NELSON, ROBERT	Meeting with B. Glackin re documents obtained by D. Dimalanta.	0.30	7	875.00	\$ 262.50
06/30/16	RIM, HISUN	Sanyo/Panasonic custodian research; Casemap document upload; Catalyst troubleshooting.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
06/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail U.S. Legal re status of deposition exhibits.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition files for Case Map.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
06/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading issues.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
06/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize deposition files.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
06/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
06/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibits and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
06/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Panasonic production and prepare for loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege log and save to file.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review proffer and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
06/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoenas and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/01/16	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Assistance in exporting report from a database; clear/unload log in account.	0.30	11	360.00	\$ 108.00
07/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding settlement and discovery matters; confer with H. Rim regarding same.	1.20	11	515.00	\$ 618.00
07/01/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan re document review.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/01/16	RIM, HISUN	Sanyo/Panasonic custodian research; Casemap entries; new production review.	7.90	7	345.00	\$ 2,725.50
07/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail to Catalyst re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading issues.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition exhibit index.	0.70	9	345.00	\$ 241.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

From 06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To 02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
07/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review production and prepare for loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise letter brief regarding Walmart motion to compel.	0.10	8	515.00	\$ 51.50
07/05/16	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Begin to find and gather cases in class certification reply memorandum per L. Chan.	0.50	10	345.00	\$ 172.50
07/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with K. Dugar regarding Casemap.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
07/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
07/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions and other discovery matters.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
07/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Review memorandum regarding ascertainability; legal research regarding same.	1.30	11	515.00	\$ 669.50
07/05/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence regarding deposition scheduling.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
07/05/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review and edit draft correspondence to Jeff Kessler.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
07/05/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Demetrius Lambrinos memorandum regarding ascertainability.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
07/05/16	RIM, HISUN	Sanyo/Panasonic custodian research; Casemap entries.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
07/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare consulate payment request form for L. Chan review.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
07/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition exhibit index.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
07/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review corrected deposition exhibit and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
07/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review verifications and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/06/16	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Finish finding and gathering cases and slip opinions in class certification reply memorandum per L. Chan.	1.60	7	345.00	\$ 552.00
07/06/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum regarding cost fund and invoices.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
07/06/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan regarding tracing.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
07/06/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review, approve additional work budgets for EconOne.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
07/06/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson, Jeff Friedman and Steve Williams regarding expert issues [REDACTED]; review Phil Johnson memorandum regarding [REDACTED].	2.90	11	700.00	\$ 2,030.00
07/06/16	RIM, HISUN	Sanyo/Panasonic Custodian Research; Casemap.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
07/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re [REDACTED]	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
07/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize documents on Case Map.	3.50	7	345.00	\$ 1,207.50
07/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
07/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review production and prepare for loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/07/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence with Phil Johnson.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
07/07/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call regarding class certification reply.	0.80	10	700.00	\$ 560.00
07/07/16	RIM, HISUN	Sanyo/Panasonic custodian research; Casemap; first 1000 DOJ production review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
07/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit translations in Case Map.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
07/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/08/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson; memorandum to co-leads regarding same.	0.80	11	700.00	\$ 560.00
07/08/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Work on opposition to Leamer Daubert motion.	1.00	8	700.00	\$ 700.00
07/08/16	GRANT, ANTHONY	Attention to conversion, optical character recognition, and upload of electronic discovery materials into electronic discovery database.	1.00	7	360.00	\$ 360.00
07/08/16	RIM, HISUN	Sanyo/Panasonic custodian research; Casemap; first 1000 DOJ production review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
07/09/16	RIM, HISUN	Sanyo/Panasonic custodian research; first 1000 DOJ production; new production review.	3.50	7	345.00	\$ 1,207.50
07/11/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
07/11/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum to Jeff Friedman and Steve Williams regarding [REDACTED]	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
07/11/16	RIM, HISUN	First 1000 DOJ production review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
07/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production issues.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to [REDACTED].	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
07/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare [REDACTED]	0.50	11	345.00	\$ 172.50
07/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition errata and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review LG production re corruption issues.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/12/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding Daubert brief.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
07/12/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding document review.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
07/12/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft deposition notice.	0.50	3	515.00	\$ 257.50
07/12/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Deposition scheduling.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
07/12/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Email correspondence regarding former LGC employee.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
07/12/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Bruce Simon.	0.10	11	700.00	\$ 70.00
07/12/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Demetrius Lambrinos.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
07/12/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan re Document Review.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/12/16	RIM, HISUN	First 1000 DOJ production review; deposition preparation – S. Lee, N. Choi, including document review.	6.30	7	345.00	\$ 2,173.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading issues.	0.60	7	345.00	\$ 207.00
07/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re missing production files.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize production files.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and revise deposition notice.	0.60	8	345.00	\$ 207.00
07/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and revise e-mail re deposition notice.	0.20	8	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and revise proof of service.	0.40	8	345.00	\$ 138.00
07/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review database re production loading issues.	1.00	7	345.00	\$ 345.00
07/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition errata and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review productions and prepare for loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
07/13/16	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead call.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
07/13/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list; email correspondence regarding discovery.	1.40	11	515.00	\$ 721.00
07/13/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft Daubert opposition brief.	2.90	8	700.00	\$ 2,030.00
07/13/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call (weekly).	0.60	11	700.00	\$ 420.00
07/13/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Demetrius Lambrinos; email correspondence regarding press release.	0.60	11	700.00	\$ 420.00
07/13/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jeff Friedman regarding [REDACTED]	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
07/13/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Steve Williams regarding [REDACTED]	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
07/13/16	RIM, HISUN	First 1000 DOJ production; deposition preparation – S. Lee, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
07/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Class member correspondence.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	[REDACTED]	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
07/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition notice for service.	1.00	8	345.00	\$ 345.00
07/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
07/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review LG production and prepare for loading.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
07/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding case strategy.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
07/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with co-leads regarding case strategy.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
07/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for Daubert opposition brief.	3.60	8	515.00	\$ 1,854.00
07/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Review correspondence regarding depositions, class certification, and settlement; email correspondence and review deposition transcripts regarding same.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/14/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft Daubert opposition; telephone conference with regarding LG former employee; Econ One budget review.	5.90	8	700.00	\$ 4,130.00
07/14/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation – S. Lee, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
07/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Class certification reply preparation.	0.40	10	345.00	\$ 138.00
07/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.10	4	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case law for L. Chan review.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
07/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Daubert briefing for L. Chan review.	0.20	10	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG Chem production for loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
07/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production dates for L. Chan.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re redacted class certification filings.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
07/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare summary adjudication exhibits for L. Chan review.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
07/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
07/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery requests and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re status of expert backup data.	0.30	10	345.00	\$ 103.50
07/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review filings re status of pending settlement deadlines for L. Chan.	0.30	12	345.00	\$ 103.50
07/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review hearing transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translation index and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/15/16	CARNAM, TODD	Pull all Daubert opinions issued by Honorable Yvonne Gonzalez Rogers in ND California.	1.80	8	345.00	\$ 621.00
07/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter regarding Shimokomaki; review prior discovery and orders.	0.60	6	515.00	\$ 309.00
07/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
07/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for Daubert opposition.	3.00	8	515.00	\$ 1,545.00
07/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Review Sony settlement approval transcript and order.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
07/15/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft opposition to Daubert motion; telephone conference with Ed Leamer.	1.00	8	700.00	\$ 700.00
07/15/16	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assistance with transfer of database.	1.00	7	360.00	\$ 360.00
07/15/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition Preparation – S. Lee; New Production Review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
07/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production loading issues.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
07/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case law for B. Glackin review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
07/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Toshiba production.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding document review and deposition preparation; email correspondence regarding same.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
07/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions and document review.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
07/18/16	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assistance with migration of database.	0.50	7	360.00	\$ 180.00
07/18/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan re document review.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/18/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation – S. Lee; new production review.	5.80	7	345.00	\$ 2,001.00
07/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail class member re purchase history.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class member contact list for attorney review.	0.50	12	345.00	\$ 172.50
07/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition exhibit index.	2.30	4	345.00	\$ 793.50
07/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit service list.	0.10	8	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.20	8	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review case map database.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibits save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list, including reviewing prior correspondence.	0.70	11	515.00	\$ 360.50
07/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Review meet and confer correspondence regarding depositions.	0.10	6	515.00	\$ 51.50
07/19/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation – S. Lee, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
07/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Class member correspondence.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/20/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Demetrius Lambrinos and B. Glackin regarding case strategy.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
07/20/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise correspondence regarding document production; email correspondence regarding discovery and class certification.	1.40	11	515.00	\$ 721.00
07/20/16	CHAN, LIN	Review deposition transcript invoices.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
07/20/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft Daubert opposition.	0.90	8	700.00	\$ 630.00
07/20/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan regarding Shimokomaki deposition.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
07/20/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review research regarding [REDACTED]	0.50	10	700.00	\$ 350.00
07/20/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation – H. Shimokomaki, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
07/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Class member correspondence.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with U.S. Legal re missing deposition transcript.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition files for Text Map.	2.00	9	345.00	\$ 690.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare expert agreements for D. Harvey review.	0.10	10	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re deposition transcripts for L. Chan.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit class member correspondence log.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition index.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
07/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize pleadings files.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organizes deposition files.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
07/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organizes discovery files.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and save confirmations re deposition scheduling.	0.10	4	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review escrow statement and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re missing deposition transcripts.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review order and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding Shimokomaki.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
07/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
07/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer correspondence regarding Shimokomaki.	0.30	6	515.00	\$ 154.50
07/21/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with [REDACTED]	0.10	12	700.00	\$ 70.00
07/21/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Work on opposition to Leamer Daubert motion.	1.40	8	700.00	\$ 980.00
07/21/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation – H. Shimokomaki, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
07/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Class member correspondence.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition files for Text Map.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
07/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
07/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding reply brief.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
07/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding Shimokomaki; confer with H. Rim regarding same.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
07/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for and draft Daubert opposition.	3.40	8	515.00	\$ 1,751.00
07/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	EconOne correspondence.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
07/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Jeff Amato correspondence and respond to same.	0.70	11	700.00	\$ 490.00
07/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Leamer draft.	0.30	9	700.00	\$ 210.00
07/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference regarding government entity purchases.	0.60	11	700.00	\$ 420.00
07/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Work on Daubert opposition brief.	2.20	8	700.00	\$ 1,540.00
07/22/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan re document review.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/22/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation – H. Shimokomaki, including document review.	7.80	7	345.00	\$ 2,691.00
07/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding Shimokomaki.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
07/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for and draft Daubert opposition brief.	2.70	8	515.00	\$ 1,390.50
07/24/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation – H. Shimokomaki, including document review.	3.00	7	345.00	\$ 1,035.00
07/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding document review.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
07/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding Shimokomaki; confer with H. Rim regarding same; review Shimokomaki-related documents and correspondence.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
07/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding stipulation with third parties.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
07/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for and draft Daubert opposition brief.	5.20	8	515.00	\$ 2,678.00
07/25/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Manage Cost Fund and Global Economics invoices.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
07/25/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan re document review.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
07/25/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation – H. Shimokomaki and S. Lee, including document review.	7.80	7	345.00	\$ 2,691.00
07/26/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list; review and respond to case strategy and administration emails.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
07/26/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
07/26/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding Shimokomaki; review Shimokomaki documents; confer with Carl Hammar skjold regarding same.	1.30	11	515.00	\$ 669.50
07/26/16	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for and draft opposition to Leamer Daubert motion; email correspondence regarding same.	3.30	8	515.00	\$ 1,699.50
07/26/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Draft insert to joint letter regarding tutorial.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
07/26/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Final revisions to tutorial submission.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
07/26/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Lead counsel regarding tutorial.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
07/26/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation – H. Shimokomaki and S. Lee, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
07/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter brief regarding Shimokomaki.	0.30	8	515.00	\$ 154.50
07/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
07/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for and draft Opposition to Daubert motion.	8.60	8	515.00	\$ 4,429.00
07/27/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation: S.W. Lee and H. Shimokomaki, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
07/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Carl Hammar skjold regarding Shimokomaki; email correspondence regarding same.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
07/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
07/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for and draft Daubert opposition brief.	2.80	8	515.00	\$ 1,442.00
07/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sanyo regarding Shimokomaki.	0.50	6	515.00	\$ 257.50
07/28/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition Preparation – SW Lee.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
07/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding discovery matters and Daubert opposition.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
07/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Carl Hammar skjold regarding Shimokomaki.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
07/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
07/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Legal research regarding Daubert opposition brief; email correspondence regarding same.	1.60	8	515.00	\$ 824.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
07/29/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Guerin-Calvert deposition.	1.50	4	700.00	\$ 1,050.00
07/29/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation – SW Lee; Casemap, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
07/30/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
07/30/16	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for class certification reply brief.	0.20	8	515.00	\$ 103.00
08/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter brief regarding Shimokomaki.	0.40	8	515.00	\$ 206.00
08/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
08/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sanyo regarding Shimokomaki.	0.50	6	515.00	\$ 257.50
08/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Guerin-Calvert deposition, including reviewing prior transcripts.	0.30	4	515.00	\$ 154.50
08/01/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for expert deposition.	3.10	4	700.00	\$ 2,170.00
08/01/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap entries.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
08/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class member correspondence re purchase history.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
08/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare refund request form re Osaka deposition fee for mail.	0.40	4	345.00	\$ 138.00
08/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare translation for L. Chan review.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.80	9	345.00	\$ 276.00
08/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review de-designation brief and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibits and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
08/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
08/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery verifications and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re document custodians for H. Rim.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re status of deposition transcripts.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re status of document production for H. Rim.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re status of outstanding document production.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
08/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review hearing transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review production and save to file.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoena and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Phil Johnson, Steve Williams, and B. Glackin regarding Guerin-Calvert deposition.	1.50	11	515.00	\$ 772.50
08/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list; review email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
08/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Guerin-Calvert deposition, including reviewing prior deposition testimony, expert report.	4.60	4	515.00	\$ 2,369.00
08/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise draft motion to compel.	0.10	8	515.00	\$ 51.50
08/02/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson regarding deposition preparation.	1.40	11	700.00	\$ 980.00
08/02/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap entries; deposition preparation - SW Lee, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
08/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.10	4	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail to U.S. Legal re status of deposition transcript.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Phone call to U.S. Legal re status of deposition transcript.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class member correspondence re purchase history.	0.60	9	345.00	\$ 207.00
08/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Samsung production for H. Rim review.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit class member correspondence log.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize translation files.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.60	9	345.00	\$ 207.00
08/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibit and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re status of outstanding productions.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re status of Toshiba production for H. Rim.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft Daubert brief; legal research regarding same.	6.00	8	515.00	\$ 3,090.00
08/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
08/03/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Deposition preparation (expert).	2.50	4	700.00	\$ 1,750.00
08/03/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap entries; deposition preparation - S.W. Lee, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
08/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	2.00	4	345.00	\$ 690.00
08/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
08/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review production and prepare for loading.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
08/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re outstanding productions for translation.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Margaret Guerin-Calvert deposition, including conference with B. Glackin and reviewing expert reports.	1.90	4	515.00	\$ 978.50
08/04/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Guerin-Calvert deposition.	3.60	4	700.00	\$ 2,520.00
08/04/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN		0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
08/04/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with co-lead counsel regarding tutorial.	0.10	11	700.00	\$ 70.00
08/04/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with opposing counsel regarding tutorial.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/04/16	RIM, HISUN	Review CaseMap entries.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
08/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	1.30	4	345.00	\$ 448.50
08/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading status.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class member correspondence.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
08/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	1.00	9	345.00	\$ 345.00
08/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice response and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Sanyo documents re metadata issues.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
08/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re Toshiba productions.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Toshiba productions and save to file.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
08/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Guerin-Calvert deposition.	1.60	4	515.00	\$ 824.00
08/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Second chair Guerin-Calvert deposition.	9.20	4	515.00	\$ 4,738.00
08/05/16	RIM, HISUN	Document review Casemap entries, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
08/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class member correspondence.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit class member contact log.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibits and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re missing Toshiba production.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re deposition exhibits for co-counsel.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with co-counsel and Phil Johnson regarding regression analysis.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
08/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jerrod Patterson regarding reply brief.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
08/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft Daubert brief; confer with B. Glackin regarding same.	1.20	8	515.00	\$ 618.00
08/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery and class certification.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
08/08/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson; draft Daubert opposition brief; telephone conference with Jeff Friedman.	3.50	8	700.00	\$ 2,450.00
08/08/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap entries; deposition preparation - SW Lee.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
08/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
08/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege log and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Toshiba production and prepare for loading.	1.50	7	345.00	\$ 517.50
08/09/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding class certification reply brief; email correspondence regarding same.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
08/09/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft Daubert brief.	3.50	8	515.00	\$ 1,802.50
08/09/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
08/09/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Panasonic and Sanyo regarding privilege logs.	0.50	6	515.00	\$ 257.50
08/09/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Schedule expert call.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
08/09/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Work on Daubert opposition brief.	4.20	8	700.00	\$ 2,940.00
08/09/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap entries; deposition preparation - SW Lee, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
08/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case docket for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts for Text Map.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production log for H. Rim review.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re third party productions for H. Rim.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re Sanyo corruption issues.	1.50	7	345.00	\$ 517.50
08/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Sanyo production and prepare for loading.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
08/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
08/10/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with experts.	0.80	11	700.00	\$ 560.00
08/10/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Weekly team call.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
08/10/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap entries.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
08/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.10	4	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail court reporter re status of transcript payment.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize production files.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re Sanyo file issues.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re Sanyo data for co-counsel.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/11/16	BELTRAN, EILEEN	Meeting with B. Glackin, L. Chan, and B. Troxel regarding assisting with product code search.	0.40	10	345.00	\$ 138.00
08/11/16	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Find article, [REDACTED], per B. Glackin.	0.30	10	345.00	\$ 103.50
08/11/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin, B. Troxel, and E. Beltran regarding [REDACTED] project.	0.20	10	515.00	\$ 103.00
08/11/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding class certification briefing.	0.70	10	515.00	\$ 360.50
08/11/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding document review.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
08/11/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft Daubert motion.	3.10	8	515.00	\$ 1,596.50
08/11/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise Daubert opposition; office conference with L. Chan regarding same; office conference with L. Chan regarding case status.	1.90	9	700.00	\$ 1,330.00
08/11/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson regarding camcorders; office conference with E. Fastiff, B. Troxel and L. Chan regarding [REDACTED] project.	0.80	10	700.00	\$ 560.00
08/11/16	GRANT, ANTHONY	Administration database.	2.00	7	360.00	\$ 720.00
08/11/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap entries; Deposition preparation - SW Lee, NS Choi, including document review.	7.80	7	345.00	\$ 2,691.00
08/11/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan re Document Review.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare [REDACTED] for Econ One.	1.00	10	345.00	\$ 345.00
08/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/12/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for SW Lee, NS Choi, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
08/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare [REDACTED] for Econ One.	4.50	10	345.00	\$ 1,552.50
08/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sanyo load file for loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Toshiba production for H. Rim review.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/13/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
08/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Carl Hammarskjold regarding Shimokomaki.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
08/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jamie Mamera regarding Consortra.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
08/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Shana Scarlett regarding class certification reply briefing.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
08/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
08/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise Abrantes-Metz Daubert opposition brief.	2.80	8	515.00	\$ 1,442.00
08/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Review response to motion requesting framework for tutorial.	0.10	8	515.00	\$ 51.50
08/15/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan regarding briefs.	0.20	8	700.00	\$ 140.00
08/15/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Daubert opposition (Abrantes-Metz); comments regarding same; draft response to defendant administration motion.	2.40	8	700.00	\$ 1,680.00
08/15/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for SW Lee, NS Choi, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
08/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.10	4	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Draft response re tutorial.	0.20	8	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re [REDACTED] for Econ One review.	2.40	10	345.00	\$ 828.00
08/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
08/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
08/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review motion to compel opposition and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding class certification reply brief.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
08/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding document review.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
08/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jamie Mamera regarding Consortra.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
08/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Shana Scarlett regarding class certification reply brief; email correspondence regarding same.	0.20	10	515.00	\$ 103.00
08/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification reply briefing.	0.70	10	515.00	\$ 360.50
08/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
08/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters and class certification.	1.40	11	515.00	\$ 721.00
08/16/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Call with experts regarding power tools.	0.60	10	700.00	\$ 420.00
08/16/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft class certification reply.	0.40	10	700.00	\$ 280.00
08/16/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Send draft of Administrative motion response to Bruce Simon.	0.10	9	700.00	\$ 70.00
08/16/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson regarding power tools.	0.50	10	700.00	\$ 350.00
08/16/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan re document review.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/16/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for SW Lee, NS Choi; Catalyst troubleshooting, including document review.	5.10	7	345.00	\$ 1,759.50
08/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare [REDACTED] for Econ One review.	4.80	10	345.00	\$ 1,656.00
08/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re LG native files for H. Rim.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/17/16	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Find and download several cases regarding superiority per L. Chan.	0.90	7	345.00	\$ 310.50
08/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Shana Scarlett and Demetrius Lambrinos regarding class certification briefing; email correspondence regarding same.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
08/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Shinae Kim-Helms regarding translations; email correspondence regarding same.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
08/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification reply brief and supporting papers.	4.50	8	515.00	\$ 2,317.50
08/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery and translation matters.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
08/17/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft Metz report.	0.60	9	700.00	\$ 420.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/17/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review, finalize and file response to administrative motion; coordinate regarding reply brief filing.	1.10	9	700.00	\$ 770.00
08/17/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Leamer draft.	1.60	9	700.00	\$ 1,120.00
08/17/16	GRANT, ANTHONY	Extended analysis of documents within production delivered.	2.00	7	360.00	\$ 720.00
08/17/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for SW Lee, NS Choi; informal translation for reply brief.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
08/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Filing preparation re class certification reply.	0.40	10	345.00	\$ 138.00
08/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare [REDACTED] for Econ One review.	3.40	10	345.00	\$ 1,173.00
08/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare chambers copy re economics tutorial.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
08/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re LG files for H. Rim.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
08/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification reply brief and supporting papers.	5.10	10	515.00	\$ 2,626.50
08/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft Daubert brief and supporting papers.	0.70	8	515.00	\$ 360.50
08/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters and named plaintiffs.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
08/18/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/comment on Ed Leamer draft report.	4.90	10	700.00	\$ 3,430.00
08/18/16	RIM, HISUN	Informal translation for reply brief; Catalyst troubleshooting for document review.	5.80	7	345.00	\$ 2,001.00
08/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Class member correspondence re purchase history.	0.40	10	345.00	\$ 138.00
08/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Filing preparation re class certification reply.	0.10	10	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare battery pack coding documents for Econ One review.	2.60	10	345.00	\$ 897.00
08/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence for attorney review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit class member correspondence log.	0.20	10	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification brief.	7.30	10	515.00	\$ 3,759.50
08/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery and class certification.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
08/19/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Respond to correspondence.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
08/19/16	RIM, HISUN	Informal translation for reply brief.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
08/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class member correspondence.	0.20	10	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare hearing transcript for co-counsel review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re notice of appearance for L. Chan.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review bank statement re settlement funds and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
08/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
08/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review hearing transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/20/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification reply brief.	4.40	10	515.00	\$ 2,266.00
08/20/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft Daubert opposition and supporting papers.	0.50	8	515.00	\$ 257.50
08/20/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise class certification reply brief.	5.20	10	700.00	\$ 3,640.00
08/20/16	RIM, HISUN	Informal translation for reply brief.	5.00	7	345.00	\$ 1,725.00
08/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with expert and co-counsel regarding briefing and analysis.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
08/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Revise class certification reply brief.	0.10	10	515.00	\$ 51.50
08/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Revise Opposition to Daubert brief.	5.90	8	515.00	\$ 3,038.50
08/21/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Expert call.	0.40	10	700.00	\$ 280.00
08/21/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise reply brief.	2.10	10	700.00	\$ 1,470.00
08/21/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review revisions to reply brief.	0.30	10	700.00	\$ 210.00
08/22/16	BELTRAN, EILEEN	Fact check brief re motion to exclude expert testimony.	4.60	8	345.00	\$ 1,587.00
08/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft class certification reply brief; confer with Shana Scarlett regarding same.	0.40	10	515.00	\$ 206.00
08/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft Daubert opposition and supporting papers; email correspondence regarding same; confer with Phillip Johnson regarding same.	13.00	8	515.00	\$ 6,695.00
08/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan regarding briefing; review reply brief edits.	0.30	8	700.00	\$ 210.00
08/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Daubert opposition; revise same.	0.40	8	700.00	\$ 280.00
08/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Leamer draft.	5.50	10	700.00	\$ 3,850.00
08/22/16	RIM, HISUN	Informal translation for reply brief.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
08/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Filings preparation re class certification reply.	7.60	10	345.00	\$ 2,622.00
08/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare hearing transcript for co-counsel review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft Daubert opposition brief; confer with B. Glackin regarding same.	12.50	8	515.00	\$ 6,437.50
08/23/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Class certification reply filings.	5.10	10	700.00	\$ 3,570.00
08/23/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Emails regarding Abrantes-Metz report.	0.20	10	700.00	\$ 140.00
08/23/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan regarding briefing.	0.30	8	700.00	\$ 210.00
08/23/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Daubert opposition; office conference with L. Chan.	1.50	8	700.00	\$ 1,050.00
08/23/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review edits to Daubert brief; review objections.	0.30	8	700.00	\$ 210.00
08/23/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise Daubert opposition.	1.80	8	700.00	\$ 1,260.00
08/23/16	RIM, HISUN	Informal translation for reply brief; deposition preparation for SW Lee; Catalyst troubleshooting for document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
08/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Filing preparation re class certification reply.	9.50	10	345.00	\$ 3,277.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/24/16	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Find and download cases marked as useful per L. Chan.	0.30	8	345.00	\$ 103.50
08/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Call Phil Johnson regarding backup data; email correspondence regarding same.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
08/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead call.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
08/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters; draft task list.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
08/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with Sanyo regarding Shimokomaki; confer with Carl Hammarskjold regarding same; email correspondence regarding same.	0.50	6	515.00	\$ 257.50
08/24/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer regarding Shimokomaki; legal research regarding same.	1.10	11	515.00	\$ 566.50
08/24/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for SW Lee; deponent research on K. Goto; Catalyst troubleshooting; document review on the first 1000 DOJ production.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
08/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
08/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation.	0.40	14	345.00	\$ 138.00
08/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
08/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize pleadings files.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
08/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review filings re class certification reply and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
08/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege logs and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Toshiba production and prepare for loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
08/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Attend motion to compel hearing.	1.20	4	515.00	\$ 618.00
08/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter brief regarding Shimokomaki.	3.20	8	515.00	\$ 1,648.00
08/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Travel to and from hearing; confer with Jerrod Patterson regarding hearing; review motion papers.	1.40	4	515.00	\$ 721.00
08/25/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Seung Won Lee and Nam Seon Choi; Catalyst troubleshooting; deponent research on Hiroshi Shimokomaki, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
08/25/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation re motion to compel.	0.50	14	345.00	\$ 172.50
08/26/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with DAPs and Carl Hammarskjold regarding Shimokomaki.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
08/26/16	CHAN, LIN	Review documents and draft Shimokomaki brief.	0.20	8	515.00	\$ 103.00
08/26/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Seung Won Lee and Nam Seon Choi; Catalyst troubleshooting; deponent research on Hiroshi Shimokomaki, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
08/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft Shimokomaki letter brief.	3.20	8	515.00	\$ 1,648.00
08/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding settlement approval and litigation fund.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft motion to compel regarding Shimokomaki.	2.70	8	515.00	\$ 1,390.50
08/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding fee approval and discovery matters.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
08/29/16	RIM, HISUN	Catalyst troubleshooting; deponent research on Hiroshi Shimokomaki, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
08/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare hearing transcript for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
08/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review expert backup data and save to file.	0.20	10	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/30/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter brief regarding Shimokomaki.	0.30	8	515.00	\$ 154.50
08/30/16	RIM, HISUN	Catalyst troubleshooting; deposition preparation for Nam Seon Choi, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
08/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re database figure totals.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
08/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re database totals for co-counsel.	2.00	7	345.00	\$ 690.00
08/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case citations re letter brief for L. Chan.	0.30	8	345.00	\$ 103.50
08/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/31/16	BELUSHKO BARROWS, NIKKI	Find Plavix ruling from this week on Westlaw and send to L. Chan.	0.30	8	345.00	\$ 103.50
08/31/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft Shimokomaki motion to compel and supporting papers; conference with Carl Hammarskjold, Aaron Sheanin, and Eva Cole regarding same; file.	6.20	8	515.00	\$ 3,193.00
08/31/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding settlement administration.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
08/31/16	CHAN, LIN	Review recent legal authority.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
08/31/16	CHAN, LIN	Review settlement administrator invoice; confer with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding same; email correspondence regarding same.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
08/31/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Nam Seon Choi and Hiroshi Shimokomaki; Catalyst troubleshooting for document review.	6.30	7	345.00	\$ 2,173.50
08/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Class member correspondence.	0.20	10	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.60	9	345.00	\$ 207.00
08/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare motion to compel for filing.	1.50	8	345.00	\$ 517.50
08/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare production files for L. Chan review.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re translations for L. Chan review.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.60	9	345.00	\$ 207.00
08/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
08/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
08/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
08/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review expert report and save to file.	0.10	10	345.00	\$ 34.50
08/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review filings re class cert reply objections for L. Chan.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
08/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review hearing transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim regarding document review.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
09/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding [REDACTED], class certification; conference with J. Fanucchi and Demetrius Lambrinos regarding same.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
09/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with defense counsel regarding expert depositions; email correspondence regarding same.	0.20	6	515.00	\$ 103.00
09/01/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan re document review.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/01/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Nam Seon Choi; Catalyst troubleshooting, including document review.	7.80	7	345.00	\$ 2,691.00
09/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
09/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail counsel re service list.	0.10	8	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification filings for attorney review.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
09/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG production for loading.	0.60	7	345.00	\$ 207.00
09/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit service list.	0.20	8	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	1.00	9	345.00	\$ 345.00
09/02/16	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Download and unencrypt LGC-MDL020 production natives.	1.50	7	345.00	\$ 517.50
09/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding cost motion; confer with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding same.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
09/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery, class certification.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
09/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Review briefing and draft response regarding objections to reply report.	0.70	8	515.00	\$ 360.50
09/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition index for L. Chan review.	2.30	4	345.00	\$ 793.50
09/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG production for loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
09/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re deposition transcripts.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
09/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Review discovery correspondence.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
09/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise response to motion to strike reply evidence.	5.90	8	515.00	\$ 3,038.50
09/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding discovery, class certification briefing.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
09/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding motion for costs.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
09/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft response to objection to reply evidence.	1.60	8	515.00	\$ 824.00
09/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Review deposition assignments, settlement, and discovery; email correspondence regarding same.	1.10	11	515.00	\$ 566.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/06/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan regarding case issues; revise response to defendants' objection to new evidence; telephone conference with Phil Johnson.	3.20	11	700.00	\$ 2,240.00
09/06/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Nam Seon Choi, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
09/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with U.S. Legal re missing deposition transcripts.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Filing preparation re evidentiary objections.	0.60	8	345.00	\$ 207.00
09/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG native files for loading.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
09/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare settlement filings for L. Chan review.	0.10	12	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
09/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
09/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review filings re motion to dismiss and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/07/16	ANTHONY, RICHARD	Load deposition exhibits into the TextMap database.	1.50	7	345.00	\$ 517.50
09/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with co-counsel regarding case status.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
09/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list; email correspondence regarding discovery issues.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
09/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and comment on briefing regarding motion to compel.	0.20	8	515.00	\$ 103.00
09/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise administrative motion; confer with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding same; email correspondence regarding same.	0.30	8	515.00	\$ 154.50
09/07/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Email correspondence regarding scheduling settlement call.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
09/07/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Manage Batteries cost fund; memorandum to co-leads regarding same.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
09/07/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Manage escrow, AB Data invoices.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
09/07/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Weekly Batteries call.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
09/07/16	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assistance with uploading transcripts into electronic discovery database.	1.00	7	360.00	\$ 360.00
09/07/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Nam Seon Choi; Catalyst troubleshooting; Casemap entries.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
09/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Class member correspondence.	0.60	12	345.00	\$ 207.00
09/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit class member correspondence log.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense production and prepare for loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review minute order and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review plaintiffs production re downloading issues.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with A. Klamann and H. Rim regarding depositions; email correspondence regarding same.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
09/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin and A. Klamann regarding case status.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
09/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions, discovery matters, fee brief.	1.40	11	515.00	\$ 721.00
09/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise letter brief regarding expert depositions.	0.70	8	515.00	\$ 360.50
09/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise Response to Objection to reply evidence.	0.50	8	515.00	\$ 257.50
09/08/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Final review of opposition to motion to re-depose experts; email correspondence regarding same.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
09/08/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet with L. Chan and A. Klamann regarding case.	0.60	11	700.00	\$ 420.00
09/08/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Meeting with L. Chan and B. Glackin re: summary of case and assignment of tasks.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
09/08/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Meeting with L. Chan and R. Hisun re: deposition preparation.	0.50	11	345.00	
09/08/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review and proofread filings.	0.80	9	345.00	
09/08/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review class action certification documents.	3.50	9	345.00	\$ 1,207.50
09/08/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan and A. Klamann re document review.	0.50	11	345.00	\$ 172.50
09/08/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Nam Seon Choi and Seung Won Lee; research on possible deponents; Catalyst troubleshooting for document review.	7.50	7	345.00	\$ 2,587.50
09/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
09/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re new account.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
09/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sanyo production for loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
09/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review case file procedures with A. Klamann.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
09/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review expert report and save to file.	0.10	10	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review invoices and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/09/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
09/09/16	CHAN, LIN	Review court orders regarding fee and cost awards.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
09/09/16	CHAN, LIN	Review SDI deposition transcripts.	0.10	9	515.00	\$ 51.50
09/09/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Finish reviewing all final class certification filings and accompanying defense Daubert motions.	1.50	9	345.00	\$ 517.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/09/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review Samsung SDI translations binder and create Excel sheet of involved individuals as preparation for KS Lee Deposition.	4.50	4	345.00	\$ 1,552.50
09/09/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Ki Seop Lee; Catalyst troubleshooting for document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
09/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition files for review on Text Map.	1.50	9	345.00	\$ 517.50
09/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare pre-trial order for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense productions and prepare for loading.	0.80	7	345.00	\$ 276.00
09/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice objection and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re Catalyst procedures for attorney review.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/11/16	CHAN, LIN	Review SDI deposition transcripts.	3.20	9	515.00	\$ 1,648.00
09/11/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Begin review of LG Chem Productions binder.	2.00	9	345.00	\$ 690.00
09/12/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with A. Klamann regarding case status.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
09/12/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft outline for KS Lee deposition; review related documents; confer with Shana Scarlett regarding same.	2.40	4	515.00	\$ 1,236.00
09/12/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding class member inquiries, time entries, and discovery.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
09/12/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Deal with invoices, cost fund management.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
09/12/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Ki Seop Lee and Nam Seon Choi; document organization for Casemap; Catalyst troubleshooting.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
09/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail class member re case status.	0.10	12	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re translation project.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re translation loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
09/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts for Text Map.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
09/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
09/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit class member contact log.	0.10	12	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition exhibit index.	1.00	9	345.00	\$ 345.00
09/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition errata and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re missing deposition exhibits.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re witness employment status for co-counsel.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
09/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translation index and save to file.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
09/13/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding response to administrative motion; email correspondence regarding same.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
09/13/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding case management and discovery.	1.40	11	515.00	\$ 721.00
09/13/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for KS Lee deposition, including reviewing prior discovery.	2.20	4	515.00	\$ 1,133.00
09/13/16	CHAN, LIN	Review response to Indirect Purchaser Plaintiff motion to file an opposition to defendants' objection to reply evidence.	0.10	9	515.00	\$ 51.50
09/13/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Deposition scheduling: Sam Kim.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
09/13/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Escrow management.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
09/13/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review judge's standing orders for civil cases.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
09/13/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review most recent filing (IPP Motion to File an Opposition to Defendants' Objection to Reply Evidence).	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
09/13/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update task list and distribute.	0.50	11	345.00	\$ 172.50
09/13/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Ki Seop Lee, Nam Seon Choi and Hiroshi Shimokomaki; Catalyst troubleshooting.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
09/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.30	4	345.00	\$ 103.50
09/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re translation loading.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
09/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Econ One retention agreement for D. Harvey review.	0.10	10	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re searching translations on Catalyst.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
09/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare translations for loading by Catalyst.	2.00	7	345.00	\$ 690.00
09/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition exhibit index.	0.70	9	345.00	\$ 241.50
09/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
09/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
09/14/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Email correspondence regarding expert depositions and objections.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
09/14/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin regarding expert depositions.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
09/14/16	GRANT, ANTHONY	Upload of electronic discovery into electronic discovery database.	3.00	7	360.00	\$ 1,080.00
09/14/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Catalyst training with B. Troxel.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/14/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Search through Catalyst docs for KS Lee custodial docs in preparation for deposition (get through reviewing first 150 docs).	1.50	4	345.00	\$ 517.50
09/14/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Nam Seon Choi and Ki Seop Lee; catalyst troubleshooting; document organization for Casemap.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
09/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare operative translations for H. Rim review.	1.30	7	345.00	\$ 448.50
09/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN		0.20	10	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re Sanyo overlay issues.	2.20	7	345.00	\$ 759.00
09/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with A. Klamann and H. Rim regarding document review; confer with A. Klamann and Aaron Sheanin regarding KS Lee deposition.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
09/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery.	0.90	11	515.00	\$ 463.50
09/15/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Settlement call; prepare for same.	1.20	12	700.00	\$ 840.00
09/15/16	GRANT, ANTHONY	Administration of electronic discovery database.	1.00	7	360.00	\$ 360.00
09/15/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Meeting with H. Rim and L. Chan re: batteries update (go over prep for depositions and doc review status).	0.80	11	345.00	\$ 276.00
09/15/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Prepare for Batteries meeting with H. Rim and L. Chan by reviewing documents accumulated for KS Lee deposition, comparing against H. Rim and L. Chan lists for KS Lee, pulling certified translated versions.	1.00	11	345.00	\$ 345.00
09/15/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan and A. Klamann re document review.	0.40	11	345.00	\$ 138.00
09/15/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Nam Seon Choi and Ki Seop Lee; document organization for Casemap.	7.60	7	345.00	\$ 2,622.00
09/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
09/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail class member re case status.	0.20	12	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re Sanyo overlay.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition exhibits for H. Rim review.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts for H. Rim review.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
09/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare index of exhibit translations.	1.00	7	345.00	\$ 345.00
09/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare retention agreement for D. Harvey review.	0.10	10	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re Sanyo overlay issues.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
09/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit class member correspondence log.	0.10	12	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery requests and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re Sanyo overlay issues.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
09/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review order re de-designation.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Sony production and prepare for loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
09/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone call with Catalyst re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead strategy call; conference with B. Glackin and A. Klamann regarding case management.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
09/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
09/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for KS Lee deposition.	0.80	4	515.00	\$ 412.00
09/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Review case deadlines; email correspondence regarding same.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
09/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Review SDI deposition transcripts.	1.40	9	515.00	\$ 721.00
09/16/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Weekly team call.	0.70	11	700.00	\$ 490.00
09/16/16	KLAMANN, ABBY	Review Samsung depositions for information related to who received reports from competitors.	0.80	9	345.00	\$ 276.00
09/16/16	KLAMANN, ABBY	Status update conference call with L. Chan, B. Glackin and co-counsel.	0.60	11	345.00	\$ 207.00
09/16/16	RIM, HISUN	Document organization for Casemap.	2.50	7	345.00	\$ 862.50
09/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.50	4	345.00	\$ 172.50
09/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare index of translations for H. Rim review.	1.50	7	345.00	\$ 517.50
09/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition confirmations and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re translations for Case Map.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
09/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions and case management.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
09/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Review SDI deposition transcripts.	1.50	9	515.00	\$ 772.50
09/18/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition Preparation for Ki Seop Lee.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
09/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions and document review; confer with H. Rim regarding same.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
09/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with LG regarding document production and 30(b)(6) deposition notice.	0.50	6	515.00	\$ 257.50
09/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for motion to compel hearing, including reviewing Shimokomaki documents.	1.00	4	515.00	\$ 515.00
09/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Review SDI deposition transcripts and exhibits.	1.70	9	515.00	\$ 875.50
09/19/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence to Toshiba re settlement.	0.10	12	700.00	\$ 70.00
09/19/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Manage cost fund/invoices.	0.10	11	700.00	\$ 70.00
09/19/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum regarding Citi escrow.	0.10	11	700.00	\$ 70.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/19/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum regarding cost fund.	0.10	11	700.00	\$ 70.00
09/19/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Read Samsung's YA Oh full deposition transcript to prepare memo for KS Lee transcript (focus on any information about how sales department worked, who had pricing authority, etc.).	4.80	9	345.00	\$ 1,656.00
09/19/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Ki Seop Lee, Seung Won Lee, Hiroshi Shimokomaki and Katsuhiko Goto; document organization for Casemap; Catalyst troubleshooting.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
09/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare letter brief for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re class certification translations for L. Chan.	1.00	10	345.00	\$ 345.00
09/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re documents for Case Map.	1.00	7	345.00	\$ 345.00
09/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition exhibit index.	1.00	7	345.00	\$ 345.00
09/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review draft deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/20/16	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Assistance in duplicating production media; format and compare copy.	1.30	11	360.00	\$ 468.00
09/20/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
09/20/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence regarding deposition stipulation; telephone conference with Jeff Friedman.	1.10	11	700.00	\$ 770.00
09/20/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum to Ed Leamer.	0.10	11	700.00	\$ 70.00
09/20/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Finish reading all Samsung depositions and taking notes on operations of sales and marketing departments, relationship between sales and marketing and other departments, participation of sales and marketing team in meetings with competitors, who had pricing authority, and other information relevant for memo for KS Lee deposition.	7.10	9	345.00	\$ 2,449.50
09/20/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update task list for batteries team meeting tomorrow morning.	0.40	11	345.00	\$ 138.00
09/20/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Ki Seop Lee Katsuhiko Goto.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
09/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	3.30	4	345.00	\$ 1,138.50
09/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG Chem production for loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
09/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re class certification translation for H. Rim.	0.10	10	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit defendant employee status list for L. Chan.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
09/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead call; confer with B. Glackin and A. Klamann regarding same.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
09/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding case management.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
09/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for KS Lee deposition.	0.10	4	515.00	\$ 51.50
09/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Review memoranda regarding case strategy; confer with B. Glackin regarding same.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/21/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet and confer regarding expert depositions; email correspondence regarding same; review draft stipulation.	0.80	6	700.00	\$ 560.00
09/21/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan regarding deposition scheduling; review deposition assignments.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
09/21/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with co-counsel.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
09/21/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review KS Lee Deposition binder materials and begin drafting KS Lee deposition memo for 10/05 L. Chan deposition.	6.60	4	345.00	\$ 2,277.00
09/21/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Weekly Batteries meeting with L. Chan, B. Glackin, and co-counsel.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
09/21/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Ki Seop Lee and Katsuhiko Goto, Catalyst troubleshooting.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
09/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Class member correspondence.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
09/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.50	4	345.00	\$ 172.50
09/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
09/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG Chem production for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
09/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit class member correspondence log.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit translation index.	2.50	7	345.00	\$ 862.50
09/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review escrow statement and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review expert production and save to file.	0.10	10	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and A. Klamann regarding deposition preparation.	0.70	11	515.00	\$ 360.50
09/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding depositions.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
09/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters and objections; confer with B. Glackin regarding same.	1.30	11	515.00	\$ 669.50
09/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan regarding depositions; review Goto documents; telephone conference with Shana Scarlett; telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin.	2.00	11	700.00	\$ 1,400.00
09/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Ed Leamer stipulation; revise deposition assignment list; review more Goto documents; office conference with L. Chan.	1.90	11	700.00	\$ 1,330.00
09/22/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revision to Ed Leamer stipulation; telephone conference with Jeff Friedman; emails to defense counsel.	0.80	10	700.00	\$ 560.00
09/22/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Prepare KS Lee deposition memo.	6.20	4	345.00	\$ 2,139.00
09/22/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Weekly status meeting with H. Rim and L. Chan.	0.50	11	345.00	\$ 172.50
09/22/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan and A. Klamann re document review.	0.60	11	345.00	\$ 207.00
09/22/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Ki Seop Lee and Katsuhiko Goto.	7.40	7	345.00	\$ 2,553.00
09/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.10	4	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re translation loading.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
09/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare translations for loading by Catalyst.	1.00	7	345.00	\$ 345.00
09/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare translations re loading to Case Map.	2.50	7	345.00	\$ 862.50
09/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit translation index.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
09/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize vendor invoices.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibits and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review notice of counsel change and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding depositions; email correspondence regarding same.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
09/23/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Complete KS Lee deposition memo.	7.80	11	345.00	\$ 2,691.00
09/23/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition Preparation for Ki Seop Lee and Katsuhiko Goto.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
09/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
09/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading issues.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
09/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Hitachi production for loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare native files for translation.	1.00	7	345.00	\$ 345.00
09/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare translations for loading to Case Map.	1.00	7	345.00	\$ 345.00
09/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition errata and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibits and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
09/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translation upload in Catalyst database.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
09/26/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
09/26/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review LG Chem translated docs and flag those that mention DY Kwon, or when he is the document's custodian, in preparation to write DY Kwon deposition memo.	2.20	9	345.00	\$ 759.00
09/26/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Deuk Yong Kwon; Catalyst troubleshooting; document organization for Casemap.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on
Timekeeper: all

From 06/01/13
To 02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	1.00	4	345.00	\$ 345.00
09/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare exhibits for loading to Case Map.	1.00	7	345.00	\$ 345.00
09/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare expert report for B. Glackin review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re native file documents for translation.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading issues.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
09/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar re pending depositions.	0.10	4	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding KS Lee deposition; email correspondence regarding same.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
09/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
09/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise response to objections; email correspondence regarding same.	0.20	8	515.00	\$ 103.00
09/27/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Defend Ed Leamer deposition.	7.60	5	700.00	\$ 5,320.00
09/27/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Work on Paul Kwon deposition memo by beginning review of all custodial docs and emails on which he is copied; review deposition transcript of YO Chung.	3.80	9	345.00	\$ 1,311.00
09/27/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Deuk Yong Kwon; Catalyst troubleshooting.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
09/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.40	4	345.00	\$ 138.00
09/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail deposition confirmations to co-counsel.	0.10	4	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare exhibits for loading to Case Map.	3.50	7	345.00	\$ 1,207.50
09/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition errata and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead call; confer with B. Glackin and A. Klamann regarding same.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
09/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding response to objector.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
09/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters and response to objectors.	1.00	11	515.00	\$ 515.00
09/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit task list.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
09/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Review objections.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
09/28/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Deposition scheduling chart.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
09/28/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Email correspondence with co-leads regarding settlement negotiations.	0.40	12	700.00	\$ 280.00
09/28/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum regarding Ed Leamer deposition.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
09/28/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
09/28/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Batteries co-counsel team meeting.	0.50	11	345.00	\$ 172.50
09/28/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Begin review of JW Huh (LG Chem) deposition transcript for DY Kwon (LG chem) deposition.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
09/28/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review LG Chem translated docs binder for DY Kwon docs, compare those against exhibits used in previous LG Chem depositions, and add to DY Kwon depo memo.	4.70	9	345.00	\$ 1,621.50
09/28/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Search for expert tutorial orders in docket and update L. Chan on status.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on
Timekeeper: all

From 06/01/13
To 02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/28/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update task list for co-counsel team meeting.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/28/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Deuk Yong Kwon; Catalyst troubleshooting.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
09/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.10	4	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
09/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification filings for L Chan review.	0.20	8	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare settlement filings for L Chan review.	0.20	8	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading for L. Chan.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production ranges for H. Rim.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with A. Klamann and H. Rim regarding document review and deposition preparation.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
09/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Review Reply regarding cost motion.	0.10	9	515.00	\$ 51.50
09/29/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review/revise deposition assignments.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
09/29/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Continue to prepare DY Kwon deposition memo, including by reading Huh deposition and using information to supplement memo.	6.90	4	345.00	\$ 2,380.50
09/29/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Meeting with H. Rim and L. Chan re: batteries translations and depo prep (weekly status meeting).	0.50	11	345.00	\$ 172.50
09/29/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Meeting with H. Rim re: batteries translations and depo prep.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/29/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with A. Klamann re document review.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/29/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan and A. Klamann re document review.	0.50	11	345.00	\$ 172.50
09/29/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Deuk Yong Kwon.	6.30	7	345.00	\$ 2,173.50
09/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading issues.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
09/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG Chem documents for attorney review.	2.50	7	345.00	\$ 862.50
09/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG Chem production for loading.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
09/30/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding final approval briefing and discovery requests.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
09/30/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Read depositions of JJ Joe and DW Lee (LG Chem) for background and relevant information for inclusion in DY Kwon and YS Kim Deposition Memos. Continue to edit and draft DY Kwon deposition memo.	6.50	9	345.00	\$ 2,242.50
09/30/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Deuk Yong Kwon; Catalyst troubleshooting.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
09/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
09/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition notice objections for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG Chem production for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
09/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
09/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Catalyst invoice re overlay billing.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
09/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice objections and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise final approval briefing.	2.30	8	515.00	\$ 1,184.50
10/01/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Deuk Yong Kwon.	1.00	7	345.00	\$ 345.00
10/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery and Daubert briefing.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
10/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and edit final approval briefing.	0.70	8	515.00	\$ 360.50
10/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Review Daubert reply brief.	0.70	9	515.00	\$ 360.50
10/03/16	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Assistance in accessing file transfer site, download requested document and monitor connection error.	1.20	11	360.00	\$ 432.00
10/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding final approval brief; review drafts.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
10/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Paul Kwon deposition, including reviewing documents.	0.10	4	515.00	\$ 51.50
10/03/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Compare Excel sheet of Kwon hot docs against Kwon deposition memo and note gaps where awaiting certified translations and purported collusive events represented in the untranslated documents.	2.40	9	345.00	\$ 828.00
10/03/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Deuk Yong Kwon and Jun Yeol Youn.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
10/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
10/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to LG Chem counsel re production links.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Daubert briefing for attorney review.	1.30	9	345.00	\$ 448.50
10/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for co-counsel.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense productions for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
10/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re deposition tallies for co-counsel.	1.00	9	345.00	\$ 345.00
10/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize class certification filings.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re status of expert deposition transcripts.	0.10	8	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding final approval brief and depositions; confer with co-counsel regarding same.	1.70	11	515.00	\$ 875.50
10/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for JY Youn deposition, including reviewing documents and prior deposition transcripts.	1.40	4	515.00	\$ 721.00
10/04/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review all Sony settlement final approval docs.	2.50	9	345.00	\$ 862.50
10/04/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review SDI translation docs for JY Youn deposition memorandum.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/04/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update weekly task list for 10/05/16 meeting with co-counsel.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
10/04/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Deuk Yong Kwon and Jun Yeol Youn.	5.80	7	345.00	\$ 2,001.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re production overlay.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re billing.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail U.S. Legal re deposition scheduling.	0.10	4	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition exhibits for loading to Case Map.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
10/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG Chem production for co-counsel.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG Chem production for loading by Catalyst.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
10/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare time status re expert depositions for co-counsel.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition confirmation and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re deposition transcripts for L. Chan review.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re discovery responses for co-counsel.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review production overlay and save to file.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/04/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review sealing declaration and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding LG employee, Daubert briefing, and depositions.	1.20	11	515.00	\$ 618.00
10/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with defendants regarding class certification hearing.	0.40	6	515.00	\$ 206.00
10/05/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review correspondence.	0.30	9	700.00	\$ 210.00
10/05/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Daubert reply papers.	0.60	9	700.00	\$ 420.00
10/05/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone calls with Aaron Sheanin regarding hearing on class certification; telephone conference with Defense counsel regarding same; team call.	0.80	11	700.00	\$ 560.00
10/05/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Weekly meeting with co-counsel and B. Glackin.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/05/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Jun Yeol Youn, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
10/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.50	4	345.00	\$ 172.50
10/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition scheduling.	0.10	4	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
10/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Daubert briefing for attorney review.	0.10	10	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Daubert briefing for attorney review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare protective order for attorney review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit exhibits in Case Map.	2.50	7	345.00	\$ 862.50
10/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review calendar re pending depositions.	0.10	4	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition confirmation and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Telephone call with U.S. Legal re deposition issues.	0.10	4	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and A. Klamann regarding JY Youn deposition.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
10/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.80	11	515.00	\$ 412.00
10/06/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Batteries team meeting with L Chan and H Rim	0.50	11	345.00	\$ 172.50
10/06/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review SDI's KS Lee deposition transcript from 10/05/16 and use to supplement JY Youn deposition memo.	1.60	9	345.00	\$ 552.00
10/06/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan and A. Klamann re document review.	0.40	11	345.00	\$ 138.00
10/06/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jun Yeol Youn.	7.60	7	345.00	\$ 2,622.00
10/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit exhibits in Casemap.	3.00	7	345.00	\$ 1,035.00
10/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
10/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review expert backup data and save to file.	0.10	10	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/07/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jun Yeol Youn.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
10/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit exhibits in Casemap.	2.20	7	345.00	\$ 759.00
10/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Catalyst invoices for L. Chan.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition objection and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
10/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
10/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise motion to compel.	0.10	8	515.00	\$ 51.50
10/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
10/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise motion to compel.	0.30	8	515.00	\$ 154.50
10/10/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Finishing reviewing KS Lee's (SDI) deposition and supplement JY Youn (SDI) deposition memo as applicable.	1.50	9	345.00	\$ 517.50
10/10/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review full transcript of JY Youn's CRT deposition in preparation for his batteries deposition; add relevant information to JY Youn (SDI) Deposition memo.	4.10	9	345.00	\$ 1,414.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/10/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review local rules re: opposition due date for defendants' Rule 7-11 administrative motion for more time at class certification hearing and compile facts/data for response.	1.40	1	345.00	\$ 483.00
10/10/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jun Yeol Youn.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
10/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Class certification hearing preparation.	0.50	10	345.00	\$ 172.50
10/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re clawback status.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare clawback request for Catalyst.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare productions for loading.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
10/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
10/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review subpoena and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review transcripts re bifurcation for L. Chan.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/11/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and A. Klamann regarding document review.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
10/11/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
10/11/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise Response to administrative motion regarding class certification hearing.	0.40	8	515.00	\$ 206.00
10/11/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review administrative motion re class certification hearing.	0.40	9	700.00	\$ 280.00
10/11/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
10/11/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Shana Scarlett; review correspondence from Nate Einer.	0.60	11	700.00	\$ 420.00
10/11/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN		0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
10/11/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review SDI and LG Chem docs involving JY Youn for inclusion in JY Youn deposition memo and discuss issues and questions with H. Rim. Continue drafting JY Youn deposition memo.	5.50	9	345.00	\$ 1,897.50
10/11/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Weekly batteries meetings with H. Rim and L. Chan	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
10/11/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with A. Klamann re document review.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/11/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan and A. Klamann re document review.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
10/11/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jun Yeol Youn and Paul Kwon, including document review.	7.60	7	345.00	\$ 2,622.00
10/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
10/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail re settlement inquiry.	0.10	12	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare defense production for co-counsel.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re clawback production for co-counsel.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/12/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Mike Scarborough regarding depositions; email correspondence regarding same.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
10/12/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
10/12/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise task list; email correspondence regarding same.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/12/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Add case map ID'd docs to JY Youn deposition memo.	0.80	9	345.00	\$ 276.00
10/12/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Discuss JY Youn deposition translation issues with H. Rim and review SDI rogs and CRT deposition transcript to clarify official spelling of his English name.	0.40	11	345.00	\$ 138.00
10/12/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review and edit Plaintiffs' Opposition to Defendants' Motion for Additional Time.	0.20	8	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/12/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update task list for weekly co-lead counsel call.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/12/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jun Yeol Youn.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
10/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	8	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/13/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Aaron Sheanin regarding depositions; email correspondence regarding same.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
10/13/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review LG Chem TRO request; review and approval final draft of opposition to administrative motion.	0.50	9	700.00	\$ 350.00
10/13/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Continue reviewing depositions, interrogatories and documents in preparation for JY Youn deposition and adding relevant information to JY Youn deposition memo.	3.60	9	345.00	\$ 1,242.00
10/13/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jun Yeol Youn.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
10/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
10/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with LG regarding document production.	0.50	6	515.00	\$ 257.50
10/14/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Call with L. Chan and co-lead plaintiffs' counsel and LG counsel re: LG Chem production issues.	0.60	11	345.00	\$ 207.00
10/14/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Continue working with H. Rim on translation issues for JY Youn deposition and researching and drafting JY Youn deposition memo.	4.30	9	345.00	\$ 1,483.50
10/14/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review LG Chem's response to plaintiffs' first request for inspection and copying.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/14/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jun Yeol Youn and Hiroshi Shimokomaki.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
10/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation re custodial motion to compel.	2.50	14	345.00	\$ 862.50
10/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
10/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and A. Klamann regarding document review.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
10/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding class certification and motion to compel hearings.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
10/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
10/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Shimokomaki motion to compel hearing; review documents.	4.10	4	515.00	\$ 2,111.50
10/17/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum to E. Cabraser regarding class certification hearing.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
10/17/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jeff Friedman and Steve Williams regarding settlement.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
10/17/16	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assistance with download and conversion of electronic discovery from electronic discovery database.	2.00	7	360.00	\$ 720.00
10/17/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Draft letter to LG Chem re: blank document in production	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
10/17/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review contents of new JY Youn deposet binder and use to supplement JY Youn deposition memo where necessary	2.80	9	345.00	\$ 966.00
10/17/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Weekly status meeting with H. Rim and L. Chan.	0.40	11	345.00	\$ 138.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/17/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Work through doc translation issues and priorities for JY Youn deposition.	0.40	11	345.00	\$ 138.00
10/17/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan and A. Klamann re document review.	0.40	11	345.00	\$ 138.00
10/17/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jun Yeol Youn and Hiroshi Shimokomaki, including document review.	7.60	7	345.00	\$ 2,622.00
10/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re searching issues.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail with Catalyst re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare NEC production for loading by Catalyst.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
10/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	8	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding class certification and case strategy.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
10/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
10/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Shimokomaki hearing, including reviewing prior custodian correspondence and documents.	4.10	4	515.00	\$ 2,111.50
10/18/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Continue reviewing documents and other relevant discovery materials connected to JY Youn, conversing with H. Rim on documents that might need to be translated, and drafting JY Youn deposition memo.	1.70	4	345.00	\$ 586.50
10/18/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review documents, briefings, and all other discovery materials to help L. Chan prepare for Shimokomaki hearing on Oct. 27.	2.50	14	345.00	\$ 862.50
10/18/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jun Yeol Youn and Hiroshi Shimokomaki, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
10/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.60	4	345.00	\$ 207.00
10/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail co-counsel re status of translations.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail with Catalyst re searching issues.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification filings for co-counsel review.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare motion to compel briefing for A. Klamann review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition exhibit index.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
10/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
10/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review sealed class certification filings and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review searches re search string issues.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead call.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
10/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
10/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for hearing, including reviewing Shimokomaki documents; conference with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs and A. Klamann regarding same.	1.80	4	515.00	\$ 927.00
10/19/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Email correspondence with co-leads regarding settlement.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
10/19/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Meet with L. Chan re status of document and discovery review for Shimokomaki hearing on October 27.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/19/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review documents, briefing, and all other discovery materials to help L. Chan prepare for Shimokomaki hearing on Oct. 27; send potentially hot documents to H. Rim to review.	4.60	14	345.00	\$ 1,587.00
10/19/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review new hot documents identified by H. Rim and add to JY Youn (SDI) deposition memorandum.	0.80	14	345.00	\$ 276.00
10/19/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update weekly task list.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
10/19/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jun Yeol Youn and Hiroshi Shimokomaki; deponent research on Shinichiro Takao, Nam Seon Choi, and Shinji Scott Nawa, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
10/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail from Catalyst re production status.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re searching issues.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition exhibit index.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
10/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.60	9	345.00	\$ 207.00
10/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Daubert opposition and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review privilege log and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/20/16	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Un-encrypt requested hard drive and create duplicate; compare and confirm files.	1.30	11	360.00	\$ 468.00
10/20/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Shana Scarlett regarding discovery matters; email correspondence regarding same.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
10/20/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding case management and discovery matters; confer with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding same.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
10/20/16	CHAN, LIN	Office conference with B. Glackin regarding case strategy.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
10/20/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Continue preparing JY Youn deposition memorandum; closely analyze LG Chem's 2007-2008 calendar for potential dates of collusive meetings and send those dates to H. Rim for her use in analyzing expense records for JY Youn; review new documents identified by H. Rim.	4.00	9	345.00	\$ 1,380.00
10/20/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review defendants' expert Margaret Guerin-Calvert's expert declaration re class certification.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
10/20/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review H. Rim's suggestions of documents to be translated before Shimokomaki hearing on October 27 and analyze strengths and weaknesses of identified documents for L. Chan.	0.50	11	345.00	\$ 172.50
10/20/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jun Yeol Youn and Hiroshi Shimokomaki.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
10/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition files for Text Map.	0.70	9	345.00	\$ 241.50
10/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG Chem production for loading.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
10/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review expert reports and save to file.	0.20	10	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translation index and save to file.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with A. Klamann regarding Shimokomaki hearing.	0.60	14	515.00	\$ 309.00
10/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.10	14	515.00	\$ 51.50
10/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Shimokomaki hearing, including reviewing documents.	0.20	14	515.00	\$ 103.00
10/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Review documents; email correspondence re same.	0.10	7	515.00	\$ 51.50
10/21/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Continue reviewing documents for Shimokomaki hearing, work with H. Rim to get selected documents rush translated, and prepare summaries for L. Chan of new documents for use in October 27 hearing.	2.20	14	345.00	\$ 759.00
10/21/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Meet with L. Chan to discuss documents flagged for and otherwise prepare for October 27th hearing.	0.50	14	345.00	\$ 172.50
10/21/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jun Yeol Youn and Hiroshi Shimokomaki; Catalyst troubleshooting for document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
10/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation re motion to compel.	0.60	14	345.00	\$ 207.00
10/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification exhibit for H. Rim review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare LG Chem production for loading by Catalyst.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
10/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading for H. Rim.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/24/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Pull all documents responsive to court's request re: sealed documents concerning the motion for class certification and/or Daubert motions and discuss strategy for dividing work with co-counsel.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
10/24/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Work with B. Troxel and H. Rim to prepare all documents for L. Chan for 10/27 hearing re Shimokomaki briefing.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/24/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jun Yeol Youn and Hiroshi Shimokomaki.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
10/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation re motion to compel.	1.50	14	345.00	\$ 517.50
10/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review expert Declaration and save to file.	0.10	10	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/24/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review expert invoice and save to file.	0.10	10	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/25/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Shimokomaki hearing; confer with Cadio Zirpoli regarding same.	0.80	14	515.00	\$ 412.00
10/25/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with co-counsel regarding class certification hearing planning.	0.90	14	700.00	\$ 630.00
10/25/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Analyze new documents identified by H. Rim and provide analysis on whether or not they need to be translated for JY Youn (Sanyo) deposition.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/25/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Participate in call with all IPP and DPP plaintiff and defense counsel re: strategy for dividing work to comply with court's request for sealed and unsealed versions of all class certification documents before class certification hearing.	0.70	11	345.00	\$ 241.50
10/25/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Prepare summaries of all documents in Shimokomaki 10/27 hearing binder for L. Chan.	1.40	11	345.00	\$ 483.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/25/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Pull IPP's unsealed, as-filed opening papers for class certification motion and compare against those in the custody of co-counsel in order to comply with court's request for copies before class certification hearing. Communicate with IPP co-counsel re: dividing work to comply with court's request for sealed and unsealed versions of all class certification documents before class certification hearing.	0.50	11	345.00	\$ 172.50
10/25/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jun Yeol Youn and Hiroshi Shimokomaki.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
10/25/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	1.50	4	345.00	\$ 517.50
10/25/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation re motion to compel.	1.50	14	345.00	\$ 517.50
10/26/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
10/26/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
10/26/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for motion to compel hearing, including reviewing documents; confer with Cadjo Zirpoli regarding same.	6.30	14	515.00	\$ 3,244.50
10/26/16	CHAN, LIN	Review statement of recent decision.	0.40	9	515.00	\$ 206.00
10/26/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Attend conference call with counsel for defendant LG Chemical and co-counsel regarding production status and issues.	0.80	6	345.00	\$ 276.00
10/26/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Prepare materials for Shimokomaki motion to compel hearing on October 27, 2016.	0.80	11	345.00	\$ 276.00
10/26/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review translation recommendations from H. Rim and make suggestions to L. Chan re what documents would be useful in JY Youn deposition.	0.50	11	345.00	\$ 172.50
10/26/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update weekly Batteries task list.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/26/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jun Yeol Youn and Hiroshi Shimokomaki.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
10/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	2.00	4	345.00	\$ 690.00
10/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation re motion to compel.	2.00	14	345.00	\$ 690.00
10/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/26/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review LG Chem production and prepare for loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding deposition preparation.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
10/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for motion to compel hearing.	0.50	14	515.00	\$ 257.50
10/27/16	CHAN, LIN	Travel to and from, argue motion to compel, and conference with co-counsel and Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs.	3.30	14	515.00	\$ 1,699.50
10/27/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Attend motion to compel Shimokomaki's electronically stored data in Oakland.	3.00	14	345.00	\$ 1,035.00
10/27/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Participate in call with co-counsel and defendants re court's request for docket correction and corrected versions of unsealed and sealed class certification and Daubert motions.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
10/27/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Prepare materials pursuant to court's request for docket correction and corrected versions of unsealed and sealed class certification and Daubert motions.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/27/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Weekly document review/translation meeting with H. Rim.	0.70	11	345.00	\$ 241.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/27/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with A. Klamann re document review.	0.70	11	345.00	\$ 241.50
10/27/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jun Yeol Youn, Hiroshi Shimokomaki and Young Sun Kim, including document review.	7.30	7	345.00	\$ 2,518.50
10/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.30	4	345.00	\$ 103.50
10/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
10/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation.	0.30	14	345.00	\$ 103.50
10/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification filings for court.	3.50	8	345.00	\$ 1,207.50
10/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/27/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Office conference with B. Glackin regarding settlements, case strategy, and class certification.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
10/28/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan regarding Shimokomaki hearing and settlement issues.	1.50	11	700.00	\$ 1,050.00
10/28/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jun Yeol Youn and Young Sun Kim, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
10/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.80	4	345.00	\$ 276.00
10/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.60	9	345.00	\$ 207.00
10/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification filings for co-counsel review.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
10/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and save class certification files sent to court.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class certification sealing requests and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
10/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review LG Chem production and prepare for loading by Catalyst.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
10/30/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Finish researching and writing deposition memo for JY Youn (SDI) for L. Chan.	2.50	4	345.00	\$ 862.50
10/31/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for JY Youn deposition.	0.80	4	515.00	\$ 412.00
10/31/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with B. Troxel regarding hearing preparation.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
10/31/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft LGC settlement agreement; comments re same.	0.80	11	700.00	\$ 560.00
10/31/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update JY Youn deposition memorandum pursuant to suggested edits from H. Rim.	0.40	11	345.00	\$ 138.00
10/31/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Young Sun Kim and Jun Yeol Youn, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
10/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Class certification hearing preparation.	3.00	14	345.00	\$ 1,035.00
10/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.10	4	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
10/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail court reporter re hearing transcript.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
10/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare time report for service.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
10/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and save re-filed class certification pleadings.	0.20	8	345.00	\$ 69.00
10/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re status of sealing exhibits for co-counsel.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
10/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review sealing exhibits and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
10/31/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding class certification hearing.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
11/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for JY Youn deposition.	3.50	4	515.00	\$ 1,802.50
11/01/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Prepare documents and memorandum for JY Youn deposition.	3.50	4	345.00	\$ 1,207.50
11/01/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Young Sun Kim and Jun Yeol Youn, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
11/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	4.70	4	345.00	\$ 1,621.50
11/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with court reporter re transcript.	0.10	14	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation re motion to dismiss.	0.50	14	345.00	\$ 172.50
11/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcript for co-counsel review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with co-leads regarding case strategy; conference with A. Klamann and B. Glackin regarding same.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
11/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to SDI regarding JY Youn deposition; email correspondence regarding same.	0.60	6	515.00	\$ 309.00
11/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding translations and other discovery matters.	1.20	11	515.00	\$ 618.00
11/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for JY Youn deposition; confer with Cadio Zirpoli and A. Klamann regarding same.	2.60	4	515.00	\$ 1,339.00
11/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Review class certification papers.	2.90	9	515.00	\$ 1,493.50
11/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Review objection to Sony settlement; review expert reports; email correspondence regarding same.	0.70	9	515.00	\$ 360.50
11/02/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for oral argument.	1.50	14	700.00	\$ 1,050.00
11/02/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with co-counsel.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
11/02/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Assist L. Chan in preparing for deposition of JY Youn.	3.60	11	345.00	\$ 1,242.00
11/02/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Attend meeting with L. Chan and Cadio Zirpoli to prepare for JY Youn deposition.	1.00	11	345.00	\$ 345.00
11/02/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Attend weekly batteries meeting with co-lead counsel.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
11/02/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Draft letter to defense counsel regarding proffer ahead of JY Youn deposition.	0.40	11	345.00	\$ 138.00
11/02/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Prepare deposition notice for Takeda deposition.	0.80	2	345.00	\$ 276.00
11/02/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Prepare task list for weekly batteries meeting with co-lead counsel.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/02/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jun Yeol Youn and Hiroshi Shimokomaki, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
11/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	1.20	4	345.00	\$ 414.00
11/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re Sanyo clawback request.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail court reporter re hearing transcript.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation re motion to dismiss.	1.50	4	345.00	\$ 517.50
11/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence for A. Klamann review.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare settlement filings for A. Klamann review.	1.30	8	345.00	\$ 448.50
11/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize filings re motions to dismiss.	1.30	4	345.00	\$ 448.50
11/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re Sanyo clawback request.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
11/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer correspondence regarding translation objections; draft stipulation.	0.70	6	515.00	\$ 360.50
11/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for JY Youn deposition, including reviewing documents.	4.20	4	515.00	\$ 2,163.00
11/03/16	CHAN, LIN	Review class certification briefing; confer with B. Glackin regarding same.	1.00	9	515.00	\$ 515.00
11/03/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for oral argument (class certification).	2.60	14	700.00	\$ 1,820.00
11/03/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN		0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
11/03/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review documents identified by defense counsel in JY Youn proffer and summarize them for L. Chan ahead of JY Youn deposition.	1.80	11	345.00	\$ 621.00
11/03/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review translation protocol and recommend next steps in dispute over Shimokomaki document translation.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/03/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition Preparation on Jun Yeol Youn and Hiroshi Shimokomaki.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
11/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	4.00	4	345.00	\$ 1,380.00
11/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with court reporter re hearing transcript.	0.10	8	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class certification filings for L. Chan review.	0.60	9	345.00	\$ 207.00
11/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re clawback request.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare transcript form for e-filing.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
11/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize filings re motions to dismiss.	0.40	4	345.00	\$ 138.00
11/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
11/03/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re motion to compel.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/04/16	CARNAM, TODD	Research recent 9th Circuit authority on ascertainability in the Rule 23 context.	1.80	8	345.00	\$ 621.00
11/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding class certification.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
11/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft deposition notice.	0.10	2	515.00	\$ 51.50
11/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
11/04/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for JY Youn deposition; conference with H. Rim and A. Klamann regarding same; review documents for deposition.	3.40	4	515.00	\$ 1,751.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/04/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for oral argument (class certification).	3.40	14	700.00	\$ 2,380.00
11/04/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Finalize and send notice of deposition for J Takeda.	0.50	8	345.00	\$ 172.50
11/04/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Meetings with L. Chan and H. Rim re JY Youn documents and deposition preparation.	2.30	11	345.00	\$ 793.50
11/04/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Work with L. Chan to prepare for JY Youn's deposition.	3.00	11	345.00	\$ 1,035.00
11/04/16	RIM, HISUN	Confer with L. Chan and A. Klamann re Jun Yeol Youn deposition.	2.30	11	345.00	\$ 793.50
11/04/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jun Yeol Youn, including document review.	4.20	7	345.00	\$ 1,449.00
11/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for JY Youn deposition.	5.40	4	515.00	\$ 2,781.00
11/06/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Find and analyze claims forms and settlement notices in previous component parts cases to determine what type of proof was required to submit a claim.	0.60	11	345.00	\$ 207.00
11/06/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Put together an index of documents for reference in the November 8 proffer call with SDI counsel.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
11/06/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jun Yeol Youn, including document review.	4.30	7	345.00	\$ 1,483.50
11/07/16	CARNAM, TODD	Find claims forms for various antitrust class action settlements.	2.00	12	345.00	\$ 690.00
11/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer regarding translation objections.	0.10	6	515.00	\$ 51.50
11/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for class certification hearing.	0.10	14	515.00	\$ 51.50
11/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for JY Youn deposition.	6.50	4	515.00	\$ 3,347.50
11/07/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Oral argument preparation (class certification).	3.80	14	700.00	\$ 2,660.00
11/07/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Assist L. Chan in preparing for JY Youn deposition.	2.20	4	345.00	\$ 759.00
11/07/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Prepare research on the claims requirements in other component parts cases to help prepare for class certification hearing.	0.70	14	345.00	\$ 241.50
11/07/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jun Yeol Youn, including document review.	13.80	7	345.00	\$ 4,761.00
11/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Class certification hearing preparation.	0.10	14	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	7.00	4	345.00	\$ 2,415.00
11/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare claim forms for A. Klamann review.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
11/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Attend JY Youn proffer; confer with Cadio Zirpoli and A. Klamann regarding same.	1.50	11	515.00	\$ 772.50
11/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer regarding translation objections.	0.20	6	515.00	\$ 103.00
11/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for class certification hearing.	0.10	14	515.00	\$ 51.50
11/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for JY Youn deposition; confer with B. Glackin regarding same.	9.30	4	515.00	\$ 4,789.50
11/08/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Meet with L. Chan regarding JY Youn deposition.	0.50	4	700.00	\$ 350.00
11/08/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Oral argument preparation (class certification).	2.10	14	700.00	\$ 1,470.00
11/08/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Shana Scarlett regarding Sony approval hearing; telephone conference with Jeff Friedman.	0.60	11	700.00	\$ 420.00
11/08/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Attend two proffer calls with SDI counsel and other parties ahead of JY Youn deposition.	1.60	11	345.00	\$ 552.00
11/08/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Meet with L Chan re JY Youn deposition preparation.	0.60	4	345.00	\$ 207.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/08/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Preparation for JY Youn deposition, including checking translations, reviewing new documents, and quality control checking all exhibit documents.	2.90	4	345.00	\$ 1,000.50
11/08/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Prepare memorandum for L Chan based on proffer call re JY Youn deposition.	2.50	11	345.00	\$ 862.50
11/08/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	[REDACTED]	2.50	4	345.00	\$ 862.50
11/08/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review L Chan's deposition outline for JY Youn and provide comments and suggestions.	0.40	11	345.00	\$ 138.00
11/08/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jun Yeol Youn and Hiroshi Shimokomaki.	12.80	7	345.00	\$ 4,416.00
11/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	6.80	4	345.00	\$ 2,346.00
11/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare component litigation filings for L. Chan review.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
11/09/16	CHAN, LIN	Email meet and confer regarding translation objections.	0.50	6	515.00	\$ 257.50
11/09/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for and take JY Youn deposition.	11.00	4	515.00	\$ 5,665.00
11/09/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Manage cost fund; memorandum to co-leads.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
11/09/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call regarding class certification hearing and Sony approval hearing.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
11/09/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Second chair at JY Youn deposition.	10.00	4	345.00	\$ 3,450.00
11/09/16	RIM, HISUN	Check translation for JY Youn deposition.	11.70	4	345.00	\$ 4,036.50
11/09/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Hiroshi Shimokomaki.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	1.00	4	345.00	\$ 345.00
11/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare component antitrust litigation documents for L. Chan review.	3.00	9	345.00	\$ 1,035.00
11/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare component antitrust litigation documents for L. Chan review.	1.00	9	345.00	\$ 345.00
11/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare sharefile credentials for co-counsel.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re deposition videos for co-counsel.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding class certification hearing.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
11/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Cadio Zirpoli regarding JY Youn deposition.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
11/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for and take JY Youn deposition.	4.60	4	515.00	\$ 2,369.00
11/10/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare letter brief for filing.	0.50	8	515.00	\$ 257.50
11/10/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Oral argument preparation (class certification).	4.90	14	700.00	\$ 3,430.00
11/10/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Draft memorandum memorializing JY Youn deposition.	3.00	1	345.00	\$ 1,035.00
11/10/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Draft nonredacted version of Shimokomaki brief based on compromises with defendant counsel, circulate and file.	0.50	8	345.00	\$ 172.50
11/10/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Second chair at JY Youn deposition.	1.80	4	345.00	\$ 621.00
11/10/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap entries.	6.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,070.00
11/10/16	RIM, HISUN	Check translation for JY Youn deposition.	1.50	4	345.00	\$ 517.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.70	4	345.00	\$ 241.50
11/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Filing preparation re letter brief re motion to compel.	0.60	8	345.00	\$ 207.00
11/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Hearing preparation re class certification.	2.50	14	345.00	\$ 862.50
11/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare component antitrust litigation documents for L. Chan review.	2.30	9	345.00	\$ 793.50
11/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Sanyo overlay for loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/10/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/11/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for class certification hearing; confer with B. Glackin regarding same.	6.60	14	515.00	\$ 3,399.00
11/11/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Draft memorandum memorializing JY Youn deposition and evidence obtained therein.	3.20	11	345.00	\$ 1,104.00
11/11/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap entries; deposition preparation on Hiroshi Shimokomaki.	4.50	7	345.00	\$ 1,552.50
11/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Class certification hearing preparation.	1.80	10	345.00	\$ 621.00
11/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail U.S. Legal re deposition exhibit status.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail U.S. Legal re status of deposition exhibits.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare component antitrust litigation documents for L. Chan review.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
11/11/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition exhibits for co-counsel.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
11/12/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for oral argument.	4.80	14	700.00	\$ 3,360.00
11/13/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for class certification hearing; confer with B. Glackin regarding same.	8.00	14	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
11/13/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for oral argument.	8.30	14	700.00	\$ 5,810.00
11/13/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Help L. Chan and B. Glackin prepare for class certification hearing by pulling all contacts from the early period of the conspiracy and checking the docket to make sure the brief was properly re-filed.	0.50	14	345.00	\$ 172.50
11/13/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap entries.	3.50	7	345.00	\$ 1,207.50
11/14/16	CARNAM, TODD	Research Indirect Purchaser Class Claim Forms from various antitrust settlements, per A. Klamann's request.	2.80	12	345.00	\$ 966.00
11/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding class certification hearing.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
11/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for class certification hearing; conference with B. Troxel, Jerrod Patterson, and B. Glackin regarding same.	8.30	14	515.00	\$ 4,274.50
11/14/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Oral argument preparation (class certification).	9.80	14	700.00	\$ 6,860.00
11/14/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Help L Chan and B Glackin prepare for 11/14/16 class certification hearing.	2.30	11	345.00	\$ 793.50
11/14/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap entries; deponent research.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
11/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Class certification hearing preparation.	11.00	14	345.00	\$ 3,795.00
11/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re status of missing overlay.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
11/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare missing overlay for loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status for co-counsel re missing overlay.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on
Timekeeper: all

From 06/01/13
To 02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Attend, travel to, prepare for, and assist at class certification hearing.	8.00	14	515.00	\$ 4,120.00
11/15/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Class certification hearing.	6.50	14	700.00	\$ 4,550.00
11/15/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Class certification hearing.	4.30	14	345.00	\$ 1,483.50
11/15/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap entries; deposition preparation on Hiroshi Shimokomaki.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
11/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Class certification hearing.	6.50	14	345.00	\$ 2,242.50
11/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Class certification hearing preparation.	3.50	14	345.00	\$ 1,207.50
11/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
11/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Strategy call.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
11/16/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Check exhibit numbering from JY Youn deposition for co-counsel.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/16/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Create task list for weekly call with co-counsel.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/16/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Weekly call with co-counsel, L Chan, and B Glackin.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/16/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap entries (document review).	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
11/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re clawback issues.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re outstanding productions for loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition exhibit index.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
11/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.70	9	345.00	\$ 241.50
11/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize class certification hearing documents.	0.30	14	345.00	\$ 103.50
11/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review case calendar re pending discovery deadlines.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and exhibits and save to file.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
11/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review orders and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review settlement agreement and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with A. Klamann and H. Rim regarding NS Choi; email correspondence regarding same.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
11/17/16	CHAN, LIN	Office conference with B. Glackin regarding class certification and strategy.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
11/17/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap entries; deposition preparation on Hiroshi Shimokomaki; deponent research, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
11/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with co-counsel re overlay status.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with U.S. Legal re status of missing deposition exhibits.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
11/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts and exhibits for Text Map.	1.20	9	345.00	\$ 414.00
11/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition index.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize deposition files.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review escrow statements and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/17/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
11/18/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
11/18/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Case update with B Glackin.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/18/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap entries; deposition preparation on Hiroshi Shimokomaki, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
11/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to Catalyst re production overlays.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
11/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	8	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.10	8	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize production translations.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize settlement objection filings.	0.10	8	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re motion to compel.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review production overlays and prepare for loading.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
11/18/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re missing deposition transcripts in U.S. Legal repository.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/21/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery matters.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
11/21/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap entries; deponent research; Catalyst troubleshooting for document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
11/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail co-counsel re status of overlay productions.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with U.S. Legal re status of deposition transcripts.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts for Text Map.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare transcript order form for e-filing.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
11/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class certification opposition presentation and save to file.	0.10	10	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re status of deposition transcripts.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re status of overlay productions.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/21/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review issues re class certification opposition presentation.	0.10	10	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and A. Klamann regarding discovery.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
11/22/16	CHAN, LIN		1.20	6	515.00	\$ 618.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/22/16	CHAN, LIN		1.20	11	515.00	\$ 618.00
11/22/16	CHAN, LIN		0.80	12	515.00	\$ 412.00
11/22/16	GRANT, ANTHONY	QC of video files.	0.50	7	360.00	\$ 180.00
11/22/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE		2.20	9	345.00	\$ 759.00
11/22/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Weekly status meeting with L. Chan and H. Rim.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/22/16	RIM, HISUN	Conference with L. Chan and A. Klamann.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/22/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Nam Seon Choi, Hiroshi Shimokomaki, and Youngsun Kim, including document review.	7.80	7	345.00	\$ 2,691.00
11/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail court reporter re hearing transcript.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail U.S. Legal re status of deposition exhibits.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class member correspondence.	0.20	1	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition notices for attorney review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcript and exhibits for Text Map.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
11/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
11/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re document production status.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibits and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition testimony video clips.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re Sanyo metadata issues for H. Rim.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re status of deposition exhibits.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re deposition notices for A. Klamann.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/22/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re deposition transcripts.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery and settlement.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
11/23/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Seung Won Lee, Youngsun Kim, and Hiroshi Shimokomaki, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
11/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibit index and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibits and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
11/23/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translation index and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding case strategy.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
11/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to SDI; confer with Cadjo Zirpoli and B. Glackin regarding same.	1.00	6	515.00	\$ 515.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From 06/01/13

To 02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions, discovery, and settlement; confer with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding same.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
11/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise preliminary approval papers; email correspondence regarding same.	1.90	8	515.00	\$ 978.50
11/28/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review draft letter to Jim McGinnis; office conference with L. Chan regarding same; review LG Chem settlement approval papers; telephone conference with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding same.	1.20	11	700.00	\$ 840.00
11/28/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Nam Seon Choi, Seung Won Lee, and Youngsun Kim, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
11/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Demetrius Lambrinos regarding depositions.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
11/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to SDI re JY Youn deposition.	0.90	6	515.00	\$ 463.50
11/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise final approval and settlement papers; email correspondence regarding same.	1.90	8	515.00	\$ 978.50
11/29/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum to co-leads regarding cost fund; review accounting.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
11/29/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review LG Chem preliminary approval papers.	0.50	9	700.00	\$ 350.00
11/29/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review [REDACTED]; telephone conference with Shana Scarlett regarding class certification.	1.50	11	700.00	\$ 1,050.00
11/29/16	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assistance with loading of electronic discovery documents into electronic discovery database; update indexes.	1.00	7	360.00	\$ 360.00
11/29/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap entries; deposition preparation on Hiroshi Shimokomaki, Nam Seon Choi, Seung Won Lee, and Youngsun Kim; Catalyst troubleshooting for document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
11/30/16	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead call; confer with A. Klamann and B. Glackin regarding same.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
11/30/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Direct Purchaser Plaintiffs regarding JY Youn deposition; email correspondence regarding same; confer with B. Glackin regarding same.	0.90	11	515.00	\$ 463.50
11/30/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding letter to SDI; email correspondence regarding same.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
11/30/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft meet and confer letter to SDI.	1.20	6	515.00	\$ 618.00
11/30/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
11/30/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery, settlement, and translations; confer with B. Troxel regarding same.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
11/30/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise LG settlement approval papers; legal research regarding same.	1.50	8	515.00	\$ 772.50
11/30/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan regarding JY Youn deposition; telephone conference with Aaron Sheanin regarding same.	0.90	11	700.00	\$ 630.00
11/30/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review LG Chen preliminary settlement motion.	1.00	9	700.00	\$ 700.00
11/30/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call with co-leads.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
11/30/16	KLAMANN, ABBY	Create new task list for weekly meeting with co-counsel.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/30/16	KLAMANN, ABBY	Review documents in preparation for SW Lee deposition.	1.80	1	345.00	\$ 621.00
11/30/16	KLAMANN, ABBY	Weekly co-lead counsel call with L Chan and B Glackin.	0.50	11	345.00	\$ 172.50
11/30/16	RIM, HISUN	Casemap entries; Deposition preparation on Nam Seon Choi, Seung Won Lee and Youngsun Kim.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
11/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
11/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail court reporter re transcript.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails to U.S. Legal re deposition invoices.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
11/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Preliminary settlement motion preparation.	4.00	8	345.00	\$ 1,380.00
11/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review signature pages and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
11/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re deposition invoices for co-counsel.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
12/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with A. Klamann and H. Rim regarding document review.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
12/01/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery, translations, and settlement approval; conference with Veronica Glaze, Shinae Kim-Helms, and B. Glackin regarding same.	2.30	11	515.00	\$ 1,184.50
12/01/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review, circulate draft letter to Jim McGinnis.	0.50	6	700.00	\$ 350.00
12/01/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review escrow agreement.	0.20	9	700.00	\$ 140.00
12/01/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Cadjo Zirpoli; email correspondence regarding Jim McGinnis letter.	0.80	11	700.00	\$ 560.00
12/01/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review discovery responses and deposition transcripts to prepare for SW Lee deposition.	2.20	9	345.00	\$ 759.00
12/01/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Status meeting with L Chan and H Rim.	0.50	11	345.00	\$ 172.50
12/01/16	RIM, HISUN	Conference call with L. Chan and Demetrius Lambrinos.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/01/16	RIM, HISUN	Conference with L. Chan and A. Klamann.	0.50	11	345.00	\$ 172.50
12/01/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Nam Seon Choi, Seung Won Lee, Jiro Takeda, Hiroshi Shimokomaki, and Youngsun Kim, including document review.	6.40	7	345.00	\$ 2,208.00
12/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail deposition invoices to counsel.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Filing preparation re preliminary settlement motion.	2.00	8	345.00	\$ 690.00
12/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Econ One invoices for payment.	0.10	10	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition invoices and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/01/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Econ One invoices and save to file.	0.10	10	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding meet and confer letter.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
12/02/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding translations and settlement.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
12/02/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Cadjo Zirpoli, L. Chan and Steve Williams regarding JY Youn deposition, possible motion to compel; revise correspondence regarding same.	2.40	11	700.00	\$ 1,680.00
12/02/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Nam Seon Choi, Jiro Takeda, and Hiroshi Shimokomaki.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
12/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail counsel re status of hearing transcript.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading status.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
12/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition invoice for payment.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re missing document productions.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
12/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re Sanyo overlay issue.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
12/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense overlay and prepare for loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition invoice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translation index and save to file.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/02/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Check court calendar.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
12/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding Jim McGinnis.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
12/05/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions, class certification briefing; conference with H. Rim, Jessica Moy, and B. Glackin regarding same.	1.40	11	515.00	\$ 721.00
12/05/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Finalize, send correspondence to Jim McGinnis.	0.20	6	700.00	\$ 140.00
12/05/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review, finalize, send escrow agreement re LGC.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
12/05/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review H Rim feedback on SW Lee deposition notes.	0.10	1	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/05/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review proposed DPP and IPP class cert sealing orders to check whether they corrected previously identified sealing issues.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
12/05/16	RIM, HISUN	Conference call with L Chan.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/05/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Nam Seon Choi, Seung Won Lee, Jiro Takeda, Hiroshi Shimokomaki, and Youngsun Kim, including document review.	5.20	7	345.00	\$ 1,794.00
12/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re class certification re-filings for A. Klamann.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
12/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
12/05/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with IT department regarding LGC notice; email correspondence regarding same.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
12/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions and class certification briefing.	0.70	11	515.00	\$ 360.50
12/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Legal research regarding motion to compel regarding attorney-client privilege.	1.80	11	515.00	\$ 927.00
12/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Review draft LG settlement notice.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
12/06/16	CHAN, LIN	Review notice of appeal and related paper; legal research regarding same.	1.30	9	515.00	\$ 669.50
12/06/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review and sign escrow agreement.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
12/06/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review bids regarding notice provider; correspondence regarding same.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
12/06/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Apply for admission to practice in ND Cal.	0.40	8	345.00	\$ 138.00
12/06/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review documents for SW Lee deposition memo.	1.30	1	345.00	\$ 448.50
12/06/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Nam Seon Choi, Seung Won Lee, Jiro Takeda, and Hiroshi Shimokomaki.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
12/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail co-counsel re production loading issues.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading issues.	0.60	7	345.00	\$ 207.00
12/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case citations re deposition letter brief for L. Chan review.	0.30	8	345.00	\$ 103.50
12/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare settlement objection filings for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/06/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading issues.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
12/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead call; conference with B. Glackin and A. Klamann regarding strategy.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
12/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with court reporter regarding class certification hearing transcript.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
12/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
12/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding case strategy; confer with Shana Scarlett regarding same.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
12/07/16	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for meet and confer with SDI, including legal research and conference with Shana Scarlett; draft letter brief.	2.40	6	515.00	\$ 1,236.00
12/07/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Cost fund issues.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
12/07/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Draft response to Sweeney notice of appeal.	1.60	8	345.00	\$ 552.00
12/07/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Prepare notice of appearance.	0.20	8	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/07/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review documents for SW Lee deposition memo.	0.60	1	345.00	\$ 207.00
12/07/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update task list for weekly co-lead counsel meeting.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/07/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Weekly meeting with co-lead counsel, B Glackin and L Chan.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/07/16	RIM, HISUN	Check translation for Nam Seon Choi deposition.	10.50	4	345.00	\$ 3,622.50
12/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
12/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence re class member inquiry.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts and exhibits for Text Map.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
12/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize deposition files.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review appellate motion and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review dockets re status of appellate filings.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review proffers notes and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/07/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with A. Klamann regarding notice of appeal.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
12/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding motion to compel.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
12/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with co-counsel regarding motion to compel.	0.50	11	515.00	\$ 257.50
12/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jessica Moy regarding deposition; email correspondence regarding same.	0.30	11	515.00	\$ 154.50
12/08/16	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for motion to compel.	1.80	8	515.00	\$ 927.00
12/08/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Team call regarding JY Youn deposition.	0.50	11	700.00	\$ 350.00
12/08/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Draft motion to dismiss Sweeney notice of appeal.	2.70	8	345.00	\$ 931.50
12/08/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Meet with L. Chan re motion to dismiss Mr. Sweeney's appeal.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/08/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review deposition testimony for examples of witnesses changing their testimony on redirect and summarize for L. Chan.	0.80	9	345.00	\$ 276.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/08/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review NS Choi transcript.	0.50	9	345.00	\$ 172.50
12/08/16	RIM, HISUN	Check translation for Nam Seon Choi deposition.	12.00	4	345.00	\$ 4,140.00
12/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class member correspondence re purchase history.	0.20	10	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition exhibits for Case Map.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
12/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare orders for A. Klamann review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare settlement filings for attorney review.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit class member correspondence log.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case filings.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize settlement filings.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and save documents re motion to compel letter.	0.10	8	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence and save to file.	0.60	9	345.00	\$ 207.00
12/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re deposition scheduling.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/08/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review distribution issues re appellate filing notices.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
12/09/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jim McGinnis.	0.30	11	700.00	\$ 210.00
12/09/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Call with Jim McGinnis re JY Youn deposition.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
12/09/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review NS Choi deposition transcript.	1.10	9	345.00	\$ 379.50
12/09/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review SW Lee documents for deposition.	1.30	4	345.00	\$ 448.50
12/09/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Jiro Takeda, and Youngsun Kim; Catalyst troubleshooting for document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
12/09/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re deposition preparation.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/11/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Finish first draft of Sweeney motion to dismiss.	2.10	8	345.00	\$ 724.50
12/12/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and A. Klamann regarding document review.	0.40	11	515.00	\$ 206.00
12/12/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
12/12/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise motion to dismiss Sweeney appeal.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
12/12/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Complete and file ND California petition for bar membership.	0.20	8	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/12/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Finish review of transcripts from NS Choi deposition.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
12/12/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review new suggestions for documents to translate from H. Rim.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/12/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review SW Lee documents for deposition memo.	0.60	9	345.00	\$ 207.00
12/12/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update Sweeney motion to dismiss per L. Chan edits.	1.30	8	345.00	\$ 448.50
12/12/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Weekly meeting with H. Rim and L. Chan.	0.50	11	345.00	\$ 172.50
12/12/16	RIM, HISUN	Conference with L. Chan and A. Klamann.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/12/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation for Jiro Takeda and Seung Hwan Na, including document review.	4.00	7	345.00	\$ 1,380.00
12/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Filing preparation re motion to compel deposition.	0.10	8	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/12/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/13/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Manage cost fund, invoices.	0.40	11	700.00	\$ 280.00
12/13/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Seung Won Lee and Jiro Takeda, including document review.	6.80	7	345.00	\$ 2,346.00
12/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re Samsung production loading issues.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail co-counsel re Samsung production loading issues.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail hearing transcript to co-counsel.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re Sanyo metadata issues.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re Samsung production loading issues.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
12/13/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review hearing transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Co-lead call notes.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
12/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft motion to dismiss appeal.	0.50	8	515.00	\$ 257.50
12/14/16	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
12/14/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Call Microsoft to discuss reasoning for selecting SH Na for a deposition; report back to L. Chan and B. Glackin.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/14/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Edit Sweeney motion to dismiss per L. Chan edits.	1.20	8	345.00	\$ 414.00
12/14/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update task list for co-lead counsel call with B. Glackin and L. Chan.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/14/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Weekly co-lead counsel call with L. Chan and B. Glackin.	0.40	11	345.00	\$ 138.00
12/14/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation on Seung Won Lee and Seung Hwan Na.	6.30	7	345.00	\$ 2,173.50
12/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	2.50	4	345.00	\$ 862.50
12/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail Catalyst re Samsung production loading.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
12/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare briefing re interlocutory appeal for A. Klamann review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/14/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Samsung production for loading by Catalyst.	0.50	7	345.00	\$ 172.50
12/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re discovery.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
12/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise motion to dismiss appeal; email correspondence regarding same.	0.50	8	515.00	\$ 257.50
12/15/16	CHAN, LIN	Review notice of appearance.	0.10	8	515.00	\$ 51.50
12/15/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Check local rules re notices of admissions and check notice for compliance.	0.30	8	345.00	\$ 103.50
12/15/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Finalize draft of motion to dismiss Sweeney notice of appeal and send to L. Chan.	0.50	8	345.00	\$ 172.50
12/15/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Finalize notice of appearance and send to L. Chan for edits.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/15/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Follow up on issue with SDI docs SDI-B-000083307 and SDI-B-000106643 with H Rim and B Troxel.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/15/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Incorporate L. Chan's edits to motion to dismiss Sweeney notice of appeal and send to B. Glackin.	0.30	8	345.00	\$ 103.50

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/15/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Research when motion to dismiss the notice of appeal must be filed.	0.40	8	345.00	\$ 138.00
12/15/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review SW Lee documents for deposition preparation.	2.80	4	345.00	\$ 966.00
12/15/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Seung Won Lee and Jiro Takeda, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
12/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/15/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re Samsung document production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding class representatives and depositions; draft memorandum regarding same.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
12/16/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding motion to dismiss.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
12/16/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Memorandum regarding McGinnis call.	0.20	11	700.00	\$ 140.00
12/16/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jim McGinnis.	0.40	6	700.00	\$ 280.00
12/16/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review calendar's recommendations about deadline to file motion to dismiss and summarize for B. Glackin and L. Chan.	0.20	8	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/16/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review documents H Rim recommends for translation.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/16/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda and Youngsun Kim, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
12/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
12/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail co-counsel re status of deposition transcripts.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/16/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review invoice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/19/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding discovery.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
12/19/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update notice of appearance per L. Chan's edits.	0.20	8	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/19/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda and Youngsun Kim, including document review.	1.00	7	345.00	\$ 345.00
12/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition errata and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/19/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/20/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Discuss potential document translation with H. Rim.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/20/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	File A Klamann's notice of appearance with word processing.	0.10	8	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/20/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
12/20/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/21/16	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Lisa Skylar.	0.10	11	700.00	\$ 70.00
12/21/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Discuss translation issues and questions with H. Rim.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/21/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review SW Lee documents for deposition memo.	5.30	4	345.00	\$ 1,828.50
12/21/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update task list for weekly co-lead counsel meeting.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/21/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Seung Won Lee and Jiro Takeda, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
12/22/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding document review.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
12/22/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Discuss document/translation issues with H. Rim.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/22/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review SW Lee documents for deposition memo.	2.70	4	345.00	\$ 931.50
12/22/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Seung Won Lee and Jiro Takeda, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
12/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Conference with A. Klamann and H. Rim regarding document review.	0.60	11	515.00	\$ 309.00
12/23/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding document review.	0.20	11	515.00	\$ 103.00
12/23/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Meeting with H. Rim re SW Lee document translations and check interpreting for upcoming depositions.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
12/23/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	SW Lee deposition memo and preparation.	3.10	9	345.00	\$ 1,069.50
12/23/16	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Weekly status meeting with H. Rim and L. Chan.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
12/23/16	RIM, HISUN	Conference with A. Klamann.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
12/23/16	RIM, HISUN	Conference with L. Chan and A. Klamann.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
12/23/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition Preparation on Jiro Takeda and Seung Won Lee.	6.20	7	345.00	\$ 2,139.00
12/26/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
12/26/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda and Seung Won Lee, including document review.	1.80	7	345.00	\$ 621.00
12/27/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda and Seung Won Lee, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
12/28/16	CHAN, LIN	Edit Hitachi Maxell preliminary approval papers; legal research regarding same.	2.20	8	515.00	\$ 1,133.00
12/28/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda and Hiroshi Shimokomaki, including document review.	7.50	7	345.00	\$ 2,587.50
12/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.50	4	345.00	\$ 172.50
12/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re Sanyo production for H. Rim.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/28/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/29/16	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions.	0.10	11	515.00	\$ 51.50
12/29/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Hiroshi Shimokomaki, Jiro Takeda and Seung Won Lee, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00
12/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.50	4	345.00	\$ 172.50
12/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail status re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading status.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
12/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re settlement objections.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	8	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review escrow statement and save to file.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re production loading status.	0.40	7	345.00	\$ 138.00
12/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translation index and save to file.	0.10	8	345.00	\$ 34.50
12/29/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.20	7	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/30/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda, including document review.	8.00	7	345.00	\$ 2,760.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
12/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	3.00	4	345.00	\$ 1,035.00
12/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition exhibits for Text Map.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts for Text Map.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
12/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibits and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/30/16	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
12/31/16	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda, including document review.	0.30	7	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/02/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Finish first draft of SW Lee deposition memo and send to L. Chan and H. Rim for review and edits.	2.20	4	345.00	\$ 759.00
01/03/17	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and A. Klamann regarding document review.	0.50	11	540.00	\$ 270.00
01/03/17	CHAN, LIN	Draft motion to dismiss.	0.20	8	540.00	\$ 108.00
01/03/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions.	0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
01/03/17	CHAN, LIN	Review SW Lee deposition memorandum.	0.50	11	540.00	\$ 270.00
01/03/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Revise motion to dismiss Sweeney appeal.	0.40	8	725.00	\$ 290.00
01/03/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Begin reviewing documents and drafting memo for Takeda deposition.	0.90	9	345.00	\$ 310.50
01/03/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Discuss deposition next steps with B. Glackin.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/03/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Discuss Takeda deposition binder status with B Troxel.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/03/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Final clean up of Sweeney appeal opposition brief and send to IPP co-lead counsel.	0.20	8	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/03/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Incorporate H. Rim's edits into SW Lee deposition memo and send to Aaron Shearin.	0.60	9	345.00	\$ 207.00
01/03/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Propose potential documents for IPPs to cover in SW Lee deposition.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/03/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review documents recommended by H. Rim for translation for Takeda deposition.	0.40	9	345.00	\$ 138.00
01/03/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update task list for 1/4/2017 co-lead counsel call and send to L. Chan for review.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/03/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Weekly status meeting with H. Rim and L. Chan.	0.50	11	345.00	\$ 172.50
01/03/17	RIM, HISUN	Conference with L. Chan and A. Klamann.	0.30	11	360.00	\$ 108.00
01/03/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda and Seung Won Lee, including document review.	7.70	7	360.00	\$ 2,772.00
01/04/17	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Aaron Shearin regarding SW Lee deposition; email correspondence regarding same.	0.30	11	540.00	\$ 162.00
01/04/17	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.10	11	540.00	\$ 54.00
01/04/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda, including document review.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
01/05/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions.	0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
01/05/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update Jiro Takeda Notice of Association with proof of service.	1.10	8	345.00	\$ 379.50
01/05/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda and Seung Hwan Na, including document review.	6.50	7	360.00	\$ 2,340.00
01/05/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	1.00	4	360.00	\$ 360.00
01/05/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
01/05/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production index.	0.20	7	360.00	\$ 72.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/05/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/05/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review production and prepare for loading.	0.20	7	360.00	\$ 72.00
01/05/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.10	7	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/06/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding settlements.	0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
01/06/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Respond to correspondence re briefing and deposition calendar.	0.50	11	725.00	\$ 362.50
01/06/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update and serve J Takeda deposition notice.	0.50	8	345.00	\$ 172.50
01/06/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda and Seung Hwan Na, including document review.	6.30	7	360.00	\$ 2,268.00
01/06/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.30	4	360.00	\$ 108.00
01/06/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.40	9	360.00	\$ 144.00
01/06/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition notices for A. Klamann review.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
01/06/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/06/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence re deposition preparation.	0.10	4	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/06/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/06/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translation objections and save to file.	0.10	7	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/06/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translations and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/07/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review deposition set and draft deposition memo for J. Takeda deposition.	1.10	4	345.00	\$ 379.50
01/07/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review documents recommended for translation for Takeda deposition.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/08/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re depositions.	0.60	11	540.00	\$ 324.00
01/08/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Prepare for SW Lee deposition.	0.30	4	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/08/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda and Seung Hwan Na, including document review.	1.30	7	360.00	\$ 468.00
01/09/17	CHAN, LIN	Conference with A. Klamann and H. Rim regarding depositions and document review.	0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
01/09/17	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin regarding depositions.	0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
01/09/17	CHAN, LIN	Email regarding depositions.	0.60	11	540.00	\$ 324.00
01/09/17	CHAN, LIN	Review SW Lee deposition outline; confer with A. Klamann regarding deposition.	0.40	4	540.00	\$ 216.00
01/09/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Discuss SW Lee deposition with L Chan.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/09/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Discuss updated SW Lee deposition outline with L. Chan.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/09/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Meeting with B. Troxel and L. Chan re deposition preparation assistance.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/09/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Preparation for SW Lee deposition.	3.00	4	345.00	\$ 1,035.00
01/09/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review documents recommended by H. Rim for translation and make final translation decisions.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/09/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Weekly status meeting with L. Chan and H. Rim re document translation and deposition preparation.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/09/17	RIM, HISUN	Conference with L. Chan and A. Klamann.	0.20	11	360.00	\$ 72.00
01/09/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda and Seung Won Lee, including document review.	7.80	7	360.00	\$ 2,808.00
01/09/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	2.50	4	360.00	\$ 900.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/09/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/09/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Meeting re deposition preparation.	0.30	4	360.00	\$ 108.00
01/09/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare motion to dismiss briefing for A. Klamann.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
01/09/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re invoice payment for L. Chan.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/10/17	CHAN, LIN		0.50	11	540.00	\$ 270.00
01/10/17	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Shana Scarlett regarding document review; email regarding same.	0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
01/10/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions.	0.50	11	540.00	\$ 270.00
01/10/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE		0.60	4	345.00	\$ 207.00
01/10/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Conversation with Aaron Sheanin re SW Lee deposition.	0.60	11	345.00	\$ 207.00
01/10/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Prepare for SW Lee deposition.	3.10	4	345.00	\$ 1,069.50
01/10/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update batteries task list for weekly co-lead counsel call.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/10/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Masahiro Aoki, Jiro Takeda and Seung Won Lee; Catalyst troubleshooting.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
01/10/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	1.70	4	360.00	\$ 612.00
01/11/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions; confer with Demetrius Lambrinos, B. Glackin, H. Rim regarding same.	1.50	11	540.00	\$ 810.00
01/11/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Attend Seung Won Lee deposition on behalf of indirect purchaser plaintiffs.	9.40	4	345.00	\$ 3,243.00
01/11/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
01/11/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.30	4	360.00	\$ 108.00
01/11/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit counsel deposition log for L. Chan.	0.50	9	360.00	\$ 180.00
01/11/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice objection and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/12/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re depositions.	0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
01/12/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	S.W. Lee deposition.	2.20	4	725.00	\$ 1,595.00
01/12/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Seung Won Lee deposition.	11.10	4	345.00	\$ 3,829.50
01/12/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition Preparation re Jiro Takeda, including document review.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
01/12/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	3.50	4	360.00	\$ 1,260.00
01/12/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/12/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production status.	0.30	7	360.00	\$ 108.00
01/12/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition notice for B. Glackin review.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/12/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/12/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.10	7	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/12/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/12/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review production translations and save to file.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
01/13/17	CHAN, LIN	Office conference with A. Klamann regarding SW Lee deposition.	0.10	11	540.00	\$ 54.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/13/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review documents H Rim suggests for translation in Takeda deposition.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/13/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda, including document review.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
01/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	4.20	4	360.00	\$ 1,512.00
01/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail co-counsel re production status.	0.10	7	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	360.00	\$ 72.00
01/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.20	7	360.00	\$ 72.00
01/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit deposition assignment log.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	7	360.00	\$ 72.00
01/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/15/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence regarding depositions.	0.60	11	540.00	\$ 324.00
01/16/17	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to McGinnis re Aoki deposition.	0.50	11	540.00	\$ 270.00
01/16/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Draft memorandum memorializing SW Lee deposition.	1.50	11	345.00	\$ 517.50
01/16/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review H. Rim's suggestions re documents for translation in Takeda deposition.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/16/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda; SDI deponent research, including document review.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
01/17/17	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and A. Klamann re document review and depositions.	0.60	11	540.00	\$ 324.00
01/17/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re depositions and case management.	0.40	11	540.00	\$ 216.00
01/17/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	[REDACTED]	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/17/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update task list for weekly co-lead counsel call.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/17/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Weekly status meeting with L Chan and H Rim.	0.60	11	345.00	\$ 207.00
01/17/17	RIM, HISUN	Conference with L. Chan and A. Klamann.	0.60	7	360.00	\$ 216.00
01/17/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda, Masahiro Aoki and Youngsun Kim; proofreading draft translations for Jiro Takeda deposition.	7.40	7	360.00	\$ 2,664.00
01/17/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	360.00	\$ 72.00
01/17/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class member correspondence.	0.30	10	360.00	\$ 108.00
01/17/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare overlay production for loading.	0.20	7	360.00	\$ 72.00
01/17/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.10	7	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/18/17	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to McGinnis re Aoki deposition.	0.40	11	540.00	\$ 216.00
01/18/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re case strategy.	0.30	11	540.00	\$ 162.00
01/18/17	CHAN, LIN	Office conference with B. Glackin re case strategy.	0.10	11	540.00	\$ 54.00
01/18/17	CHAN, LIN	Review NEC settlement; confer with B. Glackin re same.	0.80	12	540.00	\$ 432.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/18/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review NEC settlement agreement; review damages calculations; memorandum to co-leads regarding [REDACTED].	1.40	9	725.00	\$ 1,015.00
01/18/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with co-leads; review [REDACTED]; memorandum to co-leads; memorandum to Phil Johnson regarding damages.	1.10	11	725.00	\$ 797.50
01/18/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Circulate battery task list for weekly co-lead counsel call.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/18/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Complete and circulate memo regarding SW Lee's deposition.	0.70	11	345.00	\$ 241.50
01/18/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Continue reviewing documents for Takeda deposition.	0.30	4	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/18/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review documents in preparation for Takeda deposition.	1.00	4	345.00	\$ 345.00
01/18/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda; proofreading draft translations for Jiro Takeda deposition.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
01/18/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.20	4	360.00	\$ 72.00
01/18/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit calendar re deposition deadlines.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
01/18/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/18/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.10	8	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/19/17	CHAN, LIN	Review and revise preliminary approval papers.	1.30	8	540.00	\$ 702.00
01/19/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jeff Friedman and Steve Williams [REDACTED].	0.50	11	725.00	\$ 362.50
01/19/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Discuss translation questions and issues regarding Sanyo documents with H. Rim.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/19/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review documents and draft memo for deposition of Sanyo's J Takeda.	3.50	9	345.00	\$ 1,207.50
01/19/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda and Masahiro Aoki, including document review.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
01/19/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	1.00	4	360.00	\$ 360.00
01/19/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re deposition exhibits for co-counsel.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/19/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.10	7	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/19/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.50	9	360.00	\$ 180.00
01/19/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review appellate notice and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/19/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review statements and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/20/17	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Ben Siegel re preliminary approval papers.	0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
01/20/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re depositions.	0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
01/20/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda and Masahiro Aoki, including document review.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
01/20/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	4.50	4	360.00	\$ 1,620.00
01/20/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibit index and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/20/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/22/17	CHAN, LIN	Review/revise preliminary settlement approval papers.	0.60	8	540.00	\$ 324.00
01/23/17	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and A. Klamann re document review.	0.40	11	540.00	\$ 216.00
01/23/17	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re depositions; email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
01/23/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Weekly status meeting with H. Rim and L. Chan.	0.40	11	345.00	\$ 138.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/23/17	RIM, HISUN	Conference with L. Chan and A. Klamann.	0.30	11	360.00	\$ 108.00
01/23/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda, Youngsun Kim and Masahiro Aoki; proofreading draft translations.	7.70	7	360.00	\$ 2,772.00
01/23/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	2.00	4	360.00	\$ 720.00
01/23/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Filing preparation re settlement briefing.	0.50	8	360.00	\$ 180.00
01/23/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
01/24/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re depositions.	0.40	11	540.00	\$ 216.00
01/24/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review and clean up amended Takeda notice and serve on all parties.	0.50	8	345.00	\$ 172.50
01/24/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review documents and draft deposition memo for Jiro Takeda deposition.	2.60	4	345.00	\$ 897.00
01/24/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda; proofreading draft translations.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
01/24/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition errata and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/24/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
01/25/17	CHAN, LIN	Draft task list.	0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
01/25/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re document review and depositions.	0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
01/25/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Continue preparing for Takeda deposition.	4.30	9	345.00	\$ 1,483.50
01/25/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Make administrative arrangements for depositions being hosted at Lief Cabraser Heimann & Bernstein.	0.70	11	345.00	\$ 241.50
01/25/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Meeting with B. Troxel and R. Bata re Takeda deposition prep.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/25/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update task list for weekly co-lead counsel meeting and send to L. Chan for edits.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/25/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda; proofreading draft translations; SDI deponent research; Catalyst troubleshooting.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
01/25/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	3.00	4	360.00	\$ 1,080.00
01/25/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
01/25/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
01/25/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notices and save to file.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
01/26/17	BATA, RAMI	Download and prepare copies of new certified translations for deposition of J. Takeda	0.50	4	340.00	\$ 170.00
01/26/17	CHAN, LIN	Confer with A. Klamann re Takeda deposition.	0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
01/26/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Meeting with L. Chan regarding next week's Takeda deposition.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/26/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Preparation for Takeda deposition.	0.80	4	345.00	\$ 276.00
01/26/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Prepare for Takeda deposition.	1.60	4	345.00	\$ 552.00
01/26/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda and Masahiro Aoki; SDI Deponent research.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
01/27/17	BATA, RAMI	Manage copy of CD received from Sony and download of documents then send to Catalyst for upload to database	0.20	1	340.00	\$ 68.00
01/27/17	BATA, RAMI	Prepare exhibits for deposition of J. Takeda	0.50	4	340.00	\$ 170.00
01/27/17	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assistance with preparation of discovery materials to be provided to vendor.	1.00	7	375.00	\$ 375.00
01/27/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Arrange to send latest Sony production to Catalyst and H. Rim with L. Chan and R. Bata.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
01/27/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Work with H. Rim and R. Bata to update deposition binder with new certified translations for Takeda deposition.	0.30	9	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/27/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda and Masahiro Aoki, including document review.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
01/29/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Continue reviewing documents and drafting Takeda deposition memo.	3.50	4	345.00	\$ 1,207.50
01/29/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Draft outline for Jiro Takeda's deposition.	2.70	4	345.00	\$ 931.50
01/30/17	BATA, RAMI	Prepare exhibit documents for deposition of J. Takeda and create deposition binders for attorneys.	6.70	4	340.00	\$ 2,278.00
01/30/17	CALANGIAN, MARGIE	Assistance in duplication of e-discovery media.	0.30	11	375.00	\$ 112.50
01/30/17	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and A. Klamann re depositions and document review.	0.90	11	540.00	\$ 486.00
01/30/17	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re depositions; call Jim McGinnis re same.	0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
01/30/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re depositions and case management; confer with Demetrius Lambrinos re same.	0.80	11	540.00	\$ 432.00
01/30/17	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Takeda deposition.	1.00	11	540.00	\$ 540.00
01/30/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Takeda deposition memorandum.	0.50	4	725.00	\$ 362.50
01/30/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Jim McGinnis; office conference with L. Chan.	0.60	11	725.00	\$ 435.00
01/30/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Draft outline and prepare exhibits for Takeda deposition.	7.30	4	345.00	\$ 2,518.50
01/30/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update draft letter to Catalyst enclosing Sony production and circulate.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
01/30/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Weekly meeting with H. Rim and L. Chan and follow-up meeting with L. Chan re Takeda deposition.	1.00	11	345.00	\$ 345.00
01/30/17	RIM, HISUN	Conference with L. Chan and A. Klamann.	0.50	11	360.00	\$ 180.00
01/30/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda and Masahiro Aoki, including document review.	7.50	7	360.00	\$ 2,700.00
01/31/17	BATA, RAMI	Prepare exhibits and information for use in deposition of J. Takeda.	7.20	4	340.00	\$ 2,448.00
01/31/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re named plaintiffs and depositions.	0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
01/31/17	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Takeda deposition; conference with A. Klamann, Jessica Moy, and B. Glackin re same.	3.60	4	540.00	\$ 1,944.00
01/31/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with A. Klamann and L. Chan re Takeda.	0.90	11	725.00	\$ 652.50
01/31/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with A. Klamann re Takeda deposition.	0.20	11	725.00	\$ 145.00
01/31/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review Jiro Takeda deposition outline and exhibits.	1.80	9	725.00	\$ 1,305.00
01/31/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Call with DPPs re Takeda deposition.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
01/31/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Meeting with B. Glackin re: strategy for Takeda deposition.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
01/31/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Meeting with L. Chan and B. Glackin re: strategy for Takeda deposition.	1.00	4	345.00	\$ 345.00
01/31/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Preparation for Takeda deposition.	5.50	4	345.00	\$ 1,897.50
01/31/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Jiro Takeda and Masahiro Aoki, including document review.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
02/01/17	BATA, RAMI	Preparation of documents for deposition of J. Takeda.	2.50	4	340.00	\$ 850.00
02/01/17	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Takeda deposition.	0.30	4	540.00	\$ 162.00
02/01/17	CHAN, LIN	Second chair Takeda deposition.	8.40	4	540.00	\$ 4,536.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/01/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Preparation for Takeda deposition.	1.20	4	345.00	\$ 414.00
02/01/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Take Sanyo's Jiro Takeda deposition for indirect purchaser plaintiffs.	8.50	4	345.00	\$ 2,932.50
02/01/17	RIM, HISUN	Check translation for Jiro Takeda deposition.	9.00	4	360.00	\$ 3,240.00
02/02/17	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin and A. Klamann re depositions.	0.40	11	540.00	\$ 216.00
02/02/17	CHAN, LIN	Draft deposition notice.	0.30	2	540.00	\$ 162.00
02/02/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re depositions and document review; conference with Jessica Moy and H. Rim re same.	2.60	11	540.00	\$ 1,404.00
02/02/17	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Aoki deposition, including reviewing documents; confer with B. Glackin re same.	0.70	4	540.00	\$ 378.00
02/02/17	CHAN, LIN	Review LG settlement and prepare for depositions.	1.70	11	540.00	\$ 918.00
02/02/17	CHAN, LIN	Review memoranda for deponents.	0.10	11	540.00	\$ 54.00
02/02/17	CHAN, LIN	Review Takeda deposition transcript.	0.20	9	540.00	\$ 108.00
02/02/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Draft notice of deposition for Hiroshi Shimokomaki.	0.40	2	345.00	\$ 138.00
02/02/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Finish drafting memo regarding Takeda deposition outcomes.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/02/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Meet with L. Chan re Takeda deposition and next step in deposition preparation.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/02/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review H. Rim's recommendations for translations for Aoki deposition and provide feedback.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/02/17	RIM, HISUN	Conference with L. Chan.	0.10	11	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/02/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Masahiro Aoki and Youngsun Kim; SDI deponent selection, including document review.	7.90	7	360.00	\$ 2,844.00
02/03/17	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Shana Scarlett and H. Rim re depositions and document review.	0.30	11	540.00	\$ 162.00
02/03/17	CHAN, LIN	Email re SDI and Sony depositions.	0.60	11	540.00	\$ 324.00
02/03/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review translation suggestions from H. Rim and make translation determinations.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/03/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Schedule rooms and reports for Richard Ra and Paul Kwon depositions, create chart of all LCHB hosted depositions reflecting which reservations have been made.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/03/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Masahiro Aoki and Youngsun Kim, including document review.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
02/05/17	CHAN, LIN	Review Kunihiro Negi transcript.	0.50	9	540.00	\$ 270.00
02/06/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re depositions.	0.40	11	540.00	\$ 216.00
02/06/17	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Aoki deposition, including reviewing documents.	0.20	4	540.00	\$ 108.00
02/06/17	CHAN, LIN	Review Negi deposition transcript.	0.70	9	540.00	\$ 378.00
02/06/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review YS Kim related documents in preparation for YS Kim deposition.	3.00	9	345.00	\$ 1,035.00
02/06/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Masahiro Aoki, including document review.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
02/06/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.50	4	360.00	\$ 180.00
02/06/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	7	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/06/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	8	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/06/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.30	9	360.00	\$ 108.00
02/06/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.30	9	360.00	\$ 108.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/06/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Sony production.	0.10	7	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/06/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.20	7	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/06/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.30	7	360.00	\$ 108.00
02/07/17	CHAN, LIN	Conference with Aaron Sheanin, Charles Tompkins, H. Rim, A. Klamann and Jessica Moy re Aoki deposition; leave messages for Beatriz Mejia and Charles Tompkins.	2.00	11	540.00	\$ 1,080.00
02/07/17	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re depositions.	0.30	11	540.00	\$ 162.00
02/07/17	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Erika Smilevski re Shimokomaki deposition.	0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
02/07/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re litigation fund.	0.10	11	540.00	\$ 54.00
02/07/17	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Aoki deposition, including reviewing documents and discovery.	2.00	4	540.00	\$ 1,080.00
02/07/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re depositions.	0.40	11	725.00	\$ 290.00
02/07/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Discuss deposition preparation strategy and priorities with L. Chan.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/07/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Pull previous exhibits for L. Chan's Aoki review.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/07/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review H. Rim's recommendations regarding translating documents for upcoming defendant depositions.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/07/17	RIM, HISUN	Conference with L. Chan.	0.10	11	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/07/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Masahiro Aoki; SDI deponent selection, including document review.	7.90	7	360.00	\$ 2,844.00
02/07/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	2.20	4	360.00	\$ 792.00
02/07/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re deposition exhibits for L. Chan.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/07/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/07/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize case files.	0.50	8	360.00	\$ 180.00
02/07/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re production loading.	0.20	7	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/08/17	CHAN, LIN		0.40	11	540.00	\$ 216.00
02/08/17	CHAN, LIN	Draft Shimokomaki deposition notice.	0.30	2	540.00	\$ 162.00
02/08/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re settlement approval.	0.40	11	540.00	\$ 216.00
02/08/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review Hisun Rim's recommendations for translations for the Aoki deposition.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/08/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review H. Rim's recommendations for translations for the Aoki deposition.	0.10	4	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/08/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update deposition notice of Hiroshi Shimokomaki and service list.	0.30	2	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/08/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Masahiro Aoki, including document review.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
02/08/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	2.50	4	360.00	\$ 900.00
02/08/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with U.S. Legal re deposition transcript status.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/08/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition files for Text Map.	0.50	8	360.00	\$ 180.00
02/08/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibit and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/08/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/09/17	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim and A. Klamann re document review.	1.40	11	540.00	\$ 756.00
02/09/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re claims administration.	0.10	11	540.00	\$ 54.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

From

06/01/13

Timekeeper: all

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/09/17	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for YS Kim deposition, including reviewing documents.	1.10	4	540.00	\$ 594.00
02/09/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Correspondence re notice provider.	0.30	11	725.00	\$ 217.50
02/09/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Weekly status meeting with H. Rim and L. Chan.	1.20	9	345.00	\$ 414.00
02/09/17	RIM, HISUN	Conference with L. Chan and A. Klamann.	1.30	11	360.00	\$ 468.00
02/09/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Masahiro Aoki.	6.70	7	360.00	\$ 2,412.00
02/09/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	5.00	4	360.00	\$ 1,800.00
02/09/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/09/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/09/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review escrow statement save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/09/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review settlement agreement signature and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/09/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translation index and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/10/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re depositions.	0.10	11	540.00	\$ 54.00
02/10/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review documents for Aoki deposition.	4.20	4	345.00	\$ 1,449.00
02/10/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Masahiro Aoki, including document review.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
02/10/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	0.50	4	360.00	\$ 180.00
02/10/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition files for war room.	1.30	9	360.00	\$ 468.00
02/10/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/10/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review calendar re pending deposition deadlines.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/12/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re depositions.	0.10	11	540.00	\$ 54.00
02/12/17	CHAN, LIN	Review Aoki documents.	1.20	7	540.00	\$ 648.00
02/12/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review documents and draft memo for Aoki deposition.	3.10	4	345.00	\$ 1,069.50
02/13/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re depositions.	0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
02/13/17	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for YS Kim deposition, including reviewing documents.	4.00	4	540.00	\$ 2,160.00
02/13/17	CHAN, LIN	Review Aoki documents; confer with H. Rim and A. Klamann re same.	0.50	7	540.00	\$ 270.00
02/13/17	CHAN, LIN	Review memorandum re Aoki documents.	0.60	11	540.00	\$ 324.00
02/13/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference with Phil Johnson.	0.20	11	725.00	\$ 145.00
02/13/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Finish the first draft of the Aoki deposition memo and send to L. Chan and H. Rim for edits.	4.10	4	345.00	\$ 1,414.50
02/13/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Meeting with L. Chan and H. Rim re Aoki deposition documents.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/13/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Meeting with L. Chan re Aoki deposition memo.	0.20	4	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/13/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Organize index of B.Glackin's binder of Aoki documents and send to services.	0.70	9	345.00	\$ 241.50
02/13/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review H. Rim's recommendations for translations for the Aoki deposition and send summary update to L. Chan.	0.30	11	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/13/17	RIM, HISUN	Conference with L. Chan and A. Klamann.	0.20	11	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/13/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Masahiro Aoki, Youngsun Kim and Hiroshi Shimokomaki.	7.80	7	360.00	\$ 2,808.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	2.00	4	360.00	\$ 720.00
02/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class member inquiry e-mail.	0.10	10	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition files for Text Map.	0.50	9	360.00	\$ 180.00
02/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit class member correspondence log.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review calendar re pending deposition dates.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review defense production and save to file.	0.30	7	360.00	\$ 108.00
02/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition exhibits and save to file.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcripts and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review e-mails re outstanding class member inquiries.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/13/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translation index and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/14/17	CHAN, LIN	Call Sony counsel re Aoki deposition.	0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
02/14/17	CHAN, LIN	Confer with A. Sheanin re SDI depositions; confer with B. Glackin and review documents re same.	0.70	11	540.00	\$ 378.00
02/14/17	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re Aoki deposition; review Aoki documents and memorandum.	0.40	11	540.00	\$ 216.00
02/14/17	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim and A. Klamann re depositions and document review.	0.80	11	540.00	\$ 432.00
02/14/17	CHAN, LIN	Review LG deposition transcripts.	1.10	9	540.00	\$ 594.00
02/14/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Aoki deposition preparation; office conference with L. Chan re Yoo M. Kim.	2.00	4	725.00	\$ 1,450.00
02/14/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Aoki deposition.	0.60	4	725.00	\$ 435.00
02/14/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Telephone conference re mediation.	0.30	11	725.00	\$ 217.50
02/14/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Continue editing Aoki deposition memo per L. Chan's edits.	1.80	4	345.00	\$ 621.00
02/14/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update Aoki deposition memo per L. Chan edits.	0.30	4	345.00	\$ 103.50
02/14/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Weekly status meeting with H. Rim and L. Chan.	0.70	11	345.00	\$ 241.50
02/14/17	RIM, HISUN	Conference with L. Chan and A. Klamann.	0.80	11	360.00	\$ 288.00
02/14/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Masahiro Aoki and Youngsun Kim, including document review.	7.20	7	360.00	\$ 2,592.00
02/14/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	5.30	4	360.00	\$ 1,908.00
02/14/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/14/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition transcripts for attorney review.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/14/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review files re status of plea agreements for A. Klamann.	0.30	9	360.00	\$ 108.00
02/14/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Sony production and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/15/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re depositions and case strategy.	1.80	11	540.00	\$ 972.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on
Timekeeper: all

From 06/01/13
To 02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/15/17	CHAN, LIN	Meet and confer with SDI re depositions; email correspondence re same.	0.70	6	540.00	\$ 378.00
02/15/17	CHAN, LIN	Review deposition transcripts.	1.90	9	540.00	\$ 1,026.00
02/15/17	CHAN, LIN	Review memoranda re SDI witnesses.	0.80	11	540.00	\$ 432.00
02/15/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Aoki deposition preparation.	4.10	4	725.00	\$ 2,972.50
02/15/17	GRANT, ANTHONY	Assistance with administration of database; conversion, preparation, and import of documents into electronic discovery database.	1.00	7	375.00	\$ 375.00
02/15/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Answer B. Glackin's follow-up questions re Aoki documents.	0.70	9	345.00	\$ 241.50
02/15/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Edit Aoki deposition notice per L. Chan's edits.	0.10	8	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/15/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Prepare deposition notice for Aoki.	0.40	8	345.00	\$ 138.00
02/15/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Provide B. Glackin with overview of Aoki documents.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/15/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update Aoki binder with new potential exhibits.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/15/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update task list for weekly call with co-lead counsel.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/15/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Masahiro Aoki and Youngsun Kim; Casemap reports, including document review.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
02/15/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	3.50	4	360.00	\$ 1,260.00
02/15/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with co-counsel re deposition file distribution.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/15/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with U.S. Legal re deposition file distribution.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/15/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare case filings for L. Chan review.	0.40	9	360.00	\$ 144.00
02/15/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition files for co-counsel review.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/15/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare deposition files for Text Map review.	0.40	9	360.00	\$ 144.00
02/15/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review settlement agreements and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/15/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review status re deposition files for co-counsel.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/15/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/16/17	CHAN, LIN		0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
02/16/17	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re depositions.	0.10	11	540.00	\$ 54.00
02/16/17	CHAN, LIN	Confer with H. Rim re documents.	1.40	11	540.00	\$ 756.00
02/16/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re depositions, including document and deposition review.	0.60	11	540.00	\$ 324.00
02/16/17	CHAN, LIN	Review deposition transcripts.	0.90	9	540.00	\$ 486.00
02/16/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Aoki deposition preparation; review Y.S. Kim exhibit set.	2.80	4	725.00	\$ 2,030.00
02/16/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update Aoki deposition notice per IPP co-counsel edits.	0.10	2	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/16/17	RIM, HISUN	Conference with L. Chan.	1.30	11	360.00	\$ 468.00
02/16/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Hiroshi Shimokomaki, Masahiro Aoki and Youngsun Kim, including document review.	6.70	7	360.00	\$ 2,412.00
02/16/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	4.50	4	360.00	\$ 1,620.00
02/16/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare class member correspondence.	0.10	10	360.00	\$ 36.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/16/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare Samsung production for loading by Catalyst.	0.10	7	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/16/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/16/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review class member correspondence and save to file.	0.50	9	360.00	\$ 180.00
02/16/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/16/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Samsung production and save to file.	0.10	7	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/16/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review settlement agreement and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/17/17	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Jim McGinnis re Aoki; email correspondence re same.	0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
02/17/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re depositions.	0.30	11	540.00	\$ 162.00
02/17/17	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Aoki deposition, including conference with B. Glackin and A. Klamann re documents.	0.90	4	540.00	\$ 486.00
02/17/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Aoki deposition preparation.	1.70	4	725.00	\$ 1,232.50
02/17/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Review correspondence re Aoki.	0.20	11	725.00	\$ 145.00
02/17/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Call with Jim McGinnis and Jessica Moy re Aoki.	0.20	6	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/17/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Follow up with H. Rim re Aoki questions.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/17/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review Aoki documents with B. Glackin and L. Chan.	1.80	4	345.00	\$ 621.00
02/17/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Serve notice of deposition for M. Aoki on all parties.	0.10	2	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/17/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Status update with L. Chan.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/17/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Strategy call with Jessica Moy (DPPs).	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/17/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Masahiro Aoki and Seung Hwan Na, including document review.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
02/17/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	4.70	4	360.00	\$ 1,692.00
02/17/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/17/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize correspondence files.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/17/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize discovery files.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/17/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and organize pleadings files.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/17/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence files re status of defense productions.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/17/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review escrow statement and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/17/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review motion to dismiss and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/18/17	CHAN, LIN	Draft SDI letter.	0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
02/18/17	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Aoki deposition; email correspondence re same.	0.10	4	540.00	\$ 54.00
02/18/17	CHAN, LIN	Review LG deposition transcripts.	2.60	9	540.00	\$ 1,404.00
02/19/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re depositions.	0.30	11	540.00	\$ 162.00
02/19/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Amend Aoki notice.	0.10	2	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/20/17	CHAN, LIN	Draft deposition notice.	0.10	3	540.00	\$ 54.00
02/20/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re depositions and SDI.	0.50	11	540.00	\$ 270.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/20/17	CHAN, LIN	Review LG deposition transcripts.	1.90	9	540.00	\$ 1,026.00
02/20/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Edit amended Aoki deposition notice per L. Chan's edits.	0.10	2	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/20/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Masahiro Aoki and Youngsun Kim, including document review.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
02/21/17	CHAN, LIN	Conference with A. Klamann and H. Rim re YS Kim deposition.	3.60	4	540.00	\$ 1,944.00
02/21/17	CHAN, LIN	Draft correspondence to SDI re telephone call.	1.10	11	540.00	\$ 594.00
02/21/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re translations, mediation, and depositions.	1.30	11	540.00	\$ 702.00
02/21/17	CHAN, LIN	Review LG deposition transcripts.	1.30	9	540.00	\$ 702.00
02/21/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Amend and re-serve notice of deposition for M. Aoki.	0.10	2	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/21/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Confirm that LCHB-hosted depositions are properly scheduled in the right rooms.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/21/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Continue drafting YS Kim deposition memo.	1.30	4	345.00	\$ 448.50
02/21/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Discuss Aoki and YS Kim binder changes with B. Troxel.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/21/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Document review meeting with L. Chan and H. Rim.	1.10	9	345.00	\$ 379.50
02/21/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Make reservations for additional day of Andrew Chung testimony.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/21/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Meeting with L. Chan and H. Rim re YS Kim documents.	1.30	9	345.00	\$ 448.50
02/21/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Research questions about Aoki documents.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/21/17	RIM, HISUN	Conference with L. Chan and A. Klamann.	2.00	11	360.00	\$ 720.00
02/21/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Masahiro Aoki and Youngsun Kim, including document review.	6.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,160.00
02/21/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	3.00	4	360.00	\$ 1,080.00
02/21/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.10	7	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/21/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare mediation statement for L. Chan review.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/21/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare status re production loading.	0.10	7	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/21/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare watch list documents for L. Chan review.	0.50	9	360.00	\$ 180.00
02/21/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit production log.	0.10	7	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/21/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/21/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery responses and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/21/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review opposition re motion to dismiss and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/21/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/22/17	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Shana Scarlett re discovery.	0.10	11	540.00	\$ 54.00
02/22/17	CHAN, LIN	Draft letter to SDI re depositions.	0.10	6	540.00	\$ 54.00
02/22/17	CHAN, LIN	Draft mediation statement; legal research re same.	1.70	8	540.00	\$ 918.00
02/22/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re depositions.	0.40	11	540.00	\$ 216.00
02/22/17	CHAN, LIN	Review LG deposition transcript.	0.20	9	540.00	\$ 108.00
02/22/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Confirm and organize location of Ra and Kwon depositions with co-counsel.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/22/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review documents and draft YS Kim deposition memo.	2.60	9	345.00	\$ 897.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/22/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update and circulate weekly co-lead call task list.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/22/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Masahiro Aoki and Youngsun Kim; Casemap reports, including document review.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
02/22/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	1.40	4	360.00	\$ 504.00
02/22/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Prepare correspondence for B. Glackin review.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/22/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/22/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/23/17	CHAN, LIN	Call with Sawa Nagano re Shimokomaki deposition.	0.10	11	540.00	\$ 54.00
02/23/17	CHAN, LIN	Conference with A. Klamann and H. Rim re YS Kim documents.	1.20	11	540.00	\$ 648.00
02/23/17	CHAN, LIN	Conference with DAPs re Aoki deposition; email correspondence re same.	0.30	11	540.00	\$ 162.00
02/23/17	CHAN, LIN	Legal research for mediation brief.	1.10	12	540.00	\$ 594.00
02/23/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Confirm in-person attendance at Aoki deposition on behalf of LCHB.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/23/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Confirm YS Kim deposition preparation is complete per DPP email.	0.10	11	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/23/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Converse with DPPs re Aoki deposition and follow-up with our team.	0.20	11	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/23/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update B. Glackin's Aoki binder.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/23/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Update YS Kim binder with L. Chan's requested documents.	0.10	9	345.00	\$ 34.50
02/23/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	YS Kim document review meeting with H. Rim and L. Chan.	1.20	4	345.00	\$ 414.00
02/23/17	RIM, HISUN	Conference with L. Chan and A. Klamann.	1.20	11	360.00	\$ 432.00
02/23/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Masahiro Aoki and Youngsun Kim.	6.80	7	360.00	\$ 2,448.00
02/23/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	1.80	4	360.00	\$ 648.00
02/23/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Distribute documents from the electronic court filings system and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/23/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition invoices re payment.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/23/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/24/17	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	0.40	11	540.00	\$ 216.00
02/24/17	CHAN, LIN	Conference with B. Glackin, Jessica Moy, A. Klamann, H. Rim, and DAPs re Aoki deposition.	0.80	11	540.00	\$ 432.00
02/24/17	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	1.70	12	540.00	\$ 918.00
02/24/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re depositions.	0.10	11	540.00	\$ 54.00
02/24/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Address translation/review issues re Aoki and YS Kim depositions.	0.20	9	345.00	\$ 69.00
02/24/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review YS Kim documents and prepare deposition memo.	2.00	4	345.00	\$ 690.00
02/24/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Masahiro Aoki, including document review.	8.00	7	360.00	\$ 2,880.00
02/24/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	2.00	4	360.00	\$ 720.00
02/24/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with Catalyst re production loading.	0.20	7	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/24/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mails with co-counsel re production loading.	0.10	7	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/24/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review and edit case calendar.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/24/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/24/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition notice and save to file.	0.20	9	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/24/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition objection and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/24/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition objections and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/24/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review deposition transcript and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/24/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review discovery requests and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/24/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review Sony production and prepare for loading.	0.30	7	360.00	\$ 108.00
02/24/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review translated production documents and save to file.	0.20	7	360.00	\$ 72.00
02/25/17	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	0.20	6	540.00	\$ 108.00
02/25/17	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	7.00	12	540.00	\$ 3,780.00
02/25/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re Aoki deposition.	0.10	11	540.00	\$ 54.00
02/26/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	[REDACTED]	0.80	12	725.00	\$ 580.00
02/26/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Review documents related to YS Kim and draft deposition memo.	6.20	4	345.00	\$ 2,139.00
02/26/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Masahiro Aoki, including document review.	8.80	7	360.00	\$ 3,168.00
02/27/17	CHAN, LIN	Conference with H. Rim and A. Klamann re Aoki deposition and document review; email correspondence re same.	0.50	11	540.00	\$ 270.00
02/27/17	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	0.40	11	540.00	\$ 216.00
02/27/17	CHAN, LIN	Confer with B. Glackin re Aoki deposition.	0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
02/27/17	CHAN, LIN	Confer with Cadio Zirpoli re YS Kim deposition.	0.10	11	540.00	\$ 54.00
02/27/17	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	2.80	12	540.00	\$ 1,512.00
02/27/17	CHAN, LIN	Email correspondence re Aoki deposition.	1.00	11	540.00	\$ 540.00
02/27/17	CHAN, LIN	Review deposition invoices; email correspondence re same.	0.30	11	540.00	\$ 162.00
02/27/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Aoki deposition.	4.60	4	725.00	\$ 3,335.00
02/27/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	[REDACTED]	2.10	12	725.00	\$ 1,522.50
02/27/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Answer Aoki deposition preparation questions.	0.80	4	345.00	\$ 276.00
02/27/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Continue reviewing YS Kim documents and drafting deposition memo.	1.20	4	345.00	\$ 414.00
02/27/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Continue reviewing YS Kim documents and drafting deposition memo.	2.90	9	345.00	\$ 1,000.50
02/27/17	RIM, HISUN	Conference with L. Chan.	0.10	11	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/27/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Masahiro Aoki and Youngsun Kim, including document review.	11.90	7	360.00	\$ 4,284.00
02/27/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	9.80	4	360.00	\$ 3,528.00
02/27/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	E-mail with Catalyst re production loading.	0.10	7	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/27/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Review correspondence and save to file.	0.10	9	360.00	\$ 36.00
02/28/17	BELTRAN, EILEEN	[REDACTED]	0.50	12	360.00	\$ 180.00
02/28/17	CHAN, LIN	[REDACTED]	0.60	4	540.00	\$ 324.00

LIEFF CABRASER HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN, LLP
--

Report created on

Timekeeper: all

From

06/01/13

To

02/28/17

3574-0001 BATTERIES ANTITRUST - General Matter

Date	Timekeeper	Narrative	Hours	Task Code	Rate	Lodestar
02/28/17	CHAN, LIN	Draft SDI mediation brief.	1.40	12	540.00	\$ 756.00
02/28/17	CHAN, LIN	Office conference with B. Glackin re SDI mediation.	0.20	11	540.00	\$ 108.00
02/28/17	CHAN, LIN	Prepare for Aoki deposition, including reviewing documents.	1.90	4	540.00	\$ 1,026.00
02/28/17	CHAN, LIN	Review memorandum re YS Kim.	0.10	11	540.00	\$ 54.00
02/28/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Office conference with L. Chan re Aoki deposition and [REDACTED]	0.30	11	725.00	\$ 217.50
02/28/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	Prepare for Aoki deposition.	7.50	4	725.00	\$ 5,437.50
02/28/17	GLACKIN, BRENDAN	[REDACTED]	0.20	12	725.00	\$ 145.00
02/28/17	KLAMANN, ABBYE	Call with Sony re Aoki deposition and follow-up with B Glackin and L Chan.	0.40	4	345.00	\$ 138.00
02/28/17	RIM, HISUN	Deposition preparation re Paul Kwon, Masahiro Aoki and Youngsun Kim, including document review.	11.50	7	360.00	\$ 4,140.00
02/28/17	TEXIER, RICHARD	Emails from and to H. Mottershead and B. Troxel. Cite check mediation statement.	2.10	8	360.00	\$ 756.00
02/28/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	Deposition preparation.	12.50	4	360.00	\$ 4,500.00
02/28/17	TROXEL, BRIAN	[REDACTED]	0.60	12	360.00	\$ 216.00
		Total Hours	21,180.80			\$ 8,572,433.00